Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 April 2018 10:16 AM

To: ‘Ng Wai Yin'

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SHD 422A (AAD1804-104) Our Ref : CC3/EQI18006863/Kma3 ACCIDENT
INVOLVING GBD 6624R & SHD 422A ON 09/04/2018

Attachments: SHDO0422A DOA 09.04.18.wmv

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Wai Yin,
We refer to your email below.

Based on the video footage, your driver was coming out from the parking lots. While my insured driver was moving
straight. As per Bola 24 Vehicle moving in/out of parking lot should exercise greater caution.

We regret to inform that we have our principal instruction to reject your client’s claim.

Thank you.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,
Bevan Lim | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 23 April 2018 4:16 PM

To: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) <bevanlim@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SHD 422A (AAD1804-104) Our Ref : CC3/EQI18006863/Kma3 ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 6624R &
SHD 422A ON 09/04/2018



Hi Bevan
As per requested.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

/._-..,Cag Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.iranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you
have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or
disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for
response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) [mailto:bevanlim@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 23 April, 2018 2:16 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; 'Zhe Wei' <zhewei.kek@transcab.com.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SHD 422A (AAD1804-104) Our Ref : CC3/EQI18006863/Kma3 ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 6624R &
SHD 422A ON 09/04/2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Wai yin,

We refer to your email below.

Kindly let us have a full footage of the incident for our review of this matter.

Thank you.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,
Bevan Lim | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 23 April 2018 2:06 PM

To: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) <bevanlim@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; 'Zhe Wei' <zhewei.kek@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Your Ref: SHD 422A (AAD1804-104) Our Ref : CC3/EQI18006863/Kma3 ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 6624R
& SHD 422A ON 09/04/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Bevan
Enclosed the video footage for your investigation.

From the video you can see, our front of the taxi’s is already moving out from the carpark lot quick a while, and your
insured vehicle FBD 6624R also slowing down the speed when our taxi moving out that time, suddenly your insured
vehicle speed-up and moving forward and collided onto our taxi front portion that causing this accident.

My opinion is both parties should be exercise caution.

Circumstances of Accident

On 09/04/18 at about 1240hrs, | was exiting from a parking lot at blk 22 Havelock Road market carpark. | stoppe:
(SHD422A) with about a quarter of my car out of the parking lot as there was a lorry blocking my way, while waiti
reverse parking into the lot, | suddenly felt and impact on the right side of my taxi. | alight and noticed that vehicle
had collided onto the front right portion of my taxi.
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Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

/_-..,Cag Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.iranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you
have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or
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disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for
response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) [mailto:bevanlim@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 19 April, 2018 4:43 PM

To: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Zhe Wei <zhewei.kek@transcab.com.sg>; 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: Your Ref: SHD 422A Our Ref : CC3/EQI18006863/Kma3 ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 6624R & SHD 422A ON
09/04/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: SHD 422A
Our Ref : CC3/EQI18006863/Kma3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 6624R & SHD 422A ON 09/04/2018

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is unclear / our

Insured is disputing for the above mentioned case. Our insured also filing Third Party claim against your client’s insurer.
Enclosed herewith is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you heard
further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request the CCTV footage / accident scene photos / evidence in order to seek further
instruction from our principal.

Thank you.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,
Bevan Lim | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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