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Y our ref: D ROD2RA4EMESH
Our ref: CS/FCI 8006860/ Avb Date : 8/10/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirfMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. GBC 80755

We thank you for your instruction on 12/4/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

17/4/2018  at the premises of M/s T & C AUTOMOTIVE
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5$6,351.40

Revised Estimate Amount : §52 400,00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check"” Items Amount 1 3%

Market Value 8%

LTA Reimbursement Value v h

MNett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion

rear

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

E.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE, AMSAE-A MMATAI
Licensed Appraiser



MS@FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited ce Reg Mo, 1950001060 C5T Reg Mo H2 00016765
& Raffies Quay 42100 Singapore 048580
Tel: (B5) 6222 €311 Fax (656222 3547

Claims & Mater Underwrting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore OGEGT 7
Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 3849
wiww mefirsteapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

12-04-2018 Our Ref No. D18002848MFSH
08-04-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHCB938G Third Party Vehicle. GBC8075S

NO. 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-68 AUTOBAY

MR CHA|

O/ 90075148 Fax No. 0
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax No. 68415315

MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

T&C AUTOMOTIVE
R. 5. SOLOMON LLC

Attention. MIL
TP Solicitor Fax No. 68177499

EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey repon via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,

;-|_ RANCT OROUE




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 8 October 2018 2:44 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

Cc: ‘EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.3G; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMEMT - D18002848MFSH/, GBC BOT7SS
Attachments: GBC 8075S PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBC 80758
Date of survey: 17/4/2018
Number of days : 5 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 April 2018 2:00 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=
Cc: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002848MFSH/1, GBC 80755

Dear SirMadam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBC 80755 on 17/4/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 April 2018 5:23 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assienments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.S5G; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com:>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002848MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,



Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8414 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 12 April, 2018 4:48 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LEKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002848MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 April 2018 2:00 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System'

Cc: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002848MFSH/1, GBC 80755
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBC 80758 on 17/4/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 April 2018 5:23 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002848MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 12 April, 2018 4:48 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002848MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey,
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Cwner 1D Type: Company

Owenver 1Dz 3362G

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.; GBCAD75S

“ehicle to be Exported: Mo

Intended Deregistration Date: 08 Oct 2018

Wehicle Make: CITROEM

Vehicle Model: BERLIMGO 1.6 MT ABS AB 2WD 60DR PANEL VAN
Primary Colour: White

Manufacturing Year: 2013

Engine Mo 10JBEBOOSS000
Chassis No.: VF77FYHECDI6T 1604
raximum Power Qutput: =

Open Market Value: $17.327.00

Original Registration Date: 27 Nov 2013

First Registration Date: 27 Nov 2013

Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: 2867.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Mo

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: 0,00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 26 Nov 2023

COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $55,503.00

COE Rebate Amount: $28,491.00

Total Rebate Amount: $28,491.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 Oct 2018

OK
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GST Reg.Mo.  M2-8919323-5 . mct ion/Due an:ﬂ;mﬁm
51

Spinacas Eats Pre Ltd
2 Halg Avenue

#8100 Halg Grove
Singapore 4318540

Type of Policy COMMERCTAL VEMICLE PRIVAYE (SEM I ) -
Policy Number DMCPHLT - 003517 :
Perlod of Cover from T4/06/2917 to I6/05/20818 e Mo o

vahicle Regiztration no. GRCEOTSS
Insured”s Nase 5§ Addeess Spinacas Eats Pte Ltd T
I Halg Avenus #91-06 Halg Grove ¥y :

Singapors 438844 L,
Branch/Territory Singapare/Singapore TEE e
Ascount/igency ADG@IAL/ABIDIAT  Abwin Pte Ltd g s
Singapare Dollar
Preais o 25,35
STANDARD RATED GST 7.80% - SG052.77
. SG0L,AM,13
Total Due e ~SCo1, 418, 13
This i3 a computer-gensrated ﬂncﬁﬂl ﬂ*@‘&ﬁs not require 3 signature.
g '“"*53; '}
B W
. ¥
g O
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL; G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 1906071098R GST Reg. No. 15-9607193-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref ©  CS/FCI18006860/Avbn2
0T Iy HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 DNy WIS M“wmwmmm
Code - FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHC 8938G Veh. Inspected GBC 80755
Policy Mo. Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. D1800284BMFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From  EILEEN Assign Date 12/D4/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model CITROEN BERLINGD C.C 1560
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 203
Chassis No. VFTTFSHECDJET1604 Colour WHITE
Odometer 66400 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/85 R15 LEAD & mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/65R15 LEAC & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/65R15 LEAD & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/85 R15 LEAD & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 091042018 |inspection Date 17/0412018
Survey held at 51 UBI AVE 1#01-25 PAYA UBI IND.PARK S (408933)
Repairer T & C AUTOMOTIVE
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REFORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




B Pl Vq LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
L; ; . ; 51 Lbl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Feg. No: 199607198R. GST Reg. No, 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBC 80755
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) IS{
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 659.00 59900
2|REAR SIDE BUMPER @$1685.00 N/S DEFORMED 370.00 185.00
1|REAR BUMFER CLIPS MNECESSARY 30.00 30.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER @5%45.00 NOT MECESSARY %000 -
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 315.40 31540
1|REAR LH DOCR NOT NECESSARY 1,077.00
1|REAR LH DOOR HINGE NOT NECESSARY 118.00 -
1|TAILLAMP LH CRACKED 316.00 316.00
1|REAR END PAMNEL DENTED 54600 506.00
LESE 10% DISCOUNT i 214 14
3.611.40 1,927 .26
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR LH DOOR GLASS SEALANT (SN} MNOT NECESSARY 40.00 -
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN} DAMAGED 280.00 200.00
1|70KM/H STICKER {SN) NOT MECESSARY 10.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 60.00
390.00 260.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING. 1,000.00 500.00
SPRAY PAINTING B00.00 250.00
WIRING, 50.00 30.00
TO UNDERSEAL NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
TO REMOVE REVERSE SENSOR. 100.00 50.00
TO TRANSFER REAR DOOR FITTINGS. NOT NECESSARY 150.00
TO REMOVE REAR DOCR GLASS. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
2,350.00 B30.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,351.40 3,017.26
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,400.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18006860/Avbn2
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Report Ref No. CS/FC118006860/Avbn2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

OISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report Is made sclely for the use and benafit of the Client named on the frant page of this Report.

Ha
Report, in whils of in part, does 8o af his of el ewn sk




