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N T g LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Bedis D48 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Uibl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 199607198R GST Reg MNe. 18-9507198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCB/EQI1B006830/eb]
o Yoo N
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date - 13-04-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 0688110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBD 2887R Veh. Inspected GBF T2009P
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 130472018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c g
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer . Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  09/04/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at STYTECH AUTO FTELTD
2 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 2 #02-30
KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417921
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
BiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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Your rel: T Be Advised
Our ref: CCH/EQI 00683V Ueb3 Date: 16.04.2018

The Motor Claims Department

M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dear SirfMadiom,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. GRF7209P
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on_13.04.2018
at the premises of M/s _Stviech Auto Pre Lid and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ' 5§ 7.763.75

Revised Estimate Amount (5% 4.900.00

"Check” Items Amount t 88 -

Market Value 5% -

LTA Reimbursement Value i 5% -

Nen Value 1 535 -

Description of Damage: S

The vehicle sustmined damages at the = LIS T
Rew N/S Pﬁniﬂ‘n = —'_—:::_ |

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 6 days

Yours faithiully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser
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Vehicle: GBF7209pP Make & Model
Chassis No:
%" e ,-v‘bp/f BrR e Nrp ="
S/N Parts/Labaour QTy | Unit Price Price Recommend
1 |Left Body Panel $  1,712.45 gg%r
2 |Left Body Panel Cardboard 5200 SN A -’(
e
3 |Left Body Panelﬁclip 540 SN AA X
4 tRoottming.
5 |Left Tail Lamp 5 387.50 $ A0 -
6 |Left Tail Lamp Panel (TOP) 5 216.00 prd x
Left Tail Lamp Panel (Bottom) &  29600| A xé},m —
Left Tail Lamp Panel (INNER) s 28800 /7L X
7 |Rear Bumper 5 687.40 s
8 |Rear Bumper Retainer 2Pcs|S 8800 S 176.00 /v‘?’f(n( lp e
8 |Rear Bumper Clip 5 30.00 4&(- "
10 |Rear Air Ventilation Duct & (400 A, x
11 |Reverse Sensor $200 SN Tora
12 |Rear End Panel $ 1,275.00 rt X
13 |Rear End Panel Stricker $ 95.00 17 X
14 |Rear Tailgate S 171840 | 2/ Ln/ —
" " —
15 |"1250KG" Sticker ; 48.00 7L
16 ["70KM/H" Sticker S 1000 421 —
17 |"8 Pax" Sticker 5 1000 | Ua e
18 |"Hiace" Sticker 5 56.00 A
19 |Toyota Emblem s S 58.00 A -~
q J
60.00 . Y
20 |Tailgate Glass Inner Seal l -L ] ) /e 19§
21 |Glass Sealant s s000| aUd Yol 1




22

Panel joint Sealant

= ra

23

Rear Wheel Cap

580 SN

24 mﬁ

LRITR




Labour

|r & Refix Roof Li
emove & Refix Roof Lining S 100.00 6_;?
T fer Door Fitti
ranster Door Fitting 3 120.00 é D
Transfer Glass $ 120.00 /@D
R & Refi ﬁSh f
emove & Refix n $ 12000 T ez
Wheel Alignment s gooo| »17 pYd
Anti Rust Proofing $ 80.00 § )
Check Wiring s 100.00 22
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Asher Sna !LI{I{Auto!

From: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd <stytechent@singnet.comsg>

Sent: Monday, 7 May 2018 5:00 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto}; Joy irene (LKKAuta)

Subject: RE: Your Ref. SAPL/98824/04/18, ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 7209P & GBD 2997R ON
09/04/2018

Dear Asher,

We confirm your below email of the amount, Total 56101.00
Thank you

Best Regards

Winston Teo

Stytech Auto Pte Ltd

Emall: stytechent{@singnet com.sg | Mobile: +65 9685 8843 | Fax: +65 6445 3310
Address: 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-02/ #02-30, Kaki Bukit Autohub, Singapore 417921

IRy,

STYTELCN aUTo PTE [T

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, May 7, 2018 4:51 PM

To: stytechent@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>; Joy lrene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Your Ref: SAPL/98824/04/18, ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 7209P & GBD 2997R ON 09/04/2018

Without Prejudice

Your Ref: SAPL/98824/04/18
Our Ref; CC6/EQI18006830/Ueb3

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 7209P & GBD 2997R ON 09/04/2018
We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement as follows: -
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) S 5,243.00

2. Loss of Rental (Bdays x 5100)(w/GS5T) % 856.00
3. LTA Search Fee 5 2.00



Total: $6,101.00

Kindly let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Bast Regordy

Asher Sng | Cose Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 884 1-4051 | emoll: gsherng@kkauto . com | fox: &741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industial Park, ULl Avenue |, #02-25 | 5/408733)



STYTECH AUTO PTE LTD

2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2 #02-30 SINGAPORE 417921 (Kaki Bukit Auto hub)
TEL: 6444-8125 FAX: 6445-3310 H/P: 9685 8843 Email: stytechent@singnet.com.sg
GST REG. NO: 201601530K CO. AEG. NO: 201601 538K

Our Ref:SAPL/98824/04/18

Date :23/4/2018

To :M/S EQ Insurance Company Ltd.
5 Maxwell Rd #¥17-00
Tower Block MND Complex

S'pore 069110
Attn:Motor Claim Dept

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Re :Claim of repair cost & loss of use for veh no.GBF 7209-P

NO PRICE
1.Lump Sum Repair Cost For Veh No.GBF 7209-P.......58$5,243,00
2.Loss Of Use For Rental Bill NR:32018(120X8Days)..S5$1,027.20
(Six Working Days & Plus One Waiting Day & One Sunday)
3.GIﬁ SearCh FEE-""""""'QI"'.l".""”"”"-‘5$ 2.&“

TOTAL : 5$6,272.20

F+ s -3 F - 3 ¢ T = 2 3+ 3+ = = - = 8 & - &£ % .



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April 2018 12:38 PM

To: ‘RONALDYEO@ADVENTURERS.COM SG'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 2997R AND GBF 7209P ON 09/04/2018

Our Ref: CC6/EQIN8006830/Ueb3
26 APRIL 2018

ADVENTURER’'S SINGAPORE PTE LTD

Dear Sir'Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 2997R AND GBF 7209P ON 09/04/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED 1o resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party,

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email; Ashersngf@lkkauto.com

ce.  EQINSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
{Motaor Claims Dept)
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Ta: M/S STYTECH AUTO PTE LTD
2 Kaki Bukit Avenue 2, #02-30

Kaki Bukit Autohub
Singapore 417921
Dear Sir/Mdm,
Repair Cost for Vehicle Number ﬁ@ F7L05p
Coused by accident datedon__ 07 04118 inlving vehice/s umber_#BF 7207P
'..-"1 5802‘?‘??'#2 at ﬁdm‘f‘dr‘q?‘ S‘f Moo

Alrth  Bul fo/mf

Our Company /', ﬁ”’tu ‘S;rnf&ﬂdrl fle /1"(/‘9
vehicie number ARKF 72 0? P herahy authorized you to liaise with the insurance

company and undertake all repairs & any other damages incurred as | am involved in the accident dated
on 09 [oy [ g

All legal & repai. costs will be deducted from the proceeds of my claim and be released to M/S STYTECH
AUTO PTE LTD.

Thank you.

Yours Faithfully




STYTECH AUTO PTE LTD

2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2 #02-30 SINGAPORE 417921 (Kaki Bukit Auto hub)
TEL: 6444-8125 FAX: 6445-3310 H/P: 9685 8843 Email: stytechent@singnat.com.sg
GST AEG, NO: 201601538K CO, REG. NO: 201601530K

Qur Ref:SAPL/98824/04/18

Date :23/4/2018

To :M/S EQ Insurance Company Ltd.
5 Maxwell Rd #17-00
Tower Block MND Complex

S'pore 069110
Attn:Motor Claim Dept

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Re tAccident on 9/4/2018 involving veh nos.GBF 7209-P & GBD2997-R
Along Admiralty Street Near North Link Bldg.

FINAL BILL FOR VEH NO.GBF 7209-P

DESCRIPTION PRICE

Lump Sum Repair Cost For Veh No.GBF 7209-P..ces...5%4,900.00
?: ESI....EII.I.I.."S$ 3&3.':'0

TOTAL : $$5,243.00

s+ == =1+ £ = = 3 3 & & 4§ F ® = 3

Yours Faithfully
STYTECH AUTO PTE.LTD.

Mr.Winsten Tean
9HhB5-88B43
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‘g% STYTECH AUTO PTE LTD
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2 #02-30 SINGAPORE 417921 (Kaki Bukit Auto huly)

NR No: 32018

TEL: 6444-B125 FAX:6445-3310 H/P: 9685 : stytechent@singnet.com.sg
LBF 7209P osTrea. No: 201601539 ool i

Vehicle No: ﬁ:-"#ql-l!‘? Ageroi6L MewamdTwe  To7ila if1gL€

DewTime Ot /3 [tfip  2-30pm

DateTimeln Kc.f:/-ir [ - COpun

EXTENSION CHARGES IS 512 00 PEA HOUR (SINGAPDRE USE]

Fuel Guags i I | | GEROSIT WILL BE FORFEITED IN ANY ACCIDENT/DAMAGETIRE & THEFT
M0 RETURNING OF VEHICLE AFTER 8 PM A EVE / PUBLIC HOLIDAY

r - H "__fj M

Hier's Name: o e Sergepare [ SUT = l

Hirer's Address: ‘ﬁz HENTALS CTF!\GES AMOUNT
W omsass [ 0.0-cveed | 4940 0

s - VC: Waoek at 53 pat waak

WP D0271S35¢ Fegi M= —— — =

Drivers Name: T Ak Llans /
mmmmh-h;\mrhm /

Oriver's Address: Bk 207 fass Me (cte Ae (Fo(-1

Tt 22ct¥332 VC: 3CH33S724 | eenvCotectontes [

[ A [ PLS PetrolDiasel }

Driving Licence Date: 3¢ [ /§7  Class 3

Additional Driver's Name: Others ]

Driver's Address. — /

b ve: Add GST = =

Age: fc//"b A4 é F'M‘

Guaramor's Namae Loss Toad .

Guarantor's Address: Received
Balance Amount Due/Relundable

Tel 1G:

Occupation: Age: Add : EXTENSION CHARGES

IMPORTANT MOTES

* This vahuchs is restncied 1o SINGAPORE anly,

* No rafund wil be given for ary retum or fuel left in vehicl.

* Hirer ia liable to pay all parking fees, iraffic summons & offer claims

* Mirar who carries ihe number of passengers o load sxcasding tha UPC
labai will have 1o lake Ihair own responsibiifles & LTA gummong,

“ In the event of vehicls braskdown dua 1o no fual, hirer |s lable to pay $50
servics chamge plus cost of fuslidiessl.

* Mo replacement of vehicls in any damage o loss.

* Hirer is responaibie for the first § £ 0 £ {—axcoss lor collision/damage’ fire
of thatt o first party (Le. STYTECH AUTO PTE LTIx) vehicla {inclusing
windscreen) and also first § / STG/ ~ excess lor coliision/damage/fire
& thaft 1o third party's wahicia for and every sccident & damage.

METHOD OF PAYMENT
0 Cash [0 ChequaNo: [ Visa Bill Co.

Retund
Received$___ By Hirer x

* In tha even! of the rental vehicle & nol retum on the date due & no
contaci ig make to infarm our company ol any changes & payment afiar

one waok dua, Our will taka action & reposess the &
B senvics charge ol $120.00 are subjoct 1o the Hirer incluzive of the
evartue changes wilh &n sdilional in iereat gl 34 per monih,

I/'We have read the terms and conditions of the rental agreement and agree thereto:-

e i

U X -
Hirer's Sigheture Guarantor's Signature STYTECH AUTO PTE LTD

Signed By
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

: GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
INSURANCE 5/one=65 22 0010 fax” 66 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Rel No: GR-18-055222
Date of Requast: 12/04/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchass
Stytech Aulo Ple Lid

2 Kakl Bukit Ave 2 #02-30
Kaki Bukit Autohub

Singapore 417921

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 12/0472018

Enquiry By Teo CHoon Kiat Winston

TP Vahicle No. GBD20a7R

Accident Date 09/04/2018

Enguiry Result

TF Vehicie No. Insurer Fenod of Insurance Insurer Tel. No
GBD2937R EQ Insurance Company Lid 2B/0B/2017-27/08/2018 6223 9433
Thank You.

The images pravided 1o you are taken from the original reports forwarded (o the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of
Singapore and we (ake no respansibility for their sccuracy or contents and shall be under no kability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of

of In connection with the repons or their images,

This 18 @ computer generated document and requires no signature.

e el e s ————— e Ll e s w ol s bana =TT O s Bl cnambirm—des  meeine b P ealdbd - A TTAG30 # ACP=T74 00T § CCTAVERM =TT TLEM A He-dl
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
INSUMN & Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
c E Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Manday to Friday 9am to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ©ST Regisiration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No GR-1B-055222
Date of Requesl 12/04/2018 Your Rel No: Online Purchase

Stytech Aulo Pte Lid

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #02-30
Kaki Bukit Autohub
Singapore 417521

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Daie 1210472018
Enquiry By Teo CHoon Kiat Winston
TP Vehicle No. GBD298TR
Accidant Date 09/04/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUMT {S5)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amournt .13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You

This is a computer genarated documant and requires no signalure.

For GIARMC Official use.
Date;
[¥] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque

b e - i r A e M v e R T D= B = ' ] Frmfd— 4 TTARA E RN -1 00071 BATTOWER <33 TR SFA Wanl
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Company Registration No  199807198R

SUUIEAVE | 20225 A% A 0 HL ST STRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 08930 TEL : (065) 62563361 FAX : (Uh5) 62364015

: M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 14/05/2018

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

) GBD 29897R (Insd Veh) |Your Ref No. DM18HOO00843
vehi o, GBF T209P (TP Veh) |Our Ref No.: CC6/EQI18006830/Ueb3g2
Date of Accident 8/4/2018
Liability 100%

Final Repair Cost ] 5,243.00
Loss of Use ' 9 days
Rental (If any) 8 856.00 8 days
Others: -1 2.00
.-
6,101.00
Final Settlement Sum |: § 6,101.00

Remarks

Payment Instruction. Payee's Breakdown

1)

STYTECH AUTO PTE LTD

- 6,101.00

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No 10G807198R GST Reg No 10-8807188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

5 MAXWELL ROAD

Ref CCE/EQI18006830/Ueb3a2

#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date  14-05-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Coda: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBD 2867R Veh. Inspected GBF T206P
Policy No. DMCPHO17-004118 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM18HO00943 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 13/04/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HIACE DX (M) c.c 2982
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. KDH2010201615 Colour SILVER
Odometer 20716 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/80 R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/B0 R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |19580 R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/80 R15 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  09/04/2018 [inspection Date 13/04/2018
Survey held at STYTECH AUTO PTELTD
2 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 2 #02-30
KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417921
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR

6 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBF 7209P
- Estimate By | Our Adjus
Qty Description of Parts Condition | ST BY ‘ﬁ""‘“
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|LEFT BODY PANEL BADLY DENTED / 1,712.45 1712.45
BUCKLED
1|LEFT TAIL LAMP BROKEN 38750 38750
1|LEFT TAIL LAMP PANEL (TOP) TO REPAIR SEE 216.00
LABOUR
1|LEFT TAIL LAMP PANEL (BOTTOM) BADLY DENTED 296.00 206.00
1|LEFT TAIL LAMP PANEL (INNER) TO REPAIR SEE 288.00
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER DISTORTED 687 40 887 40
2|REAR BUMPER RETAINER @$88 00 N/S CRACKED 176.00 88.00
1|REAR BUMPER CLIP NECESSARY 30.00 30,00
1|REAR AIR VENTILATION DUCT NOT NECESSARY 128.00
1|REAR END PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 1.275.00
LABOUR
1|REAR END PANEL STRIKER NOT NECESSARY 95.00 -
1|REAR TAILGATE DENTED / 1,718.40 1,718.40
BUCKLED
1|'1250kG" STICKER NECESSARY 48.00 48,00
1|'7okMM STICKER NECESSARY 10.00 10,00
1|'sPAX’ STICKER NECESSARY 10.00 10.00
1|'HIACE’ STICKER NECESSARY 56,00 56.00
1|TOYOTA EMBLEM NECESSARY 58 00 58.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT 1327544
710175 3.826.31
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|LEFT BODY PANEL CARDBOARD (SN) NOT NECESSARY 200,00 :
1|LEFT BODY PANEL CARDBOARD CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 40.00
1|SET REVERSE SENSOR (SN) TORN 200.00 200.00
1| TAILGATE GLASS INNER SEAL (SN} NECESSARY 60.00 30.00
1|GLASS SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 40.00
1|PANEL JOINT SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 40.00
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- Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
1|REAR WHEEL CAP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 80.00
700.00 310.00
LABOUR
REMOVE & REFIX ROOF LINING 100.00 60.00
TRANSFER DOOR FITTING 120.00 60.00
TRANSFER GLASS 120,00 100.00
REMOVE & REFIX AXLE SHAFT NOT NECESSARY 120.00
WHEEL ALIGNMENT NOT NECESSARY 80.00
ANTI RUST PROCFING 80.00 60.00
CHECK WIRING 100.00 20.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING 1,000.00 850.00
PARTS INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF LEFT TAIL LAMP
PANEL (TOP) LEFT TAIL LAMP PANEL {INNER) AND REAR
END PANEL
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING 1.000.00 B00.00
2.720.00 2,050.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,611.75 6,186.31
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,900.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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CHUA KANG SENG
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