Hsiao Tunﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: claims@teamworkgarage.com

Sent: Friday, 12 October 2018 5:36 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 1804-10-DN (SJH 2350R) *Our Ref: CC4/EQI18006814,/Dpb3

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING 50Q 8178G(EQ) /5JH 2350R/ OTHERS ON 07/04/2018]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Hsiao Tong ,

We refer to your offer stated below , it is acceptable,
Please let us have your most favorable DV soonest.

Thank you and have a nice day.
]

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, October 12, 2018 9:00 AM

To: TEAMWORK GARAGE CLAIMS <claims@teamworkgarage.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 1804-10-DN (SIH 2350R) *Our Ref: CC4/EQI18006814/Dpb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDQ
8178G(EQ) /SIH 2350R/ OTHERS ON 07/04/2018]

wWithout Prejudice
Hi,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of 54,420.00{all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of llability on

#our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in
respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for

settlement sum above 520,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made
payment on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S3{408053)

Sent: Friday, 21 September 2018 4:20 PM



Ce: claims@teamworkgarage.com

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 1804-10-DN (SJH 2350R) *Our Ref: CC4/EQI18006814/Dpb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDQ
8178G(EQ) /SJH 2350R/ OTHERS ON 07/04/2018]

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong,
As requested.

Darren Ng

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 68442475

Fax: 68442474

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, September 20, 2018 9:29 AM _,
To: 'claims’ [claims@teamworkgarage.com) <claims@teamworkgarage.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 1804-10-DN (5JH 2350R) *Our Ref: CC4/EQI18006814/Dpb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDQ
8178G(EQ) /SJH 2350R/ OTHERS ON 07/04/2018]

240 REMINDER

Without Prejudice
Hi,
We refer to our below email.

We would like to request a copy of the de-registered letter of your client's vehicle from LTA for our
necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred ~ #™
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4080133)



From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 August 2018 9:07 AM

To: 'claims’ (claims@teamworkgarage.com) <claims@teamworkgarage.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 1804-10-DN (5JH 2350R) *Our Ref: CC4/EQI18006814/Dpb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDQ
8178G(EQ) /SJH 2350R/ OTHERS ON 07/04/2018]

Without Prejudice
Hi,
We refer to our below email.

We would like fo request a copy of the de-registered lefter of your client's vehicle from LTA for our
neceassary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” -,

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhti@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 July 2018 12:40 PM

To: 'claims' (claims@teamworkgarage.com) <claims@teamworkgarage.com»

Subject: Your Ref: 1804-10-DN (SIH 2350R) *Our Ref: CC4/EQI18006814/Dpb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDQ
8178G(EQ) /SJH 2350R/ OTHERS ON 07/04/2018]

Your Ref: 1804-10-DN (SJH 2350R) Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC4/EQI18006814/0pb3

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDQ 8178G(EQ) /5JH 2350R/ OTHERS ON 07,/04,/2018
We refer to the above matter.

We would like to request a copy of the de-registered letter of your client's vehicle fram LTA for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
fram this negatiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence baing discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsgiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4080923)
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Company Registration No. 199607198R

S UBLAVE L #0225 PAYA URL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 18/10/2018

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

PRI SDQ 8178G (Insd Veh) [Your Ref. No. : DM18HO00927/JT
SJH 2350R (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No. : CC4/EQI18006814/Dpb3s2
Date of Accident 7/4/2018
Liability 100%
Total Loss % 4,000.00
Loss of Use % 420.00 7 days
Rental (If any) 5 days
Others: % 7.45
'3

4,427 .45

Final Settlement Sum |: $ 4.420.00 | (GLOBAL SUM)

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |TEAMWORK GARAGE PTE LTD

4,420.00

NUR SHAQILAH
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

iA 1 #01-23/24 5i 408934
lﬂ%fk 53 Ubi Avenue /24 Singapore

Paya Ubi Industrial Park

rage Tel: 6844 2475 Fax: 6844 2474

Pte Ltd Email; claims@teamworkgarage.com
GST Register No: 201015366H

20" June 2018

Our reference: 1804-10-DN

Your reference: SDQ8178G

EQ Insurance Company Limited BY HAND
5 Maxwell Road #17-00

Tower Block, MND Complex

Singapore 069110

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir/ Madam,

Claimant : ROSET LIMOUSINE SERVICES PTE LTD
Address : 53 UBI AVENUE 1 #03-47 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK SINGAPORE 408934

We are instructed by the above named to claim damages against your insured/your
insured’s driver in connection with a road accident on 07 APR 2018 along AYE TWDS
CHANGI AIRPORT involving our client’s vehicle registration number SJH2350R and vehicle
registrations number SDQ8178G driven by you/your insured’s driver at the material time.

The accident was caused by your insured negligent driving and/or management of the
vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and our client has

been put to loss and expense, particulars of which are as follows:-

Cost of Repair : S 4, 280.00
Loss of Use (30 Days x $120) : $ 3, 600.00
LTA Search Fee : $7.45
Total o : 57, 887.45

Revised 01 April 2016



A copy of each of the following supporting documents are enclosed:-

a) Qur client’s Accident Report / Police Report;
b) COE/PARF Certificates;

c) Certificate Of Insurance;

d) Owner / Driver’s IC & Driving License;

e) LTA search;

f) Letter Of Authorisation;

g) Profoma Invoice;

h) Satisfaction & Discharge Voucher;

The demand herein is in respect of our client’s claim for damages pertaining to their motor
vehicle and any settlement following or subsequent of this demand shall not prejudice our

client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to personal injuries.

Please send to us an acknowledgement of receipt of this letter with 14 days of your receipt
of this letter, failing which our client will have no alternative but to commence
proceedings against you without further notice to you or your insurer. Our client’s claim
is quantified based on the supporting documents in our file. Until a settlement is reached,
all negotiations are conducted on the basis that the damages quantified herein are subject

to revision if so instructed by our client.

Yours faithfully,

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd
Encl.

Ravised 01 April 2016
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SLUBLAVE ol 22 Paya UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408433 TEL (063 62363361 FAN @ (0651 62564513

Our Ref: CC4/EQI18006814/Dpb3
20 APRIL 2018

LEE KANG MING

BLK 656B JURONG WEST STREET 61
#16-311

SINGAPORE 642656

Dear Sir/Madam.,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5D(Q) 8178G/ SJH 2350R/ OTHERS ON 07/04/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster

appointed by your motor insurer, EQ Insurance Company Ltd to deal with the third party
claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SJH 2350R against your insurance policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst
other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the
appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with
third party claimant.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD — if applicable) will be with held for
the time being. Pending for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal EQ
INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

C%mm{) TONG

Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: chewht(@lkkauto.com

ce.  EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Dept)
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ETTER (F AUTHORIZATIO

EQ {Third pasty insmemce & Workshop)

To T
Clatmant  ROsek Livsusine, Sexvtay Q18 \a9
Dlear 5irs,

owner of vehicle no, STIH2350K

we Rimet LMGUSIL Seqles QT8 O
Teomwess lfmrmje_ 1 LID

hereky anfhorize mayfour repairer,

act 63 myfour sgent and proceed on behalf for mefus with respect to myjony olaim for repair costs and/or rental

andfor Joss of use ("olsim?) for myjour vehicle no, _ ST 2350 € that was damsge pursuant

o ghe accident - which occurred atfafong
P E Aot d"'u.f"nﬁ Peoget 4

SUGE\TR (5

inyolving vehicle nos,

1/We hereby irrevocably sssign sbsolufely o you that Ifwe have authorized and assigned ail compensation
monies perfeining the sbove mentioned sccident due fo mefus to myfour repairerfsolicifors
Teomuges Gosooe. RTe ARG , I/We hereby anthorize you to forward and release
all compensstion setflement chegues(s) due io fhe seiflement io myjour repairer/solicifors
Teoyed  Gosose e 0 pertatning to above said aceident whom Jfwe

amfhorized and assigned to collect the said compenssiion monies.

I/We further acknowledse that any scitlement the workshop may reach on noyfour behalf is on & wifhout
prejudice and without admission of lisbility basis insofar as the driverfowner/insuvers of the other vehicle/s

concerned.

IjWe acknowledge that the Discharge Voucher applies only o my/our property damage and will not affect any
of the personal ijuries claim(s) involved and/jor uninsured losses claim in a lafer date. Further fhe sefflement
terms herein should not be used as an evidence o prejudice to any personal injuries claim(s) involved and/or

ofher uninsured losses claim grising of the subject matter in the acfion.

Thank you,

Datedfhis_ 'O dayof o4 (montt) 20_\®__ (yean)

Signature of owner veldele (CIRIMANE ...ocvvracoriiine i s s e
Name of owner of vekicle (elamant) ....5 ooy, ENVA0G, S22 TR A
NRIC Nurtber (latmant). ... ZERERSATEZn oo vesivenisissssesasies s ssasmssisissssssssssasassen

Any amersimanis ek i this lomm wil nol be volid unless approved and endosed by fhe monogement of the wershop

Page 4of 8




A19/2018 Raraint

Land |1';11w.s-.:nr"lg'm|';fn”|-i1_~~

Land Transport Autharity

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

G5ST Registration Mo, ; M4-0006528-2

Print Date/Time : 09 Apr 2018 [ 17:48:58
Receipt Date/Time : 09 Apr 2018 [ 17:48:58

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No, - ITNET-00000-180403-001835
Pravious Recaipt No.

S/N Item Description/ Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before
No. GST (S8)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SDQ8178G
As at 07 Apr 2018/15:00:00
Insurance Co: EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

GS5T
Amount
(53)

0,49

0.49
0.4%

b 1 Insurance Enquiry - SDQB178G

Enquiry Fee 7.00

20180409174753206223
Sub-Total T.00
Total Before Rounding 7.00
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payable
Paid By

20180409174830731 Diract Dabit: eN ETS Debit
{intemet Banking)
Total
Cash Change
Tenderad Amaount
Excess Refundable Amaunt
—

THAMK ¥ OU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Amount
After GST
(5%)

748

7.49
748
0.04
T.45

7.45

745
0.00
T.A45
0,00

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.

NILpSE: L IEE, gov. S0/1ERNIIFacnan fCaMmplateEayment - UNL L IUN_ILSETIUIuu |



Vahirls Insirance Particnlars Frm lirw

Arai?NiA

Vehicle Insurance Particulars Result

Wehicle No. Incident Date/Time
sDQB/178G 07 Apr 2018 / 15:00:00
OK
F_
-

b B TR T T a.--v-u|-':..'||r|rpi‘1|Hr1|lﬁ1|—nl'|||lr\f|—'a"'manwm AL FLIN i

Insurance Company Name
EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Save as PDF
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= Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehlele Owner Particulars
Owmer 1D Typa:

Oheirvar |1

Vehicle Detalls
Wehicle No..

Wehicle ta ba Expored:

Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Prirnary Cokour;
Mamfaciuring Year:
Engine No.:
Chassis No-
Maxinum Power Outpul;
Oipen Market Valve:
Oniginal Registration Dale:
First Ragisﬁal'k:n Diate:
Transfe: Guuﬁl,;
Aclual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eliginliity:
PARF Eligiblity Expiry Dato;
PARF Rebate Amount;
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Data:
COE Catagory,
COE Perlod{Years);
QF Pald:
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount,
The Infermation contained herein Is correct as at 16 May 2018

OK

EQR.QFFICIAL USE GMLY E
Tolne Regetore-. oot of Vehicte Nc: SIH 7350 @

Company
G722Z

SJHZI50R

Yes

17 May 2018
MITSUBISHI

LANCER 1.5 MIVED GLS 4AT
Black

2007

4AS10073245
JMYSRCY2ZABLIO04Z 23
0.0 KW (107 bhp)
$16.910.00

30 Jul 2008

30 Jul 2008

F

$18,601.00

Yes,
28 Jul 2018
$9.300.00

29 Jul 2018

A - Car (1600ce & below)
10

£12.001.00

$238.00

$4,538.00

This is bo confinm that the abave-mentionaer vahicla has oeen derogisterad on

Ploase nole Bl the velide liceims (is. mad lac) and relatad lees, i oulsi
115 an adfence o anyone Lo keos of use A dorareslarod vehlels,

Dale

Thea bnformation Is current al ime of parting (Jan 2018)
WRLEO-F-DO1-W7 TOPT150- 02117}

A ]
5 5&% Tor S period ug ke ihe data af deragslration
VE! LLES

for Registrar of Vehlcles



