










1

Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2019 12:44 PM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540     Accident involving SKC6525S & PC4270E 

along Jalan Berseh on 11/4/18 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18006813/mb3 

Dear Jia Le 
 
Please proceed. 
 
 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse  
Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 10:35 AM 
To: MT_Claim_SG 
Cc: ONG LI LI 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540 Accident involving SKC6525S & PC4270E along Jalan Berseh on 11/4/18 
***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18006813/mb3  
 
Lonpac Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540 
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC18006813/Kdb3 
  
Dear Sirs/Madam, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We have highlighted to your good office on 07/05/2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with 
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 
  
Insured opened door and resulted accident. Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 
  
Summary to offer to third party repairer, “CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD” is as follows: - 
  

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 5,435.62 $ 2,889.00 
2. Loss of Use (5days x $100.00) $    500.00 $    500.00 (5days x $100.00) 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $       8.00 $        8.00 

Total $ 5,943.62 $ 3,397.00 
  
**05days recommendation for repair. 
  
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
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The above is for your approval. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Carlor Chan | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 4:06 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto); Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540 Accident involving SKC6525S & PC4270E along Jalan Berseh on 11/4/18 
***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18006813/mb3  
 
Dear Bevan/Hsiao Tong 
 
What is the status of TP claim? 
 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
From: ONG LI LI  
Sent: Wednesday, 10 October, 2018 2:31 PM 
To: 'Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)'; 'Shu Pei (LKKAuto)' 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; 'Admin A'; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) (chewht@lkkauto.com) 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540 Accident involving SKC6525S & PC4270E along Jalan Berseh on 
11/4/18 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18006813/mb3  
 
Dear Bevan/Hsiao Tong 
 
You may continue to handle the third party claim and put up the report to us. 
 
Thanks, 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
From: ONG LI LI  
Sent: Thursday, 27 September, 2018 4:12 PM 
To: 'Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)'; 'Shu Pei (LKKAuto)' 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; 'Admin A' 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540 Accident involving SKC6525S & PC4270E along Jalan Berseh on 
11/4/18 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18006813/mb3  
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Dear Bevan 
 
Please kiv case – Insured has come back to dispute on liability. 
 
We will update you again. 
 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
From: ONG LI LI  
Sent: Monday, 4 June, 2018 2:17 PM 
To: 'Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)'; 'Shu Pei (LKKAuto)' 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; 'Admin A' 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540 Accident involving SKC6525S & PC4270E along Jalan Berseh on 
11/4/18 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18006813/mb3  
 
Hi Bevan 
 
You may put up the mandate approval to us.   
 
Pls take into consideration that TP moved off from the stationary position as reported by 
Insured. 
 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
From: ONG LI LI  
Sent: Friday, 25 May, 2018 9:14 AM 
To: 'Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)'; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540 Accident involving SKC6525S & PC4270E along Jalan Berseh on 
11/4/18 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18006813/mb3  
 
Dear Bevan 
 
Based on OI’s report, TP moved off from stationary position –under BOLA, TP should exercise 
caution as well. 
 
Usually we would expect the claim handler to engage Insured for such contentious case 
before any settlement so as to avoid any disputes later on. 
 
For this case only, I will help you to write to Insured and update you again. 
 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) [mailto:bevanlim@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Friday, 25 May, 2018 8:46 AM 
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To: ONG LI LI; Shu Pei (LKKAuto); GERALD POH WEE BIN; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540 Accident involving SKC6525S & PC4270E along Jalan Berseh on 
11/4/18 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18006813/mb3  
 
Dear Li Li, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We would like to check if we may proceed with Direct settlement. 
 
Based on OI’s GIA  BOLA Scenerio 26 applies. 
 
Kindly let us have your instruction/comments if any. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Bevan Lim | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 
 
 

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 8 May 2018 10:09 AM 
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; ERIC WOO JUN 
KIAT <ericwoo@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) 
<bevanlim@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540 Accident involving SKC6525S & PC4270E along Jalan Berseh on 11/4/18 
***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18006813/mb3  
 
Dear Shu Pei 
 
Please see attached for our Insured’s GIA report that you have requested. 
 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Monday, 7 May, 2018 6:48 PM 
To: ONG LI LI; GERALD POH WEE BIN; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540 Accident involving SKC6525S & PC4270E along Jalan Berseh on 
11/4/18 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18006813/mb3  
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We had inspected TP vehicle PC 4270E at M/s Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd. 
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  
-              TP estimated cost of repair 
-              Preliminary advice 
 
Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our 
necessary action. 
 
Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 17 April 2018 9:05 AM 
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) 
<bevanlim@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540 Accident involving SKC6525S & PC4270E along Jalan Berseh on 11/4/18 
***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18006813/mb3  
 
Dear Shu Pei 
 
Our Insured has not reported the accident yet. 
 
We will follow up with him to lodge the GIA report. 
 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Monday, 16 April, 2018 7:47 PM 
To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; GERALD POH WEE BIN; ONG LI LI 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540 Accident involving SKC6525S & PC4270E along Jalan Berseh on 
11/4/18 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18006813/mb3  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
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This is a TP direct settlement case. 
 
Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action. 
 
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Bevan and he can be contacted at DID: 6749 4274. 
 
Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 13 April 2018 12:09 PM 
To: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540 Accident involving SKC6525S & PC4270E along Jalan Berseh on 11/4/18 
 
Dear Eric, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT [mailto:ericwoo@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Friday, 13 April, 2018 11:18 AM 
To: assignments@lkkauto.com 
Cc: chmotor@singnet.com.sg; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/20540 Accident involving SKC6525S & PC4270E along Jalan Berseh on 11/4/18 
 
Dear Catherine, 
 
Kindly refer to our attachment.        
 
Please proceed to conduct a survey of the vehicle PC 4270E on without Prejudice Basis. 
                                                                                                                                     
    
We look forward to receiving your report soon. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Eric Woo 
Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767 
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