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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, 26 July 2019 2:49 PM
To: Precise Auto Service
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOVLING VEHICLE NO. GY 2779J AND SKR 329C [AIG] ON 12/04/2018
Attachments: LOA.pdf; AIG DV.pdf

Your Ref: GY 2779J/T/18 (SJE)                              Without Prejudice 

Our Ref: CC4/LCR18006812/Apb3 

 
 
Without Prejudice 
(save as to costs) 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We confirm settlement at a global sum of $8,900.00(all-in). 
 
We attach herewith a copy of the DV and LOA for your further action. 
 
Thank you. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: Precise Auto Service <Support@preciseauto.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 2:47 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOVLING VEHICLE NO. GY 2779J AND SKR 329C ON 12/04/2018 
 
Without Prejudice 
To Save Costs 
 
Dear Sirs / Mdm 
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We refer to your above offer. 
 
We would like to request as a global sum at $8,900.00 (all in) 
 
Thank you 
 
Best Regards 
Yan Hong 
 

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

 
On Mon, 27 May 2019 at 10:16, Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Your Ref: GY 2779J/T/18 (SJE)                              Without Prejudice 

Our Ref: CC4/LCR18006812/Apb3 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOVLING VEHICLE NO. GY 2779J AND SKR 329C ON 12/04/2018  

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We propose settlement at a global sum of $7,900.00(all-in). 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Precise Auto Service <Support@preciseauto.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 17 May 2019 6:02 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOVLING VEHICLE NO. GY 2779J AND SKR 329C ON 12/04/2018 

  

Without Prejudice  

  

Your Ref. : -  

Vehicle No. : GY 2779J/T/18 (SJE)  

  

M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd  

  

Dear Ms. Hsiao Tong 

  

We are the repairer for vehicle no. GY 2779J and instructed by the owner, Stib Technologies Pte Ltd, on his behalf to 
submit the claims against your insured's vehicle no. SKR 329C that was involved in the above mentioned accident. 

  

The accident was clearly caused by your insured's negligence. In order to save the legal cost, we will process the claim 
to you directly as follows:  

  

1. Cost of Repair (Surveyed By Mr. Adrian)  $                    6,420.00 (Including GST) 

2. Car Rental (21 days X $120.00)  $                    2,520.00 (Including GST) 

3. LTA / GIA  Search Fee  $                            8.00   

Total :   $                  8,948.00   
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Please let us have your payment in our favour of "Precise Auto Service".  

  

Your prompt reply of the above claims will be much appreciated.  

 
 

Thank You 

  

Best Regards 

Yan Hong 

  

On Fri, 17 May 2019 at 17:41, Precise Auto Service <Support@preciseauto.sg> wrote: 

Without Prejudice  

  

Your Ref. : -  

Vehicle No. : SLR 5500D/T/18(SJE)  

  

M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd  

  

Dear Ms. Hsiao Tong 

  

We are the repairer for vehicle no. GY 2779J and instructed by the owner, Stib Technologies Pte Ltd, on his behalf to 
submit the claims against your insured's vehicle no. SKR 329C that was involved in the above mentioned accident. 

  

The accident was clearly caused by your insured's negligence. In order to save the legal cost, we will process the claim 
to you directly as follows:  

  

1. Cost of Repair (Surveyed By Mr. Adrian)  $                    6,420.00 (Including GST) 
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2. Car Rental (25 days X $200.00)  $                    2,520.00 (Including GST) 

3. LTA / GIA  Search Fee  $                            8.00   

Total :   $                  8,948.00   

  

Please let us have your payment in our favour of "Precise Auto Service".  

  

Your prompt reply of the above claims will be much appreciated.  

 
 

Thank You 

  

Best Regards 

Yan Hong 

--  

  

  

  T : 6745 7367   |   F : 6841 3390 

  E : support@preciseauto.sg 

  W: www.preciseauto.sg 

  A : No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883 

  

 

  Follow us on social media:  
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https://www.instagram.com/preciseautosvs/          

https://twitter.com/preciseautosvs 

https://www.facebook.com/PreciseAutoService/ 

 
 

  

--  

  

  

  T : 6745 7367   |   F : 6841 3390 

  E : support@preciseauto.sg 

  W: www.preciseauto.sg 

  A : No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883 

  

 

  Follow us on social media:  
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https://www.instagram.com/preciseautosvs/          

https://twitter.com/preciseautosvs 

https://www.facebook.com/PreciseAutoService/ 

 
 
 
--  
 
 
  T : 6745 7367   |   F : 6841 3390 
  E : support@preciseauto.sg 
  W: www.preciseauto.sg 
  A : No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883 
 

 
  Follow us on social media:  

https://www.instagram.com/preciseautosvs/          

https://twitter.com/preciseautosvs 
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https://www.facebook.com/PreciseAutoService/ 
 

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

 


