Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 June 2018 4,53 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto); ERIC WOO JUN KIAT

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Qur Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020534  Accident involving SJF 1185T & SJP 7984L at Blk

210 Kovan carpark on 10/4/18

Dear Thin Thin
Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 13 June, 2018 4:05 PM

To: ONG LI LI; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; GERALD POH WEE BIN; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020534 Accident involving SJF 1185T & SIP 7984L at Blk 210 Kovan carpark on
10/4/18

Your ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020534

Dear Sir / Madam,

ACCIDENT ON 10/04/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SJF 1185T AND SIP 7984L

We refer to the above accident.

The accident occurred while Ol turning right and collided with TP vehicle which was driving straight along the drive way.

Basing on the reparts of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.

Summary to offer to repairer M/s Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop is as follows:

TP CLAIMED OUR REVISED
TO OFFER
Cost of Repairs (w/gst) S 2,966.04 52,193.50
Loss of Use 5 600.00($150 x 4 days) S 300.00 00(5100 x 3 days)
LTA Search Fee 5 2.00 S  2.00
TOTAL S 3,568.04 $ 2,495.50

*Surveyor recommended 2 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
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Kindly let us have your approval/instruction/comments for our further negotiating and settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 12 April 2018 5:39 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <sMeikwan@lkkauto.com>; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ericwoo@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G =<mt claim@lonpac.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
<thinthin@|kkauto.com=; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020534 Accident involving SJF 1185T & SJP 7984L at Blk 210 Kovan carpark on
10/4/18

Hi Mei Kwan
Please see attached for our Insured’s GIA report.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 12 April, 2018 5:21 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; ONG LI LI; GERALD POH WEE BIN: Thin Thin {LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020534 Accident involving SJF 11857 & SIP 7984L at Blk 210 Kovan carpark on
10/4/18

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020534
LKK ref: CC4/LPC18006790/ua3

Dear Sir /Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
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Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 April, 2018 9:25 AM

To: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020534 Accident involving SJF 1185T & SIP 7984L at Blk 210 Kovan carpark on
10/4/18

Dear Eric,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(408933)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT [mailto:ericwoo@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 11 April, 2018 5:54 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@|onpac.com>

Subject: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020534 Accident involving SIF 1185T & SJP 7984L at Blk 210 Kovan carpark on 10/4/18

Dear Catherine / Nivitha,

Kindly refer to our attachment.

Please proceed to conduct a survey of the vehicle SIP 7984L on without Prejudice Basis.
We look forward to receiving your report soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767



_____ _THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Date: U2 May 208

Name & Address Of Claimant: Nigiediza et Alebe) bl
c/o: KAN FOOK SING MOTOR WORKSHOP 61 DEFU LANE 12 SINGAPORE 535147
Name & Address Of Third Party Insured: lo_ pac e P s P — SR BN

Eao basch v #1nocjon He concasfe o ofy /omemg 00

Dear Sir/Madam,

Accident involving vehicles ==eo-Gad L & =T |lgeT

on ol w [hjgalony at
tova~ Bl Slhe omee [ = o pacl=s
| am the owner of vehicle registration no: E:Ip‘-'-l-':‘?gq.f__ which was involved in the

above mentioned vehicle registration no: s1cllpeT which | understand is insured
with you,

The accident was clearly caused by your insured's negligence and | am therefore claiming
compensation from you for all financial losses as itemized below:-

1 Repair Costs s¢ 2,193%.50
2 Miscellaneous Items 5SS —
3 Surveyor Fee 5% —
4 LTA/GIA Search Fee 55 .00
5 Loss of Use /

Rental for "L{'_ days @ 5§ 'G5V 0 perday 5% boo o
& Excess 5% o
7 Medical Fee 54 -

TOTAL: 58 2,79%.Co

| enclosed the relevant copies of documents in support of my claims. Your prompt settlement of my claim
would be much appreciated. If you require any other information, please contact my workshop at KAN
FOOK 5ING MOTOR WORKSHOP , 61 Defu Lane 12 Singapore (539147), Tel: 6747 9560 Fax: 6748 1006. |
have authorized the said workshop to deal with my repairs & accept payment in relation to the claim for
repairs/loss of use & execute documents on my behalf for the purpose of my convenience,

Thank you.

Your faithfully

Nug \/l/j _




AUTHORISATION FORM

TO:-

KAN FOOK SING MOTOR WORKSHOP
61 DEFU LANE 12
SINGAPORE 539147

FROM.:-

MAME: i r, ey | L
NRIC ND: S Sihnzes

Dear Sir/Madam
Accident on 1ol |l involving vehicles SdpaBd L & =2r1ellgsT

along/at bove o  ble ol Omen Coc— e

I/We MoV B~ ALY ok e the owner of
vehicle registration no: =1 S99 5| hereby do authorize you. Kan Fook Sing Motor

Workshop to commence repairs to my above mentioned vehicle.

I/ We confirm that Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop is hereby authorized to handle the repairs of my/ our

vehicle and/ or to negotiate and settle any claims relating to the above accident which If We may have

against other third party/ parties or insurers and/ or to instruct lawyers on my/ our behalf to facilitate the

third party claim for me/ us.

Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop is here by authorized to execute and for sign my documents/ discharge

vouchers/ discharge agreements regarding my/ our claim to facilitate my convenience. ALL PAYMENT
WILL BE MADE TO KAN FOOK SING MOTOR WORKSHOP.,

Thank you.

Yours faithfully

I\L‘U'ub Vl h




" & LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO :17/18/18/VP05/020534
DATE : 21 JUNE 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, NORDIN BIN ABDUL RAHMAN confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SJF 1185T the sum of Singapore
Dollars Two_Thousand Four Hundred Ninetv Five and Cents Fiftyv Only
($2.495.50) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of property claim
competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of
property claim sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest.
arising either directly or indirectly from an accident to my vehicle, SJP 79841 on 10
APRIL 2018 ALONG KOVAN BLK 210 OPEN CARPARK

[ /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (CHEANG CHENG
LYE/LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever
made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize vou to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S KAN
FOOK SING MOTOR WORKSHOP

I[/'We hereby acknowledge that this pavment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

MName of vehicle owner/Date



B 1% 2 # % 1 K TAX INVOICE

KAN FOOK SING MOTOR WORKSHOP No. 44957

Headguarter: 61 Defu Lane 12, Singapore 539147
Tel: (65) 6747 9560, 6743 5344, 6858 4361 « Fax: (B5) 6748 1006, 6281 8428

E-mall: ryan@kanfs.net / patricia@kanfs.net

Branch: 1 Kaki Bukit Avenua & #01-13. Singapore 417883 Business Reg. Mo, 22 1466-00E
Tel: (55) 6481 5150 = Fax: (65) 6481 BEA3 GET Reg. No. Ma-0005333-E
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD INVOICE NO : 44952
300 BEACH ROAD #17-04/07 THE CONCOURSE SINGAPORE
VEHICLE NO. : S5JP7984L
ACCIDENT DATE : 10-04-2018 17:45
THIRD PARTY REF. : SJF11BST

ATTH: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT.

INVOICE COST OF REPAIRS TO VEICLE SJP79B4L SAAB 95

QTY  PARTS DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (SG
LABOUE CHARGES
1 LUMP S5UM REPAIRS 2050.00
TOTAL  CEERE R | 2,080.00
TOTAL REPAIR COST A 2,080.00
G 8T - 143 .50
INVOICE AMOUNT Y 2,1_"—}3.5{]

IN PANEL-BEATING & BODY-WORK, OUR WORKSHOP 15 WELL-EQUIPPED WITH THE LATEST TECHNOLOGY --- CELETTE BENCH PULLER SYSTEM
WHICH ENABLE US TO MEASURE CORRECTLY & REPAIR MANY DIFFERENT KINDS OF DAMAGES, SERIOUS DAMAGES TO THE FLOOR-BOARD
CHASSIS & WHEEL-HOUSING CAN BE RESTORED BACK TO THE ACCORDING MEASUREMENT. WE ARE ABLE TO REPAIR & RESTORE ANY BADLY
DAMAGED VEHICLE BACE TO ITS ORIGINAL SPECIFICATIONS TO ENSURE BAFETY WHILE DRIVING.

TEM G i B R » A LN R o SEMEODHERE o Scoul Bk R b B o E LR R TP - A W] A R o AR A A AR -



Invoice Page ] of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
'NSURANCE Phone. +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
i ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Menday to Friday Sam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M40001 7735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Raf Ne: GR-18-054414
Date of Regquest: 11/04/2018 Your Ref No: Onling Purchase

Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop
Mo, 61 Defu Lane 12

Singapore 539147

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 11/04/2018

Enguiry By Margarel Lee

TP Vehicle Mo, SJF1185T

Accident Date 10/04/2018

Enquiry Result

[TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SJF1185T Lonpac Insurance Bhd 20/05/2017-19/05/2018 +65 62507388
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reparts forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any
lpss or damage arising out of of in connection with the repons ar their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://www.giarme.org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_genin... 11/4/2018
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; GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #16-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours; Monday to Friday S9am to Spm
istrati W4
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE CST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Cur Ref No: GR-18-054414
Date of Request: 11/04/2018 Your Ref No: Onling Furchase
Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop
Mo. 61 Defu Lane 12
Singapore 539147
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 11/04/2018
Enguiry By Margaret Lee
TP Wehicle Mo, SJF1185T
Accident Date 10/04/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (3%)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GET Amount 0.13
Total Amaount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRC [] Cash | ] Cheque

https://www.giarme,org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_genin... 11/4/2018



