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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE*

VEHICLE 50 : SHB 4222U

=

DATE 11/4/2018 14:12

Q

MAKE i 3-1'_’
MODEL : HYUNDAL i40
ty Paris Description/ Labour Tvpe Unit Price Amount
Rear Bumper - w $ 603604
Rear Bumper Under Cover Sttt fae S 22500 |7
ﬁ‘_ - 6_1-', fo'J o fe F
SUB TOTAL 5 R28.60
LESS 20% 5 165.72
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 5 662,88
Rear Bumper Reverse Sensor X M 5 135.70 [Nett
Rear Bumper Rubber Mat  #~ MO v S S0.00 |Nett
Rear Fender Advernsement Logo (LH R!I}*"'j"’ 100,00 | 8 200000 |Nett
S 38570
Labour Charge a0
Panel Beating $ 25700
Spray Painting Charge 5 2560 |2#°
Wiring Charge $ S(a| <
R/Refix Reverse Sensor 5 |IWF1#
TOTAL LABOUR s GT0.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL
[ alk ( HH
Je / % r,{ / ‘:‘J & é’ )
2 / &
7
¥ f
This is an mitial estimate based on o visual mspection vehicle. The linal repatr quontum will
be prepared afier the velucle 18 surveved by a motor Survevor appointed by the imsurance company.




Hsiao Tnnﬂ {LKI{Autn!

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 October 2018 12:02 PM

To: Jim Waong See Pah'

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Your Ref T D418/SHB42221/ JWist) *Our Ref. CC3/EQI1BO0GTB0/KTma3 [ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SKP 7864M(EQ) /SHB 4222U/ OTHERS ON 11/04/2018]

Your Ref: T0418/SHB4222U/ JW(st) Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC3/EQI18006780/K 1ma3

Dear Sirs/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP 7844M(EQ) /SHB 42220/ OTHERS ON 11/04/2018
We refer 1o the above matier

We propose seffiement at a global sum of $1,430.00(all-in).
Flease confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on
our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter{s) in
respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settlement arising from this affer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject (o production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher [for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all eriginal documents shall be retained by us after we have made
payment on the settlement sum."”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 67g42-4197 | emml; chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)
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From: Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 October 2018 12:13 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuta)

Ce: Admin A

Subject: Re: Your Ref T 0418/SHB4222U/ IW(st) *Our Ref: CC3/EQIT8006780/K1ma3

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP 7B64M(EQ) /SHB 42220/ OTHERS ON 11/04/2018]

Dear Ms Chew

Please process settlement in sum $ 1430.00 for resolving our property damage claim amicably,
Thank you.

Best Regards

Jim Wong
Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com=>
Sent: Wednesday, 24 October 2018 12:01 PM

To: Jim Wong See Pah

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Your Ref: T 0418/SHBA4222U/ JW(st) *Our Ref: CC3/EQI18006780/K1ma3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP
7864M(EQ) /SHB 4222U/ OTHERS ON 11/04/2018]

Your Rel: TO4A18/SHBA222U/ JW(st) Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC3/EQI18006780/K1ma3

Dear Sirs/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP 7864M[EQ) /SHB 42220/ OTHERS ON 11/04,/2018

We refer o the above matter.

We propose setlement at a global sum of $1.430.00{all-in),
Please confirm acceplance.

“Please nate that our above settlement Is made on a withoul prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on
our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in
respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter Is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher [for
settlement sum above 520,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made
payment on the settlement sum.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhi@lidauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This message and any anschments may contain confidential privilieged of proprietary information If yau s nof the litended recipient. kindly notity
1% gnd dels this messags and i attachmants immedistsly. and please be adviied thil using. cooying distribuling of disclosing any comants
theroin i not alicwsd, Siotements pertaining 1o any matter oulside our business are nol to be iaken as endorsed by ComfoDeliGro Corporation
Lumited or s related compames The comments/propasals provided are for dscussion purposes only and s subject 10 @pprovils. Nollimg hemen
shall constitute a binding agresment bebwesn the paries Neliher party shall be bound in any way to any term o condition excepl as agrsed ih a
writtan agrasmeant signed by the duly authatsed repressniatives of both parties

ComfortDGro - a Gresn Offica cerfified Ly the Singapote Environment Counch - i cormmiftad o presening fhe snvwonment. We encourage you
ke poird this only f pecessary

ComfartDeiGro Enginesnng Fia Lia [Regstration No  169506048W]




COMFORIDELGRO

Our Ref T 0418/ SHB4222U /JW(st) ENG!NEERINC’

Your ref : -

Date : 23-Apr-18 COGE Taxl Claims Dept eyt
58 Loyang Deive 4th Fir

EQ Insurance Company Limited Singapors 508360

5 Maxwell Road, MND Complex

#17-00 Tower Block

Singapore 069110

Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXISHB4222U YOUR INSURED SKP7864M

AND OTHER 3 VEHICLES ON 11.04.18

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor
Vehicle No - SHB4222U which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle, The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concermned have requested and authorized us to
assist them In presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving SKP7864M
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 1,177.00

2 2 days Loss of Rental @ $ 11928 perday $ 23856

3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by Mis LKK) $ -

4 LTA Search Fees $ 7.49

§ GIA/Police Report Fees 5 -

& Towing / Medical / Transparation Fees =
SubTotal: § 1423.05

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 2 dayslossofincome@ $§ B80.00 perday $ 160.00

Total Claims: § 1,583.05
We enclose herewith the folluwing documents to support the claims; -

a) Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs : 4 pcs
b) LTA search slip/s of . SKP7864M
¢) GIA/ Police report/s of : SHB4222U

d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ ) Wilness statement/s [ ) Towing/Medical bilireceipts ( ) Cerificate of Insurance
{ ® ) Photograph/s of Accident Scene ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record { x ) Rental Rate letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
soon as possible

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully

Jim Wong

Deputy Manager

CDGE Claims Department

Tel : 6214 BA74 Fax: 6214 1843 Email : jimwong@Ecdge com.2g

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

COMFORIDELGRO (-
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Our Ref: CC3/EQI18006780/K I ma3
18 APRIL 2018

ROSET LIMOUSINE SERVICES PTE LTD
53 Ubi Ave |

#03-47 Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408934

Atn; The Management

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP 7864M/ SHB 42220/ OTHERS ON 11/04/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by vour motor insurer, EQ Insurance Company Ltd to deal with the third party
claim against your policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authonized driver had amongst
other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the
appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with
third party claimant.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD — if applicable) will be with held for
the time being. Pending for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal EQ
INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,
)

A

Beyan Li

Case Handler
DID: 6749 4274
FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: Bevanlim@|lkkauto.com

c.C EQ INSURANCE COMFPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Dept)



CDG.VARS.V. LettofAuthorisation Page 1 of |

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(MAF | PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SONATA SHB4222U , SKP7B64M , UNKNO... ON 11-Apr-18 08:15
ALONG PIE(AIRPORT) BF EUNOS FLYOVER
1/ We JOACHIM GIBSON GOH ... (Hirer) NRIC No.: S6912320A
and/or (Relief) NRIC No.:

Tax) Numper SHBa4222U
hersghy authorise ComfortDelGro Enginesring Pte Ltd{CDGE)!

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, ncluding lass of Income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs

2. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amount in respect of my/four claim
against third party (except personal wnjures and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/four bahailf,
4. To accept any payment [claim proceeds) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque

shall be forward directly to CDGE in accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of
“ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date 11-Apr-2018

Mame of Hirar JOACHIM GIBSON GOH QUEE TECK

Hirer NRIC S6912320A Signature

Address 338 UBI AVENUE 1 #02-8B61
4D0D338

Contact Nao. 96519009

http://cdgek2srv:82/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/View/CDG. V... 11/04/2018
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GST REG. NO, mmmr—a
i a7 1 n"'l":!¢ :
R INSURANCE Company BTR T 05108717, 04 2015
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Our Ref: CT18040273

Lomlort

| g

Date: 17 Apnl 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirlMadam

ACCIDENT ON 11/04/2018 @ 08:15hrs

ALONG PIE(AIRPORT) BF EUNOS FLYOVER
INVOLVING SKP7864M, UNKNOWN, UNKNOWN, SLEZ2929P

We refer to the abiove-mentioned accident and wish to Inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHB4222U (the "Taxi"). The Taxl was hired to JOACHIM GIBSON GOH
QUEE TECK IC NO S6912320A & registered hirer-operator of Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd at the time of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a
rental rate $119.28 per day (inclusive of GST),

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with India International Insurance Pte
Ltd on a third party basis at the material time of the accident

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said acciden! with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yaours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline 65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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Enquire Vehicle Insurer
Vehicle Moo Incldent DatedTlime Sagreh Stalus  [isurance Company Code Insurance Company Name
SKEP7B&4M 11 Apr 2018/ 08:15:00 Successiul ED4 EC) INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Previous oK

SHIL L1 v A
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Pre Lid Company Registration No. 189607 198R

] UBLAVE L, #0225 PAYA URINDUSTHRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 400913 TEL : (0651 62541561 FAX (06381 625643)

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 09/11/2018

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Vehicie NG SKP 7864M (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DMCFHQ17-000185
SHB 42220 (TP Veh) |Our Ref No.: CC3/EQI18006780/K1pa3q2
Date of Accident 11/4/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost ' 3 1,177.00
Loss of Income ' 3 75.00 1.5 days
Rental (If any) '$ 17892 | 1.5 days
Others: '3 7.49
79
1,438.41

Final Settlement Sum |: § 1,430.00 |GLOBAL SUM

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD '§ 1,430.00

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




’ U V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
-y 51 Uibi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX® G256 4315

Reg. Mo 109607158R GST Reg, No. 18-9607188-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCIEQI1BI0ETBO/K 1pada2
T [N
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date  09-11-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
1; Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKP 7BE4M Veh. Inspected SHB 42220
Policy No. DMCFHQ17-000185 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 11/04/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.C 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. EMHLB41UMFUDEST21 Colour BLUE
Odometer 487128 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Frant Tyre |[205/80 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre [205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[205/80 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR F'CIRTIGN-
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date _ 11/0412018 [Inspection Date 1110422018
Survey heid at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
58 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508269
Sa. Remarks Il
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 2 Working Days




’ V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AdE BE = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #0125 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL B258 1581 FAX: G255 4315
Reg Mo 18860T188R GST Reg. No. 19-8807188-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHBE 42221
Description of Parts Condition | =simara By | Our A%
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 603.60 603 60
1|REAR BUMPER UNDER COVER SCRATCHED 22500 22500
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 2200 22 00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -170.12 -170.12
68048 580 48
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 135.70 -
1|REAR BUMPER RUBBER MAT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
2|REAR FENDER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (LH/RH) NECESSARY 200.00 200.00
@$100.00 (SN)
38570 250.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING 25000 200.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE 250 00 200 00
WIRING CHARGE NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
R/REFIX REVERSE SENSOR 120 00 20.00
670.00 420,00
GRAND TOTAL 1,736.18 1,350.48
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS “IE i 310000
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) |
Report Ref No. CC3/EQI18006780/K1pa3q2
[
r
KALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor | Investigator Automotive Assessor

DOECLAMER OF LIABILITY 70 THIRD PARTIES - This Bepan is made saleby for the des snd banelit of the Clent named an fhe tront peges of Mie Sepor.




