Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 13 April 2018 4:05 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP050/20535 RE: SJQ7247B & SJQ8990L Involving accident at

Seletar Expressway towards Woodlands Mandai Exit on 10/04/2018 @ 00:00 hrs ***LKK
REF:CC4/LPC18006752/Kwb3
Attachments: 13042018160213.pdf

Dear Shu Pei,

Attached insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 13 April, 2018 1:45 PM

To: ONG LI LI; GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Admin A; MT_Claim_SG; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP050/20535 RE: SJQ7247B & SJQ8990L Involving accident at Seletar Expressway
towards Woodlands Mandai Exit on 10/04/2018 @ 00:00 hrs ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18006752/Kwb3
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SJQ 7247B at M/s Autoworx House.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Enclosed for your perusal is:

- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Our case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 April 2018 10:17 AM

To: 'ONG LI LI' <llong@lonpac.com>; 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments
<assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP050/20535 RE: SJQ7247B & SJIQ8990L Involving accident at Seletar Expressway
towards Woodlands Mandai Exit on 10/04/2018 @ 00:00 hrs

Dear Li Li,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 12 April, 2018 9:55 AM

To: admin@supreme.sg; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments@lkkauto.com; Catherine Chong (LKK
Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Dylan Chew' <autoworxhouse@hotmail.com>

Subject: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP050/20535 RE: SJQ7247B & SJQ8990L Involving accident at Seletar Expressway towards
Woodlands Mandai Exit on 10/04/2018 @ 00:00 hrs

Without Prejudice
Dear Amanda

Thank you for your email. We are appointing LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey your
client’s vehicle.

Dear Catherine (LKK)
fya

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706



From: admin@supreme.sg [mailto:admin@supreme.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 11 April, 2018 5:41 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: 'Dylan Chew'

Subject: SJQ7247B & SJQ8990L Involving accident at Seletar Expressway towards Woodlands Mandai Exit on
10/04/2018 @ 00:00 hrs

Dear Sirs,

Attached our request for Pre- repair Inspection.

Our Client GIA e-filed accident report will be forward to you once we get hold a copy of it.
Thank you.

Best regards,

Amanda Bee

Supreme Auto Service Pte Ltd
No0.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 64528211

Fax: 64517423



