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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Lbi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607108R GST Reg. No. 19-0607108-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01

Ref : CC4/ASM1BO06747/Gual

AXA TOWERSINGAPORE 068811 s u “”“IINNHM | m
Code : ASM
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBA 2693H Veh. Inspected SLH 4383E
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SemooDac Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 12/04/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Req.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer . Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5, General Information
Accident Date  10/04/2018 |Inspaction Date 12/04/2018
Survey held at ALLSWELL MOTOR TRADERS
100 JALAN SULTAN #02-41
SULTAN PLAZA
SINGAPORE 198001
5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.







4/12/2018 Claim Paortal

4 Service Request Details

SEMOODGC KK AUTO COMSULTANTS PTE LT (TP} =
Reference
None ¢*
Loss Date
April 10, 2018
1020 0
Request Diate "”'Q\Ll"ﬁ'l \QO Q
April 11, 2018 'Bq'[\ ‘ﬂ‘l’\ 1
ULI[-_.‘ Date Qﬁﬂw&'\ m@
April 18, 2018 i q
5 ijl’ﬁ\l \
Vendor Mame
LEKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD(TF)
6.

Type of Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement
Actions

Mext Step
Agree to perform service

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SLH4393E

Make
TPVD TOYOTA

https:/'vp.smartclaims.axa com,.sgiclaim-partal/himlfindex-vendor-service-requests. himi#/service-requests/?serviceRequestNumbaer=39544



4122018 Claim Portal

SErVICE AQQaress

Primary Contact/Insured

LIANG SENG HENG INDUSTRIES PTE LIMITED
184 TAGORE LANME, 787582, Singapore
63361811

ACIA1976@HOTMAILSG

Claim Handler

LOH Cynthia
6568804843
cynthia.loh@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

Messages Invaoices History Documents Assessment Metrics MNotes

hrtps:.Wp.smartcialms.a::a.curn.sg.fc:laim—pd}r‘lal.ﬂhlmlfindax—wndur—:sawloe-mquﬁsts.htrnl#.’sani'n:avﬂequesisi?sﬂwicaﬂﬂquasthlumheﬁﬂgﬁdﬂ



Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 10:45 AM
To: 00|, Ben; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A; account5 leasing; CS A Team
Subject: RE: Letter of Demand SLH4393E - 3rd party claim against AXA insured GBA2693H
(DOA: 10.04.2018) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18006747/Gpa3
Attachments: SLH4393E-Invoice-agreement-TP search.pdf; 2018-04-10_13-58-14-Normal.avi
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE”
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Please note that this case has been re-assigned to Hsiao Tong,

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 oos5 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: 00|, Ben <ben@allswellmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 8 December, 2018 10:54 AM

To: motor.survey@axa.com.sg

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; account5 leasing <account5@allswellmotor.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Letter of Demand SLH4393E - 3rd party claim against AXA insured GBA2693H (DOA: 10.04.2018)

Dear AXA,

Resend due to typo error on the subject our vehicle is SLH4393E

Truly
OOI, Ben

Allswell Motor Traders

25, Defu Lane 9

Singapore 539266

Office: +65 6679 1146

Watknle: +65 9147 B545

Email ban | Iy T,

On Fri, Dec 7, 2018 at 8:17 PM QOI, Ben <ben@allswellmotor.com.sg> wrote:
Dear AXA ( claim department )



Strictly for property damage claim only
Letter of Demand
We are pleased to write to you for demand of payment of the repaired works for SLH4393E

Attached are the replacement/agreement, TP search and tax invoice for your kind and immediate actions.

Please acknowledge receipt of Letter of Demand within 02 weeks of this email.

Truly
00I, Ben

Allswell Mator Traders
25, Defu Lane 9
Singapore 533266
Office: +65 6679 1146
mriohile: +65 9147 8545

Email: ben@allswellmotor.com.sg



51/2019

«

https:vp.smariclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/htmlfindex-vendor-service-requests htmi# service-requests/view-message/ ?service RequestNumbe. ..

Claim Portal

<MANDATE IA> - S8M00ODQC [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
GBA 2693H(Ol) & SLH 4393E(TP) ON 10/04/2018]

Type
@ Question

Message

Liability: 100%, Insured driver reversed and hot anto third party parked vehicle. Inform Ol about third party
claim. Agreed to settle at best and aware NCD issue. We seek your mandate at $2.872.80(all-in). Mandate 1A
had been uploaded in Smartclaims. Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. Hsiao Tong - 01 May 2019

3

11



F Auto
.ir _Ff F‘/ Consultants

Py Piw Lid Caompany Registration No, 199807T158R

SLURLAVE |, #0225 PAYVA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL @ (065) 62363561 FAX : (65 h2564115

Immediate Advice

To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 01/05/2019
Survey Details:
Date of loss 10.04.2018
Date of appointment 11.04.2018
Date of survey 12.04.2018
Location of survey ALLSWELL MOTOR TRADERS
Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: Third party
Vehicle number SLH 4393E
Make and Model Toyota Axio Hybrid 1496¢cc
Date of registration 02.11.2016
Excess
Market Value/ Book Value S 65,000.00 |(est)
Parf/COE Rebate 5 47,353.00 |(est)
MNett Value,/ ERV 5 17,647.00 |{est)
Repair details:
Initial Estimate B 3,065.70
Proposed/Revised repair cost:
Parts S 1,317.15
Check items (estimate) MIL
Labour 5 200.00
Supplementary NIL
Total 5 2,117.15
Lump Sum(if applicable)

|Numher of days for repair

| =




w Ausfo
f ?'./ .[f_? Consultants
s WA B Pra Lid SCompany Registration Mo, 199607 194R

S1UBIAVE L #0225 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SIN(; APORE 409933 TEL : (065) 625035681 FAX @ (65 2564315

Remarlks:

TP video shows that OID had hit onta TP parked vehicle.
4 recommended repair days + 1Sunday 1PRS = &days

Mandate:

Liability(TP) 100%

Proposed repair cost (w/GST) 5 2,265.35

Loss of use MNIL

Loss of rental 5 600.00 (6days x 5100.00)
Loss of income MIL

LTA/GIA search fees 5 7.45

Others NIL

Proposed Total S 2,872.80




5;1 12019 Claim Portal

« O TEKS 6o MINRQG IACCIDENT P) ON
~10/04/2018]

Type
@ Question

Message
MANDATE APPROVED

nttps {ivp smartclaims, axa.com sgiclaim-peralhtmlfindex-ve ndor-service-requests himi#/service-reque stsfview-message/TsernviceRequestNumbe... 11



Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto)
= ——= = —%— = =

From: 00|, Ben <ben@allswellmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 18 May 2019 12:58 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; account5 leasing

Subject: Re: Letter of Demand SLH4393E - 3rd party claim against AXA insured GBA2693H

(DOA: 10.04.2018) *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18006747/Gpa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Thank you for your understanding. Much appreciated.
We agreed and confirmed the offer of $2,870.00. Thank you

Please forward us the DV as soon as possible.

Truly
QO01I, Ben

Allswell Motor Traders
25, Defu Lane 9
Singapore 539266
Office: +65 6679 1145
Maobile: +65 9147 8545

Email: henBallswellmotor,com.se

On Sat, May 18, 2019 at 12:05 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below email.

We are prepared to revise our offer at a global sum of $2,870.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice

1



engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: 00|, Ben <ben@allswellmotor.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 17 May 2019 11:49 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; accounts leasing <account5@allswellmotor.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Letter of Demand SLH4393E - 3rd party claim against AXA insured GBA2693H (DOA: 10.04.2018) ***
LKK REF: CC4/ASM18006747/Gpa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

(Without Prejudice)

Thank you for your email...

However, we reject the global sum of all-in @ $2,630.00. It has never been a lump sum or global sum. Is part by
part.

See attached in/out form and replacement. Sat/Sun included...

Please expedite this case as it has been 12 months late. We will take further legal actions if necessary if this case is
further delay...



Truly

QO0I, Ben

Allswell Motar Traders
25, Defu Lane 9
Singapors 539266
Office: +65 6679 11456

Mabile: #65 9147 8545

Email: ben@allswellmotor.com.sg

On Fri, May 17, 2019 at 10:43 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote;
Without Prejudice

(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter,

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $2,630.00(all-in).

Flease confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice

engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other
related claims.”



Best Regards,
i
| Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Autoe Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 10:45 AM

To: 00I, Ben <ben@allswellmotor.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; account5 leasing <accoun liswellmotor.com.sg>; CS A Team <cs-

| a@kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Letter of Demand SLH4393E - 3rd party claim against AXA insured GBA2693H (DOA: 10.04.2018) ***
LKK REF: CC4}’ASM130GE?4?{'Gpa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE"

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

‘ Please note that this case has been re-assigned to Hslao Tong.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin

LEEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@|kkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: 00|, Ben <ben@allswellmotor, 5E>
Sent: Saturday, 8 December, 2018 10:54 AM
To: motor.survey@axa.com.sg

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; account5 leasing <account5@allswellmotor.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Letter of Demand SLH4393E - 3rd party claim against AXA insured GBA2693H (DOA: 10.04.2018)

Dear AXA,

Resend due to typo error on the subject our vehicle is SLH4393E

Truly

00T, Ben

Altswell Motor Traders
25, Defu Lane 9
Singapore 539266
Office: +65 6679 1146

Maokrile; +Hb5 9147 B545

Ermaili lsweell LLEHT,

On Fri, Dec7, 2018 at 8:17 PM OO, Ben <ben@allswellmotor.com.sg> wrote:

Dear AXA ( claim department )

[ EIE’:HE for propery gamgge claim only
Letter of Demand

| | Weare pleased to write to you for demand of payment of the repaired works for SLH4393E
Aftached are the replacement/agreement, TP search and tax invoice for your kind and immediate actions.

' | Please acknowledge receipt of Letter of Demand within 02 weeks of this email.

5



Truly

001, Ben

Allswell Motor Traders
25, Defu Lane 9
singapora 539266
Cffice: +65 6679 1146

Molxile: +65 9147 B545

Emall: ben@alliwelimotor.com.sg



THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
Vehicle No: GBA 2693H (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA AXIO HYBRID
SLH 4393E (TP veh)
Date of Accident: | 10/04/2018
Global Sum Settlement | : I [X] Yes | [ 1 Mo
Repair Estimate -5 3,280.30
Final Repair Cost - § 2,265.35
Loss of Use it days at $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) : 8 600.00 6 days
LTA | GIA Search Fee 1B T.45
Others: |: 5|
Final Settlement Sum (GLOBAL SUM) 2,870.00

below)

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered?

[

] YES [X]

NO (Kindly indicate

A) For Mon GIA Registered Workshop:

Agreed Liability

100 (%)

BOLA Liability:

B) For GlA Registered Workshop:

(%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

Assessed Liability () (%)

* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |ALLSWELL MOTOR TRADERS

2,870.00

NUR SHAQILAH BTE ABDOL
WAHAB

18/06/2018

Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report/ Bill {if any)



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i Sl S 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408033
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 189607198R. GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Intermationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CC4/ASM18006747/Gpads2
A TONERSINGAPORE G561 oue.aozmre | U
ATTN: CYNTHIA LOH Code : ASM
i Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBA 2693H Veh. Inspected SLH 4393E
Policy No. GA193028M1 Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. S8mooDQc Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From CYNTHIA LOH Asgsign Date 11/04/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA AXIC HYBRID c.C 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. NKE1657135375 Colour BLACK
Odometer 119285 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [185/55R15 FALKEN 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/55R15 FALKEN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/55R15 FALKEN 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/55R15 FALKEN 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION AND UNDERCARRIAGE.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  10/04/2018 Inspection Date 12/04/2018
Survey held at ALLSWELL MOTOR TRADERS
100 JALAN SULTAN #02-41
SULTAN PLAZA
SINGAPCORE 198001
5a, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

-[ESTII".I'IATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




' V4 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

BdE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo.:1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLH 4393E

: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Q Description of Parts Condition s o
y P il Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|LH SHOCK ABSORBER (CONSISTENT) BENT 499.30 499 30
1|LH FRONT FENDER {(CONSISTENT) BUCKLED 5895.20 585.20
1|LH FRONT FEMDER INNER SHIELD (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 291.10 161.60
1|LH FRONT LOWER ARM (CONSISTENT) BENT 478.10 478.10
2|UH INNER SHIELD CLIPS @ $11.00 (COMNSISTENT) MECESSARY 2200 2200
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -438.05
1,885.70 131715
LABOUR
DISMANTLE / ASSEMBLY OF LOWER ARM & SHOCK 260.00 200.00
ABSORBER.
DISMANTLE AND ASSEMELY OF R/H FENDER AND 260.00 200.00
INMNER SHIELD
SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED PART LH FENDER & LH 660.00 400.00
FRONT DOOR.
1.180.00 800.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,065.70 2,117.15
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS il | | 211748

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18006747/Gpa3s2

e

XING GUO QIANG HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor
Automotive Assessor

DIBCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made salely for the use and benef of the Client named on the front page of this Reporn.




