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ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST/ ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C

Quotation
From : Customer :
"PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
C/O 51 DEFU LANE 10 18 SIN MING LANE
539216 #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573860
Officer in Charge ; TAN LIM MOTOR
Tel Attn
Email Tel
Fax
Quotation No : QO18/04-1120 Quotation Date : 09/04/2018 Terms : 30 DAYS
icle No : SLM4SE0E Chassis No : JMBBN22ABHD 147227 Third Party Insurer :
del : MAZDA 3 Date of Accident ;
Remarks : TP INSURER: lll. INSURED VEHICLE NO: SHA7793Z. DATE OF ACCIDENT: 07.04 2018
| ITEM | DESCRIPTION | ary | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (SGD)|
1 PANEL BEATING, KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTEN THE NECESSARY 1 3000000 2D o 2 300.00

PORTION, REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF PARTS, ADJUST AND
REALIGN THE SAME. REPAIR RH REAR FENDER AND REAR
BUMPER

2 PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED PORTION 1 550.0000 Wc) 550.00

ot Mr‘//
A Yl

Ll plhrts EHerrepe
&
20//0 ¢
I e Fl7 % 622

ning
| TESUNEY

« Framuhos’ basa 2

jln Wl
g rveved ang
frrem Insutance CompaTy

Sub Total B50.00
GST(7.00%) 50.50
Total (SGD) 809,50

Please conduct the survey a
Pegasus Engineering @ Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd ¢/o 51 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 538216

hitp://54.255.197.135:81 18/v50foldersetadmin/v30stringvenda/v30master/contentadmin/sal_quo_viewl... 10/04/2018



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Page 1 of 2

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner I1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Company
7200G

SLM4990E

No

20 Apr 2018

MAZDA

MAZDA3 4-DOOR SEDAN 1.5L SP.6EAT
Blue

2017

P520435732
JM6BN22ABH0147227
88.0 kW (118 bhp)
$14,640.00

31 Mar 2017

31 Mar 2017

0

$9.640.00

Yes
30 Mar 2027
$7.230.00

30 Mar 2027

A - Car upto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$50,789.00

$45,423.00

$52,653.00

Please note that the National Environment Agency (NEA) is offering an incentive of up to
$3,500 for owners of older, more pollutive motorcycles which were registered before 1 July
2003, to de-register their motorcycles on or before 5 April 2023.

The last registered owner of this motorcycle will receive $2,000 if it is de-registered on or
before 5 April 2023. If this motorcycle's COE is not renewed on or after 7 April 2018, the last
registered owner will receive an additional $1,500 upon its de-registration on or before 5

April 2023.

https:/vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereglnput ?FUNCTION _ID=F030... 20-Apr-18



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 April 2018 10:25 AM

To: Pegasus Engineering; 'sur@Ikkauto.com'; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc Sundari Nagarajan - |lI

Subject: RE: Third party survey - SLM4990E Your insured: SHA7793Z DOA: 07.04.2018

Attachments; 10042018103745.pdf; GIA REPORT - SLM4930E PDF

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SLM4990E and let us have your report urgently. ! |
.60am 4118

This claim will be handled by Ms Sundari. 165 ©u 6

n() ( ﬂ“df'm-
"Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen. pes @{) * |
el pot In

Thank You. vehi

Eest Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

€4 Cecil Street | #05 108 Bullding | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Pegasus Engineering [mailto:claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg)

Sent: 10 April, 2018 5:51 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Third party survey - SLM4990E Your insured: SHA7793Z DOA: 07.04.2018

Dear Gabriel,

We will like to appoint LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey our vehicle (SLM4990E).

Thanks & Regards,

Alvin Low
CT

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
51 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539216

Tel : 6858 1846
Fax : 6487 6070

Email  :claiims@pegasusengrg.com.sg
On Tue, Apr 10,2018 at 12:00 PM, Motor Claim - [1] <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir / Mdm,



We acknowledge receipt of your email,

We proprose using one of the following motar surveyors:
|

» LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
* Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Lid

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

| Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

| 64 Cecll Street | £05 108 Bullding | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Pegasus Engineering [mailto:claims @pegasusengrg.com.sg)
Sent: 10 April, 2018 11:13 AM

To: Motar Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Cc: Lalitha Krishnan - 1l <lalitha @ili.com.sg>; Lawrence 5im <lawrencesim usen m.Sg>

Subject: Third party survey - SLM4990E Your insured: SHA7793Z DOA: 07.04.2018

Your Ref; SHATTE3Z

Qur Ref: SLM4880E

DOA: 07.04.2018

Without Prejudice

Dear All,



| ‘We refer to the above matter

We enclose the following documents for your attention -
a. Copy of our client's SAS report and damaged photos;
b. Copy of the estimated cost of repair

Pursuant to paragraph 2.3 of Pre-Action Protocal for NIMA Cases, please let us have a list of 10 motor surveyors for our
selection and please let us know within 2 working days whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of our
client's vehicle. If we do not hear from you within the stipulated timeline. our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle
without further reference to you.

In the event that you request for post repair inspection pursuant to paragraph 4.1 under the NIMA Protocol, you must
compensate our client for the loss of use of his/her vehicle for the day that the inspection is conducted.

In addition, please confirm in writing whether you are agreeable Lo direct settle with us at 100% liability for this case.

The vehicle is currently not in our premises.

Thanks & Regards,
| Alvin Low

-CT

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

' 51 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539216

| Tel : 6858 1846
Fax : 6487 6070

Email : claims(@pegasusengrg.com.sg

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.
If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination
of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be

3



' Tnitercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.
Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission
or any modification.
Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
' India International Insurance Pte Ltd,
Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



Vivian Lau SLKI{Autu!

From: Vivian Lau [LKKAuUtD)

Sent: Maonday, 23 April, 2018 10:34 AM

To: ‘Pegasus Engineering'

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuUto)

Subject: Your Ref: SLM 4990E Our Ref CC4/1I1B006697/Uwb3 Accident involving SLM
4990F & SHA 7793Z ON 07/04/2018

Attachments: SHA T793Z MP4; Sketch Plan pdf

WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: SLM 4990E
Our Ref: CC4/11118006697/Uwh3

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident involving SLM 4990FE & SHA 7793Z ON 07/04/2018
We refer 1o the above matter

Our insured driver has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client. Your client
swerved into our Insured’s lane

We attached herewith our insured’s accident report and our insured’s video for your perusal.
Under such circumstances, we have our principal’s instruction to deny liability of your client’s claim,

As such, we will close the matter at our end.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter ix purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intemtton of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability. whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred fram this negotiation of terms/settlement

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
ixsues of labilinw'damages, ¢ither party ix not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lan| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@|kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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wWe

|CLAIM SUSFOLDER TRACKING e — —
Case | Notified Est Submitted Adj Assignes |AdjRpt | Ad] Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status -
[ | 30 Apr 2018 [ | Pending for Survey
il 12 Apr 2018 00:06 S$600.00 5560000

I [ | Report
| S | EHI‘IM]“P‘I Eﬂ*nlm[_ mml | l lel‘.ll'l:llll

Claim Details

(CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS - [Created by adjuster]

Insured: | COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Ca feg No.:-

Maery :

Clbimang; | OMAB RENTALS PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 2016172006

[Vahicl Reg, | . |D7/D4/2018 21100 - :59 =

| Mo SLM4990E | Date of LOSSE | 112 Months and 7 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥ri]

|Claim Type: | TP 7 MCT18040217 RocyiCove | MCOMOO1S

' - | Note No.

Vehicie Reg. | |

Ne. SHA7793Z oy Ne. | A2a06978EMKE

(Insured): | A _
| Excess

MG india International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) - Tell £3476100 . [Handied by Sundari Nagarajan - 6347 6071]

MS1G Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tal: ~65 6627 7888
Adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid (HQ) - Tei: 6256-3561 . [Handled by MARCUS CHUA] . [Final Rpt due 20/04/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Comgose Case Mail ||

o III_SG (20/04/2018): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (530.00) - SLM4990E - Claim Handler: Sundarl Nagara...
+ JI_SG (19/04/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved [530.00) - SLM4990E - Claim Handler: Sundarl Nagara...
* JH_SG (13/04/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (550.00) - SLM4990E - Claim Handier: Sundarl Nagara...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS - View All | Searc Tasks | Creste vew Task | complete |
1

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assignnd By Completed On Created On Danes?

| Ne results,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 24/4/2018



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 2

Claim Documents

*SLM4990E (MCT1B8040217)
[SHA7793Z]
TP
GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
Apr 7 2018 9:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Video '  Tiowpse [~ &
INo_|Finalized On India International Insurance Pie Ltd (HQ) [ Thumbnall | Print
1 19/04/18 12109 | Video - Accident - | @ | Load e .
‘Phatos/images owpose 51 @
o |Relwbel/Reorder | LKK Autc Consultants Pteitd (WQ) | Thumbnail Print
I [21/04/1812:43  Genaral View ) | wadrs M
2 |21/04/18 12:43 | Genersl View '@ | osd G [
3 [21/04/1812:43 | General View | O | osd ;| &
4 [21/04/1812:43 | General View - - O  weawc | W
5 | 21/04/18 12:43 General View | D | Loadirc | M
6 |20/04/1812:43 | General View s
7| 21/04/18 12:43 auunilm-_ 0D | weaws | ¥
B |71/04/18 12:43 General View - - : S _n_._Lnldﬂ ™
8 21/04/18 12:43 | General View D | loadiec | A |
10| 21/04/18 12:43 | General View O  aws | M
13| 21/04/18 12:43 Ganeral View - 0 | tvaaws | A
12 20/04/18 12:43 | General View O | taars |
11 21/04/18 12:43 | General View @ | eurs | B
(14 21/04/18 12:43 | General View 0 | s |
15 f_moﬂ 12143 Genaral View B B © | oG | & |
16 21/04/18 12:43 | General View o | @ | Losaws M |
17 21/04/18 12:43 | General View 0 iosows | 4
18 2104181243 | General View B o | @ | woows | &
19 |21/04/18 12:47 | General View | @ | Lost w6 |
20 |21/04/18 12143 | Genaral View [ﬂ | wad s | A
Documentation _t;f_m = :_I i)
(Mo Relabel/Aeorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) 1  Thumbnall| Print
L 1UD4/18 16:35 | EMAIL FROM II1 DD 11042018 - —— | @ | Load poF
2 1104181639 | TPESTIMATE 0 | LosaFor
1 1UD4/1B16:35  TPGIAREPORT 2 Losd POF
4 23/04/18 1035 | Email to wkshop reject claim 33.4.18. Load POF
‘No_|Finaiized On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail Print
1 12/04/18 08:45  Singapore Accident Statement —— =— | @ | weavor |
Documents Checklist
'DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST - Reset | save | powe |

[There are no docliment checkiists configured,
|

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 24/4/2018



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Cur = LEKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd (H
W

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
um-lmlmmu_.wmcumnmu

https.//singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 24/4/2018



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg no 1sss07158r)
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel. 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/I|18006697/UWB30Q2

Date: 24/04/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India Intemational Insurance Pte Lid  Policy Mo MCOMDD15
Cialmant Vehicle <1 MasgoE Insured Vehicle No: SHA77932
Date of Loss 07/04/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18040217
| ICA I
Reg No: SLM4990E
Make & Model: MAZDA 2 1.5 SEDAN L SP BEAT (A) Engine No. P520435732
Reg Date: 31/03/2017 (Man. Year 2017) Chassis No: JMBEBN22ABHD147227
Colour Blue Odometer: 68158 km
Engine Capacity 1496 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: NfA
Sum Insured (S3); Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable) Yes Footbrake (Serviceable) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable); Yes Engne Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
N FTYR
Front Tyre Size: 205/80 R186 Rear Tyre Size: 205/60 R16
Front Left Side: Bridgestone 5 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgesione 5 mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestona 5§ mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 5 mm
The above villes represent (e remaring Hyre ireads depth
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 0.00 0.00 0.00
Miscellanaous [fems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 850,00 600.00 250.00 2841
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (55) 850.00 600.00 250.00 20.41
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 59.50 42.00 17.50 2041
Nett Amount (55) 209.50 G42.00 267.50 29.41
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 200472018
Date Inspecied: 20/04/2018 Inspected AL Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Lid
(HQ)
51 DEFU LANE 10
Singapore 539216
Estimated Period of Repair, 2.0 days
Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: VIVIAN LAU PEI FENG

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 24/4/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE' This report represenis our findings af tha fime and plasce of inspection sinfed harein. Such inspection fras beon carmed oul fo the best of pur
kncwiedge and abilly but any ofter labilily under any other circumstances i3 hemsby axpressly sxciided

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 24/4/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised; 23 Apr 2018)

Parts: 143 MAZDA 2 1.5 SEDAN L SP BEAT (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLM4830E)

Validity:  These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the [ast estimale page

Further Info: ltemsivalues not in reference catalogue are preficed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts
Them are no new paris selected,
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 24/4/2018



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscollanoous tems selected
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 PANEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTEN THE Mew 300.00 200.00
NECESSARY PORTION ,REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS .ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME .REPAIR RH
REAR FENDER AND REAR BUMPER
2 PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED PORTION New 550.00 400.00
Gross Labour Cost (S%) 850.00 600.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. ]
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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