Best Regards,

Ms Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Fri, Jan 24, 2020 at 9:51 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice

[save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below email.

We have our principal instruction to improve our offer at a global sum of $3,400.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you Is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/for that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other re lated matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other

related claims."”



“Wishing you a Hapyy and Prosperous New Year”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S({408933)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 October 2019 1:55 PM

To: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject; FW: ACCIDENT ON 06/04/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES 5HB 96712 AND SLD 135G *** LKK REF:
CC4/AXA18006630/Awa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Please be informed that this matter is now handled by my colleague, Ms Hsiao Tong.

Hi Hsiao Tong,

FYNA, our ref CC4/AXA18006630/Apa3



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin Support

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 (Ext:119) Email: SuLi@lkkauto.com| Fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com
Sent: Tuesday, 22 October 2019 1:44 PM

To: CS A Tearmn; Admin A
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 06/04/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHB 9671Z AND 5LD 135G *¥** LKK REF:
CC4/AXA18006630/Awa3

Your Ref: SHB9671Z

Our Ref: 5LD135G

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please refer to below mentioned email, as we have sent out our LOD previously to your side since 06/06/2018 &
TP Result on 13/11/2018.

We have not receive any offer from your side.
Resend LOD for your reference and hope to receive an offer from your side soon.

Please let us have your instruction within the next 14 days before we passed to our legal department.

Best Regards,

SuWong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD



Mo 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Fri, Aug 2, 2019 at 9:57 AM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

Hi Vivian,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the un dersigned.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@|kkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>
sent: Thursday, 1 August, 2019 4:02 PM
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@Ikkauto.com>; Asher sng (LKKAuto)

<AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 06/04/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHE 96712 AND 5LD 135G

Your Ref: SHBSB71Z

Our Ref: SLD135G

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please refer to below mentioned email, as we have sent out our LOD previously to your side since 06/06/2018 &
TP Result on 13/11/2018.

We have not receive any offer from your side.

Resend LOD for your reference and hope to receive an offer from your side soon.

Best Regards,

SuWong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376



On Thu, Jun 20, 2019 at 3:01 PM Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <pAsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote:
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Su Wong,

We refer to the email below.

The current case handler for this case is Poh Kin.

Hi Poh Kin,

Kindly assist.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: £841-6051 | email: ashersnog@ikkauto.com | fax &741-4108

Bik 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #OZ-25 | 5[408933)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>
sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 12:01 PM




To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSn lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 06/04/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHB 96712 AND SLD 135G

Your Ref: SHB9671Z

Our Ref: SLD135G

Dear Asher,

We refer to below, can we have an update of this claim as we have not received any status from your side.

Best Regards,

SuWong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Mon, Apr 22, 2019 at 12:57 PM MG Solution -ﬁmgi'raulution@gmail.comb wrote:

Your Ref: SHB9671Z

QOur Ref: SLD135G

Dear Asher,



please refer to below mentioned email, as we have sent out our LOD previously to your side on 06/06/2018,
16/07/2018, 21/09/2018, 24/01/2019 and TP Result on 13/11/2018 & 18/12/2018.

We have not receive any offer from your side.

Resend LOD for your reference and hope to receive an offer from your side soon.

Best Regards,

SuWong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Sat, Jan 26, 2019 at 10:50 PM Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Hi Su Wong,

We refer to the email below.

We have forward the PIR to our principal and we are still pending for direct settlement instruction.
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Shall revert to you once our principal revert to us.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | emdll; rena@lkkauto.com | fox: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi industial Park, Ui Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: MG Solution cngsmutiun@gmail.com}

sent: Thursday, January 24, 2015 11:54:25 AM

To: Admin A: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 06/04/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHB 9671Z AND 5LD 135G

Your Ref: SHB9671Z
Our Ref: SLD135G

Dear Asher,

Please refer to below mentioned email, as we have sent out our LOD previously to your side on 06/06/2018,
16/07/2018 & 21/08/2018 and TP Result on 13/11/2018 & 18/12/2018.

We have not receive any offer from your side.

Resend LOD for your reference and hope to receive an offer from your side soon.

Best Regards,

S5u Wong
MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
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AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Tue, Dec 18, 2018 at 11:47 AM MG Solution <mge3solution@gmail.com> wrote:

vour Ref: SHB96712Z
Our Ref: SLD135G

Dear Thin Thin,
Please find attached TP Result for your kind onward action.
Best Regards,

SuWong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

Mo 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Tue, Nov 13, 2018 at 4:11 PM MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com> wrote:

Your Ref: SHBS671Z
Our Ref: SLD135G

Dear Thin Thin,
please find attached TP Result for your kind onward action.
Best Regards,

5u Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

Mo 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Fri, Sep 21, 2018 at 10:58 AM MG solution <mg3solution@gmail.com> wrote:

Your Ref: SHB9671Z

Our Ref: SLD135G
12



Dear Thin Thin,

Please refer to below mentioned email, as we have sent out our LOD previously to your side on
06/06/2018 & 16/07/2018.

\We have not receive any offer from your side.

Resend LOD for your reference and hope to receive an offer from your side soon.

Best Regards,

Su Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-038B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Mon, Jul 16, 2018 at 12:05 PM MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com> wrote:

Your Ref: SHBS6T1Z
Our Ref: SLD135G

Dear Thin Thin,

please refer to below mentioned email, as we have sent out our LOD previously to your side on

06/06/2018.
We have not receive any offer from your side.
Resend LOD for your reference and hope to receive an offer from your side soon.

Best Regards,

SuWong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
Mo 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-03B Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Wed, Jun 6, 2018 at 12:09 PM MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com> wrote:

Vour Ref: SHB9671Z
Our Ref: SLD135G

Dear Thin Thin,
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Please find attached our LOD for your onward action. Original Copy will send to you by POST.
Please feel free to contact the under mentioned should you require any further information.

Your prompt action will be greatly appreciated.
Best Regards,

Su Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-03B Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Tue, Apr 17, 2018 at 8:08 AM MG solution <mg3solution@gmail.com> wrote:

Morning Thin Thin,

please refer attach CCTV footage for your self explain.

Thanks,

Best Regards,

Ms Hong

MG Solution Pte Ltd

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

Singapore 415933

Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376

On Mon, Apr 16, 2018 at 6:00 PM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> wrote:

"Without Prejudice”

Dear Sharon,

ACCIDENT ON 06/04/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHB 9671Z AND SLD 135G
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We refer to the below matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is
unclear for the above mentioned case. There is no conclusive evidence to substantiate either party’s
version. Enclosed herewith is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with
our Ol we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for
legal assistance until you heard further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request the CCTV footage as stated in your client statement in order to
seek further instruction from our principal.

“plaase note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be
construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms
of our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor
should it be binding in any other related claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933

15



MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reg. No. 20-1427944-N)

..... - =

:'x L ¥ EI ﬁ“} - Er r__-__l L:: T ;___':.
B B & % ] BEE . K
F.Va S i1LA "h:;i B%s

Bill To: INVOICE Mo : TI 204059
AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
5 SHENTON WAY PB No : 188174
#27-01 AXA TOWER
SINGAFPORE 068811 Date : 02-March-2020
ATTHN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT Vehicle Number : SLD 135G
aTy DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
1 |To carried out accident repair as per surveyor's recommendation 5 2,800.00
(Lump Sum)
BEFORE G5T 2,800.00
7% GST 196.00
TOTAL | § 2,996.00

Cheque should be made payable to MG Solution Pte Ltd




MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reg. No. 201427944N)

Date : 04/06/2018

Your Ref : SHB%671Z

To : AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
Attn : Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir/Mdm,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SLD135G & SHB9671Z ON 06/04/2018 AT
JUNCTION OF UPPER SERANGOON ROAD AND BUANGKOK DRIVE.

We refer to the above matter.

Attached copies of the following for your kind perusal:

1) Proforma Bill No.188174 @ $52,996.00 (Inclusive Of 7% GST)
2) Laoss of Use (@ §$720.00 (6 Days x §5120)

3} LTA Search (@ 5%7.45

4) Authorisation to Act

5) GIA Report

Hope the zbove is in order and kindly let us have your confirmation soon.
Tax invoice will be issue upon amount finalized.

Thank You.

Yours faithfully,

HP: 9188 6931
E-mail: mg3solution@gmail.com



LETTER QF AUTHORITY

St mitN GEK X

Mame . |

P . BLK S5k HuubANG STEEET 5|
Y- 44 SINGAVORE. 530551

Contact No

TD: AXA  INCURANCE  SINGAPCRE PTE LTD

Diear Sirs,
AcCDENT INvOLVING __SLP ! 356 (HB 1L}z o ot[ o[>t

AT/ALONG. JUNCTION OF UPPER SERANGIUN RSAD AND BUANGESE DRIVE

AND

I/ We, St BoenN GEK , @am/ars the registered owner of
CiD135(4

mator car nd.

Please note that | have assigned all compensations monies due to me/us in the above said aceident
to M/S5 MG SOLUTION PTE LTD.

|/\We, hereby authorize you to release ali compensation monies partaining to the sbove-mentioned
accident to M5 MG SOLUTION PTELTD and forward your settlement chegue to M/S MG SOLUTION
PTE LTD whom | had authorized to collzct the said compensation monias.

Thanik you

@’ +

Signature of Claimant Witness By




342020 Merimen e-Claims

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...{Pendlng for Survey Report)

agd irect Settlemen
'CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING o e — E =
S Notfied |Est Submitted Adj Assigned | Adf Rp | Ad) Submitted Ins Auth'ed | Status _
10 Apr 2018 | : Pending for Survey
Main |10 Apr 2018 e $$2,800.00  $$2,800.00 il |
Edit Adj Rpt tl Edit Estimates : Wiew Rpt . s I |

Reference Claim Details Documents

[CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS ‘ | [Created by insurer]
|Insured: TRANS-CAB. HEMEEE PTE LTD, Co. Reg MNo.: 200303B78K

' Main
Claimant: i-'i_"" BOON GEK, 1D: S1776816F B

Vehicle Reg. = |o6/04/2018 20:00 - :59
SLD135G l”m Of LoSS! | 1107 Months and 19 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)] |

[ Claim Type: | TP / C0472939 Policy/COVer | p1680520 (Third Party Only)

: Palicy No.
(Claimant):

E ESETT ) ST |Ex:e55 535, 000.00
F«‘.e_palrer MG Solutiun Pte Ltd (HQ) 23 Kaki Bulut Avenue 4 #l.‘r:'. 038, VICOM Inspection Centre, 415933 Hakl Bukit - Tel: 91836931

|'I”n“5’::’r2’:9 AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6880 4888 ... [Handled by Vale Oh - 6880 4897]

Claimant's

\.I'Ehll:lt Reg.

1
SHBY671Z 5095696455

NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd [Hq} = Tel:

Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 19/04/2018]

Driver/Custo
dian JAYARAT S/0 VELAYUTHAM (), NRIC: S6918891E Email:
| I{In:'.ured_} |

|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All | Compose Case Mail |

| .ﬁ.}m 5G {20.!’01.-’2021)}: Alert - Adj Mandate npprwed {5$3503 45) - SLD135G - Claim Handler: Vale Oh
AXA_SG (16/01/2020): PLS PUT UP YOUR MANDATE ON TP SETTLEMENT, TK5-VO

AXA_SG {16/01/2020): TP settlement - C0472939/P1680520

A¥A_SG (18/12/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - 5LD135G - Claim Handler: Vale Oh

AXA_SG (06/11/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SLD135G - Claim Handler: Vale Oh

AXA_SG (10/04/2018): CO472939/P1680520

AXA_SG (10/04/2018): New TP Assignment - C0472939/P1680520

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= View Al | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complete | |
Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done? |
Mo results.

hitps:'singapore.merimen.com/elaimsi ndex.cim?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_cimheaderfcaseid=6989828exlid=2693934CFID=6813624... 112
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ht‘lpa:ﬂsingapma.mrimen.mn'ufr.:tairns.n’indax.t:fm?lusahﬂ:=MTR|=.|dju51.er&fusaactinn=dsp_clmmadar&casald=ﬁﬂlBBﬂZ&exlid=2ﬂ-9393&C FID=6B13624,.. 2/2
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Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SLD135G (C0472939)
[SHB9671Z]
TP
SIM BOON GEK
Apr 6 2018 8:00PM
[TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD]
MG Solution Pte Ltd

Upload Ducm-nml:ﬂ Upload Photos | Compose New Letter I Upload Video I Upload Audio !

View | View in Browser ¥ |

[deu

Mo | Finalized On

LEK Auto Cunsultgq[& Pte Ltd [{HQ) ;

Thumbnail | Print

1 09/07/18 18:23

Video - Accident

@ | Load M4

Letters/Correspondences Lperpage ¥
| Ma Finalized Dn- | AXA lnsurahce Pte Ltd {HQ]_- == B B _' Thumbnail Print |
1 11/07/18 15:32 Internal - Email Correspondence - | @ Load TIF
Photos/Images R B 3perpage V| @
Mo “i'telabelfltenrder iLKi( _.i.utu Consultants Pte Ltd {HQ) . = i Thumbnail Print
|1 [19/04/18 15:39 General View © | adibc | @ '
‘2 |19/04/18 15:40 | General View © | Ladirc | &
3 19/04/18 15:40 | General View . B € | oadkrc | @
4 |19/04/18 15:40 General View o i | Loadwe | @ |
5 |18/04/18 15:40 General View a i ) | & || Load PG | B |
& |19/04/18 15:40 | General View _ - © | Load ke uﬂ_}
7 |19/04/18 15:40 | General View i B © | drws | @ |
8 |19/04/18 15:40 General View ) © | adws | @ |
‘o 19/04/18 15:40 General View - i © | Ladic | @ |
10 |19/04/18 15:40 | General View _ © | Load re | &
11 |19/04/18 15:40 General View | € | Load ire | @ |
12 |19/04/18 15:40 | General View © | loadirc | & |
13 [19/04/18 15:40 General View _ © | Load G | @ |
.14 19/04/18 15:40 General -'U'Il:w i & | Load IPG T E.:I__i
15 |19/04/18 15:40 | General View € | LoadwG | ¥
16 |19/04/18 15:40 7 General View _ _ | € | Load JPG_l_ Eﬂ__
Documentation R ) tperpage v | &
‘No |Finalized On AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) = - Thumbnail | Print
|1 |10/04/18 09:18  |EMAIL i | @ | Load POF ]
2 |10/04/18 09:18 | CO CLAIMAINT - | € | Load POF |
'3 |10/04/18 09:18 | INSD GIA REPORT € | Load POF
4 | 10/04/1809:18 SLD135G GIA REPORT ) € | Loac POF |
(Mo |Relabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail Print
1 |26/D1/19 22:45  |TP PIR i € | Load POF |
2 14/03/1909:33  |LTA SEARCH B 3 € | Load POF
3 |o5/11/1912:22 | TP ESTIMATE_MARKED Load PDF
4 |o0s/11/19 12:22 PARF_COE REBATE _ g Load POF _
|5  |05/11/19 12:22 | LKK Survey Phatos. B B € | Load PDF
6 |18/12/1908:49  EMAIL TO OI DD 081119 Load POF |
7 |04/03/20 13:13 Authorisation to Act . € | Load FOF

hups:I.rsinrgapore.merlmanmr#daimsﬁndex.t.lm?fusabnx=MTHdn-c&fus&aﬂﬁon=dsp_dcwbew&dumainid=1&mla=4&nbjid=ﬁ*359&2&exﬁd=269393&._.
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video ' ' [1perpage  ¥| @ |
Mo |Finalized On J_LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print |
'8 04/03/2013:13  LETTERTO OI € | Load POF ‘

g

04/03/20 13:13

| PAYMENT BREAKDOWN - EXPRESS SETTLEMENT FORM

m Load PDF

Documents Checklist

| DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

i There are no da_u.lrnent checklists cnnﬂgured',

Reset | Save | an

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks Te: ) Handiing Insurer
Note: Remarks are privete unbess you show it to other parties,

https'Jfsingﬂpora.mﬁan.mwﬁclaimsfmdax.:ﬁn?lusahoxﬁﬂRdnr.'-&fusaaclion=dsp_ducview&dm\ainid=1 &corole=480bjid=598982&exlid=2693034. ..
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31412020 Adjuster Repor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno:1sseorissr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8BB05 Email: sur@Ikkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
Our File No: CC4/AXA18006630/APA3S2
Date: 04/03/2020
RE NCE
Handling Insurer:  AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Policy No: P1680520
Simank.¥oNIE. mno Insured Vehicle No : SHBYE71Z
Date of Loss: 06/04/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: C0472939
DE PTION NTIFIC OF VE E
Reg No: SLD135G
Make & Model: HONDA ACCORD, 2.0 (A) Engine No: R20A32800039
Reg. Date: 18/04/2009 (Man. Year: 2008) Chassis No: MRHCF16309P020035
Colour: Black Odomeler: 180492 km
Engine Capacity: 1997 cc
Market Value/New Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured (S%): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Good  Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/40R18 Rear Tyre Size: 225/40R18
Front Left Side: Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestona & mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone & mm
The above values represeni the remaining fyre treads depth
[COSTOF CLAIMS B ] Repairer’s Adjuster's Difference  DIff %]
Parts 3,594 .64 241200 1,182.64 32490
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,280.00 1,110.00 1,170.00 51.32
Paintwork Labour 0,00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S%) 5,874.64 3,522.00 2,352.64 40.05
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 2,800.00
(5%) 5,874.64 2,800.00 3,074.64 52.34
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S5%) 411.22 196.00 215.22 52.34
Mett Amount (S§) 6,285.86 2,996.00 3,289.86 52.34
+ Loss of Use (5.0 x 55100.00/day) (53) 500.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 7.45
Nett Liability (S$) 3,503.45
INSPECT
Date of Assignment. 10/04/2018
Mg Solution (HQ)
Date Inspected: 10/04/2018 Inspected At: 25 Kakl Bukit Road 4 #04-01
Singapore 41800
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days

http5;.h'5ingapura.merirnen.v:.nr'ru'cIaims)index.cfm?lusabﬂﬁMTHadLuswr&fuseamiun‘;gan_prinlrpl&casa'ud=BBBE!EZ&E}(IBU'—‘?'SQ?&EE&GFID=BS136243&6...
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3/4/2020 Adjuster Report

Adjuster:  ADRIAN LING Manager:  CHEW HSIAO TONG

NOTE: This rapart reprasents our findings at the fime and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspeclion has been carrmed out fo the best of our knowledge and ability buf
any other liabilty under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded,

hitps:/isingapore merimen.com/claims/index cfmPfusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen _printrptécaseid=608982&exlid=2603934CFID=68136243&C... 24



3/4/2020 Adjuster Report
REPAIR DETAILS
!F{efere nce
|Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 04 Mar 2020)
iParts: HONDA ACCORD 2.0 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
|Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)
|Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLD135G)
"Ualidity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page numbers with the

END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

LFurther Info: Itemsivalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an aslgrisl{ o

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT DOOR RH (CONSISTENT) Dented 1,122 60FL *1,122.60FL
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER (CONSISTENT) Tom 1,250 00FL  "620.50 FL
3 1 *FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH (CONSISTENT) Mecassary 65.90 FL *65.90 FL
4 1 *FRONT FENDER RH (CONSISTENT) Dented 762.30FL “6B1.00FL
5 1 *FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING RH (CONSISTENT) Not Necessary 180.00 FL *-FL
5] 1 *SET FRONT BUMPER CLIP (CONSISTENT) Mecessary 20.00Fs *20.00F3
7 1 *SET FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING CLIP (CONSISTENT) Not Necessary 20.00FS *-FS
8 1 *SET FRONT WHEEL RIM (CONSISTENT) Cut B50.00FS *400.00FS3
F=Franchise parl, S=Spchett. L=ListllemDisc,
Sub Total (S%) 4,270.80 2,910.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 20.00/20,00% (S%) 676.16 498.00
Total Parts (S%) 3,594.64

2,412.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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31442020 Adjuster Report
Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellanecus items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 PANEL BEATING, REMOVING AND REPLACING PARTS. Mew 1,000.00 400.00

2 SPRAY PAINTING TO AFFECTED AREA. New 1,000.00 600.00

3 WIRING CHECK. New 100.00 30.00

4 TO TRANSFER FRONT DOOR FITTING RH. New 180.00 80.00
Gross Labour Cost (S3) 2,280.00 1,110.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out,

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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