Alice Leong

From: KHOR Saw Theng <sawtheng khor@axa.com.sg>
Sent: 13 July, 2018 10:57 PM

To: Alice Leong

Subject: RE: OUTSTANDING CASES OF PRIME TAXIS

Dear Alice Without Prejudice

We have attended to your 13 outstanding cases and have given instruction to our surveyor to liaise with your office
on the settlement except few of these cases.

Please refer to the following for the update:-

1. SHD2344D/PC4494B
We rejected this case based on video footage shows that our insured bears no liahility to the accident
2. SHD2825H/SLL3697P
We rejected this case because our insured driver claims that no contact with your vehicle and he has taken
' scene photograph which show no damages to your vehicle
3. SHD2992H/SIT3774G  Propose to settle at 50/50
. SHD2164G/SJY1184X Non-reporting
5. SHD2107Y/SLA4199L  Non-reporting

Regards

Khor Saw Theng (Ms) | Manager, Motor Claims

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email:sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No: 1800 880 4888

redefining /insurance

'ase consider the environment before printing this message
imis message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Alice Leong [mailto:aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com]
Sent: Thursday, July 05, 2018 3:33 PM

To: KHOR Saw Theng <sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg>
Subject: RE: GIRO PAYMENT APPLICATION FORM

Hi Saw Theng.

Noted with thanks.

Alice Leong

Mortor Claims Manager

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
5 Benoi Place Singapore 629926
T(65): 6861 0908 | F (65)6515 2948



