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51 bl Ave 1 £01-25 Paya Libl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

- TEL 6256 35671 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 199607 198R GST Reg. Ne 18-980T198-R

| ‘¥ L Ls LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
-

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automabile
AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CCA4/ASM18006584/Uwb3
RN o owewoszos [ HIHIIN
Code : ASM
Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.,  SLC 5672 Veh. Inspected SLG 9686D
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 10/04/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer . Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
LiH Rear Tyra mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  09/04/2018 Inspection Date 1oo4/208
Survey held at  KIM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 217883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owmner |D Type

Crwmer ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo

Viehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Output:
Cipen Market Value:

DOriginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category.

COE Pericd(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein s correct as at 12 Mar 2019

Business
Bas K

SFM222L

Mo

12 Mar 2019
MERCEDES BENZ
E EEFEGI

Ee_l_n

2007
271B4030003585
WDD21204824092584
1350 kW (181 bhp)
$51.190.00

12 Mar 2010

12 Mar 2010

4

£51.19000

Yes
11 Mar 2020
$25.595.00

11 Mar 2020

E - Open Category
10

$19,889.00
$1.509.00
$27.504.00
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%« Service Request Details

Claim
SEMOODEL

Reference

None 4

Loss Date
April 9, 2018

Reguest Date
April 9, 2018

Due Date
April 16, 2018

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TR)

Type of Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement

Actions

MNext Step
Agree to perform service

Ciaim Portal

LK ALUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP =

Al LAY

Decline Work || Accopt Wiarl

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
S5LG9696D

Make
TPVD BMW

Menu

m:!wmm:um,wmmmmwmmhmwmmmmmmmmt



4972018 Claim Paortal

Menu

SErvice Agaress

Primary Contact/Insured

XU FANG

BLK 60 LORONG 4 TOA PAYOH, #10-115, 310060, Singapore
92761386

FANGANGI2000@YAHOO.COM

Claim Handler

TAY Ernest
6568804835
ermest.tay@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

Messages Invoices History Documents Aszessment Metrics Notes

Mew Mossage

hmimmmlmmwmmmmmmmwmmmwmmmnmmm1



~ Poh Kin {LKI{Auta!

From: Jason Fastech Auto <jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 March 2019 10:56 AM

To: Pah Kin (LKKAuta), 'Nancy Lam'’

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SLG9696D AND SLCS67Z ON 09.04.2018

Without Prejudice
Dear Poh Kim,
We are pleased to accept your offer of global sum $7,300.00(all in) for my client’s vehicle property claim.

Thank vou.

Best Regards

Jason Tang

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd
| Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-46/48/50 AutoBay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 67465405

Hp: 98218445

jason(@ fastechauto.com.sg

Please note thit it is a condition of any settlerment reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injory claim (if any) of the owner/
cluimant,

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@lkkauto.com|

Sent: Tuesday, March 12, 2019 10:04 AM

To: Nancy Lam <nancy.lam(@fastechauto.com.sg>

Ce: jason(@fastechauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SLG9696D AND SLC567Z ON 09.04.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CC4/ASMI18006594/Uwb3
Your Ref: SLG 9696D

Dear Nancy,
We refer to above matter and your letter of demand.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured's part, we have
instruction from our principal to offer settlement at global sum of $7,300.00(all in) on this matter.



~ Poh Kin (LKHAuta!

From: Poh Kin (LKKAUtO)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 March 2019 10:04 AM

To: ‘Nancy Lam’

Ce: lason@fastechauto.com.sg’

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SLG9696D AND SLCS67Z ON 09.04.2018
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CC4/ASMI18006594/Uwb3
Your Ref: SLG 9696D

Dear Nancy,
We refer to above matter and your letter of demand.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we have
instruction from our principal to offer settlement at global sum of $7,300.00{all in) on this matter.

Kindly confirm acceptance on this matter.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affectfinfluence on the issues of llability/damages, either party s not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chang (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

LKK &= Save the Earth- Print only when necessary:

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient |s prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you belleve that you received this e-mail In error, please do nol
read this e-mall or any attached items. Please delele the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereal, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you,

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy.lam(@fastechauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 3:58 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkinf@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SLG9696D AND SLC567Z ON 09.04.2018



anarz01e Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP} = M

g} <S8MOODEL> A with mandate uploaded

Tyvpe
© Question

Message
pls proceed. Tks

Reply

hitlpasfivp nmnhlmmm.ug.'dnim—pmﬂhu'n.lﬁn:#a:-«randnr-immum.hmﬁhumu-tuquarmwmummmﬂnqummmaﬂ "



anrz01e Claim Partal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD [TP] = Menu

<« <S8MOODEL> IA with mandate uploaded

Type
@ Question

Message

Dear Winnie, Liability: Insured driver collided with third party vehicle when turning into major road from minor
road. Liability is down against our insured. Send letter to Q| to notify TP claim and NCD issue on 26th February
2019. Immediate Advice (with mandate) have been uploaded in SMART CLAIM. We hereby seek your approval
to offer Third Party repairer M/s "Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd" is as follows: - 1)COR[w/gst) : $6,848,00 + 2) Loss of
Rental (3days x $150.00): $450.00 +3) GIA search : $2,00 =Total: $7,300.00 **3days recommendation for repair.
**All the relevant documents had been uploaded in SMART CLAIM. For your approval please, PohKin -
11/03/201%9

Reply

htps/ivp smariclaims. aza com sg/clalim-poral himlfindex-vendor-service-requests. himi#/service-requestsiview-message 7 serviceRequesiNumbar=33, 11
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A ma®m Pwie Company Registration No. 1 BHSOT1BER

S0 AVE |, 228 FAYA UL INTUSTRIAL PAKK, SINGAPORE 808853 TR : (3 62563580 FAN @ [B45) hlSa4N]E

Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 11/03/2019

Survey Details:

Date of loss 9-Apr-18
Date of appointment 10-Apr-18
Date of survey 10-Apr-18
Location of survey KiM CHWEE AUTO PTELTD
Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: Third party
Vehicle number SLG 9696D
Make and Model BMW 740LI SR LED NAV HUB-2998cc
Date of registration 2/11/2015
Excess )

Market Value $235,000

Parf Rebate $138,377

Nett Loss 596,623

Repair details:

[initial Estimate |s 13,595.14 |

Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 5 6,473.59 [list price -5%
Check items (estimata) 5 -

Labour 5 670.00

Total 3 7,143.59

Lump Sum(if applicable) 5 6,400.00 |after -10%

[Number of days for repair | 3 days ]
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Company Asglsiration No. 19960T108R

£ LB AVE |, 812328 PAYA UB) INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAMOKE G800 TEL : (065 a2363581 FAX [ (065) 62564015

Remarks:
We hove not authorized repairs.
Mandate:
Liability(TP) 100%
Proposed repair cost 5 6,848.00 |(56,400.00 + 7%gst)
Loss of use 5 450.00 |($150.00 x 3days)
Loss of rental 5
Loss of income 5 -
GIA search fees 5 2.00
Others -] =
Proposed Total s 7,300.00




KIM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-50 Autobay

Singapore 417883 :
Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 199802379R

Date ; 02.05.2018
AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
8 Shenton Way

#27-01 AXA Tower
Singapore 068811

Attn: Motor Claim Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE:  SLG9696D AND SLC567Z ON 09.04.2018

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: SLGO8YED |, which was involved in
the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no: SLCEB7Z . The vehicle owner has requested and suthorized
mhlﬁﬂhﬂhmmmhmhmmﬂhhhﬁnm to the vehicle

ﬁ:huﬁdﬂwmwuunqlmmﬂmmm“mmmm&
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

1) Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) 5 6,848.00
2) Loss Of Use Rental 5 540,00
3) GIA Search Fee $ 2.00

s 7.390.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair Invoice b) Vehicle Registration Log Card
¢) Rental Agreement/Invoice d) U/C & Driving Licence

e) Insurance Certificate f) GIA Search Result/GIA Report
g) Letter of Authorisation, etc...

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible.

Please note that it is 2 condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice fo
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you. =
Yours faithfully, i
Jason Tang (j .COMLEE)

For Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd




S| UHIAVE 1, #01-28 PAYA LRI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL @ (145 62563561 FAX 1 (5) 62564315

25™ February 2019

XU FANG

Block 60 Toa Payoh Lorong 4,
#10-115,

Singapore 310060

Dear SirfMadam,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18006594/Uwb3

YOUR REF :SLC567Z

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SLC 567Z AND SLG 9696D
ALONG RAFFLE INSTITUTION ON 09.04.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Lid to deal with the third party
Property Damage claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd, acting on behalf of the
owner of SLG 9696D against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the acciden! reporl, accident scenario, it was reported thal your vehicle had
collided with Third Party vehicle SLG 96960 when tuming into main road. As such,
liability is down against us.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the
claim against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the
following to pohkin@lkkauto.com within 7 days from the date of this letter if not provided
at AXA's reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may
be required:

» Paolice report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)

Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured pholographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage (o all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
status of the claim



1 UHEAVE 1L #0025 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPOURE 408003 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX 1 (D65) 62564515

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settliement without AXA's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights lo repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification. please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2132 or email us
at pohkin@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

Pdh Kin, Chong
Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: pohkin@lkkauto.com

cec.  AXA Insurance Pte Lid (AXA)
(Motor Claims Dept)
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AUTHORISATION TO ACT

IWe, _kimt Ko< Soor (the thind perty olaiment) of 94 Sery Karg
Ecot fve f2-31 5 544143 i), owner of 5165 % 1D _ (reicto 0] ey

wthocize Kit_chug, futy Pre [4d (e workahop™) i act for me with respocs.

to my chuim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“olsim™) for my vehicle no.

SLG 15%2 thet was demaged pursuant to the accident which mmM&b}
slong_Bishan, 431 (location) involving

vehiclenofs_SLC 5617 (™the accident™).

Imm&mhﬁwﬁwwﬁhhtmhﬁy
deem fit and the workshop is mwhmmhﬁhlﬁmﬁw
uﬁmwﬁmmb&;mﬁhmu{ﬁqm
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mmmmmmmm-uw
of the othervehicle/s is concened.

Datedthis__' " (day)ar




p.a¥ redefining /insurance
CLAIMREF  : SBMOODEL
INSURED : XU FANG
DISCHAR

-

This Di Voucher epplies anly 1o the caimant’s claim

Tl will noi affect his personal
b h}'EL"F-"r‘r "J'T e Anc o I1|i.1ll-1.ldl'-

el cipim andior UmmELr ] |
IFr-1£" ':;iﬁ* the settiement terme hersin should nol ba used as an
Evidence o prajud ico 10 the clasmant's personal injuries claim
andiar other uninsured losses claim arising of the

subject matier in this action.

VOUCHER

We/I LIM_KOK SOON, NRIC No. $6904142/F) hereby agree to accept the sum of dollars [seven

thousand three hund {S$ 7,300.00) paid to

us/me by AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD as full and

final settlement of all claims of whatever kind Including damages for personal injuries and damages
to property that we/l may have against the said AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD or their Insured or the

driver of motor vehicle no. SLC 5672 as a result of an accident along Bishan Raffie Institution on 9™
April 2018 of which we/l were/was the driver/ owner/ hirer/ passenger/rider/pillion/ insurer of

motor vehicle no. SLG 9696D.

We/l hereby declare that the said insurer or owner and/or driver of insured vehicle shall not be
liable for any further claim(s) whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SLC 5672 in connection directly or
indirectly with the said accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/l hereby declare that we/l are/am the person(s) entitled to receive the above settlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in

respect of this settlement.

It is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of liability whatsoever
on the part of the said insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SLC 567Z.

2.

Dated this day of

2019

Claimant’s Signature W

NRIC no./ Company Stamp (S L it 12 F
Occupation/ Business
Address 1R S gy Ecnt Ave F03-3 |
Telephane No. TL bl &S —!
Witness's Name 54
S8704986H

Witness's Signature

Witness's NRIC No.

AXA Insursnce Pte Ltd (Company Reg. No, 198903512M)

B Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811

Customer Centra #8101

Tei: +65 6880 4888 Fax +65 6338 2522 Websits: www.axa.com.sg



TAX INVOICE

KIM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-50 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No; 67458520

Tax Reg No: 199802379R

Tax Invoice : 20231
AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
8 Shenton Way Date: 02.05.2018
#27-01 AXA Tower Vehicle No:  SLG9696D
Singapore 068811 Make/Model: BMW 740L
ChassisEng#
Accident Date:  09.04.2018
Attn: Motor Claim Department Claim No : 0418-20231
Amount
To proceed on repair sum 5% 6,400.00
E.£20.E Total : S§ 6,400.00
GST (@ 7% : 5§ 448.00
Amount Due - 85 _ 6,848.00
for KIM CHWEEB/AUTO PTE LTD

All Invoices are subjected to GST




DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 6741 7244 / 6746 5405 Fax No: 6745 8520 / 6746 5786
Co. Reg No: 52928467K

To: LIM KOK S00N Invoice : DCR-2018-04-17

Date : 12.04.2018

Agreement No : 20520
Payment Terme:: LOD

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

Rental charges for vehicle : SFM222L | 0418-20231 ) L 540.00

Rental Period from 09.04.2018 o 12.04.2018

E.&0.E. Total § 540,00

NANCY LAM
for Dynamic Car Rental




Dynamic Car Rental

! KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 8, #01-45/M48/50 AUTOBAY, SINGAPORE 417883,

'-r_ 1.-;_l.

t=17

TEL: (+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405 FAX: (+65) 6745 8520, 6746 5786
Co. Reg. No. 52928467K

No. 20520

MANE MOCEL

MIEJEL FETROL |E |(va|12 3w F

DATE OF EXPIRY

PLACE OF ISSUE

GATE OF IBSUE

PLALE OF ISSUE

F DHIVING LICENCE NO

DATE OF EXPIRY

PLACE OF ISSUE

PASSPORT NO

DATE OF IESUE

ay

T¥o

INITIALLING, RENTER
AGREES TO PAY ADD FEE
FOR DAMAGES
WAIVER (C.O0W.)

IMPORTANT NOTES:

Tra vaniom @ SCenCed 10 Laley D4 pREMOgATE Orfy

M rwlurd will b gieen for sefucin i sarty.

e rture will b (reat o peoriod e i vaiticy

riemt o bk by lirat S5O0 Lo smetitn | B 10 gty BCE0N g kmk OF nrmings sibe Seraged e
I i rpai,

e Al Dy 86 ARG e sl FAMC EITITON . X

[
hm-hﬁﬁh x
J

PER DAY

satmo ' b s

SOD4000 By RENTER
AGREES TO PAY ADD FEE
FOR DENT
INEURANCE [PAL)

_.' 7 dddlliorsl Dwn Damage oee of K§ 1500 s speicatie o0 oy muemnbirneme friseey C

' pnrintiz o wy - :n:wr :EH\II'E! :mm-u
I) g 84l 1> 7T yoewrn o,

£} welih diwing esperisnce of 1 pesd B s Pon J prars 0 Sgapees o0 P wlevers clasees o dmeang

FRAEPAYMENT TOTAL CHARGE

b A DR sazsss 1 SE2000 w spsicatie b Bny RAMEIACrartm dilenry whe
u) =m0 gy okl o B ey o ndee
Bifm 7Y pumry sk el sisn scwtion &
=) wlh Geiving paoerience of e Than | pEET o6 P eevant claases of gy losese.

" Laoe seboring e repiaseean wehicla, you Mol ensore et Bl scensive end mponest Sems b e
Mwh&mmumﬂuh“hn“l—“

" Hmet 18 Banie 2 pay Dl B400C wnciee secson |8 B m sy scciiert paus e of seminy st demacs setic
.

Hiree s raEDormible for Adiitionsd Eassa AMOUNT DUE / REFLIND

84,000,400
& tha THIRD PAATY DAMALLE | INAIAY clalm.

| HAVE READ THE TEFMS AND CONDITIONS ON BOTH BIDES
OF THIS RENTAL AGREEMENT AND AGREE THEREDF,

DaY OF

X :fg;}kaf##

RENTERS/ORIVER'S SIGNATURE

EIGNED BY THE PARTIES HERETD ON THE




Umisi o e

Imlce

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

m RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
§ Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fauc +65 6224 D030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE C°! fegistration No: M400017735
TAX INVQICE
Our Raf No: GR-18-0524T4
Data of Request: 09vDa/z018 Your Ral No: Online Purchase
Kim Chwea Auto Pie Lid
1 Kakl Buklt Avenua 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kakl Bukit
Singmpore 41TBE3
Dear SikMadam,
Enquiry Dale OO4/2018
Enquiry By Tang Kok Wae, Allan
(€ vehicie No. SLCE67Z
Accident Date 0o 2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (58)
TP Insurar Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated documnent and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official usa;
Date:
[¥] GIRO [ ] Cash [] Cheque

«

hitpe:/isingapore. mermen. comiclaims/index.cimPMusebar=MTReasd fussaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=17T0S20ACFID=21 TEI144ACFTOKEN=In25anB530347




THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
Plfllllﬂh No: ? FLG 5672 {Insd veh) | Model: MW, T40L (A)
FLG 9696D (TP veh)
[Date of Accident: 08/0472018
Global Sum Settiement | ; | [ ] Yes ] [X] No
Repair Estimate '3 P 14,546.80
Final Repair Cost s 6,848,004
Loss of Use 5 0.00 days at $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) i 450.00) 3 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee ' 5 2.00
Others: |: 5| 0.00
]
Final Settlement Sum $ - 1.300.00
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [] YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate

below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop:

Agreed Liabiity 100_-_ (%)

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No

Assessed Liability (*): (%)

* Assassed Liability to be filled only for chaln collisions and for cases where BOLA does not agpply.

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |¥IM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD ‘S -~ 1,300,
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 28/032018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date

/

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report/ Bill (If any)




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4316

Reg Mo 199807188R GST Reg. Mo 19-8807188-R

AMfiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD

B SHENTON WAY #24-01
AXA TOWERSINGAPORE 068811

ATTN:WINNIE HO

Ref CC4/ASM18006524/UMb3g2

Date: 28-03-2019

Cods = ASM

AN

1% Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SLC567Z Veh. Inspecled SLG 86980
Policy No. P1811180 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SBMOODEL Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 10/04/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Modal BMW 740L[A) c.c 2088
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg, 2015
Chassis No. WBATE22060GD99724 Colour BLACK
Odometer 63958 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/45R18 BRIDGESTONE B mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/45R18 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |275M40R18 BRIDGESTONE " 8mm ~
L/H Rear Tyre |275/40 R18 BRIDGESTONE B mm
4. Deascription of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. 2 General Information
Accident Date  09/04/2018 |inspection Date 10/0412018
Survey held at KIM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
£01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTIM&TED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR

3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Upi Ave 1 #01-25 Pays Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408633
TEL 6255 3581 FAX. 254 4315

Reg. No: 100607188R GST Reg. No 10-965071086-R Page No. 1 af 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO, SLG 9696D _
aty Description of Parts Condition mﬂﬁm 5
BEPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER [CONSISTENT) DENTED / 1.851.12 1,503.60
CRACKED
1|FRONT BUMPER PDC SENSOR N/S (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 248.70
1|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP N/S (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 38560
1|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP CHROME MOULDING N/S  |[NOT NECESSARY 205 40
(CONSISTENT)
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE (CONSISTENT) TORN 288 20 16630
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 671.45
LABOUR
1|FRONT BUMPER CENTRE GRILLE (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 362 50 208 30
1|HEADLAMP ASSY LED NIS (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 5,853.80 4,845 10
1|FRONT FENDER NIS (CONSISTENT) NOT NEGESSARY 1.012.35
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 86602
LABOUR
LESS §% DISCOUNT - 340 72
11.835.14 647358
|LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING 50.00 20.00
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING POC SENSOR 80.00 50.00
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING NOT NECESSARY 50.00
TO REFILL AIR CON GAS. NOT NECESSARY 120.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING 880.00 300.00
PARTS INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT BUMPER
REINFORCEMENT AND FRONT SUPPORT PANEL
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. §80.00 30000
1,860.00 670.00
GRAND TOTAL 13,595.14 7,143.58

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No, CC4/ASM18006594/Ufb3q2




Page Mo.-2 0l 2
Report Ref No. CC4/ASM1B008594/Ufb3qg2

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appralser

AL LAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIEE - This Aeport is mass asisly bor ihe me and berefi of ihe Clien named on (he frent page of this Report
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