Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

From: Francis Ng <francis.ng@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 8 June 2018 2:40 PM

To: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Inspection for SLP1530D // Accident on 07/04/2018 @ 13:40HR at along

Tanjong Katong Road, before Bus-stop 82099 involving Vehicle Number SLP1530D &
PC5714K; EQ REF: DM18HO00923/FN

Attachments: LKkKInspection (4).pdf; LKKAdjustment1 (3).pdf; LKK PHOTO 1.pdf; LKK Photo 2.pdf; LKK
PHOTO 3.pdf; ZPO0000AS pdf; SLP1530D.PDF; LOD.PDF

Dear Bevan,
Please proceed as proposed below,
Regards,

Francis Ng
Executive | Claims

s

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110 T
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190 [x] ©
Www.eqinsurance.com.sg

I —

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the s

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) [mailto:bevanlim@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, June 8, 2018 12:10 PM

To: Francis Ng <francis.ng@eginsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
<shupei@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Inspection for SLP1530D // Accident on 07/04/2018 @& 13:40HR at along Tanjong Katong Road,
before Bus-stop 82099 involving Vehicle Number SLP1530D & PC5714K; EQ REF: DM18HO00923/FN

YOUR REF - TBA
LKK REF - CC4/EQI18006587/Umb3s2

Dear Francis,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES PC5714K (OI) AND SLP1530D (TP) ON 07/04/2018

1



We refer to the above matter.

Our Insured Driver was charged for inconsiderate driving

We had spoken to the Insured Driver Mr Zuraimi where he confirmed accident details and was informed of the

TP claim, liability and agreed to settle and is aware of NCD issues on 09/05/2018.

In view of the above, our Insured is liable to the damages sustained by the TP vehicle.

Summary to offer to repairer Zoom AUTOWERKS PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER

Cost of Repair $ 22,748.04 $ 10,300.00
Loss of Rental ($120 x 18 days) $  2,160.00 $ 1,200.00 ($100 x 12 days)
GIA Search Fee b 7.45 5 7.45
Towing Fee b 80.00 $ 80.00

TOTAL $ 24,995.49 $ 11,587.45

Breakdown of days is as follows:
Our surveyor’s recommended days to 13days
repair
Weekends / Downtime / PRI 3 Sundays + 1 PRI + 1 DOA
TOTAL 18 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

For your approval, please.

Thank you.

Best Begards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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SLERER WET Save the Earthe Print only when necessary:

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 9 May 2018 2:34 PM
To: 'Francis Ng' <francis.ng@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

<shupei@lkkauto.com>



Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Inspection for SLP1530D // Accident on 07/04/2018 @ 13:40HR at along Tanjong Katong Road,
before Bus-stop 82099 involving Vehicle Number SLP1530D & PC5714K

Dear Francis,
We would like to request for O mailing address for mailing of letter.

Thank you.

Best Rezards,
Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

¥ EFES L ..

AR, Save the Earth: Print only when necessary-

From: Francis Ng [mailto:francis.ng@eginsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 12 April 2018 9:16 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) <bevanlim@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Inspection for SLP1530D // Accident on 07/04/2018 @ 13:40HR at along Tanjong Katong Road,
before Bus-stop 820992 involving Vehicle Number SLP1530D & PC5714K

Dear Shu Pei,
Our insured’s report is attached.

Regards,
Francis Ng
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190

WWW. Bginsurance.com.sg

I |

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the st




From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, April 11, 2018 7:52 PM

To: Francis Ng <francis.ng@eqinsurance.com.sg=

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) <bevanlim@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Inspection for SLP1530D // Accident on 07/04/2018 @ 13:40HR at along Tanjong Katong Road,
before Bus-stop 82099 involving Vehicle Number SLP1530D & PC5714K

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Francis,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SLP 1530D at M/s Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd.
Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Bevan and he can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 April 2018 9:12 AM

To: 'Francis Ng' <francis.ng@eqinsurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Inspection for SLP1530D // Accident on 07/04/2018 @ 13:40HR at along Tanjong Katong Road,
before Bus-stop 82099 involving Vehicle Number SLP15300D & PC5714K

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment,

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Francis Ng [mailto:francis.ng@eqinsurance.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 9 April 2018 6:00 PM
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Pre-Repair Inspection for SLP1530D // Accident on 07/04/2018 @ 13:40HR at along Tanjong Katong Road,
before Bus-stop 82099 involving Vehicle Number SLP1530D & PC5714K
4




Dear S5irs,
Flease arrange PRS as requested by the workshop below,

Please note that our insured has not reported yet.

Regards,
Francis Ng

Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWW.eqginsurance.com.sg

| |

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the s

From: Zoom Autowerks [mailto:zoomautowerks@gmail.com)]
Sent: Monday, April 9, 2018 5:41 PM

To: Francis Ng <francis.ng@eqginsurance.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Pre-Repair Inspection for 5LP1530D // Accident on 07/04/2018 @ 13:40HR at along Tanjong Katong Road,
before Bus-stop 82099 involving Vehicle Number SLP1530D & PC5714K

Hi Francis,
Please arrange LKK, thank you.
On Mon, Apr 9, 2018, 17:39 Francis Ng <francis.ng(@eqinsurance.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Elin,

Without Prejudice

We refer to your email below.

We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle.
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Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have any
objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors.

If we do not hear from you, you are deemed to have agreed to the appointment of any of the motor
surveyors listed by us.

Alternatively, please specify one or more of our proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment.

1) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd

Tel: 6255 0808

Fax: 68459155

2) Automobile Inspection Services
Pte Ltd

Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 6284 1539

Contact Person: Sophia

3) LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866

Fax: 6281 8748

Contact Person: Amy/ Grace

4) Priority Services

Tel: 62934822

Fax: 62963283

Contact Person: Hui Lian

5) RT Appraisal Pte Ltd
Tel: 67486076
Fax: 67480361

Contact Person: Ricky Teng

6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6256-3561

Fax: 6741-4108




7) Kelvin Automotive Appraising
Services

Tel: 81825263

Fax: 67461148

Contact Person: Kelvin

8) Automotive Appraiser &
Surveying Services

Tel: 96623655

Fax: 67655662

Contact Person: Mr Chee

9) JP Knights Pte Ltd

Tel: 63450068

Fax: 63445328

Contact Person: Edna Lee

If you object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors
whom you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration. We shall revert to you within 2 working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor before
you return your client's vehicle to him/her.

Regards,
Francis Ng
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWWw.eqinsurance.com.sg

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .




From: Joel Goh
Sent: Monday, April 9, 2018 9:06 AM

To: Francis Ng <francis.ng@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Subject: FW: Pre-Repair Inspection for SLP1530D // Accident on 07/04/2018 @ 13:40HR at along Tanjong Katong Road,

before Bus-stop 82099 invelving Vehicle Number SLP1530D & PC5714K

Dear Francis

Please assist

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 62232 4150 E R pO o =
WWwW.BINSUrance.Com.sg

e —]

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the

From: Zoom Autowerks [mailto:zoomautowerks@gmail.com

Sent: Sunday, April 8, 2018 6:20 PM

To: Elaine Cheong

Subject: Pre-Repair Inspection for SLP 1530 D // Accident on 07/04/2018 @ 13:40HR at along Tanjong Katong Road,
before Bus-stop 82099 involving Vehicle Number SLP 1530 D & PC 5714 K



Dear Sir/Madam,

We are instructed by Seng Siu Loong to notify you of a road traffic accident on 07/04/2018 at about 13:40HR
at along Tanjong Katong Road, before Bus-stop 82099 involving our client's vehicle registration number SLP
1530 D and vehicle registration number SPC 5714 K driven by your insured at the material time.

A copy of the Singapore Accident Statement/Traffic Police Report filed is enclosed. As a result of the accident,
out client's vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the damaged vehicle, please let us
know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair
survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated time, our client shall
proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

Please contact me @ 9450 7920, should you require more informaticn.

Kindly arrange survey at Blk 15 Kaki Bukit Road 4, Bartley Biz Centre, #01-53, Singapore 4178

08.

Warmest Regards,

Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd
832 Sims Avenue, Eunosville

#12-884, Singapore 400832

119450 7920

Azoomautowerks@agmail.com

Total Control Panel

E

To: elaine. cheongideqinsuranses, 0im.82 Remove this sender from my allow list
From: zoomautowerksid gmail com

You received this message because the sender is on your allow list.






To: EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road
#17-00 Tower Block MND Complex

Singapore 069110
Attn: Meotor Claims Department
Date: g™ May 2018

Dear Sir/Madam,

Claimant: Seng Siu Loong
984C Buangkok Link
#15-47 Singapore 533984

“WITHOUT PREJUDICE”

We are instructed by the above named to claim damages against you in connection with a road traffic accident on
D7/04/2018 at along Tanjong Katong Road before Bus stop 82099 invalving our client’s vehicle registration number
SLP 1530 D and vehicle registration number PC 5714 K driven by your insured at the material time.

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured's negligent driving and/or management of your
vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and our client has been put to loss and expense,
particulars of which are as follows:

1) Vehicle Repair Costs 510,300.00
2} Loss of Rental (SGD5120.00 x 18Days) $2,150.00
3) LTA Search Fee 57.45

4] Towing Fee S80.00

Total : $12,547.45

A copy each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:

Singapore Accident Statement
- Rental Invoice
- LTA Search Fee Receipt
- Towing Chit

Please send us an acknowledgement of receipt within 14 days of your receipt of this letter, failing which our client
will have no alternative but to commence proceedings against you without further notice.

Yours faithfully,
Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd

832 Sims Avenue, Eunosville
#12-884 Singapore 400832
Maohile: 9450 7920 | E-mail: zoomautowerks@gmail.com



!’ U"[ Auto

- . W Consultants
S B A R Ple Lict

21 UBIAVE 1, #011-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : 10651 62363561 FAX : 1065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC4/EQI18006587/Umb3
09 MAY 2018

D. JURAIMI TRANSPFORT 5V
Blk 702 West Coast Road
#04-347

Singapore 120702

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 5714K AND SLP 1530D ON 07/04/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if vour policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

<7
i Fal

P
Bevan Lim

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 4274| email: bevanlim(@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

&C. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Dept)



w_’__% ZOOM AUTOWERKS PTE LTD
< 832 Sims Avenue, Eunosville

S #12-884 Singapore 400832
= Tel: 9450 7920

AUTOWERKS e e

LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

Accident on (1% U4otRalong Tﬂﬂlmﬂﬂ mﬁﬂﬂ Pond bedore Bug “:TD'F" 82049
Involving "JEhIE‘JES SLP 1630 D and ~ pisIIuk™

In consideration of Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd, 832 Sims Avenue, Eunosville, #12-884 Singapore 400832,
repairing my/our motor vehicle no JLPIRIOD at my request, |/We,
L G Lopwa (“the clalmant ) of 194¢  Buanaror unk

A5-UF  &[5223484) (address) bearing NRIC No dA4 3U5 3B G the owner of motor vehicle
no SLPIBADD , hereby authorize them to demand claim, settle and receive whatever amount
settle payable by the insurance company or third party or commence_legal proceeding for cost of repairs,
loss of use and etc to any of their appointed solicitors to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim
and all the amount claimed or settled shall belong and make payable to them absolutely by the insurance
company of the third party. I/We further authorized them to give an absolute discharge on my/our behalf

and to sign discharge voucher(s) and any other documents necessaw or incidentals to the conduct and
disposal of my/our above claims.

I/We further agree to fully co-operate and attend all court hearings that are necessary to prosecute the
claims maintained by Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd.

I/We further agree and undertake to indemnify them against my/our claim for costs which arise therewith.

In the event that my/our claim is unsuccessful, I/we undertake to pay to Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd the cost
of repairs to my/our vehicle.

In the event that settlement cheque were to be drawn in my/our favour, |/we hereby give my/our
instructions to clear the said cheque on my/our behalf by presenting the same for payment directly into
Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd account. Upon clearance of the said cheque, |/we further authorize Zoom
Autowerks Pte Ltd and/or their appointed law firm to utilize the monies to pay their charges without further
reference to me. | confirm that the payment to Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd shall amount to a good discharge
of Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd and/or their appointed law firm’s obligation to me in respect of the settlement
monies.

Dated this 04 day of GH (month) 20 iE; {year)

S

Signed by “the claimant” Signed by Zodm Autowerks Pte Ltd

Name: Mhﬂ Gn_ Lo Name: __EWV (o0

-k AT R S




Z00OM AUTOWERKS PTE LTD
832 Sims Avenue, Eunosville
#12-884 Singapore 400832

email: zoomautowerks@gmail.com | Contact: 9480 7920
Co. Reg Mo 2017256036

INVOICE
To: EQInsurance Company Limited Invaice No. ¢ 210000039
5 Maxwell Road Date : 12/6/2018
#17-00 Tower Block MND Complex VRN : SLP 1530D
Singapore 069110 Make & Model : Honda Vezel
DOA 1 7/4/2018
Terms » COD
S/N. Description Qty u/P Amt
1 Repair & Respray Accldent Affected Portions 10,300.00
2 Loss of Rental ($100.00 x 12Days) 1,200.00
3 LTA Search Fee 7.45
4 Towing Fee 80.00
TOTAL : 511,587.45

| agree to the price as listed above and confirm that
poods are received in good condition

(Customer's Signature )

7

(by Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd)



S Zoom Car Leasing
2o -r;..-ﬁM Gﬂ% Registration No.: 5339410M

e-mail : zoomcarleasing@gmail.com

RENTAL INVOICE
Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd Invoice No. INVODOD188
Tel; 9450 7920 Date ] 30/4/2018
Ref : SIM 6370 E
Your Ref : SLP1530D
Terms : 30Days
# Rental Period Rate Quantity Amount
1 Rental Charges for SIM 6370 E 5120.00 18 Days 52,160.00
(07/04/2018 to 25/04/2018) :
C/0 Seng Siu Loong
934C Buangkok Link
#15-47 Singapore 533984
Contact: 9755 5416
Total - 2,160.00

Z 1
i [

{Customer's Signature/Stamp) [Fu?‘!mm Car Leasing)



RENTAL AGREEMENT

Zoom Car Leasing
Registration No.: 53349410M
E-mail: zoomcarleasing@gmail.com

HIRER'S PARTICULAR

VEHICLE DETAIL

SP1530D

Name: StAf) Siu waug: ; Vehicle No.: §JW) 6310 E
NRIC/Passport No.: SA4IUG 3R Vehicle Make/Model: WModa 3
address: ABUL Buiavaop Link #1574 Date/Time Out: 0}| 04| 201§ 3-30pm
E(i;}%-ﬂ%tf) Date/Time In: 25 |0Y ]}ﬂiﬁ =
Tel: 4355 BlUlp (el u]w%]rF] [elu]n]%]F]
Driving License No./Exp.: - out IN
ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICULAR Mileage: |4 €144 Mileage:
Name: = = _ |RENTAL CHARGES
MRIC/Passport No.: e — I Hours .@ per hour
Address: ) _lg_ Days @ Q-DU per day | ~¢-1|[39
Weeks @ per week
Months @ per month :
Tel: . __LE_Jther Charges |y =
Driving License No./Exp.: Petrol Top-Up
{A] - Accident (D) - Dent (S) - Scratch Sub-total
-~ P TOTAL CHARGES . DIko
PRE-PAYMENT

Downpayment and Deposit
Amount Refunded Due

not disgualified from driving.

PHYSICAL DAMAGE EXCESS ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

Singapore - Own Damage :SSE.UI:'.IU.UU

Singapore - 3rd Party SSE,EII:I_EI_.EJEI- =

Malaysia® 558,000.00

For Drivers aged < 17 }ﬁ?’d
or > 65 and/or less than 553,000.00

2 years driving experience (Additional)

regardless of age

i

I/We agreed to the terms and conditions above, overleaf
and that all information given are true & correct in all
respect. My/Our driving license(s) is/are current and

IMPORT NOTE:

1 OWLY PERSONS ABCVE 22 YEARS OF AGE, HOLDING A VALID SINGAPORE LICEWCE FOR
MORE THAN 2 YEARS. ALITHORISED, LICENSED AND SHGNING THIS AGREEMENT MAY DRIVE
THE VEHICLE

7. wehicle & strictly for use in Singapore cnby and may nat be driven cut of Singapore withoat
the prios written consent of Zoam Car Leasing

3. use of vehizte for fllegal purposes (e.g. In connection with theft, drug pedalling or
traffickirg, smuggling) is strictly prohshited

4 Im case of aceident, the hirer shall repor: to Zoom Car Leasing immediately

£e3

Hirer's Signature / Date

D*ﬂner‘fs'ignature / Date




AMRIPN1A Resraint

Lamd Transport Authority

Land Tranzpor! Authomily

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration Mo, : M4-0006529-2 .
' Print DateMime : 08 Apr 2018 f 18:09:00

Receipt Date/Time : 08 Apr 2018 / 18:08:00
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. | ITNET-D0000-180408-000535
Praviows Receipt Mo.

S/IN ltem Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
Mo. GST (S%) (S%) (S%)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - PC5714K
Az at 07 Apr 2018/13:40:00

Insurance Co: EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD
1 Insurance Enguiry - PCST14K "

Enquiry Fes 7.00 0.49 7.49
20180408130753297500
Sub-Total 7.00 £.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.4% 745
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 745
Paid By
XAXXCOCHXOIE2 f;';ﬁf:fécm . 745
Tovtal T7.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendersd Amount 745
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANEK YOU AND HAVE & NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and recelpt is considered void and late foe
may apply.



=2GAO

You Call, We Tow - Fast . Secured

Expr'ess Towing Services m

. Reliable

Blk 27 Marine Crescent Ville #10-01 Singapare 440027 Co. Reg. Mo. 531526031 HP: 900 300 92 Email: fimkehehotmail.com Website: hitpy/www.gasexpresstowing.sq

CASI—L%}LE/WORK ORDER

ki
Messrs: G&%H

. o
Vtﬁcle Mo: \:Pl"ﬁg‘h? rﬁoidel Mo:

H!%ﬁ.

B M (E /L)

Time (day/night): Contact No:

Iif;catiuh: ’%::ﬂ‘ﬁ Q‘(Dm iD

Y BoeqT

Jhid
%E) Others:

Cash S:

#F g Tow Truck %.,m oo
Aut’nonsed By: fM Driver Name: éﬁ g

EE AN HEL i ElT P A A AN, b : g8

Mote: Vehicle is towed at owner's risk. The company accepts no responsilbility for damages or
othar misdemeanour ta your vehicle whilst being towed.

No. 144 fg?
Date: O:{'H‘{OL[' &

!:l lump Start/Changing of battery
[:] Tyre Replacement
Accident/Breakdown
e
D Multi/Basement
[] with Load/Cargo Box
King Doll
[ ¥
D Transport Charge
D Low Body Kit
I:l Door Opening Service
I:I Crane Up/Winch Out
I:I Collect Doc/Key

|____| Repo

E:I Woodlands and Tuas Checkpoint



