TUTWLIHIE

_ASS RECBY. \ REF: (S Hﬁxﬁ\ 005G [ Rlﬁ bd;pwm futsustion:

Ty Raan! ASSIGNMENT (Office)

From (Person), ﬁ\ﬂﬂ \Qf_luﬂ_ b R;Ha _ Date/Tie: __Lﬂﬂm-u—%m
Estunaled Cost Bill b, Seeo e I
oD/ WS TP RES [ OD RES /EVA [INV I MV /G5 ’

To Inspect Vehicle o _ST-R Ebb'la ) iﬂsﬂltﬂ %‘“L uﬂhll_

ot Workshop ms e % Cumings T LT

af

e RS Pondan

e —

Policy Mo, ' Clam Mo 33111Iu ==
Sum nsared: _ _— Bacess: —
:ug;!kcﬁui;le}:;r ____ D.OA iﬂlﬁ__[‘is._
ek s ]
CA | REV | REP. | REV 24 HRS R 104305 ¢ ‘\rm oD, knﬁmml e
e Immffunc,___l\:lﬁﬁ’lﬂ‘-.% '1-“iﬁ_ﬁ[‘l Person Contacted: ‘___iqkf_‘lf.-__ e ‘\fuludu-.m
- Date/Time  |Action/Instruction ( v _3 {'.'-'-%'1““-"'“-'_ ERSIVEEES SN -
STR b1 - A - IR e
Yoy Lidodty X

||:-:rl,| hfr l':ﬂ " b rf-“ “FL; VI7E- ril ' "'IM |';;-__ f s LT ._'_,I'_

. el mj er?*rF rh f&f;_e:f?)iib vES g;ﬂf W 7/

¥ g"""'-g" E[M Wwigp's LJ“‘J M'?*L: [ wﬁa:ul_ & A 5 .»;J:f"c.:h.f
|
- i

;



S o DA REF: .

ASSIGNMENT )
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To Inspect Vehicle No. SF- {,{;L }_‘E Make: rne% W A [%Ll e | I\_:f?’?u(
at Workshop mvs EL8 L o Colour Wi MG Insured | Std | NI NA
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Policy No Cilo won[ 160421 T3 2240
Claims No, Gen. Cond: Good (Fair! Poor | Burnt
Sum Insured Excess: Steming-1 Jammed | Leaked / Burnt or
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Catherine Chunﬂ (LKK Auto!

From: KHAN Dino <dino khan@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 9 April, 2018 4:58 PM

To: Eric Lee Ming Hui; SUR; assignments

Cc: Dickson Property; chester@my-best-insurance.com; edwin@my-best-
insurance.com; amelia@my-best-insurance.com; blanca@my-best-insurance.com

Subject: NEW SURVEY FOR LKK - Cascadale #2071 - SFR6662) damaged by a fallen lamp
post - 30/03/2018, AXA REF: 8219914

Attachments: img-409161734-0001.pdf

»> Dear Eric,

Thanks for your mail. We have appointed LKK to assess the damage claim.

>> Dear LKK team,

Please liaise with Mr. Eric to fix an appointment to survey this damage and let us have your recommendations.
Best Regards

Dino Khan

Assistant manager — P&C Claims

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email: dino.khan@axa.com.sg

DID: (65) 6880 3366

Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Eric Lee Ming Hui [mailto:eric.lee @cyclecarriage.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 9 April, 2018 4:20 PM

To: KHAN Dino <dino. khan@axa.com.sg>

Cc: Dickson Property <dickson@dickson-property.com.sg>; chester@my-best-insurance.com; edwin@my-best-
insurance.com; amelia@my-best-insurance.com; blanca@my-best-insurance.com

Subject: RE: RE: Cascadale #2071 - SFR6662) damaged by a fallen lamp post - 30/03/2018, AXA REF: 8219914

Dear Ding,

Have attached the repair quotation for your perusal,

Please assist to clear the liability status by this week hopefully.
Thank you.

Your Sincerely,

Eric Lee Ming Hui



Service Advisor - Body Care & Repair
Mercedes-Benz Body Care & Repair Center
Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd

188 Pandan Loop Service Center
Mobile: 9181 7717 | DID: 6771 4336 | Fax: 6872 1272

Website: www.mercedes-benz.com.sg

From: KHAN Dino [mailto:dino.khan@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 9 April, 2018 4:04 PM

To: Eric Lee Ming Hui

Ce: Dickson Property; chester@my-best-insurance.com; edwin@my-best-insurance.com; amelia @my-best-
insurance.com; blanca@my-best-insurance.com

Subject: FW: RE: Cascadale #2071 - SFR6662) damaged by a fallen lamp post - 30/03/2018, AXA REF: 8219914

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE'

Hi Eric,

Please note my email. | was provided with the wrong one the first time round.
Best Regards

Dino Khan

Assistant manager — P&C Claims

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg

Email: dino.khan{@axa.com.sq
DID: (65) 6880 3366

Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: KHAN Dino

Sent: Thursday, 5 April, 2018 1:20 PM

To: 'eric.lee@cycle.carriage.com.sg' <eric.lee@cycle carriage.com.sg>

Cc: 'Dickson Property' <dickson@dickson-property.com.sg>; chester@my-best-insurance.com; edwin@my-best-
insurance.com: amelia@my-best-insurance.com; blanca@my-best-insurance.com

Subject: RE: Cascadale #2071 - SFR6662) damaged by a fallen lamp post - 30/03/2018, AXA REF: 8219914

WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
Hi Eric,

We understand that you are representing the owner of vehicle SFR6662J in seeking claim against the
MCST no. 2071, our insured.

We would appreciate your patience while we conduct our investigations. In the meantime, please let us
have the following for review:

1. Letter of authorization from the vehicle owner.

2. Repair quotation and claims summary.



We await your reply.
For avoidance of doubt, our involvement should not be construed as an admission of liability.

Best Regards

Dino Khan

Assistant manager — P&C Claims

AXA Insurance Pte Lid | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www axa com.sg
Email: dino.khan@axa.com.sq

DID: (65) BBB0D 3366

Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If
you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this
message. [f you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or
opinions presented in this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and
duly authorized by the said companies.

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.

----- Disclaimer-----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If
you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this
message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or
opinions presented in this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and
duly authorized by the said companies.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan {LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 23 April 2018 3:41 PM

To: KHAM Dino; Admin-D (LKKAUtO)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE' NEW SURVEY FOR LKK - Cascadale #2071 - SFR6662) damaged by a fallen
lamp post - 30/03/2018, AXA REF: 8219914

Attachments: CSAXA1B006579R1qb.pdf

Dear Dino,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SFR 6662.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: KHAN Dino [mailto:dino.khan@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 20 April 2018 1:25 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY FOR LKK - Cascadale #2071 - SFR6662) damaged by a fallen lamp post - 30/03/2018, AXA
REF: 8219914

Dear Catherine,

Understand that the Third Party vehicle was surveyed yesterday. We look forward to receiving your advice
on the repair estimate and loss of use.

Best Regards

Dino Khan

Assistant manager — P&C Claims

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email: dino.khan@axa.com.sq

DID: (65) 6880 3366

Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 19 April, 2018 9:10 AM

To: 'Eric Lee Ming Hui' <eric.lee @cyclecarriage.com.sg>; KHAN Dino <dino.khan@axa.com.sg>; "SUR'
<sur@lkkauto.comz; 'assignments' <assignments@ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Dickson Property' <dickson@dickson-property.com.sg>; chester@my-best-insurance.com; edwin@my-best-

1
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51 UBT AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 40933 TEL : (D65) 62363561 FAX : (D65) 62564315

Your Ref: 8219914 Date: 23" April 2018

Our Ref: CS/AXA18006579/R1gb

The Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Lid

Attn: Dino
Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, SFR 6662

We thank you for the instruction on 09/04/2018 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 19/04/2018 (9am) at the premises of M/s CYCLE & CARRIAGE and
have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 59 8.205.64
Revised Estimate Amount 1 5% 6,226.39
“Check™ Items Amount : 5% 285.84
Total :S% -
Market Value : 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value ) -
Nett Value :S% -

Description of Damage:

nearside
The vehicle sustained damages at the : . —
n/s rear portion. - g { |' I| 0 i} s
offsie

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages consistent.
Recommend days of repair: 5 days.

We have not authorised the repairs.

Yours faithfully

Rasul
Automobile Assessor



Mercedes-Benz

Cycle & Carriage

Industries Pte Limited
futharized Deater
Campary Mo 196400387

ESTIMATE FOR SFR6662J GST Reg No. MR-85001 11
Yehicle & Document |nformation

Mdm Or Hoon Ai WIF No 22461
Reg Mo/Reg Date SFRE662J | 2BI05/2015
730 Upper Changi Road East Date InMileage I 0
#01-02 Cheseis Mo WDD1760422J372260
Singapore 486858
Engine Mo 27091030649951
Make/Model MB/A 180 BlueEFFICIENCY (W17
_/ Colour/Tim 026 650 Calcit Whit/ 044 Anthracite
Account Mo Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Cperator
5100001 cash 09/04/2018/ 16:15 EL 350 / Eric Lee Ming Hui
Description of Goods / Services Qty Unit Price  Disg% Amount
A BPILAB _ : u;}wdm
PANEL BEATING TO.REPAIR AFFECTED AREAS, REMOVE AND REPLACE WITH NEW fﬁ
ODY PANELS AND REFINISH. A
A BPIRES 2o M
RESPRAY LH,/ REAR DOOR, LH/ REAR FENDER & LH/ REAR 'C' PILLAR. _
M BPHSUN
POLICY NO/ACC DATE :
DRIVE INJEXCESS  :
DATE IN/DATE SURVEY:
BY/AUTHRIZED ON  : 3 R, .
A BPILAB . B » 0.10 380.55;ff
USING STAR DIAGNOSTIC TO CHECK ON CONTROL UNIT RESET MEMORY. TO | -~
IDENTIFICATION STANDARD. NETT 3\ N\ i )
A BPILAB =0, | v 480.00,
REMOVE & TRANSFER DOOR HECHP.NICAL_& ELETRICAL INSTALL TO NEW DOOR.NETT
LEFT REAR DOOR : L A 1.00 1595.79 00.00 | Ff#1505.79
LH/ REAR DOOR WEATHERSTRIP . 1.00 280.72 00.00 A=~ 780,72
LH/ REAR ABSORBING DOOR 1.0 62.05 00.00 | A4~ 62.05

0

LH/ REAR DOOR HANDLE 1.00 133.41 00.00 P~ 133,41

REAR LEFT DOOR LOCK ; 1.00 285.84 00.00 $ucl 2~ 285.83
SuL~ 0

LEFT RODF WATER DEFLECTOR MOULDING 307.83 00.00 ['J/EU'?.EEI
L Qoo (ool
4o

s

T T T T X

the Repairer of the following

= Th redunday balom/afier

"...:; "

Lee Ming Hui

i

SpIAY painting

U pany survey 8 on
& Np '|Eh§3| moddication =}
* Supplementary ilamis} I

e

For I T TRRIAPE 1 o naurance Compan ==

Acknowledged by Repaira; i MNett 8,205.64
Signature: A‘\% 7% GST on B8205.64 574.39
Dite: \

| & Total Payable 8,780.03

Authorized signatary and company stamp ¥

yalidity of this estimate 15 14 days from date of guote. This is & computer geserated documest, no signatere is required.

Estimated costs quoted sre sxcluding G5T. We would meation that the abeve estimate is based on eur initial inspection and does not include any additiosal parts or labesr which may be
required after repair work has commenced. Occasionally wors of dimaged parts sre discoversd after work bas startad asd needed far repairs or replacement. Hewever, sheald this occur,
wi would advise you. Ploase be informed that a dopesit of B03 &f the ahove estimate i3 payable before commencement of the work. Payment for this may be wade in cash, credit card or
chegee, Yow must also agree to pay full emount for renewal of the wisdscresn in the event of imedvertent breakage in the course of renewing the rubber seal or other repair requiring

the revoval of the windscreen.

| Pandan Loop Service Center
@ WE DRIVE TIRST CLASS 188 Pandan Loop
Singapore 128376
Tel: 4777 8388
Fax: 677% 5383
www. marcedes-benz.com.sg Paga 1 of 1

CYCLE & CAARIAGE

{ AN wiercages Borz - are registered trademarks of Daimler, Stuttgart, Germary



Mercedes-Benz

Cycle & Carriage
Industries Pte Limited
Authorised Dealer

Company Na. 196400367W
ESTIMATE FOR SFR6662J GST g . MR 450011
PUETES & SoES NSRS Vehicle & rent infermation
}: Mdm Or Hoon Ai WIP No 22481
1 RegNoRegDate ~ SFRE662J [28/05/2015
E 730 Upper Changi Road East Date In/Mileage 8/05/2048 2y
; #01-02
c
Singapore 486858 : ] e DL
Engine No 27091030649951
Make/Mods! MB/A 180 BlueEFFICIENCY (W17
/" ColourTrim 026 650 Caleit Whit/ 044 Anthracite
Account Mo Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Oparatar
C5100001 Cash 10/07/2018/ 18:01 EL 350 / Eric Lee Ming Hui
Description of Goods / Services aty ‘Unif Price  Disc% Amount
bt
ASNOTAN-GFFICIAL TAX INVOICE
TS Qe ¢
A BPIRES 1200, 00
RESPRAY LH/ REAR DOOR, LH/ REAR FENDER & LH/ REAR 'C" PILLAR.
M BPNSUN
DATE IN/DATE SURVEY: 19-7-18 // 0900 // RASUL - LKK
DIRECT SETTLEMENT ¢ DIND KHAN - AXA // 2-5-2018
A BPILAB 0.10 380.00
USING STAR DIAGNOSTIC TO CHECK ONM CONTROL UNIT RESET MEMOBY TO
IDENTIFICATION STANDARD. METT
A BPILAB 480,00
REMOVE & TRANSFER DOOR MECHAMICAL & ELETRICA L ARIMETT
¥ LEFT REAR DOOR 1.00 1595.79 00.00 1595.79
% LH/ REAR DOOR WEATHERSTRIP : 1.00 280.72 00.00 280.72
% LH/ REAR ABSORBING DOOR 1.00 62.05 00.00 62.05
% WATER DEFLECTCR 1.00 307.83 00.00 307.83
¥ BLIND RIVET WITH PAN HEAD 10.00 2.29 00.00 22,90 .
¥ WATER DEFLECTOR MOLDING CL 1.00 5.88 00.00 5.88
Finalization
Confirmed & accepted by
Nett 6,255.17
7% GST on 6255.17 437.86
Total Payable 6,693.03

Authorized signatory and company stamp

Validity of this estirate 15 14 days frem date of quots. This iz a computer gonorated decussnt, no signature 15 reguired.

Extimated costs geoted are oxcleding G5T. We would meation that the sbove sstimate i5 Based on our initial inspection and does mot include any additiona) parts or labsur which may Be
raguired after ropair werh has comsanced, Occasionally wern or damaged parts are discovered after work has started and needed for repairs or replucesant. Bowsver, shedld thiz pooer,
we would adwise you, Flease be inforsad that a deposit of 50% of the abeve estimate |5 payable befers commencemant of tha werk. Fayment for this may be made in canh, eredit card ar
cheque. Yed must also agres te pay full ameunt for renews] of the windscress in the event of inedvertest Breakige in the course of resswing the rubber aea] or sther repair raquiring
the ramaval of the windscrees.

€€

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Fandan Loop Service Center o 5 (7 1 F
WE DRIVE FIRST CLASS 1E8 Pandan Lasp

Singapare 128378

Tel: 6777 6388

Fax 477% 5383

m Marcedes-Henz - are registesed tredemarks of Daimler, Stuttgart, Germany WA TETCECES-ENZ.COM. 28 Page 1 of |




Mercedes-Benz

Cycle & Carriage
Industries Pte Limited
Autharised Dealer

Company No. 195400367W
G3T Reg No, MR-BI00111-%

# i Document [nf lomn

J Mdm Or Hoon A Wi No 22561

E Req No/Req Data SFR6662J | 28/05/2015

:»;2 730 Upper Changi Road East Date In/Milgage 2048 e 186 P

4 #01-02 o § B J

Singapore 486858 i DO L,

; Engine No 27091030649951

% Make/Madel MB/A 180 BlueEFFICIENCY (W17
l\\- st Golour/Trim 026 650 Calcit Whit/ 044 Anthracite

Account Mo Terms DateTime Printad CSE Cparator

£5100001 Cash 19/07 /2018/ 18:01 EL 350 / Eric Lee Ming Hui

Description of Goods / Services QY Unit Price  Disc®%

THETSNOT AN OFFICIAL FAXINVOICE~"

SUPPLEMENTARY

Confimed & accepted by

Nett 28.78
7% GST on 28.78 2.01
Total Payable 30,79

Authorized signatory and company stamp

Validity of this estimate is L4 days frem date of quote. This is & corputer gemerated docusent, me sigmatere i required.

Cstismted costs gested ars excleding 85T, We would menticn that the absve sstimats 5 based on oer deitial fespectisn and does not isclede any additioss] garts or Tabour which may be
ruguired after repafr work has cosmenced. Occasionally wern er danuged parts are dscoversd after work bas started aad aseded for repairs or replacement, Reswver, shoald this sccur,
wa would adwise you. Please be informed that a deposit of 584 of the above asiimate §s payable beford comancement of the work, Payment for this may be made in cash, credit card or
chegue. You pust aleo agreas to pay full amount for renewal of the wisdscreen in the evext of inadvertent breakage 18 the course of renewing the rubber seal or sther regair requirisg
the removal of the wisdicreen,

€e

CYCLE B CARRLLOE

Fandan Loop Service Center
WE DRIVI FIRST CLASE 188 Pandan Loop
Singapoe 128378
Tel: 6777 8384
Fas: 6779 5383
m Mercades-Benz - are registered trademarns of Daimler, Stuttgart, Gemmary v, merzedes-benz.com.sg Page i of 1




T
Our ref: _:}M'— 41

Your ref:
Direct Settlement
Date: 1 _JUI 2018
To: AYA Incuvance B
Singapore
Attn: Motor Claims Department
Re:  Accident Involving Motor Vehicle Nos. S MR 6LL2 I & <
At/Along C b dale I'.."rll-.acﬂk On . ° '3’1’3 (@

; \ Fe - . : . ;
[ am the owner of vehicle no. SR 'vL‘L 1 J that was involved in an accident with your
insured vehicleno. _ — ~ of the above accident.

As the accident was caused by your insured negligent/inconsiderate driving, thus [ am claiming
from you for the following: -

1. Cost of Repairs $ iﬂ, 93.23
7 Lessoftse /Rental ( [V days@$ |22 perday) g Jooeo

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee g B

4. GIA Report Fee §_ -

5. Others _ g =

Total: $ 1,Ldh0)

[ hereby give you fourteen (14) days to comply with the above, failing which, I shall instruct my
solicitor to commence legal action against you. If you have any queries, pleasc contact the
representative of CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD at Telephone No:
67714336 (Mr Eric Lee) / 67714304 (Ms Amanda Ang).

I hereby give full authority to CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD and their
representative to negotiate/comprise settlement of the above claim on my behalf.

Your co-operation and immediate attention to the above is greatly appreciated. I hereby look
forward to hearing from you soon.

Yours faithfully

Name & Signature

Address: C/o. 188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378

Cc: Mr Eric Lee/ Ms Amanda Ang

E-mail: eric.lee@eyclecarriage.com.sg / amanda.ang@ cyclecarriage. cont.sg
Fax No, 67795383

Updated..22/01/15



TAX INVOICE

Mercedes-Benz

Cycle & Carriage

Industries Pte Limited
Autharised Dealer

Campany Mo, TRG40036TW
ST Reg Mo, MR-500111-K

Invaice Name & Address

Owner Mame & Vehicle Info

Cust No/Name WCY19385/AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
Reqg Ma/Reg Date SFREAGZ] J 28/05/2015
Date In/Mileage 08/05/2018/ 41362
MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT ;i
i Hingdtialghe Chassis No WDD1760422J372260
SINGAPORE 068811 Engine Mo 27091030649951
Contact No MakeMadel MB/A 1B0 BlueEFFICIENCY (W17
||Ii||||||HIIIIIIIWIHIMIIIIIMIIIN|||!I|||I||||!||1I|H||NI| o i
Account No Terms Date/Time Printed Oparator WIP No Invoice/Credit Mote Mo
C5I00001 cash 19/07 /2018, 18:06 EL 350 / Eric Lee Ming Hui 22461 28144475
Description of Goods [ Sarvices ity Unit Price 5% Amount 55
A BPILAB 1920.00
PANEL BEATING TO REPAIR AFFECTED AREAS, REMOVE AND REPLACE WITH NEW
BODY PAMELS AND REFINISH.
A BPIRES 1200.00
RESPRAY LH/ REAR DOOR, LH/ REAR FENDER & LH/ REAR 'C' PILLAR.
M BPNSUN F.0.C.
DATE IN/DATE SURVEY: 19-7-18 // 0900 Jf RASUL - LKK
DIRECT SETTLEMENT :  DINO KHAN - AXa /J/ 2-5-2018
A BPILAB 0.10 380.00
USING STAR DIAGNOSTIC TO CHECK ON CONTROL UNIT RESET MEMORY TO
IDENTIFICATION STANDARD. NETT
A BPILAB A480.00
PEMOVE & TRANSFER DOOR MECHANICAL & ELETRICAL INSTALL TO MEW DOOR.MNETT
% LEFT REAR DOOR 1.00 1595.79 1595.79
% LH/ REAR DOOR WEATHERSTRIP 1.00 2B0.72 280,72
¥ LH/ REAR ABSORBING DOOR 1.00 f2.058 62.05
X WATER DEFLECTOR 1.00 307.83 307.83
X BLIND RIVET WITH PAN HEAD 10.00 2.29 22.90
% WATER DEFLECTOR MOLDING CLIP 1.00 5.88 5.88
Parts 2,215.17 Hett 6,255.17
Labour 3,980.00 7% GST on 6255.17 437 .86
Standard Memu 0.00
Specialist Job Q.00 Total Payable 6,693.03
Diagnostics Job 0.00 Paid 0.00
Sundry/Others 0.00 Total Due 6,693.03
Total {w/o GST) 6,255.17
Payment should ba made strictly by cash, NETS or credit cards, Thank you.
Aoy gispaba 1o e mwaice musl be made withe 3 days. This i$ a compulear genarated documnant, Ao signature is reguired
Pandan Loop Service Center
@@ WE GRIVE FIRST CLASS 188 Pandan Loop
CYELE & CARBIAGE Singapore 128374
Tal: 4777 B3B8
) Fax: 6779 5383
';r-‘ln-r!' Mercedes-Benz - are registered trademarks of Daimiler, Stuttgart, Germany W Mefcedes-enz.cam. 38 Faga 1af 1



gﬂfﬁﬂ;ﬁnf; G?HDNS ENTERPRISE ChCln.S

Singapore 758374

Tel 67532536 Fax:67567565 www.chans.com.sg

GST Reg No: 51-836500-M

TAX INVOICE
MDM OR HOON Al INVOICE AR1805-0257
DATE 18/05/2018
TERMS c.OD
STAFF ID ELAINE
AGREEMENT NO. HA201805-0063
ATTN: ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
[DESCRIPTION | AMOUNT (SGD) __ |
Wehicle Reg No  SKU4312H 934.58
Make / Model - TOYOTAALTIS 1.6 AUTO
Rental Dates . Rental Billing From 08/05/2018 To 17/05/2018
Period ; 10 days
Rental Rate . 5% 100.00 Per Day (Including GST)
Reference Mo : SFRE662J
AMOUNT : 5% NON-TAXABLE VALUE : 0.00
ONE THOUSAND DOLLARS ONLY TAXABLE VALUE : 934.58
GST 7% : 6542
| TOTAL §§ : 1,000.00
Please make your cheques payable to . CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE
For Official USe Only
Payment Date : F {Amt
\ 3 ] CS/CCICH
NI CS/GCC /CH
Member of Loy ARTAS 353 Senibawang Road Goodlink Park Singapore 758379 T 67312536 F ATRETEAS £ salesi@oiEnG, com.sg

VRA & ARTAS "2



. CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE
363 Sembawang Road, Goodlink Park,
. Gingapore 758379,
i n Tel: 6753 2536 Fax: 8756 7565
el e Braakdown Recovary: 9?‘12 o448

RENTAL AGREEMENT 201805 -6063
Hirer's Name | Date of Birth | Passport’ Nric N Nafionaity B
MLOm D Lo boes Al ' | |
Address | Occupation _ ‘ummmmmm; imm&ﬂﬁf
Do Ul cangl T | |
T | Postal Code | ContactNo Mobile Phane No. ] T
LT dhol -0 LK Qe132r |
Jm'n:-i/-ﬂﬂ er's / Guaranior’s Name [~ Drate of Girth | Passport’ Nric Na., = Nationaiity
_uer s Hu? (el 1§57 | Suitevas
| Dccupation ‘ Driving Licance o "'T'ba;au«ﬁ.mw
|
- == I — e a. — -
Postal Code | Contact No Mobile Phone No.
| | ’ L
| | G A S W)
CHECK OUT [o% e P i — -
8 K-t (V-3Van | al B 1" 2 3 F |
CHECK IN Date Time —Mlaage_ 3 | Remarks il
IEssER | Ry i ] gﬁﬁ
| =
IMPORTANT NOTES:- LUMIT | [ RATE {$} TOTAL (&)
s Caris restricted to SINGAPORE use, See clause 1{f] for non-compliance. T | = i, |
s Mo retund will be given for vehicle thal retumns aarly. | HATE I. ¢ JL@ 1|, tm ﬂﬁ'ss |
» Own Damage Lisbility — First 51500 for damage to vehicls plus loss of |
sarmings while damaged venicle isundar repair. | DisAvE — - !
= Third Party Liability — First $2000 for any Third Party Accident Claim. [ : GST @ 7% | ! EJ‘;_{{'},
* Adggiional Excess of $3000 for drivers under 24yrs oid or above 70yrs f — , |
and/or less than 2yrs driving experience. TOTAL | 1000 -60
= Hirer & responsible for all parking fines & traffc summons. t ! ——— -
» Extension:- One day's advance notice is required otherwise no extension | EXTENSION | :
will be aliowed ! =N i =
y f | |
« \ghicle should be refumed at the same time as collection except on !
Saturday where return time i before 10am, I — o= -1 1
= ghicle reterned &fer aflice hour will be charged o the next working day. r i = | | [ |
* Hourly extension is charged at 1/5 of the daily rate, et e ' . ==
= Ag preventive maintenance, please check water & engine oil daily.
* Please check that you have not belt any of your personal belongings in the Fx'/ll. 5 {" i LH':- ﬁ"" 1}-
vehicle. Our company and stall will not be responsibie for any loss of | L [
belongings after ihe vehicle is returned. _ ; | [
s For the comion of other users, please relrain from smoking, eating or i_ | | | | =N |
carrying of pets in the car. A cleaning charge of $200 will be imposed for | = =
smoky, smelly or dirty vehicis. | DEPOSIT {refundable) S8 - N . i
= Carrying of PASSENGERS in commercial vehicle js strictly prohibited. [ i e [
Only WORKERS covered under hirer's workmen compensation are | CHANGED OVER FROM VEH. DATE |
allowead, | |
: i"We have read and agree io the terms and conditions of fhe rental agreement above and as sef ovarigal /
| MWe declare that &l this form is true and socurate.
| b '.,-
| s
| o S __
Hirer's Signature Joint Hirer's! Guarantor's Signature for CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE
e s . = = e
' VEHICLE NO. SE\-\ @I bt MDDEL (hiofy ATy (e

“Eatrate Cate o scius’ refum sed CHECH W |

- FROM HETUFIN

OPERATING HOURS: MONDAY TO FRIDAY 8.304M TO 5.30PM. SATURDAY 8.30AM TO 12.30PM. CLOSED ON SUNDAY & PUBLIC HOLIDAY



T'D: E
Ce: :

Subject: RE: Cascadale #2071 -

Without prejudice’

Dear Erig,

Dmp Khan
Assistant Manager — P&C Claims

AXA Insurance Pig Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AxA Tower, Singapore 068811 | WWw.axa.com.s
——.aXd.00m.sg

Email: djno.khan@axa_.cmgg

DID: (65) 6880 3365

Please consider the Environmen| before printing this message
This message is confidential Any unauthorized disclosure, use gr dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited.
If you are not the Intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Eric Lee Ming Hui {rnathD:eri-:.IeE@cyclecarriage.cum.sg]
Sent; Wednesday, 2 May, 2018 9:20 AM

Cc: Dickson Property -=:dicksun@dicksc—n-pmperty,cum.sg:-; chester@my—hest-insurance.mm; edwin@my-best-
insurance.r:urn; ameIfa@my-hest—insurance.mm: bIam:a@mv—best-insuranr:e.cnm

Subject: RE: Cascadale #2071 - SFR6662) damaged by a fallen lamp post - 30/03/2018, AXA REF: 82 15914

Dear Ding,

Any update?

Thank you,

Your sincerely,



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408033

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 198607188R GST Reg. Mo. 19-8607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ATTN : DINO KHAN

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01
AXA TOWERSINGAPORE 068811

Ref : CS/AXA1B006579/R1gbez

Date

17-08-2018

{L T

1

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh, PUBLIC LIABILITY Veh. Inspected SFR 8662
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No, 8219914 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From DINO KHAN Assign Date 09/04/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ A180 c.c 1595
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. WDD1760422J372280 Colour WHITE
Odometer 40621 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
i Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45 R17 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45R17 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [225/45 R17 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45 R17 BRIDGESTOMNE & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
K General Information
Accident Date  30/03/2018 |inspection Date 19/04/2018
Survey held at CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES (1886) PL
188 PANDAN LOOP
SINGAPORE 128378
(MERCEDES-BENZ)
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

§ Working Days




Nl 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

‘-J; ; ; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SFR 6662J
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Conditi
Qty Description of Parts ondition Workshop ($) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|LEFT REAR DOOR (SN) BENT 1,595.79 1,585.79
1]LH/ REAR DOOR WEATHERSTRIP (SN) NECESSARY 280.72 28072
1|LH/ REAR ABSORBING DOOR (SN) NECESSARY 62.05 62.05
1|LH/ REAR DOOR HANDLE (SN} TO REPAIR SEE 133.41 -
LABOUR
1|REAR LEFT DOOR LOCK (SN) SERVICEABLE 285.84 -
T[LEFT ROOF WATER DEFLEGTOR MOULDING (SN) cuTt 307.83 307.83
10|BLIND RIVET WITH PAN HEAD (SN) (ADDITIONAL) @%2.29 |NECESSARY 2290 22,90
1|WATER DEFLECTOR MOLDING CLIP (SN} (ADDITIONAL) |NECESSARY 5.88 5.88
2,694 42 227517
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING TQ REPAIR AFFECTED AREAS, 2,880.00 1,920.00
REMOVE AND REPLACE WITH NEW BODY PANELS AND
REFINISH. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF LH/ REAR
DOOR HANDLE
RESPRAY LH/ REAR DOOR, LH/ REAR FENDER & LH/ 1,800.00 1,200.00
REAR 'C' PILLAR.
USING S5TAR DIAGNOSTIC TO CHECK ON CONTROL 380.00 380.00
UNIT RESET MEMORY TO IDENTIFICATION STANDARD.
REMOVE & TRANSFER DOOR MECHANICAL & 480.00 480.00
ELECTRICAL INSTALL TQ NEW DOCR
5.540.00 3,980.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,234 .42 6,255.17
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS [ | 6,255.17]

Report Ref No. CS/AXA18006579/R 1 gbe2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS
Automotive Assossor

MMSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report s made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report,

Lility of responsibility whalsoeyve

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE,AMIRTE, AMSAE-A M.MATA|

Licensed Appraiser




