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&1 UBT AVE 1, #)1-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: (065) 2563561 FAYX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18002770MFSH Date: 12 April 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCIL18006561/R1td3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear SirfMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __PC 3251S.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 11/04/2018 at the premises of M/s SC Auto Industries (S) Pte Ltd and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 185  2.820.00
Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 1.640.00
“Check™ Items Amount : 5% -
Market Value : 5% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : S8 -

Nett Value 1 5% -
Description of Damage: T

The vehicle sustained damages

at the n/s front portion. el @ fror

offside

Repair days: 3 Days

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully,
Mohd. Rasul
Automotive Assessor



MS. Firs tCE Pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited ccfeq no 1990001080 657 Reg e, ME-0001676.9

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (65) 6227 2311 Faw (BS) 6227 3547

Cialms & Metor Undervriting Dept: 36 Rabinsan Road #16-01 Clty House Singapare 068377
Tel (65] 6507 3848 Fax: [65) 6507 3649
www. msfirstcapital com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person
Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

09-04-2018 Our Ref No. D18002770MFSH
03-03-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHADBT2A Third Party Vehicle. PC32515

51 SENOKO ROAD
AELYNE LEE MEI LIN
67582222/ 0 Fax No. 62576931

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: ACCIDENT NOT REPORTED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use {based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc: TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

SC AUTO INDUSTRIES

{S) PTELTD Attention. NIL
A TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,

This is a computer generated latter, no signature required




ShirleI Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Thursday, 12 April 2018 3:58 PM

To: cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg; SITHARA@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG;
denisetay@lkkauto.com

Cc: 'SUR'"; assignments@Ikkauto.com

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1 8002770MFSH/1, PC 32515

Attachments: pC 32515 - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Sir'Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle PC 32515
Date of survey: 11/4/2018
Number of days:3 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-23 | sl408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 April 2018 9:19 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’ <cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <zssipnments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: SITHARA@MSEIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR =sur(@lkkauto . com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002770MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: H256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@ msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 9 April 2018 5:40 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORC LAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM .5G; SITHARA@MSF RSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002770MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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SCAUTO

SC AUTO INDUSTRIES (S) PTE LTD
51 Senoko Road, Singopore 758133
T 65 6758 2222

F 65 6257 6931

E soles@scauto.com.sg

scauto.com.sg

Co. Reg. No. 1998001070

MIS KHIM SEAH ENTERPRISE PTE LTD ESTIMATE Bill
NO 71 WOODLANDS IND PARK E9 GST Reg. No: 19-9800107D
406-08 WAVE 9 . o
SINGAPORE 757048 Date: 9/3/2018
) Our Case Ref, SC18/03/047/4KS-TP
Insured  KHIM SEAH ENTERPRISE PTE LTD e S
Accrdent Date 332018
Policy VEX/P0902358/00225
Damaged Vehicle No: PC32518
S/no Description OTY Price  Disc Amount
Replaced Parts
| DOOR RUBBER L pc saa000  SNC M s240.00
Labour Charges
I SPRAY PAINTING I $1.300.00 - (WL 5136000
2 LABOUR FOR LHS FRONT PORTION | $1,280.00

ihe Repairer of th
» To resurvey be
» To display damag
« Pans prices are subject

» Third pasty survey is an-a "

owing.
r Speay painiing
riis) during resuryoy

to confirmation

» Mo illegal modification|
« Supplemantary bemis) must ba res eved and
] :ﬁniecl_ o final approval from Insurancé Lompany

Acknowladged by Repairer
Signature:

Date:

I |
=

U

1A
Vi

Authorised S{znature

Sub Total

5 2.820.00




{: » SC AUTO INDUSTRIES (S) PTELTD

: E ’_ﬁ ||| t” !”':.Ir;__; :15';_||_:E1, "~'.|F|E_]FI[‘.II'H|-‘ .'J..r'.IEJ. |Jli
: T &5 6758 2222 F 65 6257 69N
J’ 50|ps@sCauto.com.sg

SCAUTO scauto.com.sg
Co. Reg No 1998001070
MIS KHIM SEAH ENTERPRISE PTE LTD Final Bill
N” Tl “‘IDDDIANUH IN” P.n"'l.ﬂk IU Ul;l Rl..'Lﬂ. MNo: 19-9800 107
06-08 WAVE 9 N .
SINGAPORE 757048 Dhate: 362018
losured  KHIM SEAH ENTERPRISE PTE LTD HIRrCase Rel, FL S AR Ts-TH
Accidem Date 332018
Policy VEX/PO902358/00225
Damaged Vehicle No: PC32518
S/no Description QTY Price  Dise Amount
Labour Charges
I SPRAY PAINTING | S1.000.00 - $1.000.00
2 LABOUR FOR LHS FRONT PORTION ! S640.00 2 $640.00
{
Sub Total 5 1L640.00
GST (7%) S 11480
| ¥,
ml/ Total Amount $ 1,754.80

Authorised Signature




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No, 18-8607108-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref - CS/FCIMB006561/R1td3n2
#15.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068677 S R sk I“”“I"‘”"I"‘lm
Code : FCIZ2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 872A Veh. Inspected PC 32515
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D1B002770MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From SITHARA Assign Date 09/04/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model ISUZU LT434P c.c 7790
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. JALLT434PETO0007T Colour MULTI
Odometer 239310 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Meodification NIL
General FAIR
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |295/80R225 BRIDGESTOMNE B mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/B0R225 BRIDGESTONE B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |295/80 R22.5 (D) BRIDGESTOME B/8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |295/80 R225 (D) BRIDGESTONE B/8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date  03/03/2018 Inspection Date 11/04/2018
Survey held at SC AUTO INDUSTRIES (S) PTE LTD
51, SENOKO ROAD #03-01
SINGAPORE 758133
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

3 Working Days




TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

B4 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9807198-R Page Mo.;1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. PC 32518
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qty P Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMEMT OF PARTS
1|{DOOR RUBBER (SN} SERVICEABLE 240.00 -
240.00 d
LABOUR
SPRAY PAINTING 1,300.00 1,000.00
LABOUR FOR LHS FRONT PORTION. 1.280.00 640.00
2,580.00 1,640.00
GRAMND TOTAL 2,820.00 1,640.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 1,640.00]

Report Ref No, CS/FCI18006561/R11d3n2

MG

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng.AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report s made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




