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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 5:33 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'Keline'; SUR

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: YRef: AYC2105.16.kt : ORef: TWK/DN/0936/16 - SJS 149L

Attachments: LKKAdjustment1a.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf; LKKInvoice1.pdf; photo.pdf

Dear Keline, 

 

Enclosed herewith SJE report (soft copy). 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 4:28 PM 

To: 'Keline' <keline@yoga-legal.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YRef: AYC2105.16.kt : ORef: TWK/DN/0936/16 - SJS 149L 

 

Dear Keline, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Dear Veron, 

 

FYNA. Our Ref: CS/LAW18006544/Avb 

 

 
BEST REGARDS, 

G.Nivitha | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Keline [mailto:keline@yoga-legal.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 4:26 PM 

To: 'Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; sur@lkkauto.com 

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YRef: AYC2105.16.kt : ORef: TWK/DN/0936/16 - SJS 149L 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Catherine, 

 

Kindly let us have a copy of the SJE report urgently.  
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Thank you.  

 
Regards 
 
Keline Tung (Ms) 
M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC 
883 North Bridge Road 
#19-05 Southbank 
Singapore 198785 
(UEN No. 201333127N) 
(GST Reg No. 201333127N) 
Tel        : (65) 6292 5838 
Fax       : (65) 6292 5938 
Email    : keline@yoga-legal.com 
 

 

 

Important Note: This electronic mail transmission (including any attachments) is private and confidential and may 
contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy or disseminate the 
information contained herein. Please delete this message and its attachments immediately and contact us at (65) 
6292 5838, if you have received this message in error. Thank you. 
 

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 26 July, 2018 05:20 PM 

To: 'Keline'; sur@lkkauto.com 
Cc: 'assignments' 

Subject: RE: YRef: AYC2105.16.kt : ORef: TWK/DN/0936/16 - SJS 149L 

 

Dear Keline, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Dear Veron, 

 

FYNA. Our Ref: CS/LAW18006544/Avb 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Keline [mailto:keline@yoga-legal.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 26 July, 2018 5:17 PM 

To: 'Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YRef: AYC2105.16.kt : ORef: TWK/DN/0936/16 - SJS 149L 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Catherine, 

 

We refer to the above subject matter and our earlier email of 9 April 2018. 

 

Kindly let us have your “SJE” report urgently within the next seven (7) days. 

 

Thank you.  
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Regards 
 
Keline Tung (Ms) 
M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC 
883 North Bridge Road 
#19-05 Southbank 
Singapore 198785 
(UEN No. 201333127N) 
(GST Reg No. 201333127N) 
Tel        : (65) 6292 5838 
Fax       : (65) 6292 5938 
Email    : keline@yoga-legal.com 
 

 

 

Important Note: This electronic mail transmission (including any attachments) is private and confidential and may 
contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy or disseminate the 
information contained herein. Please delete this message and its attachments immediately and contact us at (65) 
6292 5838, if you have received this message in error. Thank you. 
 

From: Keline [mailto:Keline@yoga-legal.com]  
Sent: Monday, 9 April, 2018 11:02 AM 

To: 'Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)' 
Cc: 'assignments'; jasbaer.kaur@tkqp.com.sg 

Subject: RE: YRef: AYC2105.16.kt : ORef: TWK/DN/0936/16 - SJS 149L 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Catherine, 

 

Refer to our earlier telephone conversation. 

 

We write to confirm the re-inspection of our client’s vehicle SJS 149L as follows:- 

 

Date      :               11 April 2018 (Wednesday) 

Time:     :               3.00 pm 

Venue  :               Twincar Automotive Pte Ltd 

                                2 Kaki Bukit Avenue 2 

                                #01-17 Kaki Bukit Auto Hub 

                                Singapore 417921 

                                Contact: Ms. Emily 

                                Tel: 6-842-0051                   

 

Kindly let us have your SJE report within the next four weeks from the date of re-inspection. 

 

Thank you.  

 
Regards 
 
Keline Tung (Ms) 
M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC 
883 North Bridge Road 
#19-05 Southbank 
Singapore 198785 
(UEN No. 201333127N) 
(GST Reg No. 201333127N) 
Tel        : (65) 6292 5838 
Fax       : (65) 6292 5938 
Email    : keline@yoga-legal.com 
 

 

 

Important Note: This electronic mail transmission (including any attachments) is private and confidential and may 
contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy or disseminate the 
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information contained herein. Please delete this message and its attachments immediately and contact us at (65) 
6292 5838, if you have received this message in error. Thank you. 
 

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Monday, 9 April, 2018 10:42 AM 

To: keline@yoga-legal.com 
Cc: 'assignments' 

Subject: RE: YRef: To be advised : ORef: TWK/DN/0936/16  

 

Dear Ms Keline, 

 

Kindly arrange RI appointment for this SJE. 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: catherine [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 24 August, 2017 4:07 PM 

To: 'Jasbeer Kaur on behalf of Narayanan Ramasamy' <jasbeerkaur@tkqp.com.sg> 

Cc: danielcheong@tkqp.com.sg; andy@yoga-legal.com; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YRef: To be advised : ORef: TWK/DN/0936/16  

 

Dear Daniel, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Kindly provide us the full set colour photograph for PAR Automotive. 

 

Dear Andy, 

 

Kindly arrange RI appointment for this SJE. 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Jasbeer Kaur on behalf of Daniel Cheong [mailto:jasbeerkaur@tkqp.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 24 August, 2017 2:43 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Daniel Cheong Yong Liang <danielcheong@tkqp.com.sg>; andy@yoga-legal.com 

Subject: FW: YRef: To be advised : ORef: TWK/DN/0936/16  

Importance: High 

 

Dear Sirs, 

 

MC SUIT NO. 9030 of 2016 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJS 149L, FBB 4233J AND SKV 5829Y ON 20.10.2015 ALONG BKE TOWARDS WOODLANDS 

BEFORE BUKIT PANJANG EXIT ABOUT 1820 HRS 

 

We refer to the above matter.  
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M/s C Yogarajah LLC acts for the Plaintiff and M/s Tan Kok Quan Partnership acts for the Defendant, whose vehicle 

No. is FBB 4233J. 

 

Please be informed that the Court has appointed, Mr Adrian Ling you as the Single Joint Expert for this action to 

provide an independent assessment in respect of cost of repairs to motor car No. SJS 149L.  We forward herewith 

copies of 2 survey reports and accident reports for your perusal. 

 

Kindly note that as Single Joint Expert appointed by the Court, your primary duty is to the Court and you are 

required to give a fair and reasonable assessment of cost of repairs for SJS 149L. 

 

Your report to be released within 4 weeks from today.   

 

Based on our previous record, Mr Adrian Ling’s fees for SJE report is $500.00. 

 

Kindly liaise with M/s C Yogarajah LLC on when you can conduct the re-survey of the Plaintiff’s vehicle.  Their contact 

no. is 62925838 and their reference No. AY/C2105/16 

 

All the documents have been placed under this link  

 

Link as below: 

 

https://tkqp.sharepoint.com/insurancelitigation/_layouts/15/guestaccess.aspx?docid=1f8696722f37f43828c241895

cda1c0d8&authkey=AZbmAy9FBpOZ1O9K7HYLvTk  

 

 

Regards, 
Daniel Cheong 
Associate 
 
_________________________________________________________________ 

 

 

Tan Kok Quan Partnership 

Advocates & Solicitors, Singapore 

1 Wallich Street #07-02 Guoco Tower Singapore 078881 

T (65) 6225 9333 

D (65) 6496 9590 

F (65) 6227 6116 

E danielcheong@tkqp.com.sg 

W www.tkqp.com.sg  

This email is intended solely for the abovenamed addressee(s). It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. If this email has reached you in error, 
please delete it immediately and inform us of the error. Thank you for your co-operation. 

Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information can be intercepted, corrupted, lost, or it may arrive late or contain viruses. The 
sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message which arise as a result of Internet transmission. 
 

 

 

_________________________________________________________________ 

 

 

Tan Kok Quan Partnership 

Advocates & Solicitors, Singapore 

1 Wallich Street #07-02 Guoco Tower Singapore 078881 

T (65) 6225 9333 

D (65) 6496 9588 
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F (65) 6227 6116 

E jasbeerkaur@tkqp.com.sg  

W www.tkqp.com.sg  

This email is intended solely for the abovenamed addressee(s). It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. If this email has reached you in error, 
please delete it immediately and inform us of the error. Thank you for your co-operation. 

Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information can be intercepted, corrupted, lost, or it may arrive late or contain viruses. The 
sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message which arise as a result of Internet transmission. 
 

 

 

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 

www.avg.com  

 


