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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

I

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 9 April 2018 8:08 AM

To: 'Irene Tan": Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto);
assignments

Cc: . SUR

Subject: RE: Please let us have the pre-accident market value of SGK979K; Our claim no.:
550917/1T

Dear Irene,

The market value for SGK 979K is $36K - $40K (Est) as at Feb 2018.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Irene Tan [mailto:irene_tan@sg.msig-asia.com]

Sent: Saturday, 7 April 2018 3:59 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau
(LKKAuto) <olivialau@Ikkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Please let us have the pre-accident market value of SGK979K; Our claim no.: 550917/1T
Importance: High

Dear Veron,

Please see attached and let us have the pre-accident market value of SGK979K at the time of the accident on 27.2.18
asap or within the next 7 days by Friday, 13.4.18.

Best Regards

Irene Tan
Senior Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2541 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | irene_tan@sg.msig-asia.com

insurer Claims
__ Team of the Year
FHIC 2016
Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
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MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type:
Owmner 1D:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

intended De-registration
Date:

Vehicte Make:
Vehicle Modet:
Primary Colour:
Mar.;aufe.a.ctﬁrin.g Year:.
Engine No.:

Chassis No:

Maximum Power Output:

Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:

First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Singapore NRIC

3982A

SGK979K
Yes

01Mar 2018

BMW.

251X

Grey

2008
75934346N52825AF
WBANUS:O@28§496
1600 ka (214 bhp)
$53.726.00

31 Dec 2008

31Dec 2068

1

$537256.00

. Intended PARF Rebate Details
. PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

© COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

i COE Period(Years):

. QP Paid:

" COE Rebate Amount:

! Total Rebate Amount:

Yes
30 Dec 2018
$26,863.00

- 30Dec 2018
E - Open Category
10
$6889.00
$404.00
$27,267.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 01 Mar 2018
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