Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 4 May 2018 8:05 AM

To: ‘Janice Kee'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Single joint expert report (Vehicle No.SLB 4458 J) Ari Goh Ref:
DAI.17.0282.wt.LSM Our Ref: C900-ACC-37834.17sf

Attachments: LKKAdjustment1a.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf; LKKInvoice1.pdf; photo.pdf

Dear Janice,

Enclosed herewith SJE report (soft copy).

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janice Kee [mailto:janice.kee@ksteoptr.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 May 2018 8:56 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Single joint expert report (Vehicle No.SLB 4458 J) Ari Goh Ref: DAI.17.0282.wt.LSM Our Ref: C900-ACC-
37834.17sf

Dear Catherine / Veron,
We refer to your email dated 24 April 2018.
Kindly let us have your SJE report on an urgent basis.

Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Kee

c/o Teo Keng Siang LLC

111 North Bridge Road,
#29-07/08 Peninsula Plaza,
Singapore 179098

Tel: 6333 4222 Fax: 6333 5676



On Tue, Apr 24, 2018 at 7:08 PM, Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Janice,

Thank you for your email.

Dear Veron,

FYNA. Our Ref: CS/LAW18006387/Gvb

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janice Kee [mailto:janice.kee@ksteoptr.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 24 April, 2018 10:18 AM
To: Catherine Chong <catherinechong90.cc@gmail.com>; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Single joint expert report (Vehicle No.SLB 4458 J) Ari Goh Ref: DAI.17.0282.wt.LSM Our Ref: C900-ACC-
37834.17sf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Catherine

We refer to the above matter.



Kindly let us have your SJE report ASAP.

Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Kee

c/o Teo Keng Siang LLC
111 North Bridge Road,
#29-07/08 Peninsula Plaza,

Singapore 179098
Tel: 6333 4222 Fax: 6333 5676

On Mon, Apr 16, 2018 at 2:03 PM, Janice Kee <janice.kee @ksteoptr.com> wrote:

Regards,

Janice Kee

c/o Teo Keng Siang LLC
111 North Bridge Road,
#29-07/08 Peninsula Plaza,

Singapore 179098
Tel: 6333 4222 Fax: 6333 5676

—————————— Forwarded message ----------

From: Janice Kee <janice.kee @ksteoptr.com>

Date: Mon, Apr 16, 2018 at 2:00 PM

Subject: Re: Single joint expert report (Vehicle No.SLB 4458 J) Ari Goh Ref: DAI.17.0282.wt.LSM Our Ref: C900-
ACC-37834.17sf

To: "Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)" <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>




Cc: assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>, Shimin <shimin@agp.com.sg>, willy@agp.com.sg, Kenneth Wong
Yong Sheng <kenneth.wong@ksteoptr.com>

Without Prejudice

Dear Catherine

Please see attachment.

Thank you.

Regards

Janice

Regards,

Janice Kee

c/o Teo Keng Siang LLC
111 North Bridge Road,
#29-07/08 Peninsula Plaza,

Singapore 179098
Tel: 6333 4222 Fax: 6333 5676

On Mon, Apr 16, 2018 at 11:02 AM, Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Janice,

Kindly assist URGENTLY.



Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, 14 April, 2018 11:51 AM

To: Janice Kee' <janice.kee@ksteoptr.com>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'Shimin' <shimin@agp.com.sg>; 'willy@agp.com.sg'
<willy@agp.com.sg>; 'Kenneth Wong Yong Sheng' <kenneth.wong@ksteoptr.com>; 'will.tay@agp.com.sg'
<will.tay@agp.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Single joint expert report (Vehicle No.SLB 4458 J) Ari Goh Ref: DAI.17.0282.wt.LSM Our Ref: C900-
ACC-37834.17sf

Dear Janice,

Kindly provide us Survey report of Absolute Appraisal Services Pte Ltd and colour copied photographs of SLB
4458 J.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janice Kee [mailto:janice.kee@ksteoptr.com]
Sent: Friday, 6 April, 2018 10:08 AM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; Shimin <shimin@agp.com.sg>; willy@agp.com.sg; Kenneth Wong
Yong Sheng <kenneth.wong@ksteoptr.com>; will.tay@agp.com.sg

Subject: Re: Single joint expert report (Vehicle No.SLB 4458 J) Ari Goh Ref: DAI.17.0282.wt.LSM Our Ref: C900-
ACC-37834.17sf




Dear Catherine

We refer to your email dated 5 April 2018

We confirm your appointment for re-inspection as per your email dated 5 April 2018.

The address is 300 Sembawang Road S(758532), please call Leong Wai Kiong at 96805051, when about to reach.

Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Kee

c/o Teo Keng Siang LLC
111 North Bridge Road,
#29-07/08 Peninsula Plaza,

Singapore 179098
Tel: 6333 4222 Fax: 6333 5676

On Thu, Apr 5, 2018 at 7:20 PM, Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Janice,

Can we arrange appointment Rl 17.04.2018 @ 10am to 12pm at Khatib Camp guardroom?

Best Regards,



Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janice Kee [mailto:janice.kee@ksteoptr.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 April, 2018 10:09 AM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; Shimin <shimin@agp.com.sg>; willy@agp.com.sg; Kenneth
Wong Yong Sheng <kenneth.wong@ksteoptr.com>; will.tay@agp.com.sg

Subject: Re: Single joint expert report (Vehicle No.SLB 4458 J) Ari Goh Ref: DAI.17.0282.wt.LSM Our Ref: C900-
ACC-37834.17sf

Without Prejudice

Dear Catherine

Please be informed that our client is available on 17 April 2018, 18 April 2018 and 20 April 2018 from 10 am to 12pm at
Khatib Camp guardroom.

The address is 300 Sembawang Road S(758532), please call Leong Wai Kiong at 96805051, when about to reach.

Kindly let us have the confirmation soonest possible.

Thank you.

Regards

Janice

Regards,



Janice Kee
c/o Teo Keng Siang LLC

111 North Bridge Road,
#29-07/08 Peninsula Plaza,
Singapore 179098

Tel: 6333 4222 Fax: 6333 5676

On Tue, Apr 3, 2018 at 8:39 PM, Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Janice,

Kindly arrange Rl appointment for this SJE case.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janice Kee [mailto:janice.kee@ksteoptr.com]

Sent: Monday, 2 April, 2018 8:10 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; admin-d@Ilkkauto.com; Shimin <shimin@agp.com.sg>;
willy@agp.com.sg; Kenneth Wong Yong Sheng <kenneth.wong@ksteoptr.com>; will.tay@agp.com.sg

Subject: Re: Single joint expert report (Vehicle No.SLB 4458 J) Ari Goh Ref: DAI.17.0282.wt.LSM Our Ref: C900-
ACC-37834.17sf

Dear Mr Xing Guo Qiang
Please be informed that you are nominated as the Single Joint Expert for this matter.
We act for Leong Wai Kiong, the owner of SLB 4458 J, which was involved in a road accident on 14 March

21017. M/s Ari Goh & Partners acting for Direct Asia Insurance (S) Pte Ltd, the insurers of SKF 9265 G.
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Please be informed that you are jointly appointed as a Single Joint Expert to put up your SJE report by 26 April
2018.

We attach herewith copies of the following documents for you to take into consideration in putting up your
report:-

a. Survey report of Absolute Appraisal Services Pte Ltd dated 15 April 2017 and 37 pages of colour copied
photographs of SLB 4458 J.

b. Accident Statement and Police report of driver of SLB 4458 J.

¢. Accident Statement of driver of SKF 9265 G

d. re-inspection report done by Vicom Ltd dated 8/10/2017

Please let us know does any physical re-inspection require, if needed kindly keep us posted in advance so that
we are able to make necessary arrangement.

We shall be obliged if you will let us have your SJE report as soon as possible.

Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Kee

E 20180402195903703.pdf

c/o Teo Keng Siang LLC

111 North Bridge Road,
#29-07/08 Peninsula Plaza,
Singapore 179098

Tel: 6333 4222 Fax: 6333 5676
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