MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reg. No. 201427944N)

Date - 04/06/2018

Your Ref - SHC52347Z

To . AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
Attn . Motor Claims Department
Dear Sir/Mdm,

RE: ACCIDENT INV OLVING VEHICLE SJS8543D & SHC5234Z ON 30/0
ROUNDABOUT TOW ARDS TUAS CHECKPOINT.

We refer to the above matter.

Attached copies of the following for your kind perusal:

1) Proforma Bill No.188172 @ $$3,424.00 (Inclusive Of 7% GST)
2) Loss of Use @ S$480.00 (8 Days x S$60)

3) LTA Search @ $$29.00

4) Authorisation to Act

5) GIA Report

Hope the above is in order and kindly let us have your confirmation soon.
Tax invoice will be issue upon amount finalized.

Thank You.

Yours faithfully,

Z\ON o
SLE

HP: 9188 6931
E-mail: mg3solution@gmail.com

3/2018 AT



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 10 June 2019 4:41 PM

To: ‘claims@transcab.com.sg’; Ng Wai Yin; ‘jasminetan@transcab.com.sg‘

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 5234Z(AXA) AND SJS 8543D ALONG/AT JALAN

AHMAD IBRAHIM ON 30/03/2018

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Lid to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

we would like to request the following documents (if any): -

e Police Investigation Result (PIR)
« Video footage

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

sent: Saturday, 16 March 2019 11:45 AM

To: claims@transcab.com.sg

Cc: ‘carrisalee@ava-ins.com' <carrisalee@ava-ins.com>; ‘foonghon@ava-ins.com' <foonghon@ava-ins.com=>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 5234Z AND SJS 8543D ALONG/AT JALAN AHMAD IBRAHIM ON 30/03/2018

16 MARCH 2019

Transcab Taxi
Singapore

Dear Sir,
OUR REF : CC4/AXA18006347/Ap03

YOUR REF  : P1680520 (SHC 5234I)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 52347 AND $JS 8543D ALONG/AT JALAN AHMAD IBRAHIM ON 30/03/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from MG SOLUTION PTE LTD acting on behalf of the owner of §J§ 8543D against
your motor insurance policy.




We have reviewed the matter and based on the circumstances of accident and both parties damage
profile, there is No conclusive evidence o substantiate either's parties version. Both parties involved have
given conflict of version. Pursuant fo the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver
had amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the
appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party
claimant.

We also wish to advise that there is an excess of $$5,000/- is attached with Third Party Claims. Please be
informed that you shall be liable for the excess following any settlement of the third party claim. The
applicability of the excess is as follows:

1) Any settlement equal to or above the excess. you shall be liable o make the payment of $5000/-; or
2) Any settlement below the excess, you shall be liable for the amount settled.

wWe shall keep you informed of the third party claim settlement and thereafter kindly let us have the excess
payment in your cheque payable to “AXA Insurance Pte Ltd". Please indicate your vehicle registration
number and the date of accident on the back of the cheque.

Notwithstanding the excess being applied and/or received by us for the above subject matter, we
expressly reserve all our rights under the policy to refund the excess payment in the event that there arises
any known policy breach and or exclusion material to coverage.

As Insurers, we shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to
the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to
take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply fo
us within 10 days from the date of this lefter. You intent must be formally expressed to AXA and
acknowledged by AXA.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following if not provided
at our reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

. Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
. Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

. Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

. Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

. Video footage of accident (if any)

. statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

. If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are fo

keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim.

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third
Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise Of setflement without our prior
knowledge and consent. If you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons
in connection with this accident, please forward it to AXA immediately. You may email it to cst@axa.com.sd
| chewhi@lkkauto.com OF deliver it by hand to our Customer Care Centre.

This letter should not be regarded as waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any
breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the
final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6742 3197 or email us at
chewht@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.




Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
03 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 (South Wing) #02-03B
Vicom Inspection Centre, Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
GST Reg. No. : 201427944N

MOTOR CLAIM DISCHARGE

INSURED: {4//!/4(,5,2#///1/1&71/

e
CAR/ LORRY/CYCLE: REG NO: wovene Sﬂg&ﬂzf'o POLICY NO: cowisvusmseiionssisiioissnionuensssssnssasssratsssoses

ACCIDENT CLAIM NO: couiricciassammnssssransmmmisranssessissasass

I/ We confirm that 1 / we have taken delivery of Car / Lorry / Motor Cycle

Registered No. §1jggg?"gl)'fra:.»m the repairers,

MESSIS wveeene

And that all repairs necessary as a result of an accident in which the said vehicle was Involved on or
30 0l /8 .
ABOUL the weeweeemrwerss GBY OF cusseremsirissiZonsnrs 20umamone have been completed to my / our satisfaction, and that

1/ we have no further claim on the above company in Respect thereof.

_QUL O

DEEEL +1sisvass svssasmerrisirenmpasissd SETRHRTAS SIENATUTE: < rriesnosenfiizagiessesssssssasvennaseunes

CO'S SEAMP: ovvnmninsrssesanmsunirinssess NRIC NO: corevtrsissesmrasmssiosinsss sesussmassnsasans ssaten

o



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

Name : Shina L 2 E#}LMAW
nadress - 8Lk 193 IR RIS Srecer //
Ao0d-n/ $ ( $1dlay)

Contact No

TO:  pyp [MSUPANCE Sinah PerE P7e ¢t

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING Sz AND SHC 60342 %ﬂ/é/fcf’

ON
AT/ ALONG Round dbout  AwardS Tual Check fo.nt

I/We,
motorcarno. ?j' g &Wg!)

, am/are the registered owner of

Please note that | have assigned all compensations monies due to me/us in the above said accident
to M/S MG SOLUTION PTE LTD.

I/We, hereby authorize you to release all compensation monies pertaining to the sbove-mentioned
aceident to M/S MG SOLUTION PTELTD and forward your settlement cheque to M/S MG SCLUTION
PTE LTD whom | had authorized to collect the said compensation monies.

Thankyou

Lo A

e

signature of Claimant Witness By



Provided always that (hg discharge of my
Claim for damages refating to the damage 1o

my vehicle shay not prejudice or affect my
further  elaim for general

AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

r,  SHINEL B Pa many

claimant”)

of Lle /@ FA(’K KK fTﬂéE‘[ (| # ()),/[” < (;'/d{/(l;)

address) ,

(“the third party

owner of §J§ 9@39 (vehicle no.) hereby authorize

mlS ma SeluTioy Ple 170

(“The workshop”) to act for me with respect to my claim for

repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use ("elaim") for my

Vehicle No. gjg E@ZD that was damaged pursuant to the

accident which occurred on 30/3 /f (date) along /?C’U/Ic/&’iécwf

%Uu\/ﬂ-fr—{g 7“5! - C/’IIZ( éﬁﬂ:ﬂf (location)
involving Vehicle No/s <~/’/C §‘,)3 ke 2Z

("The accident®).

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned
claim in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further
authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim
with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshep.

further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach
on my behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of
lizbility basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the
other vehicle/s is conecernad.

Dated this g day of L* (month) 20 ‘% (year)

g2 o =
HQQ:L&&HR‘&:b = J5i

=

% */
: Zg27ga0,
Signed by “the third party claimant® Signé‘b{ﬁgthe workshop”



AXA THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

SHC 5234z Gmeweni s B ]
P veh Jedel: ROUNDABOUT TOWARDS
SJS8543D  (TPveh} | Model: rjag CHECKPOINT |
30/03/2018 06:00 o R o 1
872029 B ! ]
- 3,424.00 @ 50% : $1,712.00 ]
N 210 @ 50% : $105.00 | 7 daysat$ 30.00per day
5 o days at per day
B0, oo !
" Final Settlement Sum s 1.846.00 - T ’
' payee vame : MG Solution Pte Ltd .
| Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? | 1 YES [/]  NO  [Kindly indicate below)
A) T Fur Non GlA Registered \.’Jorksiwop: Agreed Liability __'9Q7 (%)
i B8) For GIA Registered Workshop: BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No  BOLA Scenario No: _____
BOLA Liakiity: %) Assessed Liabiliey (*):___ (%)
+ Assessed Liobility to be filled only for chain collisions and for coses where BOLA does not apply.

‘?ﬂ_::na:ks

NOTE:

1. PLEASE EXPRESSLY RESERVE YOUR CLIENT'S RIGHTS IF SO REQUIRED IN THIS SETTLEMENT DOCUMENT.
2. THIS SETTLEMENT IS ON A WITHOUT PREJUDICE BASIS AND SHOULD NOT CONSTRUED AS AN ADMISSION OF

LIABILITY ON AXA AND THEIR CLIENT/TORTFEASOR IN ANY MANNER WHATSOEVER.

3 AXA RESERVES THEIR RIGHTS UNDER THE POLICY TERMS & CONDITIONS AS WELL AS THEIR RIGHTS IN LAW,

Only applicable to rental claim - All document are to be submitted with this setilement confirmation. In the event, rental
spreement f invoices are not received within 7 days of this signed confirmation, we will automatically revert to loss of use claim

&
per the NIMA rates.

We/l confirmed that this is a full and final settlement that we and or our client have/h;‘gy’has against you (AXA and their
polieyholder/zutherised driver/tortfeasor} for any and all losses (past/present/future) arisi?z’g from this accident.

We confirmed that we have the zuthority of our client to act for and on their behalf L::.thff accident.

Ganature S{woriahop

Name of Repregéntative

U2 wlpl2eve
L (LKK) ]

—_— Date:

\ p?¢5c:r‘.1;ita:c / Workshop stamp  Signature of Withess 7 Workshop stamp (if applicable)

G SwHA Name of Witness: SHARON C Hih

LNG provided aways Whel e dtsiha‘g:nggaﬁz
% i he
. ... S LN R SRS damages retaing o

Signature of AXA's surweyor/representative. claim for i fot prejudice oF affect my

my vehicle shall

§ AV A e cLIrVEy S
Name of AXA's surveyor /Representative! turther  claim ior

Date: \\\\o\u% gamages for my persana!

n the same acaident,

A%A Insurance Pie Ltd (Company Reg. No.: 199202512M)
8 Shentan Way #24-01 AXA Tower Singapore 068811

AXA Customer Centre #01-21/22

Telephone: 465 6880 4888 - axa.com.ag

general snd special

gs sustained



Bill To:
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
8 SHENTON WAY

#27-01 AXATOWER
SINGAPORE 068811

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reg. No. 20-1427944-N)

INVOICE No : TT 209164

PB No: 188172

Date : 11-June-2020

Vehicle Number: SJS 8543D

QTyY DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
1 |To carried out accident repair as per surveyor's recommendation 1,600.00
(Lump Sum)
BEFORE GST 1,600.00
7% GST 112.00
TOTAL 1,712.00

Cheque should be made payable to MG Solution Pte Ltd

Co's stamp &A{Iﬂﬂ;&[iséd Signature




N

" GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
A & 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Si 048580
20 & 'NSURANCE Phoane:eiﬁsusagz;ﬂm 0 F;r;??-%%rgzu 0030

ER: ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
e e A L e e e e, BET BOGISHFARON No: M400017735
RrCORDS MANAGEN-NT LENERE
TAX INVOICE
OurRef No: GR-18-050111
Date of Request: 04/04/2018 Your Ref No: WALK IN HONG

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD - KAKI BUKIT
25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 #04-01
SINGAPCRE 41800

Dear SirlMadam,

Your Vehicle No: 5J58543D
Date of Accident: 30/03/2018
Place of Accident: ROUNDABQUT TWDS TUAS CHECK POINT

Invalving Vehicle No:  SHCE2347

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S3)

E-File Search Fee (Public) 14.02
GST Amount 0.98
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 15.00

Thank You.

Thisis a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[1 GIRO [X] Cash [] Cheque




GST Registration No: M400017735

TILORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE
OurRef No: GR-18-050113
Dat: of Request: 04/04/2018 Your Ref No:

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD - KAKI BUKIT
25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 #04-01
SINGAPORE 41800

Dear SirfMadam,

Dateof Accident: 30/03/2018
Vehicle No: 5J58543D

~, Placa of Accident: ROUNDABOUT TOWARDS TUAS CHECKPOINT

R
]

Involving Vehicle No:  SHC5234Z

WALK IN HONG

A GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
i B 2 GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

i 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm

Withreference 1o your application for the accident report, we have attached the following accident reports as requested:

DOCUMENTS ACCIDENT LOCATION

PER DOC (S§)

QTYy

AMOUNT (S$)

SHC5234Z ROUNDABOUT TOWARDS TUAS CHECKPQINT 14.00{1 13.05
GSTAmount 092
14.00

Tota Amount Due (GST Inclusive)

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for

any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reporis or their images.
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires ne signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[1GIRO[X] Cash [] Cheque




Pte Ltd Company Registratior

Immediate Advice

To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

Survey Details:

<L UL ANV E 1L #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUNTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 IEL < (663) 625363361 FAN (63) 62564315

Date: 16.03.2019

Date of loss 30.03.2018
Date of appointment 04.04.2018
Date of survey 05.04.2018
| Location of survey MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: Third party

Vehicle number SJS 8543D

Make and Model . Perodua Viva (989cc)

Date of registration 11.09.2009

Excess NIL

Market Value/ Book Value ) 8,500.00 |(est)
Parf/COE Rebate S 3,063.00 |(est)
Nett Loss S 5,437.00 [(est)

Repair detaiis:

[Initial Estimate IE 8,149.80 |
Proposed/Revised repair cost:
Parts S 2,465.50
Check items (estimate) NIL
Labour S 1,640.00
Supplementary NIL
Total S 4,105.50
Lump Sum(if applicable) $ 3,200.00

|

ﬁ\lumber of days for repair

|




Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

Company Registration No

199607 198R

3P UBIAVE 120225 PAYA UBLHINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 48933 TEL : 10631 62563561 FANX : (D3] 61564315
Remarks:
Both parties had given a conflict of version.
Mandate:
Liability(TP) 50%
Proposed repair cost (w/GST) S 3,424.00
Loss of use S 210.00 | (7days x $30.00)
Loss of rental NIL
Loss of income NIL
S 3,634.00
50% | S 1,817.00
LTA/GIA search fees S 29.00
Others NIL
Proposed Total S 1,846.00




6/11/2020 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SJS8543D (C0472845)
[SHC5234Z]
TP
SAINAL B RAHMAN
Mar 30 2018 6:00AM
[TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD]
MG Solution Pte Ltd

i Reply ” Reply All E; Mark as Unread “ Print Message “ Delete Message | | Forward |

From AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (AXA_SG), sent on 03/04/2020 11:56 AM,
To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$1846.00) - S1S8543D - Claim Handler: Yvonne Ang Ching Ching

\Approved: 1846.00.

1

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1659513&Domainld=11&iObjld=1...  1/2



