Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: April 8, 2020 10:21 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: MANDATE: SNM18D01754C02/1/LKKDS & YR REF: PC5420H (TP : LKK REF -

CC6/CTI118006279/Umb3 ) on 28.03.2018

From: Chong Boon Sen [mailto:boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Monday, 20 January, 2020 5:25 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Admin A

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); OLIVIA; Jess Kong; Janice Yeoh

Subject: RE: MANDATE: SNM18D01754C02/1/LKKDS & YR REF: PC5420H (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CT118006279/Umb3 ) on
28.03.2018

Dear Sir,
Where is repair bill for LOD? For payment to be done.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896171 | M: (65) XXXX XXXX | F:(65)6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A ¥ Taiping SG 3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896171 | M: (65) XXXX XXXX | F:(65)6222 1033

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Wednesday, December 5, 2018 11:56 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Angie Foo
<angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong <chewht@lkkauto.com>;
OLIVIA <olivia@cowell.com.sg>; Jess Kong <Jess@oddsneven.com.sg>; Janice Yeoh <Janice@oddsneven.com.sg>
Subject: MANDATE: SNM18D01754C02/1/LKKDS & YR REF: PC5420H (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CTI118006279/Umb3 ) on
28.03.2018

LKK REF -CC6/CTI118006279/Umb3

CTI REF - SNM18D01754C02/1 (CB4111R)
Section Il Excess: $1,500.00

Dear Thin Thin

We refer to your email pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to resolve the property claim at $7,855.00



We await your payment advice to enable Boon Sen to act accordingly.
Aside to Angie, please follow up on the recovery of Section Il Excess.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sqg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.chtaiping.com
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Disclaimer :
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where
provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use
or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender
immediately.

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, December 05, 2018 11:31 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen
<boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
<olivialau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: MANDATE: SNM18D01754C02/1/LKKDS & YR REF: PC5420H (TP : LKK REF -CC6/CT118006279/Umb3 ) on
28.03.2018

Your Ref: SNM18D01754C02/1/LKKDS "Without Prejudice"
Our Ref: CC6/CTI18006279/Umb3

Dear Sir / Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING CB 4111R AND PC 5420H ON 28/03/2018

We refer to the above accident.

Ol collided to rear portion of TP vehicle.



