Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Joanne Yong Lai fong <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 April 2018 12:05 PM

To: Kuan Wei Loong

Cc: Sayedinah; Daniel Lim; Daniel Jude; SUR

Subject: RE: SGJ715K-3RD PARTY CLAIM-AIG-TP(SHA5177R)FIRST CAPITAL-LIABILITY
STATUS

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir,

We agreed direct settlement but with quantum to be agreed.
Dear Sir/LKK,

FYI

Thank you

Regards,

Joanne Yong
Motor Claim Department

Change of email address
joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg

First Capital Insurance Limited

A Member of Insurance Group
36 Robinson Road

#16-01 City House

Singapore 068877

Tel: 6507 3846

Fax: 6507 3849

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.first-insurance.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail.

From: Kuan Wei Loong [mailto:weiloong@motorimage.net]

Sent: Tuesday, 17 April, 2018 11:14 AM

To: Joanne Yong Lai fong <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Sayedinah <sayedinah@motorimage.net>; Daniel Lim <daniellim@motorimage.net>; Daniel Jude
<danieljude@motorimage.net>; Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; motor_claim@first-
insurance.com.sg



Subject: SGJ715K-3RD PARTY CLAIM-AIG-TP(SHA5177R)FIRST CAPITAL-LIABILITY STATUS
Importance: High

Hi Joanney,

Kindly advise liability status of the above mentioned vehicle.

Best Regards

Kuan Wei Loong

Claims Advisor

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255
HP:90903323
Email:weiloong@motorimage.net

Website:www.tanchong.com :: www.motorimage.net

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, April 4, 2018 5:19 PM

To: Kuan Wei Loong <weiloong@motorimage.net>

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D18002462MFSH ; YOUR REF: SGJ715K

Dear Sir/Madam

PRI Request For SGJ715K Accident Involving SHA5177R On 24-03-2018 AT 16:15:00HRS.
Please find below details for your reference

¢ Claim number : D18002462MFSH

¢ Insured vehicle number : SHA5177R

e Accident date : 24-03-2018

¢ Third-party vehicle number : SGJ715K

e Assignment type : WITHOUT PREJUDICE

e Surveyor : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD



e Officer-in-Charge : JOANNEY

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or
use any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the
sender immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The
sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.



