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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 13 July 2018 5:20 PM

To: ASM - Jaclyn; SUR

Subject: RE: MSIG - TP claim : XE2291C (DOA: 23.03.18)

Dear Jaclyn, 

 

part-by-part $5,723.98 & 3 days Confirm. 

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: ASM - Jaclyn [mailto:jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 11 July 2018 11:38 AM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: MSIG - TP claim : XE2291C (DOA: 23.03.18) 

 

Dear Taufikh, 

 

Please confirm the COR amount. 

 

Thank you 

 

Best Regards,     
Jaclyn LaiJaclyn LaiJaclyn LaiJaclyn Lai  

Customer Service & Motor Claims Executive  

ASM Automotive Services Pte Ltd  

No. 2 Kwong Min Road, Singapore 628705 

Hp: 9236 8218  |  Tel:  6265 0980  |  Fax: 6265 6068 

Web: www.asmauto.com.sg   
 

 
 

From: ASM - Jaclyn [mailto:jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 13 June 2018 3:03 PM 
To: sur@lkkauto.com 

Subject: MSIG - TP claim : XE2291C (DOA: 23.03.18) 

 

Dear Taufikh, 

 

Attached before paint & round mirror’ s photos for your reference. 
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COR part-by-part $5,723.98 & 3 days. please confirm. 

 

Thank you 

 

Best Regards,     
Jaclyn LaiJaclyn LaiJaclyn LaiJaclyn Lai  

Customer Service & Motor Claims Executive  

ASM Automotive Services Pte Ltd  

No. 2 Kwong Min Road, Singapore 628705 

Hp: 9236 8218  |  Tel:  6265 0980  |  Fax: 6265 6068 

Web: www.asmauto.com.sg   
 

 
 


