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MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 29-03-2018 Our Rel No. D1B0025684MFSH
Accident Date 2B-03-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHA17B9B Third Party Vehicle. SJY31268
Survey Location BLOCK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 2 #01-04/06/08
Contact Persan. NITHA
Contact No. 62723892 0 Fax No. 62708314
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR {EST. COR - §1 .B54.52)
AppC s LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Bental OR Loss of use {based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE

Cc : Workshop LD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days lor survey assignmeri and 7 days lor re-Inspaction.
This is a computer generated letier, no signature required.
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Mivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAWo) <admin-d@kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 31 May 2019 12:49 PM

To: ‘Serene Ler’; "CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: REVIEWED FILE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002564MFSH/1
Dear Serene,

Thank you for the email.

Prease be infarmied that we are unable to conduct the inspection for SI¥ 31268 after some attempts to inform the
workshop to present the vehicle.

This case has been pending for a long time due to the unavailability of the owner, therefore we decided to
temporarily close this case,

Kindly advise us if there is any arrangement made and will be glad to re-open the case accordingly.

Best Rogards,

G Nivitha! Admin
LK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Plone: 6841-1972 | emall: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blic 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(408933)

From: Serene Ler [mailto:Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 5:14 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=; CWS Mator Claims
<cwsmotorclaims@msfirsteapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Ce: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: REVIEWED FILE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002564MFSH/1

Dear Catherine,

Wz refer to the above captioned matter.

W2 are reviewing our file and note that the matter rest in our email of 4/4/18,

Kindly advise us the status and if no PRI done then you may proceed fo close file at your end.
Regards,

Serene Ler
Motor Claims



WS First Capital Insurance Limited
A Member of RIEEET Insurance Group

& Robinstn Road, City House, #1601 | Singapore 0B8877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | Fax: 6507 3849 [Reg No. 185000106C
Motor Claims: motor_clalms@msfirsteapital.com. 50 | Website: www.méfirsicapital com.sg

“With effect from 15 January 2018, we will be known as MS First Capital Insurance Limited. Our new website
will be www.msfirstcapital,com.sg.

Fersonal Data Protection Act 2012 (“POPA™): _
L'nder the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing af your pérsonal data
Please rafer o www. first-insurance com.sg for detalis of POPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mall 1s confidential. It may also be legally privileged.
If yau are not the addresses ar b6 whaom It s intended, you may nat copy, forward, disclbse or yse any part of it

Il you have received this message in 2rror, piease deliete the message and all copies from your systetn and notify the sender
Irmediately by return e-mall.

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) |maifﬁg;gﬂmig—d@lkkgg{g.ggm]

Sant: Wednesday, April 4, 2018 5:52 P

Ta: CWS Motor Claims <m;mnmmgalm;@mgfnmmgi;ahggm.sgm MSIQHMEME@LEE&L[{Q.CGM

Ce: Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital,co im.sg>; 'SUR’ <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002564MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System ilto:
Sent: Wednesday, 4 April, 2018 3:45 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSM(}T{JRCLAIMS@MEF[RHI'EAPJTM_,L“(}M.SG;
SERENELERG@MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM NG

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - DI 8002564MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Wz refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

M First Capital Insurance Limited



Nivitha (LKK Autn!

From: Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 31 May 2019 2:34 PM

Teo: Admin-D (LKKAuto); CWS Motor Claims; assignments

Ce SUR

Subject: RE: REVIEWED FILE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002564MFSH/1
Dear Nivitha,

We have rejected the 3P claim as we have video evidence that |V was stationary and was hit by TPV,

You may proceed to cancel the survey assignment and close file at your end.

Flegards,
Nerene Ler
Mator Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Limited

A Member of EEEEEN Insurance Group

35 Robinson Road, City House, #18-01 | Singapore DGES77 | Tel: 6507 3848 | Fax: 6507 3848 |Reg. No. 195000106C
Motor Claims: m s@msfirsicapital com.sg | Website: www msfirstcapital com.sq

Ll

*With effect from 15 January 2018, we will be known as MS First Capital Insurance Limited, Our new website
will be www.msfirsicapital.com.sg.

Psrsonal Data Protection Act 2012 {"PDPA"):
Under t= PDPA, thers are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Pease refer to www. first-insurance.com.sd for detalls of PDPA Perstnal Data Collectian Statement.

Confidéntiality Notice: This e-mall Is confidential. 1t may also be legally privileged,

I yqu are nob the addresses of to whorr it |s Intended, you may not copy, forward, Hisclose of Use any part of it

It you have received this message in error, please defete the message and ail copies from your systerm and notify the sender
iramiediatety by return &-mail,

From: Admin-0 (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sant: Friday, May 31, 2019 12:49 PM

To: Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com,sg>; CWS Moator Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>;
assignments <assignments@lkkauto,com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REVIEWED FILE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002564MFSH/1

Dear Serene,
Thank you for the email,

Piease be informed that we are unable to conduct the inspection for SIY 31268 after same attempts to inform the
warkshop to present the vehlcle,

This case has been pending for a long time due to the unavallability of the owner, therefore we decided to
temporarily close this case.

Kindly advise us if there is any arrangement made ard will be glad to re-open the case accordingly



Tel : 6507 3848
Fax : 6507 31849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
MWW AVE. COIT



