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Bosm s m Pte Lid Company Registration No, 199607198R

S1UBLAVE 1, A02-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL (B63) 62363561 FAN : (065) 62364315

Your Ref: D18002636MFSH Date: 27 June 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCI18006204/R 1sb

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear SirfMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SKK 4943P .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 25/06/2018 at the premises of M/s Mova Automotive Pte Ltd and have the following
to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :88  3,297.90
Revised Estimate Amount ¢ 5% 2,186.70
“Check™ Items Amount + 55 756.00
Market Value : 58

LTA Reimbursement Value : 8%

Nett Value 1 8%
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the n/s front portion,

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 3 Days

Remarks :
Pending parts prices.

Yours faithfully,
Mohammed Rasul
Automotive Assessor



MS ‘ FirStCﬂpital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited co®eq tio, 1050001060 G5T Rey. Mo M2-0001676-9

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D48580
Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Fax: (65) 6222 3547

Claims & Moo Undenwriting Dept: 36 Fobinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 0GE87T
Tel: (B5) 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) 6507 3842
www msfirstcapital. com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location

Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

03-04-2018 Our Ref No. D1B002636MFSH
29-03-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC7978Y Third Party Vehicle. SKK4943P

ELOCK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06/08
MNITHA
62723892/ 0 Fax No. 62708314

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: ACCIDENT NOT REPORTED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Ce : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE

LTD Attention. NIL
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA
LURENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

& Mamner o BEEGI (NSUHANCE BROLE




Claim Workflow System
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PRI Header Details

Claimant
Claim No D18002636MF5H Policy No D-18088937MFSH S.No & 1 &MC
Name
A M
MOVAAUTOMOTINEFIE | Sunisy BLOCK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06
| Workshop | LTD Location Mobile: 0 , Ph 627 5 . 3
Name {Contact Person : & Contact £ . ;:;'_ D:IITH:%:; EEN Azggz 5‘ GFax. 6270831
NITHA) Details mailids R
Our LKK AUTO Instructions
w E: D N P
Surveyor CONSULTANTS PTE LTD | To Surveyor ITHOUT PREJUDICE: ACCIDENT NOT REPOR
Insured Insured it
Name CITYCAB PTE LTD Vehicle No SHC7978Y Vehicle SKK49«
No
PRI e Surveyor e Surveyor
Raclaved E;—m 2018 06:06:46 Appointed 23—04-20 18 07:50:08 Accept 04-04-
Date Date Date
Survey Report Upload
i I Surveyor :::':::
I i ——— -04- |
ﬂ!PEﬂtlﬂ'ﬂ T34 6L REPDI’t Date 09-04-2015 REPDI't
Date *: L P
Vehicle Particulars
Make [Please Select Make |[»| | Model [Please Select Model[»] | Year ~ [select
Chasis No | | Engine No | Mileage | |
Cubic
Color 1 Capacity i_
Multiple Documents Upload
Upload Multiple Documents 1
File Name Action

Surveyor Job Remarks

https://ficlaims.com:9001/Claim WS/Surveyor/Details/236595

4/4/2018



5hirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com?>

Sent: Thursday, 6 September 2018 12:10 PM

To: ‘Jacelyn'

Cc 'SUR" ‘Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION: SKK4943P - TP/FCI - CHEVROLET ORLANDO 1.8A (DOA
29.03.2018)

Dear Jacelyn,

Confirmed final fig of $2,350.00 (lump sum) @ 3 days of repairs before GST.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 5256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenug 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Jacelyn [mailto:jacelyn@mova.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 5:33 PM

To: 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: FW: FINALIZATION: SKK4943P - TP/FCI - CHEVROLET ORLANDO 1.8A (DOA 29.03.2018)

Dear Rasul,

Please help to finalize the below case. Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jacelyn Qoi

Estimataor

Meva Automotive Pte Ltd

Tel 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ ©

Auviomolive Ple Ltd

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy, disclose of use
its content. We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your system

Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses thal could damage your computer system, Although we will take reasonatie precaulion o
minimize this risk, we da not accept any liability resulting from software viruses. Please carry oul your own virus checks befare opening any attachmenl.

From: Jacelyn mailto:jacelyn@mova.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 5 July 2018 6:17 PM

To: 'Rasul (LKK Auto)'

Subject: FINALIZATION: SKK4943P - TP/FCI - CHEVROLET ORLANDO 1.8A (DOA 29.03.2018)

Dear Rasul,

Please find the attached ‘Marking Estimate’, ‘Check-ltems’ & After-Paint’ photographs for your reference.



We propose the finalize amount at Lumpsum $ 2,350.00. Kindly revert.

Best Regards,

Jacelyn Oai

Estimator

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd

Tel: 6272 3802 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automu'lwi. Ple L1d

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do nol copy, disclose or use
its content, We would be grateful if you would nolify us by email and dalete the ariginal transmission and any attachment from your system.

Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruges that could damage your computer system, Although we will lake reasonable precaution to
minimize this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses, Please carmy out your own virus checks before opening any attachment.



Shirlel Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 5:09 PM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’; LU RENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG
Cc: 'SUR" 'Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)’; 'LKK Assignments’

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002636MFSH/1

Attachments: SKK 4943P - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Lurene.

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SKK 4943P.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Cass Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkka uto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 4 April 2018 9:44 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: LURENEJAW @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002636MFSH/1
Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, 1Thi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@ msfirstcapital. com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 3 April, 2018 7:45 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; LURENEJAW @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002636MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.aVE.com
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mulomotive be 1cd

Main Office:
. A _1 .I':u,uh ling
Page # A Téi : {ésg 64?6 3333
. Fax: (B85} 6271 5891
Estimate WWW.MIOVE.COM.5
Veh # -~ SKK4243P Worksh .:.p Dept:
3/04/201
03/04(2015 \eh Model -~ CHEVROLET ORLANDO Biikit Merah La
M01-04 |
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED Estimate# - CK417311 innapore 1597;
36 Robhinson Road oz S— ) _{65] 52?23!}32
#16-01 City House Claim# - TF/CRISLE> s
Singapore 068877. ACC. Date - 29/03/18 GST Heg, M2-0088864-2
Terms - C.OD Days
Attertion - XAD26 Remarks == MfFA 24 gul 29 L (2015)
MNo.  Description Qty U.Price Amounts 5%
LIST ITEMS : 7 S
1 HEADLAMP LH 1 PC 840,00 - 840.00
o ERONT BUMPER TOP 1 PC 112500 X€771,12500
3 FROMT BUMPER LOWER 1 PC 413.00 FOL413.00
4 FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH 1 PC 28.00 ¥ 2800
5 FRONT BUMPER CLIPS 1M PC 250 2500
& FOGLAMP LH - CHECK 1 PC
't FRONT BUMPER SPONGE - CHECK MM i PC
53 FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT - CHECK (S78 1 PC
g FRONT FENDER LH - REFAIR ~ 1 PC
LIST TOTAL 53 2.431.00
10% DISCOUNT 5§ 24310
2187.80
LABOUR : aswi o
TO INSPECT FRONT LIGHTING MECHANISM (F B ;a-oﬁ/

W qooleobd St

TO REPAIR ON FRONT FENDER LH. TO REMOVE &
REPLACE DAMAGED ITEMS, REALIGN CONNECTION

TO SPRAY PAINT ON REPAIRED AREAS 7> ({E ' 1 Yoo /:mﬁ
S \NQG ___________________

LABOUR TOTAL 55

—— — 2ot |1 P 1oV ——
. | %\3&2‘%““ ":‘&f"\t(

i NON-TAX AMOUNT €
*r: I" ¥ BUNVEY | ] AMOUNT 55 3.297.90
® Pe) IS0 odifical
« Suppiementary e I GST@ 7% 23085
Is subjeal I-'_- final apr ] | :-_ _____________ —
Acknowledged by Repsit B ‘A AMOUNT DUE S§ 3.528.75

na——

Eustqmer‘s Signature/Co. Stamp  MOVA AUTUMGTWE PTELTD




R
@MOVA
e
Automotive Pte Ltd
Main Offica:
Mova Bullding
Mo, 22, Jalan Kilang,
Singapore 159418
Page # ke F'g E%gg?ggg? .
E'ﬁmate U:I'WW.H'IU‘J’E.EUI'!'I.HEI -
; — Veh# . SKK4943F Workshop DE E:
' Block 1008,
i Veh Mudai =" CHEURDLE‘- DRLANDG Buki Merah Lana 3,
H03-04/06/08/D4
MS FIRST CAPITAL |N5UMNCE LIMITED Estimate# - CK417311 Singapore 158722
36 Robinson Road j Tol: (G5} 62723892
Claim # TP [CRIBI213 Fax: (65) 62708314
#16-01 City House Co. Fisg, 1089040333
Singapore 068877, ACC, Date :- 23/03/18 GST Rleg. M2-0085884-2
Terms .-, C.O.D Days
Attention - XAD2S Remarks - MEG 24 gul 79} 3 (301%)
Mo.  Deseription Qty U.Price Amounts 33
LIST ITEMS : et Lot
1.  HEADLAMP LH St 1 PC 84000 - 840.00
2. FRONT BUMPER TOP 1 PC 1,125.00 X%<71,125.00
3, FRONT BUMPER LOWER 1" PC 413,00 Folr 413,00
4, FRONTBUMPER-SIBERETAMNERLR PR S-pg———Ie—28:00. H TV
5. FRONT BUMPER CLIPS 10 PC i 250  Aame—25.00
6.  FOGLAMP LH - CHECK — . K 1 PC ,
7 FRONT BUMPER SPONGE - CHECK > <R ™ Part = 3216290 s e T@
4  FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT - CHECK lab 3 T%0-00 1 PC YT
9. FRONTFENDERLH-REPAIR > 2 1 p¢ )
LIST TOTAL S$ $ 3942-10 24 02%(0 2,431.00
10% DISCOUNT 8% Y s mf_ - 10 % 243.10
_1,/5' 7 223500 3 54- b 210 2,187.80
LABOUR : ASUL T
TO INSPECT FRONT LIGHTING MECHANISM Ly %o ;wﬁ/
TO REPAIR ON FRONT FENDER LH. TO REMOVE &
REPLACE DAMAGED ITEMS. REALIGN CONNECTION % C{ F ;.aﬁ
TO SPRAY PAINT ON REPAIRED AREAS ! ’ ] oo ;mf
LABOUR TOTAL 5% 3 ?'H}._ﬂi} 1.410.00
<ot € 1oV S
LKK Auto Consultanis hence notify i
£ f.the followlngs o M“
= To resurvey beforefalier spray painting ‘Fﬁf"’d &
» To display damaged part]s) during resurvay E.&0E
« Parts pricas &ne subject 1o confirmation NON-TAX AMOUNT &
* Eﬂm:mﬁm is o 2 "Withoul Pre|udice” basis ANIOUNT 5% 3,297.90
* No |fegal modiRcation(s) is allowed :
» Supplemaniary Bamis) must be resurveyed and GST@ 7% 230.85
ts subject (o final approval from Insurence Company J R T oy
Acknowledged by Repairer ’jf AMOUNT DUE 5% 352875
Cusigper's Sianature/Co. Stamp /Auv TIVE PTE LTD



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL. 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607T188R GST Reg. No. 18-9607158-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref : CS/FCB006204/R1sbn2

sonomeon s womeoneasserr > e |[{IHNIN
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 7978Y Veh. Inspected SKK 4943P
Policy No. D-1808893TMFSH Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. D18002636MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From LURENE Assign Date 03/04/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model CHEVROLET ORLANDO 1.8AT |c.c 1796
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis No. KL1YATS51DK 160859 Colour GREY
Odometer 100568 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
1. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/50 R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/50 R18 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R18 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  29/03/2018 Inspection Date 25/06/2018
Survey held at MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06/08 .
SINGAPORE 159722
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
CiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 8#01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 256 3561 FANX: B256 4315

Reg Mo 199807198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607188-R Page Na..1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKK 4943P
; Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | v Chop :g}m )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|HEADLAMP LH SCRATCHED 840,00 540,00
1|FRONT BUMPER TOP SCRATCHED 1,125.00 1.125.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER SCRATCHED 413.00 413.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH SERVICEABLE 2B8.00 -
10|FRONT BUMFPER CLIPS @32.50 NECESSARY 25.00 25.00
1|FOGLAMP LH (NPA) NOT NECESSARY - -
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE (NPA) NOT NECESSARY -
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (NPA) NMOT NECESSARY - =
1|FRONT FENDER LH (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE -
LABOUR
LESS 10% DISCOUNT 24310 -240. 30
2,187.90 2.162.70
LABOUR
TO INSPECT FRONT LIGHTING MECHANISM 50.00 30.00
TO REPAIR OM FRONT FENDER LH.TO REMOVE & 560.00 350.00
REPLACE DAMAGED ITEMS REALIGN
CONNECTION. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT
FENDER LH
TO SPRAY PAINT ON REPAIRED AREAS 500.00 400.00
1,110.00 T8O.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,297.90 2,942.70
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,350.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18006204/R1sbn2

i

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

3

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A MMATAI

Licensed Appraiser

HECLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repor is made sclely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page aof this Report.

Mo Bability of respensibility whatsoever, in contact of Lo, i accepted to any third party who may reply on the Fegord whelly or in part, Any third pay scting or reolying on this
Repodt, in whele ar i pard, doos so a his o lar own risk,




