Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 10 May, 2018 10:34 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Our ref: YN7246S,Your ref: SKD8573)
Attachments: YN7246S.PDF

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Categories: HMK

Dear Mei Kwan
Ol report as attached.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWW.eginsurance.com.sg
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .

From: Janet Tan

Sent: Thursday, April 12, 2018 10:13 AM

To: 'Meikwan@lkkauto.com' <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Thin Thin (LKKAuto' <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; 'Vivian Lau (LKKAuto'
<vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Our ref: YN7246S,Your ref: SKD8573J-PRS

Dear Mei Kwan
We are still following up on non reporting.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims



l o o AT T,

v e L

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWW.eginsurance.com.sg
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, April 12, 2018 9:47 AM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@egqginsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@I|kkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
<vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our ref: YN7246S,Your ref: SKD8573J-PRS

WITHOUT PRE]JUDICE

Your ref: TBA
LKK ref: CC4/EQI18006142/Kua3

Dear Janet,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a third party direct settlement case.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SKD 8573]
Date of survey: 04.04.2018
Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP estimate (marked)
- Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

We have not authorized repairs.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 68412360.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 April, 2018 12:57 PM

To: 'Janet Tan' <janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our ref: YN7246S,Your ref: SKD8573J-PRS

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janet Tan [mailto:janet.tan@egqinsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 3 April 2018 11:53 AM

To: autoworxhouse@hotmail.com; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Our ref: YN7246S,Your ref: SKD8573J-PRS

Without Prejudice
Save As To Costs

Dear Samantha
Please be informed that we shall appoint LKK Auto Consultants to attend to the PRS.

However, our insured has yet to report. We shall revert on liability soonest possible.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims
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EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .






