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11 Tannery Lane Smiapore 207930 [ Head Office) Tel B2 5578 (3 lines) Fax 6265 S5TW
LO0T/ 1009 Sermngoon Road Singapore 128168 (Show Room) Tel G341 6378 (3 lines) Fax 8341 7378
| Kaki Bukit Ave & #U2-54755 Autobay 68 Faki Bukin Singapore 41 TRE3S Tel B324 BITE (3 ines) Fax 82448370
4B Toh Guan Road East #12.140 Enterprse Hub Singapore 508586 Tel B515 4878 (1 lines) Fax 8515 4678
280 Woodlands |ndustrial Park E5 #01-43 Harvest Singapore 757322 Tel 6330 2178 (3 lines)  Fax 83303379
Date: 02/04/2018
Make / Model: Bajaj Pulsar NS200
Registration No: FBL3163G
Damage Assessment
SIN | Description Condition | Qty = Unit Price | Total Price
1 ~ Windscreen ./ g{g 1 | $6200 $62 00
2 Handle Bar — Left ol 1 $106,00 $106.00
3 Signal Light Front - Left — CRA 1 $95.00 $95.00
4 Clitch Laver 1 $71.00 571.00
5 | Balancer 1 $39.00 $39.00
& | Mirror - Left 7~ ,77] 1 $62.00 $82.00
7 | Rear Box Assy42L.  , (oA 1 $220.00 $220.00
8 | In Vehicle Unit .~ QR 1 $156.00 $156.00
] Patrol Light Front - Left <~ QWA 1 | $450.00 $450.00
10 Customised Patrol Light Bracket .~ 7 { 1 $120.00 $120.00
11 Number Plate - Front .~ {',,1- 1 $15.00 $15.00
12 Respray Front Fender 1 $60.00 $60.00
13 Perform Electrical Check 1 $20.00 $20.00
14 Towing From Accident Scene - Workshop 1 $35.00 $35.00
15 Workmanship 1 $200.00 $200.00
16 N $0.00
17 $0.00
18 $0.00
19 $0.00
20 | 000
l" L7£' Sub Total $1,731.00
“"fa : (P8¢ GST7%  $121.17
ity Grand Total $1,852.17
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AT HIANS PARFINNF Rahata Frniibay

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Owner ID Type:; Company

Owner ID: 7910H

Vehicle No.: FBL3143G
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended De-registration Date: 04 Apr 2018
Vehicle Make: BAJAJ

Vehicle Model: PULSAR 200 NS F|
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2016

Engine No.: JLZCGA29257
Chassis No.: MD2A36FZ7GCA25827
Maximum Power Output; -

Open Market Value: $2,192.00
Original Registration Date: 19 Aug 2014

First Registration Date: 19 Aug 2016
Transfer Count; 0

Actual ARF Paid: $329.00

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
COE Expiry Date: 18 Aug 2026

COE Category: D - Motorcycle
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $6,302.00
COE Rebate Amount: $5,275.00
Total Rebate Amount: $5,275.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 04 Apr 2018

OK

hitps.Mvrl ta.gov. sg/itanrfaction/enquireRebale ByPublicHetoraDereginput "FUNC | 10N _ID=FU3040049 7 1 1
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" Catherine Chuna (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - I <motorclaim@iii.comsg>

Sent: Monday, 2 April, 2018 1:47 PM

To: Alvin Koh; ‘sur@Ikkauto.com'; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

Ce: 8999; Natalie Lee

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR VEHICLE NO. FBL3163G (Accident involving
FBL3163G and SHB484S on 04.02.2018)

Attachments: shB484s_20180402095652.pdf

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle FBL3163C and let us have your report urgently.

This claim will be handled by Ms Natalie.

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimean IpLITRYIILS Q BBy (\m
T You. q
Yo E\'w n Vin'i
Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept,

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecll Street | #05 [0B Bullding | Singapore 049711
Tal: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: unique.alvin@gmail.com [mailto:unique.alvin@gmail.com) On Behalf Of Alvin Koh

Sent: 02 April, 2018 10:26 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: 8999 ﬂEBEﬂ@unIquamntarspnns.mm.sgb

Subject: Re: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR VEHICLE NO. FBL3163G (Accident involving FBL3163G and SHB4B45 on
04.02.2018)

Hi,
We shall engage LKK consultant

Thank you

Alvin Koh
Unique Motorsports Pte Ltd

Website: www. uniguemgtorsgons.cum.gg

Email: alvin@uniquemotorsports.com.s
Unigue Motorsports @ Tannery: 11 Tannery Lane Singapore 347774 Tel 6292 5578/ Fax: 6295 5570
Unique Motorsports @ Serangoon: 1007/1009 Serangoon Road Singapore 328168 Tel: 6341
5378 / Fax: 6341 7379
Unique Motorsports @ Kaki Bukit: 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-54/55 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore
417883 Tel: 6844 6378 / Fax: 6844 6379
Unique Motorsports @ Toh Guan: 48 Toh Guan Road East #02-140 Enterprise Hub Singapore
608586 Tel: 6515 4978 / Fax: 6515 4979
Unique Motorsports @ Woodlands: 280 Woodlands Industrial Park E5 #01-43 Harvest @
Woodlands Singapore 757322 Tel: 6339 2178 / Fax: 6339 3379

1



CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and any attachments may contain confidential
information which is legally privileged. The information is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any disclosure, copying, distribution of, or the taking of any action in reliance on, the contents
of this information is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please
immediately notify us by e-mail and delete all copies of this message and any attachments.

On Mon, Apr 2, 2018 at 10:09 AM, Motor Claim - 11l <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir / Mdm.
We acknowledge receipt of vour letter.
We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

« LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
« Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Lid

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections
to the above list,

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecil Streat | #05 |08 Bullding | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.



- If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination
of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



TI25Z2018 Meriman e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail |s associated with @

"FBLIL63G [MCT18020140)
[SHB4BAS)
™
Unigue Motorsports Pte Lid
Feb 4 2018 12:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Unique Motorsparts Pre Lig

_Reply | meply All | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Deiete Message | Forwers |

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (III_SG}, sent on 25/07/1019 10:03 AM.

To LKK_HO
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (551224.49) - FBLI163G - Ciaim Handier: Pool Chin Han Danisl

Approved: 1224, 459:PMease request TP WS to ralse Tax [nvolce for Cost of repairs in [II's name

There are no documents.

hitps:/isingapore. merimen.com/claimafindex. cfm Pusabox=SVCmall&fuseaclion=dsp_viewAmode=1A&iinboxid=15218314I0omainid=11&I0bjid=3...  1/2



GST REG. NO.: 200907810H

11 Tannery lane Singapore 347774 (Head Office)

10071009 Serangoon Road Singapore 328168 { Show Room)

I Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-34/55 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883
48 Toh Guan Road East #02-140 Enterprise Hub Singapore 608586

280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES #0143 Harvest Singapore 757322

Our Ref: ACCUM.TL.FRL3163G

Your Rel: CC4/111B008138/Ghal
Fleass quite yeur referance mamber whes replying

Date: 11/042018

M/s India Insurance Pte Lid
64 Cecil Street. #04/#05 10B Building.
Singapore 049711

Attention: Motor Claims Department

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBL3163G & SHE4845

1. Costof Repairs {51,177.00)
2 Loss of Use (2 days) (S60,00)
3, LTA Search Fee (57.49)

Total: (5$1,244.49)

Yours faithfully

Pl

~ UNIQUE MOTORSPORTS PTE LTD
GST Reg. No. 200907910H

1! Tennery Labe
MTTH
Tel / Fax: 6297 5578 | 6295 55719

Unique Motorsports Pte Ltd

Tel: 6292 3378 (3 lines)  Fax: 6293 3379
Tel: 6341 3378/ 6677 8999 Fax: 6341 7379
Tel: 6844 6378 (3 lines)  Fax: 6844 6379
Tel: 65154978 (3 lines)  Fax: 65154979
Tel: 63392178 (3 lines)  Fax: 6339 3379

LETTER OF DEMAND

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
BY FAX & POST
Fax No: 62244174

Alvin Koh (EXT 210) / Email: alvin@uniquemotorsports.com.sg



|spia INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE T LTD
1 1, g, Ny 19NT0X791L ] GFT. g N, M2 LL7RA0AX

e 4 | Focfl Street | 904 1 9i2% | 0802 | R It g | Smjpapote 0
o 'IJI:I:‘I'EI . Ofice (65] 147G Pl Incuredtilcomig
- L ": P (W5) GI243174  Wensie worw llLoom sy Wi

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

lil-Direct Sattlemant {PODS)

ndis rer: MCIGULC! X0

ClalmantRef: g1 ) by &

Wall, Uniqus Molorsparts Pta Lid (“the waorkshop") hereoy confirm that weil have reached an agreement
wih the appointed Surveyor of India Intermationai Insuranca Fie L LKK Auto Consuliants Ple Ltd {name
of Surveyor) with respect o (he amouni claimed for 55 1.200.00 M_______w
ey L1 ) - — e L L vehide no. FBL 31636 that wes damagod pmmnﬂ-umﬂdmmiqhmm
on 04022018 (date) st P1E {incasion) involving vehicis no. SHBABAS (170 red

vahicle). This is pursuant 1o the inspacton conducted on ONDAZONE  (data) 8l “the workshop'

Wil confirm that wall sralam authorzed by he Ownes Unigue Motorsports Ple Lid [‘the third party
d-imnm"]dwnﬂimmmumwdmmmwhmmWMMWMMmdn
mmmmmmmmammmwmwm mdmhmhhhﬂmn{.umuﬂtrymhy'ﬂum

wial further confimm that we/! will indamtly India Intematanal nsutance Pta Lid for all demages, loss andior expense that
they will o have aiready Incurmsa n e svent that Tne third parly claimant® after the above said agreament lodges &
further claim m:hnm-lwmﬂhrwmwmmwﬂmmmmbﬂdmﬂ:nnﬂwmﬂmlm
of use pursuant 1o the damage O FBL 3163 (venicle no,) a8 & fesull of the accident.’

Wedl confirm that the agreement mached abowe (s n full and final settiement of claims aof “ihe third party claimant”
pursuant 1o Ine accident and that furthar this selllemenl s reached on 0 withoul prejudice and withaut somission of Habdity
basis.

This agreemant is subject to the applicanan ol Singapore law and ihe Singagara Courts have axclusive jurisdiction over any
diaput ariming oul of tha same.

Well authorize you to pay the total amount o S5 120000 o _ Uniqua Matorsports Ple L1a ;

NIOUE MULLHSYURLS PTE LTD
o -2l Q%!%%ESJDT;WH

| Kakl Bulkit h-eanun“ﬁi_ s
IMANT: 2 0-54/66 Autobay © Kaki BURL :
. Singapore 417883 NESS Mﬂ
S Tol / Fax: BRL nare L ARAL BT e
"he workshop” (with chop) - e : =
e Al et el aui
NRIC _SPRAUARAF - o ' l ‘—__
Lmﬂﬂﬁ- mmﬁﬂﬁm -
F ' = AdOmss: Singapore 408933
AgIcsRy € wac A HESS
i MEEM Matlonsl ity

Ocupstion: PEQIONAL SALES QuWACRZ. Qecupstion:
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GST REG. NO.: 200907910H

11 Tannery Lane Singapore 347774 (Head Office)
1007/1009 Serangoon Road Singapore 328168 (8how Room)

Tel: 6292 5578 (3 lines)  Fax 6295 5579
Tel: 6341 5378 / 6677 8999 Fax: 6341 7379

| Kiki Bukit Ave 6 #02-54/55 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883 Tel: 6844 £378 (3 lines)  Fox: 6844 6379

48 Toh Guan Road East #02-140 Enterprise Hub Singapore 608586
280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES #01-43 Harvest Singapore 757322

AX INV

CLAIM NO: ACCUM.TL.FBL3163G

DATE: 11/04/2018

ACCIDENT DATE: 04/02/2018
MODEL: BAJAJ PULSAR NS 200
VEHICLE NO: FBL3163G

LUMP SUMP REPAIR COST: $1,100.00
GST 7% $ 77.00
TOTAL: $ 1,177.00

UNIQUE MOTORSPORTS PTE LTD

/

/=~ " UNIQUE MOTORSPORTS PTE LTD

Q GST Reg. No, 200907910H
11 Tunnery Lane
Slogapere 37774

Tel / Fux: 6292 5578 / 6205 5579

Alvin Koh (EXT 210)
Email: alvin@uniquemotorsports.com.sg

Tel: 6515 4978 (3 lines)  Fax: 65 154979
Tel: 6339 2178 (3 lines)  Faxi 63393379

IC

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD
64 CECIL STREET

#04-05 0B BUILDING

SINGAPORE 048711



. ||Ir'.li:’”['.|||“F]-ll'xll.|“rhl_.I.

Land Transport Authortty
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701
GET Registration No. © M4-0006528-2
Print DateTime
Receipt DateTime
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Recaipt No. : ITNET-00000-180320-000850
Pravious Receipt No. |
S/MN Item Description/
m m'm
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SHB4845
As al 04 Feb 2018/08:30:00
Insurance Co: INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD
;\b. 1 Insurance Enquiry - SHE484S
Enquiry Fes 7.00
201803201 20227101808
Sub-Total 7.00
Rasult of Insurance Enquiry - GBB3ST4K
As at 11 Mar 2018/18:45:00
Insurance Co- FIRST CAPITAL INS LTD
2 Insurance Enquiry - GBB38T4K
Enquiry Fee T.00
20180320120227237810
Sub-Total 7.00
Total Before Rounding 14.00
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payabie
Paid By
1970 Cradit Card. Visa
MasterCand
Total
Cash Change
Tandared Amount
Excess Refundable Amount

ovider nancil

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

payments lo the Authority are good and promptly settied by the payment

0.48

048

0.48

048
0.e8

20 Mar 2018/ 12:11:08
20 Mar 2018 / 12:09:51

748

T4B

7.48

749
14,98
003
1495

14.85
14.85
0.00
1485
0.00

service

Institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settiament

CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING - |

Case | Notified [Est Submitted | Ag) Asmigned | Ad|Rpt [nd] Submitted |1ns Auth'ed [ St o |
oy |04 Apr 2018 E:;:‘;:’ 018 | §31,100.00 £$1,100.00 "'""ﬁ"' for Survey —I
lLL]___ £an Ady Ape | | E’""'“““I_ “""':“_I_ | || c.-c-rc-ul |

Reference

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
insurea: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. feg, No.- 1993038218

Unigue Motorsports Pte Ltd. Co. Reg. No.: 200907910+
;V“:"'muﬂ FBLI163G Date bf Loss: | P4/02/2018 00100 - 159

R [17 Montha and 16 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
Claim Type: | TP/ MCT18020140 :“‘m‘:'f;?*ﬂ MCOMDO1S (TP, Fire & Theft)
[Vahicke Reg, |

SHBABA Policy M.
mmrwd}; . (Ciaimant); | 50719324745-02

Excess: I
Unigue Motorsports Pte Lid (Tennery Lane) 11 Tannery Lane, 347774 Macpherson - Tel; 87925578
Indh International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: E3476100 ... [Handied by Poal Chin Han Danlel)

NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:

Adjuster | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd mq;  Tel: 6256-3561 ... (Handied by XING GUO QIANG] ... [Final Rpt due 12/04/2018]

'mumnumnumm © wiewal | Compose Case Mail |

's 111.5G (25/07/2019); Alert - Adj Mandsts Approved [5§1224.49) - FILI163G - Claim Handler: Pooi Chin H...
[o I1_SG (09/04/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved {$$0.00) - FELI163G - Clalm Handler: NATALIE LEE

view Al | Searcn Tasks | Create dew Task | Compiste ||

Compieted On Created On Done? |
|

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 23/8/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 2

Claim Documents

*FBL3163G (MCT18020140)
[SHB4B45]
TP
Unique Motorsports Pte Ltd
Feb 4 2018 12:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Unigue Motorsports Pte Ltd

Video I;wﬂ HI E.
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Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ce neg ne 1sse07168m)

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Faor 6844-8805 Email: surf@lkkauto.com;assignmeants@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Page | of 4

Our File No:  CC4/1118006139/GWA302
Date: 231082019
REFEREN
Handling Insurer: India Inlernational Insurance Ple Lid  Policy No: MCOMOD15
ﬁ’:':“““‘ Vehicle g, 31536 Insured Vehicle No: SHB484S
Date of Loss: 04/02/2018 Mature af Claim: TP Claim No: MCT138020140
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: FBL3163G
Make & Model: BAJAJ PULSAR 200 NS, 200cc Engine No: JLZCGA29257
Reg. Dale: 18/08/2016 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No: MD2A3BFZTGCA25827
Colour White Odometer: 0km
Engine Capacity 200 cc
Marke! Valua/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S%) Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition; Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla) Yes Engine Modification Pre-accident Condilion:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Frant Tyre Size: 100/80-17 Rear Tyre Size 13007017
Front Lefl Side EURQGRIFP 5 mm Rear Left Side: EUROGRIFP &5 mm
Front Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
The above valuas represent e remaining lyre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS _ Repairers  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Parts 1.416.00 1,148.40 267.60 18.890
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 315.00 225.00 90.00 28.57
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 1,731.00 1,373.40 357.60 20.66
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,100.00
(S$) 1,731.00 1,100.00 83100 3645
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 121.17 77.00 4417 36.45
Nett Amount (S$) 1.852.17 1.177.00 67517 36.45
+ Loss of Use (2.0 x 5520.00/day) (S§) 40,00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 7.49
Nett Liablility (S5) 1,224.49
Global Sum Settlement (S$) 1,200.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 02/04/2018
Date Inspectad: 030472018 Inspecied Al
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Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Unique Motorsports Pie Lid (Tannery
Lane)
11 Tannery Lane
Singapore 347774
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days
Adjuster: XING GUO QIANG Manager: VIVIAN LAU PEI FENG

NOTE Thiz report represents our fndings of the time and plece of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been camed aut lo the best of our
Ancwiedpge and abilly but any other Nabilly under ary other cicemstances it haneby sxpressly sxciuded
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 22 Jul 2019)

Paris; Ni& BAJAJ PULSAR 200 NS 200ce (Mode! not available in database)
Labouir: Repairers {Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for FBL3163G)

Validity:

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimale page
Further Info: ltems/values nol in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *WINDSCREEN Cracked 62.00F *62.00 FL
2 1 *HANDLE BAR -LEFT Bent 106.00F *106.00 FL
3 1 “SIGNAL LIGHT FRONT -LEFT Cracked B5.00F *95.00 FL
4 1 *“CLUTCH LEVER Cut 71,00F *T1.00FL
5 1 “BALANCER Cut 39.00F *39.00 FL
B 1 *MIRROR -LEFT Cut B2.00F *B2.00FL
7 1 *REAR BOX ASSY 42L Cut 220.00F *“150.00 FL
B 1 *IN VEHICLE UNIT Damaged 156.00F *156.00 FL
8 1 *PATROL LIGHT FRONT -LEFT Damaged 450.00F  *4D0.00FL
10 1 *CUSTOMISED PATROL LIGHT BRACKET Bent 120.00F *100.00 FL
1 1 *NUMBER PLATE -FRONT Cut 158.00F *15.00FL
FeFranchise part LeLisilemDisc
Sub Total (S$) 141600  1,276.00
- List ltem Discount on L ltems 0.00/10.00% (S$) 0.00 127.60
Total Parts (S%) 1,416.00 1,148.40
( Repaon was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous ems salected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer’s Amount
Labour ltems
1 RESPRAY FRONT FENDER New 60.00 50.00
2  PERFORM ELECTRICAL CHECK New 20,00 20.00
3 TOWING FROM ACCIDENT SCENE-WORKSHOP New 3500 35.00
4 WORKMANSHIP New 200.00 120.00

Gross Labour Cost (S$) 315.00 225.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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