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, VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

P g—i— 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9807158-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref :  CS/GAI18006057/K1rb
IR
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date: 03-04-2018
SINGAPORE 039130
Code: GAl
13 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. FBL 9540L Veh. Inspected SHB 4314M
Policy Ne. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  RACHEL TAN Assign Date 03/04/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. IR General Information
Accident Date  02/04/2018 Inspection Date 03/04/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDAMNCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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51 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGA PORE 408933 TEL : (065} 62863561 FAX : ((63) 62564315

Your Ref: TBA

Our Ref: CS/GA118006057/K1rd3

The Motor Claims Department
GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

Dear SirMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF _SHE 4314M .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on 03/04/2018 at the premises of M/s COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount (8§ 2.104.32
Revised Estimate Amount b 1,182.08
“Check™ Items Amount 1 8% -
Market Value - 8% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : S$ -
Nett Value + 8% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the n/s front portion..

Yours faithfully

KALVIN
Automotive Assessor



Catherine ChonE (LKK Auto)

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 April, 2018 1:01 PM

To: Jumani Bin Masudin

Cc: LKK Assignments

Subject: RE: Fw: DOA.02.04.18 SHB4314M with your insured FBL9540L
Attachments: img-403124143-0001.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir

Noted on your PRI request.
Without admission of liability, we will arrange for LKK to conduct PRI.

Dear LEK
Please accept assignment, estimates attached.

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: GBO4 7846

From: Jumani Bin Masudin [mailto:jumanibm@cdge.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, April 3, 2018 12:54 PM

To: General Claims <GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: Tan, Rachel <Rachel. Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] Fw: DOA.02.04.18 SHB4314M with your insured FBL9540L

TO
Officer in charge
see attached

Best Regards

Jumani Masudin

Taxi Crash Repair / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Lid
Tel, 6214-8315 | Fax. 6546-8156

== Farwarded by Jumani Bin Masudinicdgeldelgronetes on DX04/2018 12:43 PM —

From: “ApeosPort-IV CS570 " <ghs-5ing nalling@sbstransit.com sg>

To umnanipm@edae. com.sq
Cate 03/04/2018 12:42 PM
Subject Scan Data from CDG_LO_AW_ASST0

Number of Images: B
Attachment File Type: EDF



Device Name: ApeosPort-IV C5570
Device Location:

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary
information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this
message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying,
distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining
to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro
Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for
discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute
a2 binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to
any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly
authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is
committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to print this only if

necessary.

SBS Transit Ltd [Registration No. 199206653M]

Ty
'thJnusm@xﬁnd;uu'ﬂuadﬂncnw1nuycmnuﬂncnnﬁdcnﬁm.pﬁvﬁcgedurprupﬁcuuyinﬁwnunkﬂmlryou
are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immed iately. and
please be advised that using. copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed.
Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not o be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro
Corporation Limited or its related companies, The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes
only and are subject o approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a hinding agreement between the parties,
Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement
signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment,
We encourage you to print this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Engineering Ple Lid [Registration No. 199506048 W |

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended salely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly profibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.



Janice Lee !LI{KAutn] =

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com=>

Sent: Thursday, April 05, 2018 3:48 PM

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Fw: DOA.02.04.18 SHB4314M with your insured FEL9540L
CLMOMVMOOO000197

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto) [mailto:Janicelee@lkkauto.com)]

Sent: Thursday, April 5, 2018 12:56 PM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel. Tan@sg.gaig.com=>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: [External] RE: Fw: DOA.02.04.18 SHB4314M with your insured FBLI540L

Dear Rachel,
Enclosed preliminary revised for SHB 4314M.

Kindly provide us the claim reference,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto com | fax: b256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408633)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, April 03, 2018 1:17 PM

To: 'Tan, Rachel' <Rachel. Tan@sg gaig.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Fw: DOA.02.04.18 SHB4314M with your insured FELI540L

Dear Rachel,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6741-84:34 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
BElk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Tan, Rachel [mailto:Rachel.Tan@sg gaig.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 3 April, 2018 1:01 PM




To: Jumani Bin Masudin <jumanibm@cdge.com.sg>

Cc: LKK Assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Fw: DOA.02.04.18 SHB4314M with your insured FBL3540L

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir

Moted on your PRI request,
Without admission of liability, we will arrange for LKK to conduct PRI

Dear LKK
Please accept assignment, estimates attached.

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Jumani Bin Masudin [mailto:jumanibm@cdge.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, April 3, 2018 12:54 PM

To: General Claims <GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan(®@sg.gaig.c

Subject: [External] Fw: DOA.02.04.18 5HBA4314M with your insured FBLI540L

TO
Officer in charge
see allached

Best Regards

Jumani Masudin

Taxi Crash Repair / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Lid
Tel. 6214-8315 / Fax. 6545-8156

«=e- Forwarded by Jumani Bin Masudin'cdgadalgronotes on 037042018 12:43 PM -

From: ApeosPor-1V C5570 " <sbs-singnallingi@shafrgrail.com. sg=
To: umanibmEcdne.com S

Date: 03/04/2018 12:42 PM
Subyect Scan Data from CDG_LO_AW_ASST)

Number of Images: 8
Attachment File Type: POF

Device Mame: ApecsPort-IV C5570
Device Locablon:




Thi= message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary
infarmation. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this
message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying,
distributing or disclasing any contents therein is not allowed, Statements pertaining to
any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro
Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for
discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein ghall constitute a
binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any
term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised
representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is
committed te preserving the environment. We encourage you to print this only if

necessary.

5B5 Transit Ltd [Registration Mo. 15%2086653M]

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are
not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its atachments immediately, and please
be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements
pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation
Limited or its related companies, The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are
subject to approvals, Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party
shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly
authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Coungil - is committed to preserving the environment. We
encourage you to print this only if necessary,

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid [Registration No, 1995060458W]

The: content of this e-mail message ind any aitachments are conlidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the adidressee. 1T you are not the miended recipaent, be
advised that any e, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is stricily prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please ntify the sender immediately by reply
email and destroy the message and its sitachments.

The content of this e-mail message and uny allachments ar confidential und may be legally privileged, imtended solely for the addressee. I you are not the intended recipient, be
advised that any use, disscmination, distribution, or copying of this e-madl is strictly prohibited. I you receive this message in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply
email and destroy e message and its attschiments.



MICDE1 2044608 ! ComiprDelGao Engineering Ple Lid - Loyang
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 03472018 10047
SUBMITTED BY: Calhaenne Por Moy Jusn

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the chaims

procass,

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholdes andlor the Authorised Diriver,

3. nformation provided must be ag fruthful and accurate as possible, Any wilful mesreprasantation or witholding of material facls may allow insurance companies 1o

ropudiate policy ahility

. The issue and acceplance of this Form by insurance companies is not an

admigsion of policy Eability on the par of the Insurance cormpanies

% Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation,

&, This report will b forwardad by the insurers of the GIA Racords Managamonl Centre gstablished by the Ganrral Insurance Association of Singapaore [G1A] for

archiving and that copies of this repart will, for a

aloresaid

Date Of Report

Date OF Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

Wehicle Registration Mumber
Insured/Policyholder
MWame Of Reqgistered Qwner
Co Reg No

Email Address

Mobile Phone Mo

Alternative Phane Mo
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Maodel

fae, b made available upon application by interesied parties
7. By the lodgement of this report 1o tha insurers, you hiraby consent

io the archiving of this report at the centre and o coples of e report being made av allabla

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
03/04/2018 10:41
02/04/2018 20:30
TELOK PAKU RD TWDS LOYANG AVE X CHANGI VILLAGE
SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
SHBE4314M

COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
199303821R

FLEETSAFETY@CDGTAXL.COM.SG

OFFICE-65508768

HYUNDAI
140

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicla?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Mote Number

Driver

Mame of Driver

NRIC Mo

Date Of Birth

Qccupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Mumber

Fax Number

Contact Mumber

EMail Address

NO

THIRD PARTY
TAX]

INDIA INTERMATIOMAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

THIRD PARTY FIRE ANDJOR THEFT
YES

MCOMO015

CHAN CHEAN MENG
52551184J

16/06/1952

QUTDOOR

02/06/1980

37 YEARS AND 10 MONTHS
MALE

CHEANMENGTE@GMAIL.COM

Page 1 of 13



Address 519 10-31 PASIR RIS STREET 52
Posicode 510519
WWas driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured  OTHER - TAXI DRIVER

Wehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own £
Vehicle =

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident SIDE SWIPE
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information
Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? MNO

Mumber of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? YES
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other malerial or property damaged? Y¥ES

| have been approached by unknown person(s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver) 3
Passenger 1 MNAME:

GEMNDER: @ MALE

Passenger 2 MAME: Eh

GENMDER: : FEMALE

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes,.Please state which Police Station

Was nolice of intended Prosecution given? (g [8]
If ¥es,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

SEE ATTACH.

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video caplured by Car Camera? YES

Remarks! Reasons: .

Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Wehicle Registration Mumber FEL2540L

Wehicle Make/Model/Colour
Detailz Of Properties

Vehicle Catagory MOTORCYCLE

Mame of Oriver ADE ADLI PUTRA AZMAN
MRIC/Passport Number 597471294

Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Page 2 of 13



. Insurance Company Mame

Mature Of Damage
Mo. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

MHame

Approximate Age

Injuries Sustain

Injured persan in which vehicle?
Were seal bells worn?

Was this injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Address

Postcode

FRT RHT

DETAILS OF INJURED PERSON 1
ADE ADLI PUTRA AZMAN

LEFT LEG
FBLO540L

MO

Page 3 af 13



Sketch Plan Pg. 1
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DECLARATION
I/We declare the foregoing particulars are true in

every respect. ;
COMFORT TRANSPORTATION E LT QW E\ l{
CO REG MO 180302571 S N

Policyholder's Signature Driver's Signatura Reporting Centre Persannel’s Signature
Diate & Timag; (\f driver In not the palicuhntdee Warnar

Page 4 of 13



Sketch Plan Pg. 2

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accideat to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyhelder and/or the Authorised Driver,

3. Informatkon provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible, Any wiiful misrepresentation or withhelding of material

facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy liabllity,

4. The issue and acceptance of this Farm by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance
compankes.

5. Any false reporting may be referred 1 Poli i

6. The report will be ferwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Managemeant Centre established by the General Insurance
Association of Srgapare [GLA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by

interested partias,

By the lodgment of this report 10 the insurers, you hareby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of
tha report baing made available afarasald,

B. Consent under the Persanal Data Pratection Act (POPA)
| understand, scknowledpe, agree and consent that:

{a] My insurer, my workshep and the General Insurande Association of Singapore ["GIA®) may/are permitied to collect, usa,
disclose and/for process my personal data/personal Information set out In this {form] and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer [collectively the “Personal Information™) and disclose and trandfer such
Personal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) invalved in this accident (all Insurer(s) wha have insured
vehicle(s) involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the insurers’ laveyers/law firms, the
tznetary Authority of Singapore and any refevant government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purpose(s)
of

{1} processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims;

{il) investigating tha accident andfar my claims;
(11} carrying out and/ar dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquirles by me;

[iv} administering my claims {including the malling of correspondence, statements, Invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of eartzin personal data sbout me te bring about dalivery of the same as well as en the
externzl cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/for

(v} complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handiing and/or dealing with my clalms. {collectively the
"Purposes”)

{b)  altinsurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) invelved in this sccident and the [nsurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclese and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

e} mw Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agents{including their lawyersflaw firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes.

id}  my Personal information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
Invastigation and management in prosent and all future claims.

[} the information so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

{i] toallinsurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

Otk

{1} for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

SOMFORT TRANSPORTATION Fic |
CO REG. MO, 100303821

Policyholder's Slgnature Driver's Signature Reparting Centre Persannel's Signature
Date & Tima: [If driver is nat the palicyholder) Nam:
Date & Tirme: MRIC/FIN No.:

Paige 5 of 13









AFOR]

ate/Time: 03.04.2018 11:0% Fage
am: ARC Repair TP(CLSO)1 JOB CARD sales Order: JCNO305138034
OMER =3 REGNNDC. 11 an MILEAGE
& COMFORT TRANSPORTATICON PTE LTD P ey
DHER: 7010045 HYUNDAI g
ESE %3 SI.H HIHG DRIVE WMODE D-AT TIME IN
Singapore SINGAPORE 575717 Y-40 03./04 Eu 09:00
65508755 : .
iR ) YR OF MANL, TARGET DATE
o | Wa .‘55_3 2015
CHASS CORAPLETION DATETIME:
R, KT Ba1UMFU065972
JOB DESCRIPTION
seident Date: 02.04.2018
\TURE: 3F 02.04.18
'NO LABOR CODE DESCRIPTION
“KED & PASSED OUT BY:
SERVIGE ADVISOR CUSTOMER'S SIGNATURE
ledgemant Slig I Exli Pass
\ighicla Na.:

Mo SHE4314M JU GAIG SHB4314M
Eanrh:s Advisor Zignatura/Date Mame of Service Advisor Drate

stumed to Sarvice Reception upon collaction
L
y,
#

To ba kept by Security Guard



REPAIR ESTIMATE*

COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD C {mﬁ

VEHICLENO : SHB 4314M DATE 3/4/2018 11:57 —
MAKE -
MODEL : HYUNDAL i40 L
Qty B Parts Description/ Labour Type Unit Price Amount
Front Bumper Cover »— § 56230
Front Bumper Sponge O $ 142.20
Front Bumper Reinforcement )(K-’"" 5 526.10
Front Bumper Grille (LH) = t » 5 40.30
Front Bumper Bracket Top (LH) .x’ s 22.40
Front Bumper Bracket (LH) %/~ § 2460
SUB TOTAL $ 1,317.90
LESS 20% 5 263.58
DISCOUNTED TOTAL §  1,054.32
Labour Charge Jan
Panel Beating-Repair Fender 5 ;Gﬁﬁ
Spray Painting Charge-Bumper/Fender S ¥s¥su
Tuff Kote 5 :
X ¢zl
TOTAL LABOUR 5 1,050.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL § 2,104.32
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This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will

|be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appointed by the msurance company




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD ( A lf\'\_.1
REPAIR ESTIMATE* FEN
VEHICLENO : SHB 4314M DATE 3/4/2018 11:57
MAKE
MODEL : HYUNDALI i40 LJ
Oty Parts Description/ Labour Type Lnit Price Amuug
Front Bumper Cover ~ - 5 562.30
Front Bumper Sponge 4 h 142.20
Front Bumper Reinforcement v 5 526.10
Front Bumper Grille (LH) h 40.30
Front Bumper Bracket Top (LH) S 2240
Front Bumper Bracket (LH) 7 g 24.60
SUB TOTAL 5 1.317.90
LESS 20% B 263,58
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 1,054.32
Labour Charge Jon

Panel Beating-Repair Fender
Spray Painting Charge-Bumper/Fender
Tuff Kote

TOTAL LABOUR

ESTIMATE TOTAL
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S 1,050.00

$ 2,104.32

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the

¢ final repair quantum will

be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING FTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

COMPAZNY; THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS) JOB NO
CUSTOMMER: 7010045 REGN NOD
ADDRESS: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTELTD MILEAGE
383 5IN MING DRIVE MAKE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717 MODEL
65508755 DATE OF REGN
DATETIME IN
ACCIDENT DATE

JCB / PARTS DESCRIPTION

Date: 04.04.2018
Time: 14:55:18
Page: 1

305138034
SHE4314M
0000000000
HYUNDAI

1-40

26.03.2015
03.04.2018 09:00
02.04.2018

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

PART REQUISITION

0001 04-01-0103-0578-G  140V2 COVER-FR. BUMPER# 1 000 0.00 000
0002 04-01-0102-0737-G  140V2 COVER-FRFOGLAMFE 1  0.00 0.00 0.00
SUB-TOTAL 0.00
JOB NATURE
Qooo L LUMPSUM REPAIR 950.00
SUB-TOTAL 050.00
TOTAL 530,00
Sl e = e e e ey i y SRR TS TG
MVA NAME & SIGNATURE SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE

DATE: DATE:



—— i

Our Job Ref No © 305138034

Date : 04/04/18
FINALIZATION FORM

To LKK

Attn HALVIN
Vehicle Reg No. SHB4314M

Date of Accldent :

COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

ComiforDeiGm Enginsedng Ple Lid
50 Loyang Orive Singapore 508363
Fax: 6546 8156

Fax:

02/04/16

The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentionad vehicle are as follows:-

1. Tha repair job shall bill to: GAIC — FBL9540L
=
2. The finallzed amaunt shall be:
{a) Spare Parts after List discount
{b)  Labour Charges i
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost
(c)  Lumpsum Repsir (If applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less: _20% §950.00
Final Lumpsum Repalr cost
3. Estmated normal period for repalrs: 2 working days
4, We shall traat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed If there is no raply from you
within 7 working days
5. Thank you for your assistance. We conflrm the estimates and
finalized amount
Signafura : Signatura ; !
—Name™— """ JUMMII"-—"\:'\ Mame—— __£"‘*1!_
Tel : 6214 53313\ Date S',!H‘F )
Fax : 6546*153
L™
TFor Offlcial Use Only
Document :
[tem Amaunt Attached Gsﬁnfrl;r:]i? Remarks
‘Ygs of No (Sig
1. Rantal Rate PiDay YES
2. Loss of Income Paid N
3. Survey Fees
4. LTA Search Fee §7.49
5, Medical Fees (on behalf
of drivar, If applicable)
6 Owverrun -

Remarks:




I Vel V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Bdn BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
sl TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo- 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-S807188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref : CS/GAIMB006057/K1rbn2
INRATA A
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date; 09-04-2018
SINGAPORE 039180
Code ;- GAl
15 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. FBL 8540L Veh. Inspected SHB 4314M
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CLMOMYMOO0000197 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  RACHEL TAN Assign Date 03/04/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMFUDBS59T2 Colour BLUE
Odometer 431478 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Meodification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/80 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R18 HANKOOK 7mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  02/04/2018 Inspection Date 03/04/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD
58 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508965
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON ATWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}iN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




'Y Vel V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

u - ; i" ; 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
GRS TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 18-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHB 4314M
Qty Description of Parts Condition \'E::Ih]::?pﬁ{;} Durﬁlu[:;]}usted
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER COVER DEFORMED 562,30 562,30
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE SERVICEABLE 142.20 ¥
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT SERVICEABELE 526.10 :
1|FRONT BUMPER GRILLE [LH) cuT 40.30 40.30
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET TOP (LH) SERVICEABLE 22 .40 3
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET (LH) SERVICEABLE 24 60
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -263.58 -120.52
1,054.32 482.08
LABOQUR
PANEL BEATING-REPAIR FENDER. 500.00 300.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE-BEUMPER/FENDER. 500.00 400.00
TUFF KOTE. NOT NECESSARY 50.00 .
1,050.00 700.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,104.32 1,182.08
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 950.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/GAI18008057/K1rbn2
KALVIN ANG WEI KUN ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor [ Investigator B.Eng,AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




