Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 June 2019 4:33 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Patricia

Subject: RE: Your ref: SKK 8584R (Our ref: CC4/ASM18005985/Gga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SKG 5427C / SKK 8584R / OTHERS ON 27/03/2018 ***

Dear Cecilia,
Please note that the rental agreement also equivalent to tax invoice.

Hope it clarify, thank you.

Regards,

Alice

Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop
Tel:6747 9560

Fax:6748 1006

---------- Original Message ---------—--

From:"Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)" <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

To:"alicechau@kanfs.net" <alicechau@kanfs.net>

Cc:Patricia <patricia@kanfs.net>

Sent:Wed, 12 Jun 2019 05:47:46 +0000

Subject:RE: RE: Your ref: SKK 8584R (Our ref: CC4/ASM18005985/Gga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SKG 5427C / SKK 8584R / OTHERS ON 27/03/2018 ***

> Dear Alice,
>

> Can you please email the rental invoice to us as well?
>

> As we only have rental agreement.

>

> Thank you

>

>

> Best Regards,

> Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

> Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
>
>

> From: alicechau [mailto:alicechau@kanfs.net]



> Sent: Tuesday, 11 June 2019 11:01 AM

> To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

> Cc: Patricia <patricia@kanfs.net>

> Subject: Fw: RE: Your ref: SKK 8584R (Our ref: CC4/ASM18005985/Gga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 5427C / SKK
8584R / OTHERS ON 27/03/2018 ***

>

> Dear Cecilia,

>

> Please refer to the attached DV for your perusal.

>

> Thank you.

>

> Regards,

> Alice

> Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop
> Tel:6747 9560

> Fax:6748 1006

> e Forwarded Message ---—--—---—-—-

> From:"patricia" <patricia@kanfs.net>

> To:"Alice" <alicechau@kanfs.net>

> Sent:Tue, 11 Jun 2019 10:56:05 +0800

> Subject:Fw: RE: Your ref: SKK 8584R (Our ref: CC4/ASM18005985/Gga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SKG 5427C / SKK 8584R / OTHERS ON 27/03/2018 ***

> e Forwarded Message -----------

> From:"Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)" <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

> To:patricia <patricia@kanfs.net>

> Sent:Tue, 11 Jun 2019 02:15:26 +0000

> Subject:RE: Your ref: SKK 8584R (Our ref: CC4/ASM18005985/Gga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SKG 5427C / SKK 8584R / OTHERS ON 27/03/2018 ***

>

> Dear Patricia,

>

> We have yet to receive the signed DV,
>

> Kindly email back to us (LKK).

>

> Thanks

>

>

> Best Regards,

> Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

> Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
>
>




> From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

> Sent: Tuesday, 14 May 2019 2:53 PM

> To: patricia <patricia@kanfs.net>

> Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

> Subject: RE: Your ref: SKK 8584R (Our ref: CC4/ASM18005985/Gga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 5427C / SKK
8584R / OTHERS ON 27/03/2018 ***

>

> Without Prejudice

>

> Dear Patricia

>

> Thanks for the acceptance.

>

> Duly sign on the DV as attached and email back to us(LKK).

>

> Thank you

>

>

>

> “please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice engagement
should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related claims.”

>

> Best Regards,

> Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

> Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
FICEE o
> mem mes = et Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

>

>

> From: patricia [mailto:patricia@kanfs.net]

> Sent: Monday, 13 May 2019 5:58 PM

> To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

> Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

> Subject: Re: Your ref: SKK 8584R (Our ref: CC4/ASM18005985/Gga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 5427C / SKK
8584R / OTHERS ON 27/03/2018 ***

>

> Dear Mdm,
>

> Confirm to accept offer at global $9760.00
>

> Please send us the DV.

>

> Thank you

> Patricia

>

> On Mon, 13 May 2019 09:32:18 +0000, Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) wrote
> > Your Ref: SKK 8584R Without Prejudice

> > Our Ref: CC4/ASM18005985/Gga3
>>




> > Dear Sirs/Mdm,
> >

>> ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 5427C /| SKK 8584R / OTHERS ON 27/03/2018
> >

> > We refer to the above matter.

> >

> > We propose settlement at a global sum of $9,760.00(all-in).

> >

> > Please confirm acceptance.

> >

> >

> >

> > “Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”
>>
> > Best Regards,
> > Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
> > LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
> > Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
> > BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
¥ L7
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>>

>

> -

> e End of Forwarded Message -------
------- End of Original Message --——---



