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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R G5T Reg. No. 19-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref : CS/5MO18005946/Ggb
ol DEATAT
#05-01/06 Date: 02-04-2018
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
1k Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. FS 47420 Veh. Inspected SGS 3056L
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1801383/AGC Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  GRACETEO Assign Date 28/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c ]
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  2%/03/2018 Inspection Date 02/04/2018
Survey held at RYDER AUTO WORKSHOP LLP
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE B
#01-56 SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62363561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: CMTD1801383/AGC Date: 03" September 2018
Our Ref: CS/SMO18005946/Ggb Without Prejudice

The Motor Claims Department
Sompo [nsurance

Attn: Grace
Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO._SGS 3056L .

We thank you for the instruction on _29/03/2018.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 02/04/2018 at the premises of M/s RYDER AUTO and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 15,613.70
Revised Estimate Amount :S§ 8.027.30
“Check” Items Amount . 5% -
Market Value : S§ -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -
Nett Value 5% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages consistent.

Days of repair: 5 days.
We have NOT authorized repair.

Yours faithfully

Guo Qiang
Automobile Assessor



Catherine Chnna (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 29 March, 2018 4:08 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: Ryder Auto workshop; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes

Subject: CMTD1801383/AGC - SUV/ F54742U & SGS3056L ON 29.03,2018
Attachments: RYDER pdf

Our Reference: CMTD1801383/AGC
Dear LKK AUTO/ Marcus,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for SG53056L.

Please be informed that Agnes Chan the handler of this case.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6328 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F; 6221 3147

Innovation for Wellboing A c f T
O o=

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte, Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom

disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Ryder Auto workshop [mailto:ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, March 29, 2018 3:54 PM

To: Teo, Grace

Subject: Re: CMTD1801383/AGC - PRI/ FS4742U & SGS3056L ON 29.03.2018

Please arrange marcus chua of 1kk.
Tks
san choon

On Thu, 29 Mar 2018, 15:44 Teo, Grace, <grace.teo(@sompo.com.sg> wrote:



Our Reference: CMTD1801383/AGC
Your Reference: SGS3056L

Without Prejudice

Date: 29™ March 2018

Attention:
RYDER AUTO PTE LTD

Dear Sir/ Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING F54742U & SGS53056L ON 29.03.2018

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 29/03/2018.

Please be informed that Agnes Chan the handler of this case.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your

client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)

3 Priority Services Jlimmy Lee
Lawrence Ng
Jeffery Ong

4 JP Knights Adjusters & Surveyors Jason Lek

5 In House surveyor Teo See Ling

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyars. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 63295170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 3 September 2018 1:19 PM

To: Chiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: CMTD1801383/AGC - SUV/ FS4742U & SGS3056L ON 29.03.2018
Attachments: 3056L(330)5GS 5G CAR MART.PNG

Please see attached sgcarmart screenshot.

The record of the market value on 29/3/18 shows $24,000 for September 2006 Yaris. Oursis March 2007
varis. Therefore, accordingly it should be $27,000 after adding in 6 months of depreciation..

Please adjust your repair limit to $7,800 and the lump sum repair to the same amount.
reds
san choon

Director
maobile 97924673

g

1 Kakl Bukit Ave B, #01-56, Autobay @ Kaki Bukil, Singapore 417883
Fax. 64815390

S

5 Tuas Ave 3 BS Logistics Hub Singapore 639405
Fax: 64815380

- s l

On Mon, Sep 3, 2018 at 12:17 PM, Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com> wrote:
rcvd with tks

g

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &, #01-56, Autobay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883
Fax: 648153530

"

5 Tuas Ave 3 BS Logistics Hub Singapore 639405
Fax 654815390
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On Mon, Sep 3, 2018 at 11:55 AM, Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear San Choon,

As per your requested.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto,com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 3 September 2018 9:36 AM

To: ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CMTD1801383/AGC - SUV/ FS4742U & SG53056L ON 29.03.2018

Hi,

Market value $24000. Repair limit $4800.

Regards,

Guo Qiang

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 3 September, 2018 9:30 AM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: CMTD1801383/AGC - SUV/ F54742U & SG53056L ON 29.03.2018

Dear Guo Qiang,



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 3 September 2018 9:26 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuUto)

Subject: Re: CMTD1801383/AGC - SUV/ FS4742U & SGS3056L ON 29.03.2018

No need for me to contact surveyor. He must put it in this email to show me how he calculated the repair limit. |
want this to be on record

=

1 Kaki Bukit Ave B, #01-56, Autobay @& Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883
Fax: BAB15380

g -

5 Tuas Ave 3 BS Logistics Hub Singapore 639405
Fax: 64815390

I El el e e

On Mon, Sep 3, 2018 at 9:22 AM, Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear San Choon,

This amount is advise by our surveyor. Or you want direct contact our surveyor for discuss.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan {Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 S(4089313)

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworksho mail.com>

Sent: Monday, 3 September 2018 9:18 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: CMTD1801383/AGC - SUV/ FS4742U & SGS3056L ON 29.03.2018



Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www . facebook.com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain
confidential and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may
be unlawful and is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the
purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit

bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents
{acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

__——

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 3 September 2018 12:03 PM

To: ‘Teo, Grace'; assignments; ‘Chan, Shu Hui Agnes’

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: CMTD1801383/AGC - SUV/ FS4742U & SGS3056L ON 29.03.2018
Attachments: CSSMO18005946Gqb.pdf

Dear Agnes,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of 5G5S 3056L.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 April 2018 2:15 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=; 'Chan, Shu Hui Agnes'
<agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CMTD1801383/AGC - SUV/ FS4742U & SGS3056L ON 29.03.2018

Dear Agnes,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SGS 3056L on 02/04/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sipwsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D {LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 29 March 2018 4:18 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Chan, Shu Hui Agnes' <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur Ikkauto.com:>
Subject: RE: CMTD1801383/AGC - SUV/ FS4742U & SGS3056L ON 29.03.2018

Dear Grace,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer arrange survey on 02.04.2018.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

#

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 September 2018 12:32 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Ce: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: CMTD1801383/AGC - SUV/ FS4742U & SGS3056L ON 29.03.2018

Dear Shiau Chan,

We gladly accept the offer Lump Sum $4,800.00 and 5 repair days , kindly advise when to LOD LKK.
Thank You

Best regards

Orson

1 Kaki Bukit Ave §, #01-56, Autcbay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883
Fax: B4815390

]

5 Tuas Ave 3 BS Logistics Hub Singapore 639405
Fax: 54815390

llE' ________________ =

On Thu, Sep 20, 2018 at 11:43 AM, Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Orson,

Please find the attached of our surveyor’s marking.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Elk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) .

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 April 2018 2:15 PM

To: Teo, Grace’; assignments; ‘Chan, Shu Hui Agnes'

Ce: SUR

Subject: RE' CMTD1801383/AGC - SUV/ FS4742U & SG53056L ON 29.03.2018
Dear Agnes,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle 5G5 3056L on 02/04/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Elk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{g08933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 29 March 2018 4:18 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg=, assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'Chan, Shu Hui Agnes' <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: CMTD1801383/AGC - SUV/ FS4742U & SGS3056L ON 29.03.2018

Dear Grace,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the warkshop, repairer arrange survey on 02.04.2018.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4o8033)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 29 March, 2018 4:08 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@Ilkkauto.com

Cc: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: CMTD1801383/AGC - SUV/ FS4742U & 5G53056L ON 29.03.2018

Our Reference: CMTD1801383/AGC

Dear LKK AUTO/ Marcus,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for SGS3056L.

1
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PARFICOF Rehata Fnmiking

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:

Singapore NRIC
21182

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

SGS3056L

No

04 Apr 2018
TOYOTA

YARIS EAUTO
Silver

2006
1INZX500369
MRO054HY9104020718
80.0 kW (107 bhp)
$14,933.00

12 Mar 2007

12 Mar 2007

2

$16,427.00

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Forfeited

$0.00

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

11 Mar 2022

E - Open Category
5

$24,715.00
$19,453.00
$19,453.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must
be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if

applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 04 Apr 2018

hitpsitvrllta.gov.sgitaivrifaction'enquireRebateByPublicBetoreDereginput FEUNC T ION_JD=FU3040081 | M
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B yde r Auto Pte Ltd .

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-56, Autobay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883

Email: ryderautoworksho mail.com
Fax: 64815390

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Veh # SGS3056L Model TOYOTA YARIS E AUTO

Date Of Accident: 29/3/2018

Location BKE TOWARDS PIE BEFORE KJE EXIT ON LANE 3
Gty Description Amount §

List Items

| Lpe Rear bumper ~ e / 4659.80 -l
10 pcs | Rear bumper clips »~ Mol /3800 <
2pcs | Rear bumper ofs & n/s corner clips X & MV % 182.10 ?ﬁzt’(
2pcs | Rear bumpero/s & nfsstay X AV X 26450 X
2 pcs Rear bumper o/fs & n/s retainer ~ L ” e 0 R 1"“5
1pc | Rear bumper spoiler {lower) _~ (42 {M&W < 1,620.00 %CSN)
1pe Rear tail-gate lower panel '?\,/ Bue # /s 426.20 Q 7~
1pc Rear tail-gate lower panel innertrir;\_K/E'{ /7 22600 (R e

|4 pes | Rear tail-gate lower panel inner trim clips ' L C /1520 7
lpc | Reartailgate ~ Al /_102000| Ry
1pc Rear tail-gate weather-strip Q\f 'TWI"  201.60 Q Ve
1pc | Rear tail-gate emblem - SNTE / 6140 7
1pc | Rear tail-gate YARIS emblem ,~ Mt /7 5820| 7/
1pc | Reartail-gate Eemblem - #FC i ~ 3820| /
1pc | Rear tail-gate lock (upper) d _~ 422.60 ’Hé
1pc Rear tail-gate lock (lower) }( f;‘v‘ﬁ"’ XK 101.20

| Adpc Rear tail-gate lock (Quter) X ‘? ¥ 289.60
1pc | Rear tail-gate inner trim . [ pirv « 301.20
12 pcs | Rear tail-gate inner trim clips ’R}c 3 '}E 45.60
2 pcs | Rear tail-gate o/s & n/s shock absorber oy A 428.20
2 pes | Rear tail-gate ofs & n/s stopper A f ) S X 8710
1pc | Rearbootfloor X Ngadr - AT M 99220
1pc | Rear spare wheel board cover X2 -'_j' = ~ 303.60 ls'&'
1pc | Rear n/sfenderinnerboard 3§09 ) "’% / 42620
B pes | Rear n/s fender inner board clips Xor - &L #2380 | e
e)} BOK SENG o Bluwel 2088 % B s ALBT77E 1999

[Py vihicies maring vamuain] [motorbie, sars bghtvehickes) 000 WA TN Pkt Rapoming Centre 74 ancident cal



Jh o
ByderhutoPteLtd q/g'ﬂ; q}m{.l‘s

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 8, #01-56, Autobay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883
Email: ryderauto shaol mail.com
Fax: 64815390

: X771 A~
2 pcs Rear o/s & n/s tail-lamp M /. 68410
|_4pcs | Rearo/s&n/stail-lampclips X X 1520
| 2pcs | Rear o/s & n/s tail- lamp sealant X ,-’ X' 100.00
1pc | Rearreg. no. plate lamp X \ Ly, )( 202.70
1pc Rear reg. no. plate bracket {inner) ){ d X  62.00
1pc | Rear boot floor insulator ){ * 120.00 N T'_-
1set | Rear windscreen moulding - afC ' s/ 268.20 105 v
16 pcs | Rear windscreen moulding clips % ANA/ Y 6080
9,729.70
Special Nett ltems
ipc | Rear windscreen inner seal ~ #€C- /7 5000 | 2¢
1pc Rear windscreen sealant X NI X 60.00
1pc | Rearreg.no.plate .~ eq 7 4500 | e
1pc Rear reg. no. plate bracket (outer) £ NN X 2900
1set | Rear reverse sensor ~ {AA .~ 380.00 | 288210
S64.00 206 o
Labour 2o ‘k
h;,ﬂ_—!'!— 1 To remove, straighten & welding above parts ] 2,200.00 E 4
2 To spray painting {metallic paint) | Lo 1,800.00 "ﬁ‘
3 To re-align rear chassis frame 380.00 )( AA
| 4 To remove & refit rear windscreen 180.00 | pez&- (1.0
. To remove & replace rear tail-gate 200.00 | bo
6 | Toremove & replace rear reverse sensor e 180.00 | Yo
7 To check wiring 100.00 | 3¢
8 To re-seal anti-rust 280.00 & go
5,320.00
Total 15,613.70 (éf’ &

o ' ' I LKK Auto Consyltants hence nolify

e riepairer of Ihe following:
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408932

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 43135

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Ne 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Exparts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL

Ref : CS/SMO18005946/Ggbn2

oo IO
#05-01/06 Date: 26-09-2018
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. FS a742U Veh. Inspected 5G5S 3056L
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1801383/AGC Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  GRACE TEO Assign Date 29/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA YARIS c.c 1497
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg. 2007
Chassis No. MROS4HY 2104020718 Colour SILVER
Odometer 147897 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/45R16 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/45R16 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/45 R16 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/45R16 YOKOHAMA & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  29/03/2018 Inspection Date 02/04/2018
Survey held at RYDER AUTO WORKSHOP LLP
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE &
#01-56 SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3551 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Na: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 13-8607198-R Page Mo.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGS 3056L
Qty Description of Parts Condition ﬁ:ﬂ:’:ﬁ;} ke’ ﬁ““ﬁd
LAC TOF T

1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 469.80 469.80
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS MECESSARY 38.00 38.00
2|REAR BUMPER ©/S & NIS CORNER CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 182.10 -
Z|REAR BUMFER O/S & NIS STAY NOT NECESSARY 264.50 -
2|REAR BUMPER O/S & NI/S RETAIMER NECESSARY 175.20 110.00
1|REAR TAIL-GATE LOWER PANEL BUCKLED 426.20 426.20
1|REAR TAIL-GATE LOWER PANEL INNER TRIM DEFORMED 226.00 226.00
4|REAR TAIL-GATE LOWER PANEL INNER TRIM CLIPS NECESSARY 15.20 15.20
1|REAR TAIL-GATE BUCKLED 1,020.00 750.00
1|REAR TAIL-GATE WEATHER-STRIP TWISTED 201.60 201.60
1|REAR TAIL-GATE EMELEM NECESSARY 61.40 61.40
1|REAR TAIL-GATE YARIS EMBLEM NMECESSARY 58.20 58.20
1|REAR TAIL-GATE E EMBLEM NECESSARY 38.20 38.20
1|REAR TAIL-GATE LOCK (UPPER) BENT 42260 236.00

1|REAR TAIL-GATE LOCK (LOWER) MOT NECESSARY 101.20
1|REAR TAIL-GATE LOCK (QUTER) NOT NECESSARY 289.60 -
1|REAR TAIL-GATE INNER TRIM NOT NECESSARY 301.20 -
12|REAR TAIL-GATE INNER TRIM CLIPS NOT MECESSARY 45,60 -
2|REAR TAIL-GATE O/S & N/S SHOCK ABSORBER NOT NECESSARY 42820 -
2|REAR TAIL-GATE O/S & N/S STOPPER NOT NECESSARY B7.10 -
1|REAR BOOT FLOOR TO REPAIR SEE 992,20 -

LABOUR

1|REAR SPARE WHEEL BOARD COVER CRACKED 303.80 135.00
1|REAR MN/S FEMDER INNER BOARD CRACKED 426.20 426.20
6|REAR N/S FENDER INNER BOARD CLIPS NECESSARY 22 80 22.80
2|REAR OS5 & NIS TAIL-LAMP CRACKED 684,10 68410
4|REAR O/S & N/S TAIL-LAMP CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 15.20 -
2|REAR OIS & N/S TAIL-LAMP SEALANT NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
1|REAR REG.NO. PLATE LAMP NOT NECESSARY 202.70 -
1|REAR REG.NO. PLATE BRACKET (INNER) NOT MECESSARY 62.00 -

1|REAR BOOT FLOOR INSULATOR NOT FITTED 120.00
1|SET REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NECESSARY 268.20 103.10
16|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 60.80 -

Report Ref No. CS/SMO18005946/Ggbn2




I V'l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

.‘.'_f - ; ; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-3607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Qty Description of Parts Condition 5:‘:;:!:?5{;] Our A;j}umu
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -1,000.45
B.109.70 3.001.35
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER SPOILER (LOWER)(SN) CRACKED 1,620.00 £00.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN INMER SEAL (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 20.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 60.00 :
1|REAR REG.NO.PLATE (SN) cuT 45.00 40.00
1|REAR REG.NO.PLATE BRACKET (OUTER)(SN) NOT NECESSARY 29.00 -
1|SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR (SN) DAMAGED 380.00 220.00
2,184.00 880.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE, STRAIGHTEN & WELDING ABOVE 2,200.00 800.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR BOOT
FLOOR.
TO SPRAY PAINTING (METALLIC PAINT). 1,800.00 1,000.00
TO RE-ALIGN REAR CHASSIS FRAME. NOT NECESSARY 380.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEM. 180.00 120.00
TO REMOVE & REPLACE REAR TAIL-GATE. 200.00 60.00
TO REMOVE & REPLACE REAR REVERSE SENSOR. 180.00 40.00
TO CHECK WIRING. 100.00 30.00
TO RE-SEAL ANTI-RUST, 280.00 80.00
5,320.00 2,130.00
GRAND TOTAL 15,613.70 6,011.35
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,800.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/SMO18005946/Ggbn2

XING GUO QIANG ADRIAN LING WAI PING

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser




