Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 March 2018 12:28 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A; Shu Pei (LKKAuUto)

Cc Chong Boon Sen; Alfred Toh; Hwang Shiang Yi; Chee So Chow; KKLau; Hsiao Tong
(LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM17D04318C02 LKK REF NO. CCE/CTIT7074246/Kub3

LKK REF NO, CC6/CTI17014246/Kub3
CTI REF NO: SNM17D04318C02/4 (GX6424L)

Dear Thin Thin
We refer to the above matter.

Please assist to notify M/s Wei Lee Motor Works to withdraw claim through M/s K Ravi Law Corpn if they are inclined
to have Direct Settlement.

If they agree to the above, you may proceed to offer as follow:

Cost of Repairs 52,250.00
Loss of Use (4 days x $80.00/day) S 320.00
LTA Search fee 5 5.35
Total $2,575.35

We await your further advice for our next course of action.
Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd

3 Anson Road

#15-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID : +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7175/6224 T4T8

Email: claimsdept@sqg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer ;

T P e ] 1 & PRI o - W - 2 . + Farge
This message is confidential; its contenis do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd except where proy ided for
in @ written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination. either in
whale or pariial. is prohibited. [f you are not the intended reciplent of the message, please noittfy the sender immediately.



From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, March 20, 2018 5:06 PM
To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM17D04318C02 LKK REF NO. CC6/CT117014246/Kub3

Dear Boon Sen,
Enclosed herewith our survey report for your perusal.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shu Pej (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 9 March 2018 2:51 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
<thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM17D04318C02 LKK REF NO. CC6/CTI17014246/Kub3

Dear Boon Sen,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
Dear Thin Thin,

For your information and necessary action please.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Chong Boon Sen [mailto:boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com]
Sent: Friday, 9 March 2018 2:27 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: OUR REF: SNM17D04318C02 LKK REF NO. CC3/CT117014246/KUG3




Dear ShuPei,
Refer to matter.
Pls submit final bill and report as we have received LOD from lawyer.

Thank you.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email: boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website .cntaiping.com

Disclaimer !

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute o commitment by China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided for
in a written agreement between you and China Taiping insurance (Singapore} Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the messoge, please notify the sender immediately.

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




& #H A
WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

BLOCK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32, \;
SINGAPORE 575644, 5 o e,
TEL: 456 9830 « FAX:-455-2086 LAy & \
Business Regn No - 268436/00.

20/09/ 2017

China Taiping Insurance (5) PL

Attn: Motor claim dept-3" party claim
Claiming against your insured vehicle no: GX6424L
Accident involving vehicle no:SGY6235K/GX6424L
OM 19/07/2017 AT Sakra Road Jurong Island

Dear officer incharge
We are the workshop for the owner of vehicle no: SGY8235K

Regarding the claim for the case above, this is a liability clear case considering that your client’s
vehicle collided into the front portion of our client’s vehicle.

The claim for vehicle No: SGYB235K as follow:-

Cost of repair to SGY6235K 5 2,250.00 finalised with your surveyor
Loss of use S 320.00 SB0x04d
LTA search fee 5 5.35

5 2,575.35

Enclosed with all the necessary document for your reference.

Kindly let us have your reply sconest possible.

Thank you.



' l'] Auto

= Em Ew Consuitants
A.JA BA R Pla lid

51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 4085933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (063) 62564313

Our Ref: CC6/CTI17014246/Kub3
06 DECEMBER 2017

H.K.L SCAFFOLDING & FORMWORK PTE LTD
4 TUAS SOUTH STREET 10
SINGAPORE 63709

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GX 6424L AND SGY 6235K ON 19/07/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if vou have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

VE

THIN THIN HLAING

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360

Fax: 6741 4108

Email: thinthin(@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)
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Policy Mo ¢ DMCVSNH3IOTLE81600 Claim Mo : SNM17D04318C02
Olaimant = KH LEARSING PTE LTD
Amount i iB§ 23575335

Singapore Dollars Two Thousand Five Hundred Seventy Five
and Cents Thirty Five Only

1/We agree to accept the abeve menticned amount te be paid to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries ! damages
sustained by mefus through an accident involving

Claimant Vehicle Ho. : SGY 6£Z233K
Insured Vehicle No. @ GX 6424L

pate of Loss + 19/07/2017
Place of Accident : SAKEA ROAD JURCNG ISLAND

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aferementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., IfWe agzee absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured MName : H.X.L SCAFFOLDING & FORMWORK FTE LTD
Driver Hame : OWG LAI THIAN

from all claime, present or future in respect of all loss, injury .or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge thst this payment iz made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) FTE. LTD.

{1} General Damages 55 -
{2} Cost of Repair/Excess 8% 2,250.00
{3) Loss of Use/Rental/ 55 320.00
{4} GIASfPolice Reparts/
Investigatlon Results/Search Fees 55 5.35
(5) Medical Reports/Expenses 55 -
(6] Survey Fees/P.T. Fees 55 -
{7} Cost including Disbursement 55 -
SoooooowsEsESSSDSSSSzT
TEERL o © n &R Eeaiia 4 N o% F 5w SF 2pBERG3D
Claimanc Mame : KH LEASING PTELTD HRIC HNo :

Signature Date




R # Z 9
WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

BLOCK g SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32,
SINGAPORE 5730644

TEL: 6458 G830 = FAX; BASE 0128
Businass Ragn No: 2E3438/00J

China Taiping Insurance (5) PL INVOICE NO:12478
105 cecil street #18-00 DATE.21/09/2017
The Octagon
5069534
PARTICULARS AMOUNT (S§)

WVehicle No: SGYB235K

Lump sum repaired as inspected and recommended by your 2,250.00
appointed surveyor-LKK Auto Consultants oo
2,250.00

Payments to be madr by crossed cheque in favour of WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS



1L AT IEV VT

Enguire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No, GX6424L As At 19 Jul 2017 /08:15:00)

Law Firm Search Details

Search Reason:
Law Firm Case No.:
Current Owner Detalls

Crwner D Type:

Chwner (D

Crwner Name:
Registered Address Type:
Registered Block/House

Ma.:
Registered Street Mame:

Reglstered Unit Mo.:
Registered Building Mame:
Registered Postal Code:

Current Vehicle Details

Vehlcle Mo.:
Make Description/Model:

Insurance Compary Mame:

Venicle Hub

Insurance claim in relation to traffie accident

KR.O015.17. KAREN

Company

1998045790

H.K.L SCAFFOLDING & FORMWORK PTELTD

Private Residential [Condo Apt or House) / Shapping / Office Complexes

4
TUAS SOUTH STREET 10

637099

GXE424L
TOYOTA/ DYMA 150D
CHINA TAIFING IMNSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTELTD

Fitpasitvrl lta, gov sgitafrifactionfawFirmDetal FFUNCTION _ID=F180107T1ET

m



