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TYPE; M.cai'/ M. c,vcre / Bus / Van / Loilrl ra:r.i/ prime Mover / Truck / Trairer or

LOT:.-
Reference No :

From (Person) :

Date/Time :

Vehicle No :

ldal,le & lr4o,iel:

Regisiration Daie:
^^--uur rr.piry Date:

LTA. Total Rebaie Amount:

Piiority :.tiORtJAL / i.jRc=NT

NEW CAR PRICE:$

t'.1 OPS : Yes / No DOA:

D.c'.A / A.sAf rf llhC

(PARF)
FS:$



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
lo:
Cc:

Subject:

Dear Yvonne,

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Monday, 2 April 20187:52 AM

ANG Yvonne
HO Winnie; 'Kitty Teo Poh Guek'; birdie.ong@axa.com.sg; 'Jas Tan Siok Thiew';

peter.xiao@axa.com.sg

RE: tMVl Check Market Value (MV) - S8M00BBF / DOA: 17.03.2018 - SFD 98681

The market value for SFD 98681 is S158K - Sf0Zr (Est) as at March 2018.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte ttd

Phone:6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4375

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue t, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Lavender Pa ng [mailto:surveyadmin2 @fta.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday,29 March 2018 4:39 PM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; admin@autoprobe.com.sg; chowauto@singnet.com.sg; bokhari@jpknights.com;

admin@lbs-auto.com; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; rta@rta.com.sg;

collin.wong@a-pac.sg
Cc: ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; HO Winnie <winnie.ho@axa.com.sg>; 'Kitty Teo Poh Guek'

<Kitty.Teo@axa.com.sg>; birdie.ong@axa.com.sg; 'Jas Tan Siok Thiew' <jas.tan@axa.com.sg>; Wendy Tan

<motorsu rvey@ft a.com.sg>; pete r.xiao @axa.com.sg
Subject: RE: [MV] Check Market Value (MV)- S8M00B8F / DOA: L7.O3.2O78 - SFD 98681

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to vvonne.ans@axa.com.ss and cc to all OD case handler within 48 hours.

Thank you & warm regards

fuy*s*d*r Smm6r

FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd
No. 33 Ubi Ave 3, #02-15 Vertex, Singapore 408858

Tel : (6s| 6s09 1788 r Fax: (55) 5509 5221
Email: surveyadmin2@fta.com,sg
Websitel www.fta.com.sg

4
fi Olease consider the environmant before printing this email
-ttotile : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. lt is intended solely for the identified

recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. lf you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system.

You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
OwnerlDType:

OwnerlD:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No,:

Vehicle !o be Exported:

lntended De-registration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehlcle Model:

PrimaryColour;

ManufachrringYear:

Englne No.:

ChassisNo.:

Maximum PowerOutpuh

Open MarketValue:

Original Registration Date:

Fint Registration Date:

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

lntended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Elieibilityr

PARF Elieibili$ Explry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

lntended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE RebateAmount:

Total RebateAmount:
' The information contained herein is correct as at 29 Mar 2018

PARF/COF Rnhaln Fnnrrirv

Singapore NRIC

2824E

sFD9868L

No

29Mar2OLB

JEEP

hff: rr\1116

cnd9

WRANGLER UNLIM ITED RUBICON 3.6 AT4WD

Orange

2015

GFL662I79

1C4BJWMG9FL662779

209.0kW (280bhp)

$4s,s00.00

29 Jun20t5

29 Jun 2015

0

$5s,700.00

]l'r,. ror, >1E
$41,775.00

28Jun2O25

E - Open Category

10

$7s,801.00

$54,373.00

$96.14s.00
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