
LOT: Priority :.triCIRFJlA.L / TJRGENT

f'erer11ce 
ruo ' cnlrmutox.vla/ craimNo. 

-slr,,rDoBogFrom (person) :

Daie/Time :

A{A
ll.l OPS : Yes / No DOA:

Ref:

tvlV: $

TYPE;M.Cai/M evor-,'-'B / Bus / Van rLorry r ra.x.i/ prime Mover / Tiuck / Trairer oi
Vehicle No : Sfv g1o5x, D.A.A / A.s At tclJre
lr4alle&Model: : . enr^1 ..r,^ *- ErnW 3gtA f{EW cAR pRtcE:$

--Fiegrstraiion Daie: }t,[:"ro Mr/:$ ttbk-1*4p c4\r trolv MV:$_-hqE:!&ts euote ty- : lfkrrr*sCoE Expiiy Date: . > rlrl>oro tre,q
L tA total Reoaie Amount: tpARF) + {COE) = *,,,.1---r



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, March 27,20L810:53 AM
yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg; Winnie Ho

Kitty Teo Poh Guek; birdie; jas; peter.xiao@axa.com.sg

RE: Check Market Value (MV) - S8M00808 / SJV3705X / DOA : L5.03.20L8

Dear Winnie,

The market value for SJV 3705x is Saok - S+at(eSD as at March 2018

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKKAuto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-956t I email: janicelee@lkkauto.com I fax:6256-4315

Blk 5r, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue L, #02-25 I S(+o8gSS)

From: AutoProbe Admin Imailto:admin@autoprobe.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, March 26,207812:16 PM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; 'chowautol' <chowauto@singnet.com.sg>; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg;
bokhari@jpknights.com; admin@lbs-auto.com; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; 'Priority - Cynthia Ong'
<cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg>; rta@rta.com.sg; collin.wong@a-pac.sg
Cc: Kitty Teo Poh Guek <Kitty.Teo@axa.com.sg>; yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg; Winnie Ho <winnie.ho@axa.com.sg>; birdie

' <birdie.ong@axa.com.sg>; jas <jas.tan@axa.com.sg>; peter.xiao@axa.com.sg

Subject: Re: Check Market Value (MV) - S8M00808 / SJV3705X / DOA : 15.03.2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to mailtowinnie.ho@axa.com.sg and cc to all OD case handler within 48
hours.

Jessie Ong

AutoProbe Consultants
Blk 151A Serangoon North Avenue 2,

#02-81 Singa pore 55 1-1-51

Main: 62699235 Fax: 6269L446



A RI/COE Rebate Errquiry

i'l

Enquire PARF/bOE Rebate for Reglstered Vehicle
Vehlcle Owner Partlculars
Own€r lDType:

Owner lD:

Vehlcle Detalls
Vehicle No.:

Vehlcle to be Exported:

lntended De.reglstratlon Date:

Vehlcle Make:

Vehlcle Model:

PrlmaryColour:

Mrnufacturlng Year:

Englne No.:

Chasls No.:

Maximum Pwer 0utput:
Open MarketValue;

Original Reglstrrtlon Date:

Flrst R€gistraUon Date:

TransferCount:

ActualARF Paid:

lntended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Ellglbllity:

PARF Eligibllity Expiry Datei

PARF RebateAmount:

lntended COE Rebate Details
COE Exdry Date:

COE Categorla

COEPerlod(Y€arsl: -

qP Pald:

COE RebateArcunt:

Total RebateAmount '
The lnformation contalned herein is correctas at 23 Mar 2018
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N52525AEt7387247
WBAWL32030PP59620

139.0kw (186 bhp)

$48,465.00
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$48,46sO0

Yes

2lJan2020

$26,6ss.0o
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B -Car (1601cc & above)
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$4,094.00

$30,749.00
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