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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, March 29, 2018 9:28 AM

To: 'Pauline Tham'; SUR

Subject: RE: MV for GBC1475S - DOA : 23/3/2018, Oref : M1801547/PT-01

Dear Pauline,

The market value for GBC 1475S is $22k - $24k(est) as at March 2018.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Pauline Tham [mailto:paulinetham @tokiomarine.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, March 28, 2018 11:33 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: MV for GBC1475S - DOA : 23/3/2018, Oref : M1801547/PT-01
Importance: High

Dear Veron/Denise,
We would like to request for the market value for GBC14755S.

DOA : 23 March 2018

Thanks.
Regards

Pauline Tham
Executive, Motor Claim Department

Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd.
20 McCallum Street #09-01 Tokio Marine Centre Singapore 069046
T (65) 6592 6401 | F (65) 6221 2101 | www.tokiomarine.com

This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the addressee named. If you are not the
named addressee (or authorised to receive for the addressee) you must not disseminate, distribute or copy this
email. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete
this e-mail from your system.



' PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Cwner 1T:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Modst:
Primary Colour:
Engine No.:
Chassis No:
Maximum Power Qutput:
Cpen Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date;

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

intended COE Rebate Details
COE Category:

COE PericclYears):

QP Paid;

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amaunt:

Theinformation contained herein s correct as at 23 Mar 2018

Company
2238M

GBC14755

No

23 Mar 2018

NISSAN

URVAN 3.0 5MT ABS AB 50R LWB PANEL
White

2011
ZD30280561K
JNIMGAE25207954461
$29.184.00

13 Jun 2011

13 un2011

0

$1,460.00

No

20.00

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$21,889.00

$7.051.00

$7.051.00

5.Y

12t



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Pauline Tham <paulinetham@tokiomarine.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, March 28, 2018 11:33 AM

To: SUR

Subject: MV for GBC1475S - DOA : 23/3/2018, Oref : M1801547/PT-01
Attachments: ) coe-parf - GBL1475S.pdf

Importance: High

Dear Veron/Denise,
We would like to request for the market value for GBC1475S.

DOA : 23 March 2018

Thanks.
Regards

Pauline Tham
Executive, Motor Claim Department

Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd.
20 McCallum Street #09-01 Tokio Marine Centre Singapore 069046
T (65) 6592 6401 | F (65) 6221 2101 | www.tokiomarine.com

This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the addressee named. If you are not the
named addressee (or authorised to receive for the addressee) you must not disseminate, distribute or copy this
email. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete
this e-mail from your system. -



