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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, March 29, 2018 10:30 AM

To: Zheng Hanyang

Cc: SUR

Subject: ~ RE: Market value for GZ9109S - Loss on 23/03/2018 - Our Ref: M1801576

Dear Hanyang,

The market value for GZ 9109S is $20K - $22K(est) as at March 2018.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Zheng Hanyang [mailto:Hanyang@tokiomarine.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, March 28, 2018 10:39 AM

To: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Market value for GZ9109S - Loss on 23/03/2018 - Our Ref: M1801576

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer the subject matter.

Please advise the market value of GZ9109S as of 23/03/2018 asap.

We attached here with the PARF/COE rebate enquiry for your perusal. Thank you

Warmest Regards

Zheng Hanyang

Senior Executive, Motor Claim

Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd

20 McCallum Street #11-01 Tokio Marine Centre, Singapore 069046
T (65) 6592 6416 | F (65) 6221 2101

E hanyang@tokiomarine.com.sg | W www.tokiomarine.com

A member of the
Tokio Marine Group

Please note that all personal information provided to Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd. is subject to the Personal Data Protection Policy Statement posted at
www.tokiomarine.com.



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

- -

Enqulre PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Page 1 of 1

Vehicle Owner Particulars

v

Owner ID Type Company
" Owner ID: ' 7f56R
Vehicle Details ; -
Vehicle No. GZ9109s
Vehicle to be Exported Yes
" Intended De-r regnstratlon Date 28 Mar 2018
. Vehlcle Make KIA
_ VehicleModel: k2700
Prumary Colour: Whlte
Manufacturing Year 2006
Engine No 12447290
Chassis No.: KNCSE011267152464
Maxvmum Power Output -
Open Market Value: $11, 583 00
Ongmal Reglstratlon Date: 7120t 2006
Fll’St Registration Date: 12 Oct 2006
Transfer Count: 1 :
Actual ARF Paid: $580.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
" PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Explry Date 3'07$ep 2021
. COE Category ~ C-Goods Vehicle &Bus
' COE Perlod(Years) 5
¢ PQP Paid: $24,044.00
'COE Rebate Amount: $16,857.00
Total Rebate Amount: $16,857.00
Message
Please note that alI future COE renewals for this vehlcle can onIy be for a5-year penod subject tothe statutory lifespan (if applicable) of the
vehicle.

The information contained herein is correct as at 28 Mar 2018

OK
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