Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 12:42 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Cc MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: <MANDATE> Your ref. 18/18/18/VC00,/020495 [ ACCIDENT ON 23/03/2018

INVOLVING VEHICLES YP 5842Z AND GBG 7342G]

Dear Thin Thin,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Saturday, 23 June, 2018 4:52 PM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; ONG LI LI; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: <MANDATE> Your ref: 18/18/18/VC00/020495 [ ACCIDENT ON 23/03/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES YP 5842Z
AND GBG 7342G]

Your ref: 18/18/18/VC00,/020495

Dear Sir / Madam,

ACCIDENT ON 23/03/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES YP 5842Z AND GBG 7342G
We refer to the above accident.

The accident occurred while OI turning left and collided with TP vehicle which was stationary along the road
side.

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100%
liability.

Summary to offer to repairer M/s Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd is as follows:

TP CLAIMED OUR REVISED
TO OFFER
Cost of Repairs (w/gst) $ 3.509.73 $1.233.34
Loss of Use S 320.00 ($80 x 4 days) $  320.00 ($80 x 4 days)
LTA Search Fee $ 2.00 $ 2.00
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| TOTAL |s 3.831.73 | §1,555.34

*Surveyor recommended 4 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

Kindly let us have your approval/instruction/comments for our further negotiating and settlement.
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Thank you.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 31 May 2018 12:13 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.coms>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>; "ERIC WOO JUN KIAT'
<ericwoo®@lonpac.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com=>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>;
Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: JM DOA 18 2303 YP5842Z n GBG7342G rpt

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your ref: 18/18/18/VC00/020495
LKK ref: CC4/LPC18005852/Aua3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: GBG 7342G

We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email; MeiKwan @ lkkauto,.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]
Sent: Thursday, 12 April, 2018 11:42 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @lkkauto com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com=

Subject: RE: JM DOA 18 2303 YP5842Z n GBG7342G rpt

Dear Mei Kwan,

Attached copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 12 April, 2018 11:36 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: JM DOA 18 2303 YP5842Z n GBG7342G rpt

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your ref: 18/18/18/VC00/020495
LKK ref: CC4/LPC18005852 /ua3

Dear Sir /Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Kindly let us have a copy of your insured'’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email; MeiKwan @ lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4080933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com)
Sent: Thursday, 12 April, 2018 11:12 AM
To: assignmentsi@lkkauto.com



Cc: MT _Claim_5G <mt claim@lonpac.com=
Subject: FW: JM DOA 18 2303 YP5842Z n GBG7342G rpt

Our Ref :18/18/18/VC00/020495

Dear Catherine,

Kindly forward the photos to the case handler for their review.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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GRESy  PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

OY /3
Ty ,,A = Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716
| :

Tel:: 6741 5336 (6 Lines) Fax: 6741 7208
AUTOMOTIV E-mail: progaute@progauto.com.sg
Req. No.: 2010062480

Qlur eguipsr

We epecialise in repaining, panel beating, spray painting of all kinds of Vehicles and also insurance claims. All enquines are welcome
Our Ref: TP 0318-5005
26.05.2018

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
300 BEACH ROAD,
#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir.

-
7

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: GBG 7342 G & YP 5842 7 ON 23.03.2018

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: GBG 7342 G which was involved in the
above captioned accident with your insured vehicle: YP 5842 Z. The vehicle owner has requested and authorized
us to assist him in presenting the claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of vour insured driving. we are submitting these claims for
vour consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

01y  Coast of repair (incl gst) b 1.233.34
02)  GIA Search Fee 5 2.00
03)  Reimbursement - Loss of Use (04 days x $/80day) b 320,00

b 1,555.34

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:-

a) Letter of Authorisation / GIA report(s) / Insurance Certificate, ete...
b Final Tax Invoice / GIA Search Fee

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as so0n as possible,

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any
personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank vou
Yours faithfully

P

L1
. \ |
~ Pei Wen

For Progressive Automotive Pte Lid
Email : peiwen@progauto.com.sg

ciude tha lastest and refable CAR-O-LINER MARK 5 repair bench, draw-aligner and the suppor dolfy system to provice acCurate re-algnmant and speetly repal



oPReSs, PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Bl 30224 Ubi Rozd 1 #07-4 ingapore v

Q Road 1 #01-45/46 Si 408716

2 m Tel: 6741 5338 (6 Lines) Fax: 6741 7208

AUTOMOTIVE E-mail: progauto@progauto.com.sg
T Beqg. Mo 2010088480

\We speciziise in repaining, panel besting, sprey peiming of af inds of Vehicles and gizo insurence claims, All enguines are welcome.

Cur RE_-' : 1 & i J '._ ] |

11 " & el + 1Y y =
| AT I Y | . . 5 e J
| fwe__|" UK - - Mric Mo

X
1=

Residing at 5. pritir2 =\ Ve L 7 1= | owner of

OH A Ul hereby authorize PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD at

Vehicle MNo_LIDA]

Blk 30224 Uki Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716 to resolve the above matier

In respect of this authorzation, | / We confirmed {0 accept whaisoever setfled or agreed by them

PO e CRPUIPSRVIRPPIUINE, (It LEMRPIE , LK o0 e i o IESNLY 1 | WU T [P ] O S £
and aleo agreed that all Payments include Loss of Use to make in fevour of

PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD.

p— L/ We amiare fully aware that all setflement made In respect of the accident occurred on
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SIGNATURE OF OWNER

Qur eguipment Include the lastest and reliable CAR-DO-LIMER MARK 5 rapair bench, draw-aligner arvd the support dolly system to provide accurale re-2Bgnment ano spesdy repairs



CLAIMNO : 18/18/18/VC00/020495
DATE : 29 JUNE 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, MOLKAN FABRICS confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of YP 5842Z the sum of Singapore Dollars
One Thousand Five Hundred Fifty Five and Cents Thirty Four Only ($1,555.34)
in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to
me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident 1o my vehicle, GBG 7342G on 23 MARCH
2018 ALONG VERDUN ROAD MUSTAFA CENTRE

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (JIA MEI TRADING (S) PTE
LTD/LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever
made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S
PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect ol our

insured’s recovery action, AN
oy O
(4 ~ 0
(uf = = .
1 ._f__"\-‘ /.-
& p. R 1._..'|_._II- o :

MName ol vehicle owner/Date



PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Blk 30224 Uk Road | #01-45/46 Singapore 408716

TEL: 6741 53336 FAX: 6741 7208

GST 2010069490 RCB NCO-201006949C

Email: progauo’e proganto. com sg

M/S:  LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Claim No: EST1503464
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 Final No: PS1502489
The Concourse Singapore 199555 Date: 26 May 2018
Policy No: DMCPHOQ 1 7-006360
Veh Reg No:  GBGT7342G
ATTN: Motor Claim Department Make/Model:  NISSAN NV200 1.5 MT
ABS AIRBAG 2WD 6DR
E5 W/RC
Your Ref No: TP 0318-3005 Chassis No: VSKYBAM20Z0146827
Claim Type: Third Party Engine No: KOKC400D05 7480
Accident Date: 23/03/2018 Reg. Date: 12/10/2017
TP Veh Reg No: YP5842Z

[ %)

Final Repair BilGBG7342G

Description Quantity Price
S5
Net Price
FAILLAMP AS5Y - RH I PCS 252,10
TAILLAMP CLIP - RH I PCS .40
258.50
Less 1M 2585
Labour
TOKNOCK OUT DENTS, CUT! WELD RHR FENDER. REMOVE, (LG]E] 450,00
REPLACE ACCIDENT PARTS
IOy RESPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT PORTIONS | JOB 400,00
IO CHECK WIRING 1 108 L0
[ TUFF-KOTE | HOB 40,00
920,00

[otal
Add GST it 7%

Toal Amount Pavable

Amount

S8

232.65

Q20000

55 1.152.65

RiL69

5% 1.233.34

FOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR ONE THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED THIRTY THREE AND CENTS THIRTY FOUR ONLY

For PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTE
r.-.l'f 1['-}_.--" .“'L |IL.'—-'w\. e——

Blk 3C

Email: progaute
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A2E/2018 Invaica

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
GST Registration Mo: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-045584
Date of Request: 26/03/2018 Your Ref Mo: Orline Purchase

Progressive Aulomotive Ple Lid
Blk 30224 Ubi Road 1

#01-45/486
i apore 408716
Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 26032018
Enquiry By Soo Leong Keat
TP Vehicle No. YP58427
Accident Date 230372018
Enguiry Result
TF Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. Mo,
YPSB42Z2 Lonpac Insurance Bhd 16/02/2018-15/02/2019 +65 62507388
Thank You.

The images provided o you are taken from the onginal reports forwarded to the centra by the members of the General Insurance Association of Singapore
we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage anising out of or in connection

.1 the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

hilps:iwww giarme.org.soiclaimsindes. cim Musebox=MTRsas&luseaction=dsp_geninvipirelid=1758408&CFID=30988062&CF TOKEN=9Gab9b0BTelBesac-BEI



3262018 Invoice

' GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
I“SURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax; +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday S9am to Spm
G5TR trati . M400017735
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE PRCETEn NN

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref Mo: GR-18-045584
Date of Request: 26/03/2018 Your Ref Na: Onling Purchase
Progressive Automotive Pte Lid
Blk 30224 Ubi Road 1
#01-45/46
Singapore 408716 -
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 26/03/2018
Enquiry By Soo Leong Keat
TP Vehicle No. YP58427
Accident Date 23/03/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S8)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use: -
Date:
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Chegue

hitps:/fwww.giarmec.org sg/claims/index ofm Husebox=MTRsas&luseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=17584084CFID=30988062&CFTOKEN=5/6ebBbBTeBeeec-BEFE



