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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 4085933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No, 19-86071598-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

300 BEACH ROAD

#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555

Ref : CC4/LPC18005852/ual

Date : 29-03-2018

Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YP 58422 Veh. Inspected GBG 73426
Policy No. Z/1BNCD0M101210 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 18/18/18//C00/020495 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 28/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer s Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mim
L/H Front Tyre mirm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/03/2018 |Inspa¢tion Date
Survey held at PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
ELK 30224 UB| ROAD 1 #01-45/48, SINGAPORE 048716
5a. Remarks

AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIM ACCORDANGCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




. Consultants
B JA LA R Pte Lid Company Registration No. 199607138R

| 3 74 74T

1 UBLAVE 1, #12-25 PAYA URLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (65) 62563501 FAX : (065) 62564315

Y our refl: 18/18/18/VCO0/020495 Date: 03.05.2018
Owr ref: CC4/LPC18005852/Aual

The Motor Claims Department

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. GBG 7342G
We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 27/04/2018
at the premises of M/s Progressive Automotive Pte Lid have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 3,280.12
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 1,152.65
"Check" Items Amount : S% -

Total (Including Check Items) 1 5% 1,152.65
Market Value : 8% - (est)
LTA Reimbursement Value B - (est)
Nett Value : 5% - (esL)

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the -
Rear O/S Portion { )

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4.0 day

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING
Licensed Appraiser



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

———— S =TT P e e e
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com:>
Sent: Thursday, 12 April, 2018 11:42 AM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuta)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: JM DOA 18 2303 YP5842Z n GBG7342G rpt
Attachments: 12042018113841.pdf
Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Categories: HME

Dear Mei Kwan,

Attached copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 12 April, 2018 11:36 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: JM DOA 18 2303 YP5842Z n GBG7342G rpt

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your ref: 18/18/18/VC00/020495
LKK ref: CC4/LPC18005852 /ua3

Dear Sir /Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6366 oos5 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

1



From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com
Sent: Thursday, 12 April, 2018 11:12 AM

To: assignments@|kkauto.com

Ce: MT_Claim_5G <mt claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: IM DOA 18 2303 YP58427 n GBG7342G rpt

Our Ref :18/18/18/VC00/020495

Dear Catherine,

Kindly forward the photos to the case handler for their review.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



Catherine Chnna (LKK Auto)

From: ERIC WOOQ JUN KIAT <ericwoo®@lonpac.com=>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 March, 2018 4:51 FM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc MT_Claim_5G

Subject: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VC00/020495  Accident involving YP5842Z & GBG7342G along
Mustafa Centre on 23/3/18

Attachments: 28032018164805.pdf

Dear Catherine,
Kindly refer to our attachment.

Please proceed to conduct a survey of the vehicle GBG 7342G on without Prejudice Basis.

We look forward to receiving your report soon.

Sl
Thank you. \Eﬁ’)m‘% e r{ « v
Best Regards, w_g,m
Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767
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THE MOTOR CLAXM DEPARTMENT
Lowpre lngueance Kol

L0 Reach €& #19- o

L Tanver
Swysprre 189403

Dits: : ?ﬂ’{[m\g{

Progressive Antomotive Pte Led
Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1
H0145/46

Singapore 408716

Dear Siv / Madam .
Accident involving a (N 1L 61 5 V P kg4

On : lﬁ:ﬁ,hﬂ;me Ll.e0am '
Along / At &-L"\ud, mum,‘iﬁ &v&rp_ outside e lu‘dlh\i E-uj

I am the registered owner of motor velicle no,_ f”jg’ﬁ d3%24 which was involved in
the above aecident,

-

As a result of your insured vehicle oo, ?P St¥d %nngiigmm thereby causing the
nbove-said accident,

Please appoint yoyr assesser to mspect my vehicls at the ah ove-mentioned workshop as currently
vehicle iz W‘N@

Pleass find enclosed Lsrewith the repairer’s estimate for your refareace.

Thank you

@
\%%

Ei—gnature of Ovmer
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L 2
¥ ]
PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
Blk 30224 Ubi Road | #01-45M6 Singapore 408716
TEL: 6741 5336 FAM; 6741 7208 Emaik progeuto@progauie.com.og
GST:201005945C RCB ND:201006940C
M/S: MOLKANFABRICS
62 ARAB STREET Estimate No:  EST1503464
SINGAPORE 199759 Date: 26 Mar 2018
Policy No: DMCPHQ17-006360
Veh Reg No:  GBGT7342G
ATTN: MakeModel: NISSANNVZ00 1.5 MT
ARS ATRBAG 2WD 6DR
ES W/RC
Your Ref No: TP (318-5005 Chassis Mo: VSKYBAM2I0Z0146827
Claim Type; Third Party Engine No: K9K.C400D057480
Accident Date:  23/03/2018 Reg. Date: 12/10/2017
TP Veh Reg No:  YP5B427
Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :GBG7342G
_. . Deseription pmmsmnime arerse oo e S ETLES  Quantity Price  _Amount
55 53
Met Price
| REAR FENDER -RH 1,554.300 1PC 1,554.30
7 REARFENDER ROLLER OUTER GARMISH - RH 54.0000 1 PCS 54.00
3 TAILLAMP ASSY - RH 252, 1000 1 PCS 252.10
4 TAILLAMP CLIP - RH 6.4000 IPCS 640
1,866.80
Less 10% 18668 1,680,012
Labour
5 TOKNOCK OUT DENTS, CUT/ WELD RHR FENDER, 1,000.000 1 JOB 1,000.00
REMOVE, REPLACE ACCIDENT PARTS
6 TORESPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT PORTIONS 500.0000 110B 500,00
7 TOCHECK WIRING 50,0000 1108 50.00
8 TOTUFF-KOTE 50,0000 1J0B 5000
| ,600.00 1,600.00
S s Total 85328012
Add GST @ 7% 229.61

Total Amount Payable 5§ 3,500.73
— - —
TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR, THREE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED AND NINE AND CENTS SEVENTY THREE ONLY

For PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE FTE
LTD

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE



PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD -

Blk 20224 Ubi Road | #01-43/46 Singapore 405716
TEL: 6741 5336 FAX: 6741 T208  Email; progaulof progautoe cemn.sg

M/S: MOLKAN FABRICS
62 ARAB STREET
SINGAPORE 199759

ATTN:

Your Ref No: TP 031R8-5005

Claim Type: Third Party

Accident Date: 23032018

TP Veh Reg No:  YP58427

Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :GBG7342G

GST201006949C RCB NO:ZO1006945C

Estimate No:

Date:

Policy No:
Veh Reg No:
Make/Model:

Chassis No:
Engine No:
Reg. Date:

Description

Net Price
REAR FENDER - RH

TAILLAMP ASSY - RH
TAILLAMP CLII - RH

L e =

/‘1_;—

Labour

254

>3

5 TOKNOCK OUT DENTS, CUT/ WELD RHR FENDER,

REMOVE, REPLACE ACCIDENT PARTS

TO RESPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT PORTIONS

TO CHECK WIRING
TO TUFF-KOTE

REAR FENDER ROLLER i:L.’TER GARNISH-RH Ar®™

£

120

L/Price

1,554.300
540000
2521000
. 4000

[RILERTEL

SOLAHIHE
S0.000H)
S0,0000

EST1503464

26 Mar 2018
DMCPHQ17-006360
GBGT7342G

NISSAN NV200 1.5 MT
ABS AIRBAG 2WD 6DR
Es W/RC

VSKYBAM20Z0146827
K9KC400D057480
12/10/2017

Quantity Price Amount
55 58
1 PC 1,55430 X,
1 PCS 4,00 -
| PCS 252,10
I PCS 640 =
1 86680
Less 10% | 26,68 1.680.12
$o-
1 JOB J,Lu.bftriﬁ' #
1 JOB sup-bn— G
| JOB S0 B
| JOB S0 40
600,00 160000
Tonal S%3,280.12
Add GET i@ ™% 229.61
Total Amount Payvahle S8 3,509.73

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR THREE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED AND NINE AND CENTS SEVENTY THREE ONLY

4.1 Hgi-':af; fqdﬂc.q .

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify

eay painting
fisling TESUTWEY

s
» Third pary suba 5 aon @ “Withou? Frejud ca” basis
vy ryeyed and

roval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer

Signatune:

Lales

04 by

s Jy FJ‘{-I}E. ?/?

For PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTE

LTD

|
AUTHORISED SIGNATURE



THIRD PARTY DISCHARGE VOUCHER

o N o AL
| IWe DL\ KOop WOprics agreed o accept the sum of
(8G0 [655.3%) in full and

Final Settlement of all claims that | { We or may hefeafter heve against the driver | owner of motor
e R ~i| - e T Iu' T B h.,
Vehicle no__ \"'r Bl ‘;'!-:" 2 andior Lot Jr"f(- MEuanee tfﬁ /-{ -

| o= =
SR 1 Y . : .
For damaged / Loss 1o metor vehicle no (l‘ll(; f .«"'LG - __ arising from an aceident

. 53 z!;..f aong_Bohird_Muetalq (ovdre(rieide. e loding Bay .
— poe

| | We hereby authoriged you 1o make payment without admission of liakility on the part

of sir your insured direct 1o Mis PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTELTE

PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

(U v Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 # 01-45/46)
. b Singapcte 408716 |
Tel: 6741 5336 Fax 6?41%1ﬁw-
"

2 o & Email. progauto@progauto.cont’s
SIENATURE OF CLAIMANT SIGNATURE CF WITHN EST

NRIC Na 55857 HE

T




y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

-
Fe N T
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607188R GST Reg. Mo 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automohile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref - CC4/LPC18005852/Auadn2
$17-04107 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555 D°te™ 05072018 MHWM“‘"““IM
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YP 58422 Veh. Inspected GBG 7342G
Policy No. Z/18/NCO0I101210 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 18/18/18/VC00/020485 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  GERALD Assign Date 28/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN NV200 c.c 1461
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reqg. 2017
Chassis No. VSKYBAMZ0Z0146827 Colour SILVER
Odometer 3789 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |175/70 R14C GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Front Tyre |175/70 R14C GOODYEAR & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |175/70R14C GOODYEAR B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |175/70 R14C GOODYEAR 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/03/2018 [Inspection Date 27/04/12018
Survey held at PROGRESSIVE AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
BLK 3022A UBI ROAD 1 #01-45/46, SINGAPORE 048716
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjiN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




VL

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- — ; " ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBG 7342G
aty Description of Parts Condition WE:'I,L'::;;?%’]} Our. Ag]}“md
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR FENDER -RH (N) TO REPAIR SEE 1,554.30 .
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER ROLLER OUTER GARNISH -RH (N} NOT NECESSARY 5400 -
1| TAILLAMP ASSY -RH (N) CRACKED 252.10 252.10
1| TAILLAMP CLIP-RH (N) NECESSARY 6.40 8.40
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -186.68 -25.85
1,680.12 232.65
LABOUR
TO KNOCK ,OUT DENTS ,CUT/WELD RHR 1,000.00 450.00
FENDER LREMOVE .REPLACE ACCIDENT
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR FENDER -
RH
TO RESPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT PORTIONS. 500.00 400.00
TO CHECK WIRING . 50.00 30.00
TO TUFF-KOTE. 50.00 40.00
1,600.00 920.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,280.12 1,152.65
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS ] 1,152.65

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18005852/Aua3n2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




