Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) % ————————————————

From: Waong, Justin < Justin Wong@aig.com=

Sent: Tuesday, 3 April, 2018 2:43 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuta) Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: 813538339456G,0ur Ref: CCE,’LCRlSDGSSESIlealAccidem involving
Vehicle SLE 4031R & SHD 4965Z on 23/03/2018

Attachments: SLE4031R - AVF.MP4

Dear Vivian,
please find our insured's accident video faotage and proceed to reject third-party’s PD claim as per BOLA 15.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

lustin Wang

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pta. Ltd

P Shenton Way #08-18 Singapore 079120

ral+(65) 6418 1880 | Fax +(83) BA35 7416
Justin Wong@aig.com | www.a819.C0mM.5g

Follow us:

flin

Qur latest post shares AlG Singapore’s view of the future, Don't forget to like us on Facebook
wiww facebook com/AIGSG and be a part of AIG Singapore's social media journey,
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From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, April 03, 2018 1:49 PM

To: Wong, Justin

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Suhjact: Your ref: 81353833945G,0ur Ref: CC3/LCR18005825/R1wa3 Accident involving Vehicle SLE 4031R & SHD
49657 on 23/03/2018

Your rel: 813538339458G
Our Ref: CC3/LCRI13005825/R1wal

Dear Justin

Accident involving Vehicle SLE 4031R & SHD 49657 on 23/03/2018
W refer to the above matter,

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, is conflicting versions

Kindly advise if there is any video footage(stated in GIA report) submitted by OIOID to you good office.

Thank vou

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau/@lkkauto.com| fax:
67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

I'he information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient.
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened. it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group. Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 16 April, 2018 3:14 PM

To: ‘Cecilia Lee Peng Geok'

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAUto): Hsiao Tong (LKKAUtO)

Subject: Your Ref: T0318/ SHD 4965Z/ CL(st),Our Ref. CC3/LCR18005825/R1wa3, Accident
involving SHD 49657 & SLE 4031R OM 23/03/2018

Attachments: SLE 4031.mp4

WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: TO318/ SHD 49652/ CL(st)
Our Reft: CCA/LCRIBO05EZS/R Iwal

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident involving SHD 49657 & SLE 4031R ON 23/03/2018
We refer to the above matter

Our insured driver has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client. Your client
swerved into our Insured’s lane

We attached herewith our insured’s video for your perusal.
Under such circumstances, we have our principal’s instruction to deny liability of your client’s claim.

As such, we will close the matter at our end.
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Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
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OurRef T 0318/ SHD4965Z /CL(st) ENGINEERING
Your Ref:
Date : 11-Apr-18

CDGE Taxi Claims Dept
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD 59 Loyang Drive 4th Floor
CHARTIS Buliding Singapore 508969
78 Shenton Way
#07-16
Singapore 079120
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHD4965Z YOUR INSURED SLE4031R
AND OTHER ON 23.03.18

\We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor
Vehicle No: SHD4965Z which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle.
The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to assist them
in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters arising from

the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving SLE4031R
we are submitting these claim for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER’S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 155150
2 5 days Loss of Rental @ _§ 115.00 per day $ 575.00
1 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by M/s LKK) $ -
4 GIA/LTA Search Fees 5 7.49
5 GIA / Police Report Fees 3 -
6 Towing / Medical / Transporation $ -

\

Sub Total : $ 2,133.99

1

HIRER'S CLAIM
7 5 days Loss of Income @ _$ 80.00 perdays $ 400.00

Total Claims: § 253399

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

l

1

a)  Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs : pcs.
b)  LTA search slip/s of : SLE4031R
c) GlA / Police report/s of : SHD49652
d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
( X ) Photograph/s of Accident Scene ( ) Certificate of Insurance
{ ) Witness statement/s { % ) Downtime/Mileage record

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully

Cecilia Lee

Executive

CDGE Claims Department

Tel - 6214 8354 Fax: 6214 1843 Email : cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

ee o & O
COMFORIDELGRO Z




CDG.VARS.V LettofAuthorisation Page 1 of 1

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
(MAF [ PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING 140 SHD4965L , SLE4031R oM 23-Mar-18 22:50
ALONG BENMCOOLEN ST B4 MIDDLE RD JUNCTION
1/ We LIM TENG MENG (Hirer) NRIC No.:  S0026862C
andfor TAN AI CHYE (Reliaf) NRIC MO.. 514520352
Taxi Mumber SHD4965Z

hereby authorise CamfortDelGra Engineering Pre Ltd(CDGE}:

1, To submit myfour claims for damages, Costs and expense, including lass of income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs.

2 ‘fr} have absolute discretion to agree to any sertlement or compensation amount in respect of my/our claim
against third party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on myour behalf.

4, To accept any payment {claim proceeds] in respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque
shall be farward directly to CDGE in accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of
*comfortDelGro Engineering Pte Led".

Date 24-Mar-2018
MName of Hirer LIM TENG MENG
Hirer NRIC S0026862C Signature &
F; —

Address 6§96 LORONG 3 GEYLANG

389049
Contact MNo. 95604098
Mame of Relief TAN AI CHYE
Relief NRIC 514520352 Signature :

VY
]

Address 15 UPPER BOON KENG ROAD 04-1067

380015
Contact MNao. 97200017

httne Hledoek 2sry:d Z‘-.;'[{untime.fRunlime.-"Rumim::;'Runthm:r'\.-' iew/CDGY ARS.V Lettof... 24/03/2018



COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

L member of

COMFORTDELGRO

GST REG, NO, M2-8921817-3

2010004

AT(3 BSTA PACIFIC TNSURANCE PTE LTD
$08-16 78 SHENTON WAY.CHARTIS
SINGAPORE 079120

CONTACT NO:

BUTT.D

(4793000 FFR04G94

Description : 3P 2

Iinpvoice for Lump S8um Hepair

[ssued by
Repair '

. CLS0 /AT fR7T
Payment Type/Term

[Credit 30 days

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
A member of COMRORIDE L CROD

Head Office:
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 579701

Kindly note that no receipt shall be issued unless requested.

CUSTOMER'S COPY

KATHERTNETAN (7.

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pie Ltd

Workshops

CHOMDANY

TAX INVOICE

VEHCLE KO
SHII4965Y,

MAKE
HYUNDA T

MK,
i—40)

DATE (OF HEG
04.09, 2014

("HASSTS (YK
KMHLRL (MEUNDR TSR

'.r-‘r:-a'l__..nm[:u Sum KHepalr Amt
Add GST @

Total

Imvoire ammmt

04,2018 16:3H: 40

ACCOUNT No.

INVOICE No.

7. 000

AMOUNT

RE{. N | 9950AN4EW

Fage: 1

TRV, NO/DAYE
91365652 31.03.20M8

JOK NO.

IMEY 09
1051 287

OIDOMETER KEADT NG

JOH TYFE

1, 450.00
101. 50

1,551.50

%

BANK/CHQ No.



Our Ref: CT18030749
comrort

| g

Date: 03 April 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT ON 23/03/2018 @ 22:50hrs

ALONG BENCOOLEN ST B4 MIDDLE RD JUNCTION
INVOLVING SLE4031R

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHD49652 (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to LIM TENG MENG IC NO
50026862C a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $115.00 per day
(inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with India International Insurance Pte
Ltd on a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice,

Flease liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for
settiement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required,

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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4IP018 jnsuranca Padicilars Frngine Ry Anants Nistail

Enquire Vehicle Insurer

Vehicle No. Incident Date/Time Insurance Company Name

SearchStatus Insurance Company Code

SLE4O31R 23 Mar 2018/ 22:50:00 Successful Ald

Previous OK

AIG ASLA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE.LTD.
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