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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-2807198-R

Affiliated to Federation Intemnationals Des Experts En Automobile

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CC4/AIG1BOO5STT8/R1pb3

78 SHENTON WAY #08-16

CHARTIS BUILDING
SINGAPORE 078120

Sa— || |

Code: AIG
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, EY 12828 Veh. Inspected SGF 9417TH
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 28/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No, HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steearing
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mim
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre e
L/H Rear Tyre rim
4. Description of Damages
5. l General Information
Accident Date  24/03/72018 |iInspection Date 28/03/2018
Survey held at XINYA AUTO SERVICES PTELTD
BLK 1002 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-75 SINGAPORE 159719
Sa. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




XINYA AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

Add: BLK 1002 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-75 Singapore 159710 Tel 6273 3810 Fax 8278 7522
E-mail | sinyaaulti@singnel com sg

Date : 27-Mar-18

Address : AZMAN BIN MOHD ARIFFIN Reference : TP 1153/03118
BLK 20 TEBAN GARDENS ROAD Vehicle No : SGF 8417H
#11-109 Make/Model : KIA CERATO
SINGAPORE 600020 Insurance Co. : DIRECT ASIA

RE : QUOTATION REPAIRS TO SGF 9417H FOR THIRD PARTY CLAIMS.

PARTS REQUIRED Qry AMT $
1) REAR BUMPER 1 $ 390.00 DE~~
2) REAR BUMPER RETAINER 2 $ 50.00 X vl
3 REAR ENFORCEMENT 1 $ 404007
LIST PRICE TOTAL $ 844.00
LESS DISCOUNT 20% $ 168.80
LIST PRICE TOTAL AFTER LESS $ §75.20
4) REVERSE SENSOR 1 3 150.00 7
NETT PRICE TOTAL $ 150.00
TOTAL PARTS COST s 825.20 |
MISC EQUS C
1) TO REMOVE & REPLACE REAR BUMPER, ENFORCEMENT § §08T0 350
AND TO PANEL BEAT BOOT COVER, (3 DAYS)
2) TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER AND BOOT 3 §0e-00
COVER AND OTHER AFFECTED AREA. (3 Panel)
3) TO CHECK & RECTIFY WIRING & FIT REVERSE SENSOR.  § 19800 6o
LABOUR TOTAL [z 1,300.00 ]
TOTAL ESTIMATED REPAIR COST Asul s 2125.20]
I Qoo ooy
henca notif;
the Repairer of the ng: J —|I
* To meurvey belorwiatier spray pauring g MP
* To Gupiay damaged panis) during resrvey
= Parss prices v subject 1o confirmation
e et 4
"hai w.! T m
* Supghen 2 ?’o
mmmnmh:mﬁm j,%lt’)!l‘g e r‘?
Ahincwisanay by Ragairgr ‘é ’ -
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Catherine Chong SLI(I( Auto)

From: Supramaniam, Darshene <Darshene.5upramaniam@aig.cam>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 March, 2018 4:51 PM

To: admin-a@Ikkauto.com; assignments@|kkauto.com

Ce: Tan, Lily (AIG); Fong, Andy-SY: Kaur, Baljit; Lim, Sheng Yang; Chan, Yoke Shi; Chin,
Lee-Ying; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Fan, Winnie-LW; Md Ishak, Mohd Imran

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE EY12928
& SGF9417H ON 24 MARCH 2018

Attachments: PRE-INSPECT SGF9417H.pdf

Hi,

Please refer to the enclosed request from XINYA AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD.

Claim no £ 19960099345G003

Case Owner  : Wan Nur Saliha Binte Syed Yusoff

r08 ¢ 310pm
mﬁ vth nit

280308 (@ S?N

If you have any queries/concerns, please let us know.
Pls. arrange for pre-inspect on 28.03.18 at 9.45am { clients waiting)

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Darshene Supramaniam

AlG

Express Claims Adjuster II, FNOL SG Claims Operations - Auto
Shared Services - Malaysia | Global Business Services

Level 12, Menara Worldwide, 198 Jalan Bukit Bintang. 55100 Kuala Lumpur, Malaysia
Tel +603 2719 6000 ext 100-2208 | Fax +603 2719 6150

IMPORTANT NOTICE:
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If Yyou are not the intended recipient,
You must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please

the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



Hsiao anlg (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 April 2018 5:35 PM

To: inyaauto@singnet.com.sg'

Cc Admin A

Subject: Your ref: 5GF 9417H *Cur Ref CC4/AIGT18005778/R1pb3 [ACTIDENT INVOLVING

EY 1292B(AIG) -> SGV 42058(NTUC) -> SGF 9417H(Direct Asia) ON 24/03/2018]

Your rel: SGF 9417H WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our Ret: CC4/AIG 18005778/R 1 pb3

Dear Sir/Madam.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG) -> SGV 42058(NTUC) -> SGF 9417H(Direct Asia) ON 24/03/2018
We refer 1o the above matler.

Chain coliision accidents: EY 1292B|AIG - 34 cor) -> S3GV 4205B(NTUC-279 car] -> SGF 94 17H(Direct Asia-1*
corl

As this is Chain collision accidents, kindly re-direct claim against NTUC income in accordance to MCF
guideline,

Thank you,

Hest Rogards,

Hsiso Tong. Chew | Cise Hondler

LKk Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phionee: Geg2-5197 | email: ghewhiée Ikkauto.oon | fax; 6731-4108
Bk 50, Pava Uln Industein] Park, Ubl Avenoe 1, #0205 | S[4086033)



Hsiao Tcma (LKKAuto)

From: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 April 2018 12:40 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: SGF 9417H *Qur Ref: CC4/AIG18005778/R1pb3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG) -> SGV 4205B(NTUC) -> SGF 9417H(Direct Asia) ON
24/03/2018]

PDear Ms. Chew

We understand the frame work however is anly a guideline, legally there is glaring evidence that both front vehicle
had stopped and the first vehicle’s report had absolved the 2™ vehicles liability

We appreciate If you could give us AIG instructions as client is not agreeable. In the meantime we had already
arrange for NTUC to inspect the first vehicle.

Thank you.

Regds
May

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, April 10, 2018 5:35 PM

To: xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg

Cc; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto,.com>

Subject: Your ref: SGF 9417H *Our Ref: CC4/AIG18005778/R1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG) -> SGV
4205B(NTUC) -> SGF 9417H|(Direct Asia) ON 24/03/2018)

Your ret. SGF $417H WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our Rel: CC4/AIG1BD05778/R 1 pb3

Dear SirtfMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG) -> 5GV 4205B(NTUC) -> SGF ?417H(Direct Asia) ON 24/03/2018
we refer to the above matter.

Chdin collision accidents: EY 1292B|AIG - 3 car) -> SGV 42058 [NTUC-274 car) -> SGF 941 7H|Direct Asio-17
car)

As this is Chain collision occidents. kindly re-direct ciaim against NTUC income in accordance fo MCF
guideline,

Thank you.



Hest Regarnds,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phane: fr42-1107 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | e 6og1-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrinl Park, Ul Avenue 1, mo2-25 | S(q08933)

2] =4 Virus-free. www ava com




Hsiao Tﬂl‘la (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAUto)

Sent: Saturday, 21 April 2018 12:38 PM

To: ‘Syed-Yusoff, Saliha’

Cc: CS A Team: Admin A

Subject: RE: AIG ref: 19960099345G- 003 & 005 *LKK REF: CC4/AIG1B0D0ST78/R1pbi
Hi Saliha,

Chain collision accidents: EY 1292B[AIG - 31) <> SGV 4205B[NTUC — 2rd)] -> SGF 941 7H|Direct Asia - 1V)

As per instruction, we have informed third party[SGF 9417H) to re-direct the claim to NTUC. However third
party disagreed on if. Kindly refer to the screenshot email below from third party repairer for your easy
reference.

Kindly let us have your instruction.

XA

RE: Vour ref: SGF 941TH O Ref: CCA/AIGIBOOSTTRR 1pbd [ACCIDENT INVOLVING Y 1I92RIAIG) -» SOV 43058(NTUC) -» SOF 941TH

@ rcx nere e sewnicad perires To nesp protect yous prive nicek presented svtomabe downloed of sume piciures m the mesbe

Derar WS Chew

We understand the frame work however 15 only a guideline, legally there is glaring evidence that both front vehicle had stopped and
We appreciate if you could give us AIG instructions as chent b not agresalile. In the meantime we had alieady arrange lof NTUC to i

Thank you

Regds

oy

Best Regards,

Hsian Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultanis Pre Lid

Phone: 6742-9197 | emall: ghewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Pava Ubl Industrial Pack, Ubi Avenue 1, #oe-25 | S(308a0:47%)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 2 April 2018 10:58 AM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@alg.com=

Cc: C5 A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: AIG ref: 19960099345G- 003 & 005



Hi Saliha,
Contents noted.

Chain collision accidents: EY 1292B(AIG) -> SGV 42058 (NTUC) -> SGF 9417H(Direct Asig|

Hi Shu Pei.
LKK Ref: CC4/AIG1B00S778/R 1pb3

Kindly assist 1o inform TP wksp 1o re-direct the claim to SGV 42058,

Mest Regards,

Hsing Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: ghewhti@ kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrml Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #n2-25 | SlanB8u33)

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha [mailto:Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com]
Sent: Monday, 2 April 2018 10:01 AM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: AIG ref: 19960099345G- 003 & 005
Hi Team,

\We have received 2 claim notifications against Ol policy.

As this is Chain collision accidents, please advise repairer to re-direct claim from SGF2417H against NTUC income in
accordance to MCF guideline.



Search results are for your entire organi:
However, you may require additional access

-Pending Adjuster Survey
Claim Date of Hk-"f ch..-;“
Type Loss
{ Superior)
=SGF941?H Syed-Yusoff,
TP Fif_'-ld [Enzgzu] 24/03/2018 19960099345SG {chosn;":anm_ xtm;
[Tan Hian p';f}
Kwee]
*SGV42058
Syed-Yusoff,
- “r SMOOTH DR Saliha Xinyi
Lo UCREEL  [EY1202B]  24/03/2018 (Chong, Annie- p
[Tan Hian P‘;'}
Kwes]

PLEASE NOTE THAT CONTENTS OF THIS EMAIL SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS ANY
ADMISSION OF LIABILITY ON THE PART OF OUR INSURED AND/OR INSURERS. WE HEREBY
MAINTAIN FULL RESERVATION OF RIGHTS AND ALL DEFENCES AVAILABLE TO US

Salina Syed Yusoff

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
78 Shanton Way #08-16 Singapore(079740)

Tel +(65) 8419 1917 | Fax +(65) 68357416

zaliha syed-yusofffaia com | www.aig com &g

yaterm wilo witich & o receneed and apened & & the s fulity of tre cecperl B et [l ) o o freeet Al P00 PSS ety 8 acoeptedd by
Alls
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IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must

3



not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc, or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



Hsiao Tunﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Syed-Yusoff, 5aliha <5aliha Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 April 2018 B:56 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Ce: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: RE: AlG ref: 19960099345G- D03 & 005 *LKK REF: CC4/AIG18005778/R1pb3
Hi Hsiao Tong,

please maintain, they pass to lawyer also, we will follow the same procedure.

PLEASE NOTE THAT CONTENTS OF THIS EMAIL SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS ANY
ADMISSION OF LIABILITY ON THE PART OF OUR INSURED AND/OR INSURERS. WE HEREBY
MAINTAIN FULL RESERVATION OF RIGHTS AND ALL DEFENCES AVAILABLE TO US

leave aleri; 27/04/18 - 02/05/18

Saliha Syed Yusoff

AlG

omplex Claims Exgminer

~lams | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Ltd

g Shenmion Way 808-16 Singapore((079120)

Tel =65 2419 1917 | Fax +(65) 68357416

saliha syed-yusoff@aio com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The Iinformation in this email [and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information, If you have received this emalil in error, please immediately notify me by
“Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any coples or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries ar affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising In-any way from its use

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mallto:chewht@lkkauto.com)]

Sent: Saturday, April 21, 2018 12:38 PM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

Cc: (S A Team; Admin A

Subject: RE: AIG ref: 19960099345G- 003 & 005 *LKK REF: CC4/AIG18005778/R1pb3



Hi Saliha,

Chain collision accidents: EY 1292B(AIG - 37] -> SGV 4205B(NTUC - 24]) -> SGF 9417H|Direct Asia - 1)

As per instruction. we have informed third party (SGF 9417H) to re-direct the claim 1o NTUC. However third
party disogreed on it. Kindly refer to the screenshot email below from third party repairer for your easy

reference.

Kindly let us have your instruchon.

i

XA ; 2o 3 .
RE: Youw vet SGF 94174 “Ow Bt CCATAIGIBO0STTR/Ripkd [ACCIDENT INVOLVING Y 1PSIB/AI0) - SOV 4205NTUC] - « SGF G417
il "y (LEFA

|
m Cleck beere te dewnlosd pictures. Te help pretect your pravsdy Cutinok precented sudemat dosniosd of wwme paclures i thn mesiage

Dzar pA4. Chew

We understand the frame work however i only a guideline,; legally there s glanng evidence that both front vehicle had stopped and
We apprecate i you couid e us ANG malruchiony a1 ohent is not agreeable. |0 1he meantimi we had sleeady serange for NTUC 1o w

Thank yous

g s
Sy

Rt Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 67a2-3197 | email: chewht@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Pack, Uhi Avenuoe 1, #02-25 | S(408094)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 2 April 2018 10:58 AM
To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>

Ce: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: AIG ref: 19960099345G- 003 & 005

Hi Sdliha,

Contents noted.

Chain collision accidents: EY 1292B(AIG) -> SGV 4205B|NTUC) -> SGF 941 7H{Direct Asia)
Hi Shu Pe.

LKK Rel; CC4/AIG1B005778/R 1pbd



Kindly asxist to inform TP wksp o re-direct the claim to SGYV 42058,

Hest Regards,
Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Haddber
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phioie: 6742-3107 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fas: 6741-4108
Bk 50 Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ui Avenue 1, #02-25 | S14086:544)
From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha [mailto:5allha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com

Sent: Monday, 2 April 2018 10:01 AM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto,

Subject: AIG ref: 19960099345G- 003 & D05
Hi Team,

We have received 2 claim notifications against Ol policy.

As this is Chain collision accidents, please advise repairer to re-direct claim from 5GF9417H against NTUC income in
accordance to MCF guideline.

Search results are for your entire organi;
However, you may require additional access

- Pending Adjuster Survey
l::l.nim Date of mﬂ
Loss
(Superior)
tsq;r-‘gquu Syed-Yusoff,
TP Saliha Xinyi
[EYIHI&] 24/03/2018 19960099345G
[Tan Hian (Chang:r Annie- P
Kwee] )
*SGV42058B
™ SR O e oy
[EY12928) 24/03/2018 :
[Tan Hian (Chnng:r iﬁnnir P
Kwee]

PLEASE NOTE THAT CONTENTS OF THIS EMAIL SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS ANY
ADMISSION OF LIABILITY ON THE PART OF OUR INSURED AND/OR INSURERS. WE HEREBY
MAINTAIN FULL RESERVATION OF RIGHTS AND ALL DEFENCES AVAILABLE TO US



Saliha Syed Yusoff

Al
impley Clainis Examiner
Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Lid
L Shenton Way #08-16 Singapare{078120]
+{65) 6419 1917 | Fax +[B5) BB357416

sallha syed-yusoff@aig com | www aig com sg
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IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The infarmation in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising In any way from its use.
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which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



_H_silu Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LEKKAuto]

Sent: Monday, 23 April 2018 10:56 AM

To: ‘Xinya Auto Services'

Subject: RE: Your ref: SGF 9417H *Our Ref: CC4/AIG18005778/R1pb3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG) -> SGV 4205B(NTUC) -> SGF 9417H(Direct Asia) ON
24/03/2018]

Without Frejudice

Hi May.

We refer 1o your below email.

We have our principadl instruction fo maintain our pasition on this motier.

Chain coliision accidents: EY 1292B{AIG - 3¢ car) -> SGV 4205B(NTUC-2" car) -> SGF 9417H|Direct Asia-1v
car)

Kindly re-direct your client{SGF 9417H)'s claim against NTUC income in accordance to MCF guideline.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter s purely on @ without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settiement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsian Tong, Chew | Case Hondler

LKEK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

Mhone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkautocom | fux: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Pava Ubi Indostrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(gn8g31)

From: Xinya Auto Services [mailto:xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 11 April 2018 12:40 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: 5GF 9417H *Our Ref: CCA/AIG1BD05778/R1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG) -= SGV
4205B(NTUC) -> 5GF 9417H(Direct Asia) ON 24/03/2018]

Dear Ms. Chew

We understand the frame work however is only a guldeline, legally there is glaring evidence that both frant vehicle
had stopped and the first vehicle's report had absolved the 2 vehicles liability.

We appreciate if you could give us AIG instructions as client Is not agreeable. In the meantime we had already
arrange for NTUC to inspect the first vehicle



Thank you

Aegds
My

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Tuesday, April 10, 2018 5:35 PM

To: xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Your ref: SGF 9417H *Our Ref: CC4/AIG18005778/R1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG]) -» SGV
4205B(NTUC) -> SGF 9417H(Direct Asia) ON 24/03/2018]

Your ref: SGF ¥417H WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our Ref: CC4/AIG1B005778/R 1 pb3

Dear Sir/Madarm.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG) -> SGV 4205B(NTUC) -> SGF 9417H(Direct Asia) ON 24/03/2018

We refer to the above motter

Chain collision accidents: EY 1292B(AIG - 34 car) -> SGV 4205B(NTUC-27 car) -> SGF 941 7H|(Direct Asia-1¢
car)

As this is Chain collision accidents, kindly re-direct claim ogainst NTUC income in accordance to MCF
guideline.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6742-41697 | email: chewht@@lkkaito.com | fax: 67.41-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industral Park, Ubi Avenue 1, so2-25 | ${408953)

Virus-free. www avg com
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Bgwoked [/ ho settiamant

ICLA!H SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case | Notifieg [Est Submazea | Ad] Assigneda A Rt [Ad) Submirmea | ins Auth'ed Staus
|29 Mar 2018 I2mar0IB - se900.00 '$4900.00 o Survst
eido et Ad) mpt | m:mll view Rt | | Cancel Case |

Maln

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster]
| Ingured Tan Hian Kwee, 1D 51525797)

AIMAMN BIN MOHD ARIFFIN, [D: 51123925])

24703/2018 17:00 - :59
[142 Months and 25 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]

TP / 199600993456 Note o | (comprehensive)

SGF9417H Date of Loss: |

Policy No. |
EY12928 (Cinimant); | MT/00296233

 Xinys Auto Services Pte Ltd (HQ) Bik 1002, #01-75, Bukit Merah Lane 3, 159719 Bukit Merah - Teli 6270 1481
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Express) - Tel. 65-8415-3000 _ [Mandled by Syed-Yusolf, Sallha] Salihe Syed-
YusoffiZaig com

Direct Asla Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel. 65322888

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel- 6256-3561 __ [Handied by MOHD RASUL| . |Final Rpt due 09/04/2018]

/ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Ml | Compose Case Mail ||
» AIG_SG (29/03/2015) Request To Upload TP GIA Report

View Al | Sesrch Tasks | Croste Mew Task | Compieta |
Subject  Handler  Assigned By Completed On  Created On  Done?

https://singapore.merimen.conv/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 13/22019
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ist Remarks - LKK Auto 1

Show Remarks To: O Handling Insurer
Piatm: Rarmarbs o grivete Eniess pou Show it T2 0ther perbes

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 13/2/2019



Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreq no 1essoriser)
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 4085633
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ikkaulo com;assignments@|kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur Flle No: CC4/AIG18005TTR/R1PB302
Dale: 13022018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer:  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid. Paolicy No:
Clalmant Vehicle sGraa17H Insured Vehicle No:  EY12928
Date of Loss: 24/03/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 199800083456
RIFTI IDENTIFICATION I
Reg No: SGFd1TH
Make & Model: KlA CERATO, 1.6 EX (LD} (A) Engine No: G4EDBHOE2380
Reg Date 27/04/2006 (Man. Year: 2005) Chassis No: KNAFE222365282258
Colour:; Red Odometer: 148310 km
Engine Capacity! 15089 cc
Marke! Value/New Car Price. N/A
Sum Insured (S55): Market Value/New Car Price
Hi T T
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable) Yes Foothrake (Serviceable) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/50 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/50 R18
Front Left Side: Hankook 5 mm Rear Left Side: Hankook 5 mm
Front Right Side: Hankook 5mm Rear Right Side: Hankook 5 mm
The above values represant fhe remainng Hire Meads depth
COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 825.20 312.00 513.20 62.19
Miscellansous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,300.00 B10.00 480,00 37.68
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 D.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 2,125.20 1,122.00 1,003.20 4T.20
Approved Total (Overridden) (S%) 900.00
Nett Amount (S5§) 2,125.20 900.00 1,225.20 57.65
Global Sum Settlemant (55) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 27/03r2018
Date Inspected: 28/032018 |nspectad Al Xinya Aulo Services Pte Lid (HQ)
Blk 1002, #01-75, Bukit Merah Lane 3
Singapore 158718
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: MOHD RASUL

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen _...

Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

13/272019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of' 4

NOTE: Thia report represents our findings af the time and piace of inspection sdafed herein. Such ingpection hes been carmied ouf o the bast of ow
krowledge and abiily but any other habily under any oifer circumstances is hemby srprassly orcluded.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 13/2/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4
REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
MNo. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repalrer's Amount
11 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 380.00FL *380.00FL
2 2 *REAR BUMPER RETAINER Serviceabls 50.00 FL “FL
3 1 *REAR ENFORCEMENT *Check 404 00 FL *-FL
4 1 *REVERSE SENSOR *Chack 150.00FS *-FS
F=Franchisas pan. S=SpcNet L=ListhemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 994.00 390.00
- List Itam Discount on L Items 20.00/20.00% (S%) 168.80 T8.00
Total Parts (55) 825.20 312.00
Report was unsubmitied during this print-out |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 13/2/2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thete are no new miscellaneous Hems selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE & REPLACE REAR BUMPER .ENFORCEMENT Mew 600.00 350.00
AND TO PANEL BEAT BOOT COVER
2 TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER AND BOOT Mew 600.00 400.00
COVER AND OTHER AFFECTED AREA
3 TO CHECK & RECTIFY WIRING & FIT REVERSE SENSOR New 100.00 60.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 1,300.00 810.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 13/2/2019



