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¥ LS ALY LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
BB B B 51 Ul Ave 1 #01-25 Paya LUiti Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-89607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PL Refl CC4M1180057T0MmbD3
205.02 108 BULDING SINGAPORE 045711 - M ‘"IIII“NMI'I
Code = |2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 4272P Veh. Inspected SLK T408J
Paolicy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 280372018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer . Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre all
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 08/03/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTELTD
BLK 5033
ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2
#01-259
SINGAPORE 569536
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
B]IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




_ ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTE LTD
' w ) ESTEEM
# PERFOBMANCE o' ot v i vees e ww oswomport comsg

Repair Estimates SLK 7409 J /Z/ 7 /’fﬂém;&__,
Parts (&) Cost / List Price Items 5 2,164.30 4‘; f‘fﬁrf
Plus/less  25% $ 541.08 "'1*1'7 Jeﬁ"w
Total of Cost/ List $ 1,623.23
{b) Nett Price Items
Less
Total of Natt Item
{c) Special Nett Items $ 200.00
Total Parts Cost $ 1,823.23
Labour 5 1,370.00
Total E . 3,193.23
The above total will be subjected to 7% G.S.T
Name of Surveyor : /Jf 27074
Company ] { /57 C
Survey conducted on ?/?’&/ at
Remarks By Surveyor
(a) The repair of this vehicle is guffijrized /is not authorized until further notice
(b) Recommended Days of Repair £= t day(s)
{ci Resurvey Required / Not Required
{d) Excess ]

(e) Signature of surveyor a& Date p /f"/.//
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ESTEEM

ESTEEM PERFORMANCE

PTE L

TD

PERFORMANG.

Tal: +85-6484 1221

Bik 5033 Ang Mo Kio, Ind Park 2 #01-251/ 250, 589536
Fax: +65-6484 TE2H Wobaita: wwiw.estoemport com.ag

Spare Parts
Vehicle No. SLK 7409 J Submit By Carmen Lim
Make & Mode| : TOYOTA PRIUS Year Manufacture 2016
Chassis No JTDKB3IFUDD3540154 Engine No.
Cost/ List
SiNo. Part Description Qty Unit Price Disposition by
Price Survayor

1 |Reverse sensor Juf 2 [s20000 s 7

2 |Rear bumper /T 1 |s4e7.50 X

3 |Rear bumper lower garnish RH J4 1 |s1ee70 X

4 |Rear bumper lower garnish centre 8.l 1 |sse260 e

s |Rear bumper clip ~af 10 |[sa000 x

s |Rear bumper side retainer LH fuo| 1 |s1270 X

7 |Rear bumper side retainer RH Suo| 1 |smz70 X

& |Rear bumper reinforcement 7| 1 |sassse0 X

¢ |Rear bumper under cover RH N | 1 [sese20 X

10 |Rear bumper under cover clip nd 4 51400 X

1

12

13

14

15

16 3 |

17 il

18

19 8 pedanint: .

20 '*.WHMI&L.II" :]"u-.-:--,- i :

21 s o i

22 au.

23 . T ey Oy 30|

Nate: If any of the quoted paris are recommended to be repaired, then an addifional fabou

will be charged accordingly under supplementary

ir charge

L
Blk 3033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259 Singapore 569536 Tel: 64841221 Fax: 64847829

Company Reg

No. 2000054858 / GST No. 20-0005485-N



"STEEM PERFORMANCE PTE LTD
= Es”m ESTE RFOR CE

PERFORMANGE = ey s 27 ene mon ssvemoeteomsg

Labour
Vehicle No. - SLK 7409 J Submit By : Carmen Lim
Make & Model : TOYOTA PRIUS Year of Manufacture : 2016
S/No Labour Description Esimated Adjusted
Price Price
1 |TO RENEW DAMAGED PARTS & KNOCK OUT ACCIDENT
REPAIR AREA. (REAR BUMPER,END PANEL) $500.00 Z el
2 |TOPUTTY, RESPRAY PAINT FOR AFFECTED ACCIDENT
REPAIR AREA. (REAR BUMPER, END PANEL) $500.00 .? a‘?d(
3 |To tuff coat U | $50.00 X
4 |To check wiring £50.00 S/
5 |To remove & refit reverse sensor to assit work load ArAs|  5120.00 - X
i
6 |Toremove & refit spare tyre, spare tyre board, carpet trim
to assist work load Asre | $150.00 X

Nate: The above estimate of repair /s based on visual assessment of the external affected areas. Any
additional damages observed during the course of repair will be quate accordingly as a supplementary,

L
Company Reg No. 200005485N / GST No. 20-0005485-N



Catherine Chang (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 March, 2018 4:59 PM

To: Carmen Lim; ‘sur@lkkauto.com'’; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc Sherini Pillai

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRI SURVEY - Your Ref : SHD4272P / Our Ref : SLK7409)
Attachments: 20180327135014157.pdf

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SLK7409J and et us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Shennl,

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen.

Thank You.

SIRpM
Best Regards, ﬂlﬂ,’lhlg @ k ?
Gabriel W N
M:‘.nr CtEaims ::pr, (MWJ“ \’_T\ v

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street | #05 108 Building | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Carmen Lim [mailto:carmen@esteemperf.com.sg]

Sent: 27 March, 2018 3:41 PM

To: Motor Claim - Ill <maotorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Subject: Re: REQUEST FOR PRI SURVEY - Your Ref : SHD4272P / Our Ref : SLK7409)
Dear Gabriel,

We are prefer LKK to survey the car.

Kindly arrange for us asap.

Thank you.

On Tue, Mar 27, 2018 at 2:03 PM, Motor Claim - 111 <motorclaim@iii.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir / Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your emall.

We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:



.+ LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
* Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Maotor Claims Dept

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
B4 Cecil Street | #05 108 Bullding | Singapare 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Carmen Lim [mailto:car steemperf.com.s
Sent: 27 March, 2018 1:53 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Subject: REQUEST FOR PRI SURVEY - Your Ref : SHD4272p / Our Ref : SLK7409)

Dear Sir / Madam,

NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS
PURSUANT TO PRE-ACTION PROTOCOAL FOR NON INJURY MOTOR ACCICDENT CASES
(NIMA)

We act for Grab Rentals Pte Ltd who has appointed the under-mentioned workshop to repair his motor
vehicle no.SLK 7409 J.

Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at :

Name of workshop : Esteem Performance Pte Ltd



Address : BIk 5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2, #01-259, Singapore 569536

Tel : 6484 1221

Fax : 6484 7829

We hereby give 2 clear days notice to conduct a pre-repair inspection of the said vehicle at the above-
mentioned workshop during office hours.

If you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working days excluding any intervening
Saturday, Sunday or Public Holiday. The above-mentioned workshop will commence repairs should you fail
to conduct the pre-repair inspection.

Freundliche GriBe / Best Regards

Carmen Lim
Accident Claim Executive | Qperation Division
Esteem Performance Pte Ltd

M: 8799 D066
P: B4B4 1221

E: carmen@esteemperf.com.sg
3033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-250
(Head Office)

in Mi ive Vicom Inspection Centre
(Showroom)

estes rformance com




- Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,

* disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
[nternet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Freundliche GrlBe / Best Regards

Carmen Lim
Accident Claim Executive | Operation Division
Esteemn Performance Pte Ltd

M: 8792 0066
P: 6484 1221

E: carmen@esteemperf.com.sg
5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259

{Head Office)

385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection Centre
(Showroom)

www es rform .com

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

4



DISCLAIMER:
* This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.
- It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.
If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination
of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.
Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission
or any modification.
Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
[ndia International Insurance Pte Lid.
Registration No, 198703792-K
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View Received Message

This mail is assocated with

"SLKT409]
|sHD4272P)
™

GRAD RENTALS PTE LTD
Mpr B 2018 2:00FM
| COMPORT TRANSPOHRTATION FTE LTD)
Estesm Performance Pie Lod

Roply | Reply All | Mark a5 Unread [ Frlnl.ﬂ.vr'_'lﬂpl I Hnlm bﬁmw 1 Forward |

Fram India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (II1_SG), sent on D204 /2018 13:36 PM.
To LEK_HGQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - SLK7409) - Claim Handler: Sherinl Pillal
Approved: 3,00,
= o — |
DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

Therp pré no decuments.

fitps fsingapors menmen,.com/clmmafindex.cfm Husebox=SVCmaidlussachon=sp_wewlmote=18inboxid=12581758IDomainid=118i0bjlId=380 28 Riscipi



Vivian Lau {LI(KAutn!

From: Sherini Pillal <sherini@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 May, 2018 8:46 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LEKAuUto)

Subject: FW: SHD4272P (DOA - 08/03/2018, R/N -MCT18030248) - Driver dispute Damages
Importance: High

Dear Vivian,

Please refer to the email from Comfort below.

According to our driver, the damages is confined to the centre and not the right side (dent - old damages).
Please inform your surveyor accordingly.

(Old damages)



Thank you

Regards,
Shevini Pillai
Motor Claims Department
India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street, #04/#05 IDB Bullding, Singapore 0453711
DID: 6347 6128 Fax: 5224 4174
@ Inpia

P = InNTERNATIONAL

InsurancE

(I
g i g w4

From: Wesley Tan Yuan Chuan [mailto:wesley_tan@cdgtaxi.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, May 28, 2018 11:11 AM

To: Sherini Pillai <sherini@ili.com.sg>

Subject: SHD4272P (DOA - 0B/03/2018, R/N -CT18030248) - Driver dispute Damages

Dear Sherini

Our driver Mr Ramlee came in to our office today to feedback that there was prior damage to third party's vehicle

He has submitted scene photos showing the point of contact with the third party's vehicle and there was no way he
could have cause the damages on the right side of 3P's vehicle bumper,

Please assist to review this and interview driver before any settlement should there be any third party claims

Thank youl

Warmest Regards,



Wesley Tan

Fleet Safety Department

Comfort Transportation Pte Lid / CityCab Pte Ltd
Holline: +65 6550 B768

DID: +55 6550 B723

"The best gift to your loved ones is yourself Make it home safely”

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you
are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and
please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed.
Statements pertaining to any matter owside our business are not to be 1aken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro
Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes
only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties.
Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreemen
signed by the duly authorised representatives of bath parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed 1o preserving the environment.
We encournge vou to print this only if necessary.

CityCab Pte Ltd |Registration No. 199502839G |
Comlort Transportation Pte Lid [Registration No. 199303821R|

Kindly note that by submitting this claim 1o us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
vou by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settlemant

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case Mobfled | EoSubmitted | AdjAssigned | AdjRpt | AdjSubmitted | InsAuth'sd | Stetus [
|29 Mar 2018 | 27 Mar 2018 5385195 J' MHL'I!I Panding for Survey |
M it Beg 00:00 Port Batrnates || Wiew Bt Report
_—_I Edit Ad) Rt | Cancel Case | |

Clairm Details

'CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
Ingured: mrmmlmu PTELTD, Co. Reg Mo.: -

Main Claimant: 'GRAB RENTALS PTELTD,  Co Aeg No: 2016172006

OB/D3/2018 14:00 - :59

Vehicle Reg. No.: SLK7409) Date of Loss: [13 Months and 11 Days From LTA
: Reg Data (Man ¥r))

| Claim Type:! TP/ fﬂ'_'T:I.Eﬂ]ﬂ-g_d__ﬂ | Palicy/Cover Note Na.: MOCOMO01LS

|Wehicie Reg No {Insured) SHDA272P | Palicy No. (Claimant): AZODEATEEMNF
| Excess:

Repuirer [
| Handiing Insurer: ‘Il'llil lmnlﬂnlll Im Pie Lid (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 .. [H.-ndhd by Si ih-Ini Piltal]
| Claimant's Insurer: IIBIE Insurance [Singapora) Pro. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +65 6827 7868

Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-1581 ... [Handied by ENHHTI liﬂltﬂ'j [Hnl! Rpt
Adpuater: dre nsm;:nm .

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al | Compose Case Mol |

‘& 115G (11/04/2019): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$999.99) - SLK7409] - Clalm Handler: Sherinl Piil...
» [11_SG (06/10/2018): Alert - Ad] Mandate Maintained - SLK7409] - Claim Handler: Shaerini Pillal
11 _SG (03/04/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$50.00) - SLK7409) - Claim Handier: Sherini Pillai

=
ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS Wiewal | SearchTasis |  CreatebewTast | Compiete |

Pue Date  Priority  Type  Task Group Subiject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
ho resilts

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 15/5/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

Claim Documents

*SLK7409) (MCT1B030248)
[SHD4272P]
™
GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
Mar 8 2018 2:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Esteem Performance Pte Ltd

Uphoad Docurnents | Upload Mhotos | Compose Mew Letter | View LUse Viewss .
|Photea/Images e —— Sperpme - | W
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1 JWOLIE16:10  EMALL FROM IT1 DD 27032018
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3 10/0A/18 1734 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED
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|5 09/05/15 14:17 LMK RE-INSPECTION
|6 15/05/1913:36  WORKSHOP INVOICE o
|7 15/05/18 1336 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM
B 15/05/1913:35 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER
| 8 15/051913:36 | RENTAL RECEIPT
| 10 | 15/05/19 13:36 LTA SEARCH
11 115/05/1% 13:36 LoD
| Mo | Finalired On India Intarnational Insurance Pre Ltd (HQ)
| 1 ‘HJ'I:I_JJ'IH D8:54 Singapore Accident Statement
| 2 | J0/05/18 08:40 18.5.18 - Email from CTPL on inconsistency of damages
|3 07/0/18 1406 | Letter of Demand from Third Party ESTEEM PERFORMANCE

|
| |
| | | | _.
eo0 cooocooccooe i coccooceR
| EEEEEE
322332

Documents Checklist

. e __. —
| Thare are no document checiliess configuren,

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: [T Handling Insurer
hipks, Earmmivs grn prisets yreid pou Sow B D ether DRt

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 15/5/2019



Adjuster Report

Page |1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ice regne 10aso71sem)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-35681 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkaute com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/IIINBOOSTTO/KWE3NZ

Date: 15/05/2019
BEFERENCE
Handling i .
oyl India International Insurance Pte Litd  Policy No: MCOMDO15
Claimant g
Vehicle No : SLKT7408J Insured Vehicle No : SHD4272F
Date of Loss:  08/03/2018 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18030248
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLKT4084
Make & Model: TOYOTA PRIUS, 1.8 HYBRID CVT (A) Engine No: 2ZRRAETTE51
Reg. Date: 25/01/2017 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No: JTOKB3IFUDD3540154
Colour: Metaliic Siver Odometer; 118237 km
Engine Capacity: 1788 cc
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (55): Market Value/New Car Price
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yas
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/65 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195/65 R15
Front Left Side: Yokohama 8 mm Rear Left Side: Yokohama 9 mm
Front Right Side: Yokohama 8 mm Rear Right Side: Yokohama 9 mm
The above values regresent e remarming re reeds depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Paris 182322 436 .95 1,388.27 76.03
Miscallaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,370.00 415.00 955,00 69.71
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Tolal (S§5) 3,193.22 851.95 2.341.27 73.32
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S5%) 22353 59.64 163,88 73.32
Nett Amount (S§) 3.416.75 811.59 2,505.16 73.32
+ Car Rental (1.0 x S$80.95/day) (5§) B0.85
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 745
Nett Liability (S$) 999,89
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 271032018
Date Inspected! 09/04/2018 Inspacted Al: Esteam Performance Pte Lid (HQ)

Estimated Period of Repair: 1.0 days

Blk 5033 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2, #01-
258
Singapore 569536

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: VIVIAN LAU PEI FENG
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MNOTE: This report represents our findings af the Nme and place of inspection stated henein, Such inspechion has been carmed ouf fo ihe beal of our
inowiecze and abiity but any ofher labiity under any other circumaiances is hereby expressly excluded,
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REPAIR DETAILS B

'Reference

|Part Source: MRM-SG Version; 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 15 May 2019)

Parts: 144 TOYOTA PRIUS 1.8 HYBRID CVT (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0) |

|Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard Lis{)
{Print Code: (Unsubmilted, no prini-code for SLK7400.)

Validity: These estimales are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

|Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts

Mo. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 2 *REVERSE SENSOR Serviceable 200.00FS *-FS
2 1 *REAR BUMPER Repair 497 50FL *~FL
3 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH RH Serviceable 148.TOFL *FL
4 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH CENTRE Buckled / Dented 582 60FL *58260FL
5 1 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH Serviceable 112.70FL “-FL
B 10 “‘REAR BUMPER CLIP Not Necessary 40.00 FL *FL
7 1 ‘REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH Serviceable 112.70FL ~FL
8 1 *REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Repair 308 .60 FL *FL
g 1 *REAR BUMPER UNDER COVER RH Serviceable 256 20 FL *FL
10 4 *REAR BUMPER UNDER COVER CLIP Nol Necessary 14.00FL *-FL

FaFranchise pan. S=SpcNetl, LeLaitamDisc

Sub Total (S§) 2,264.30 582.60
- List ltem Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S5) 541.08 145.685

Total Parts (S$) 1,823.22 436.95

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 15/5/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO RENEW DAMAGED PARTS & KNOCK OUT ACCIDENT  New 500.00 200.00
REPAIR AREA (REAR BUMPER,END PANEL)
2 TO PUTTY,RESPRAY PAINT FOR AFFECTED ACCIDENT MNew 500.00 200.00
REPAIR AREA (REAR BUMPER ,END PANEL)
3 TO TUFF COAT MNew 50.00 0.00
4 TO CHECK WIRING New 50.00 15.00
5 TO REMOVE & REFIT REVERSE SENSOR TO ASSIST MNew 120.00 0.00
WORK LOAD
B TO REMOVE & REFIT SPARE TYRE SPARE TYRE MNew 150.00 0.00
BOARD ,CARPET TRIM TO ASSIST WORK LOAD
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 1,370.00 415.00
Repor was unsubmitted during this print-out -]

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 15/5/2019



