Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 31 August 2018 4:56 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc Elaine Cheong; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Angie Foo: Jess Kong;
Janice Yeoh

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC4308G (Ol: SNM18D01609C02/8) and
SHCBOTT (TP : LKK REF -CC3/CTI1B005725/K1ub3) on 26.03.2018

Attachments: LETTER TQ Ol.pdf; SHCA97T doa 26 3 18.mov; IMG_9091,)pg

LKK REF -CC3/CT118005725/K1ub3
CTI REF — SNM18001609C02/8 (PCA308G)

Dear Thin Thin

We refer to your emalls pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 55,906.00.
We await your payment advice to enable Elaine to act accordingly.
Aside to Angie, please follow up on Section |l Excess recovery.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: +65 6389 6183
FAX: +85 6224 T4T8/6224 T175
Email: claimsdepti@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh .cntaiping.co
www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVIHSARY
lu Sivpapace vinee [958

Disclaimer

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid Any unauthorized disclosure
use or dissemination, elther in whole or partial, Is prohibited. If vou are not the intended reciplent of the message, please notify the
sender mmediately



From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, August 31, 2018 4:15 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene tay@sg.cntaiping.coms; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
<shupei@lkkauto.com>; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC4308G (O): SNM18D01609C02/8A) and SHCBI7T (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118005725/K1ub3 ) on 26.03.2018

LRGENT
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the below matter.

Kindly lat us have your approval / instruction as TP is keep on chasing us for settlement.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4089373)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 20 August 2018 5:49 PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claim sg cntaiping.com>
Cc: 'Irene Tay' <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pel (LKKAuto)

<shupei@|kkauto.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PCA308G (01 : CTI- SNM18D01609/C02/8A) and SHCBITT (TP : LEK
REF -CC3/CTI18005725/K1ub3 ) on 26.03.2018

Importance: High

Your Ref: SNM18D01609,/C02/8 "Without Prejudice”
COur Ref: CC3/CTI1B005725/K1ub3

Dear Sir / Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 4308G AND SHC 897T ON 26/03/2018
We refer to the above accident.

The accident occurred while OID failed to exercise lane discipline, encroached into the path of TP and initiated the
accident. Attached video footage/color scene photo for your perusal.

We did clarify with Ol the nature of accident. We had informed Ol about TP claim.

We have surveyed the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.



'Summar\f of offer made to workshop Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd is as follows:

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repairs S BA479.24 S 4,815.00
2. Loss of Rental { $167.80 x 5 days) S 1,006.80 S 839.00
3. Loss of Income (S 50 x 5 days) S  480.00 S  250.00
4. LTA Search Fee S 2.00 S 2.00
$ 9,968.04 $ 5,906.00

Enclosed herawith the relevant supporting documents for your kind perusal.

For your approval please.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@®lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)



COMFORIDELGRO

ENGINEERING

Our Ref CC18030828 | SHC BI7T /IWT(st)
Your Ref : , :
Date ; 04-May-18 COGE Taxi Claims Dept

59 Loyang Drive 4th Fir
CHINA INSURANCE COLTD Singapore 508969
3 ANSON ROAD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079909 i .",'
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE .
Dear Sir Loyaing
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAX| SHC B97T YOUR INSUREDPC 4308G o i
AND OTHER ON 26.03.18 : Sin Ming

We are the authorised repair workshop for Citycab Pte Ltd, the owner of motor Vehicle No
SHC 897T which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle.

The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to assist

them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters arising

from the damage to the vehicle

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving : PC 4308G g s
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM
1 Cost of Repair $ 481500
2 f days Loss of Rental @ § 16780 perday $ 1,006.80 Defu
3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by M/s LKK) 5 -
4 LTA Search Fees $ 2.00 Yishan
5 GIA/ Police Report Fees s - ;
6 Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees $ -
SubTotal: $ 582380
HIRER'S CLAIM
7 fi days Lossofincome@ § B0.00 perdays $ 4B0.00

Total Claims : § 6,303.80

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a) Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs - 9 pcs
b) LTA search slip/s of - PC 4308G
c) GIA/ Police report/s of : SHC Ba71
d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ X ) Pholocopies of Accident Scene Photos { ) Certificate of Insurance
{ ) Witness statement/s [ x ) Downlime/Mileage record { x ) Rental Rate |atter

Kindly lock into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver

Yours faithfully
ttAalltam ‘Jan

Deputy Manager
CDGE Claims Deparimeni
Tel: 6214 B737 Fax: 6214 1843 Email . williamtan@cdge.com sg

This Is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

COMFORIDELGRO (rumas =3



T WL e

Bl BA B Fra Lig

1 UNTAVE 1, #0125 PAYA UBE INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564313

Our Ref: CC3/CTI18005725/K 1ub3
20 AUGUST 2018

BT&TAN TRANSPORT PTE LTD
7030 ANG MO KIO AVE 5

#03-19 NORTHSTAR@AMK
SINGAPORE 569880

Dear Sir'Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 4308G & SHC 897T ON 26/03/2018

We refer 1o the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us, We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

s

THIN THIN HLAING
Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360

Fax: 6741 4108

Email: thinthin@ lkkauto.com

ec.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
{Mator Claims Dept)



CDG.VARS.V . LettofAuthorisation Page | of |

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
(HAF | PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING MERCEDES E220 SHCBS7T , PC4308G ON Z6-Mar-18 09100
ALONG MARINA BOULEVARD TWDS BAYFRONT AVE.
1/ We CHIA SIANG LYE [ Hirer ) NRIC Ma.: 577155042
andy/or | Ratief] NRIC No.:
Taxi Mumiber SHCB97T

hereby autharise ComfortDelGro Engmesring Ptz Ltd{CDGE):

1. To submit my/our clmms for damages, costs and expense, including 1oss of income, loss of rental.
medical fiee and legal costs.

2. To have ahzolute discretion to sgree 1o any settlement or compensation amount i respect of my/our claim
against third party (except personal imjuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher o my/our behalf,
4. To accapt any payment (claim proceads) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque

thall be forward directly ta CDGE in accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of
“"ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date 26-Mar-2018

Hame of Hirer CHIA SIANG LYE

Hirer NRIC S77155042 Signature ;

Ardress 529 HOUGANG AVENUE 8 #02-92
530629

Contact No. 83331239

http://edgek2srv:82/Runtime/ Runtime/Runtime/ Runtime/ View/CDG.VARS.V LeuofAut...  26/03/2018



MOTOR CLAIMS. DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Folicy We : COMBISNIUSED4L70D Ciaim Mo : SNMIEDOLE0I/CR2/8

Claimant CITYCAR PTE LTD

Amount i B8 5,900.04
Singapore Dollars Five Thousand and Nine Hundred Only

[/We dgree to accept the sbove menticned amount te be paid o mefus in full &
final settlemsst of all clsims, costs b disbursements for injuries / domages
sustained by mefus through an accident inwvolwving

Claimant Vehicle Mo. & SHC 8977
Insured Vehicle No, @ PC 43086
Pate of Loss t 26/03/2018

Plaze of Accident @ MARINA SCULEVARD TOWARDS BAYFRONT AVE

IN CONSIDERATION of cthe payment mage to meizs of the aforementioned sum BY
CEINA TAIPING INSURANCE ([SINGABORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absoluotely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) ¥#TE. LTD. and/or

Insured Name t BT&TAN TRANSPORT FTE LTD
Priver Hame : HU JUN

from all claims, pre=zent or futore in respect of all loss, Injury or damage
sustaipad by mefus arising cut of the sald sccident.

1 acknewledge thar this paymsnt -3 made withcut sgmission of liabilizy on che
part of CHINA TAIFPIKG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

Globasl Sum F 8% 5,900.90
Total : 5% 5,900,490
Clalmant Nams : CITYCRE PTE LD HEIC Ho :

A
Signatuce : /‘ ﬁ# Jare : ‘”V ' f : i

A{A 11 '_';;M.#. 'q.rrfﬁ I

UM DELGAD ENOmEZ NG FTE LY
13 [ (rANT DRIVE
FNGARDRE Laved

‘Tne conems of i docoment ancly 1o vehide dameges only :

5 &b '-'4.:.‘::?‘-4: !H'r“ A YAnn CReue maule gie O
Al persondl Injunes &) damages anseg Meseliom are erciude COMPORTDELGRO Eﬂémaﬁmwﬁpﬂﬁ im
wom e amdit and apphcadion of e docoment



COMFOR]DELGR@ ComfortDelGro Engineering Ple Ltd
ENGINEERING

COMFORIDELGRD

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE

ComfortDelGzro Engineering Pre Lud
2 i oo COMPORIDNLC R ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHO No
Head (Miice :

205 Braddell Road
Singapore 379701

Kindty note that no receipt shall be issued unless requeshed
CUSTOMER'S COPY



r Ref: CC18030828
e N\ GryCab

Date: 27 April 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT ON 26/03/2018 @ 0900 hrs

ALONG MARINA BOULEVARD TWDS BAYFRONT AVE.
INVOLVING PC4308G

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that CityCab Pte Ltd is
the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration number SHCO0B97T (the
"Taxl"). The Taxi was hired to CHIA SIANG LYE IC NO S7715504Z a registered hirer-
operator of CityCab Pte Ltd at the time of occurrence of the aforementioned accident
at a rental rate $167.80 per day (inclusive of GST),

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 G555 1188 Facsimile +65 8453 3183
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2672018 ; Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

B Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANC Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASS0CIATION Operating Hours: Monday ta Friday 9am to Spm
1% I fi . 7
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE C°' Nedistration No: M4D0017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Dur Ref Mo: GR-18-045643

Date of Request: 26/032018 Your Ref No: Cnline Purchass
ComforiDelGro Engineering Pie Lid
205 Braddell Road

Singapore 579701

Dear SirlMadam.

Enquiry Date 26/03/2018

Enquiry By Janet Lim Slang Gek

Vahicle No, PC4308G

Accidenl Date 26/03/2018

Enquiry Resuit

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurar Tel. No,
PC4308G China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. 21/12/2017-20/12/2018 6389 6111
Thank Yau.

Tha images provided 1o you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of
Singapore and we lake no responsibility for their accuracy or conlenls and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of
or in connection with the reports or thair images.

‘ia is & computer generated document and requires no signature.

hitps lfsingapare. merimen,. comiclaims/indes cfm?usebox=MTRsas8luseactlon=dsp_geninvip&refid=17585TBACFID=310121538CFTOKEN=3 115830581458



3rd62018 Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore D48580
INSURANCE Phone; +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Manday ta Friday 8am to 5pm
T tion MNo: 1
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ©S' Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-045643
Date of Request: 28/03/2018 Your Ref Ma: Online Purchasa
ComforiDelGro Engineering Ple Lid
205 Braddell Road
Singapara 579701
Daar SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 26/03/2018
Enquiry By Janet Lim Siang Gek

Vehicle No. PC4308G
Accidenl Date 26/03/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOLUNT (S5)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a compuler generaled document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
|X] GIRQ [ | Cash | | Cheque

hittps lisingapore. manmen comiclaimsdindes ofm Plussbox=MTREasd lusaaction=dsp_ganinviparafid=17585784CFID=310121534CFTOKEN=311583056M88



