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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref - CC3/CTI18005725/K1ub3
PRI DAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 el i lemmmm”m
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PC 4308G Veh. Inspected SHC 8977
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
I Assign From Assign Date 28/03/2018

2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model e.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5 General Information
Accident Date  26/03/2018 |Inspection Date 27/03/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD
58 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 5089689
5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B}IN ACCORDANCE TQ YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




CITIpany ‘-‘_a_-.._.-- iration Mo 18E0H7T198R
1L HLAYVE D 25 A A BT ENEN wTHRIA PAKk, 51 yvPORE dnxuil TEL: iaE) 62263501 FAMN sy fHIa64805
Yourref: To Be Advised Date: 28.03.2018
Our ref: CCYCTII8005725/K lub3
The Motor Claims Department
M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD
Dear Sir/Madam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHCS89TT

We refer 1o the above matter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 27.03.2018
at the premises of M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S 7.924.52
Revised Estimate Amount 1 8% 5.652.52
"Check"” Items Amount : 5% 1,732.00
Market Value - 5% -

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5% -

Nett Value : 8% =
Description of Damage: I N
The vehicle sustained damages at the = IF——H——..I |
N/S Body T
Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Estimated normal period for repairs; 3 days

Yours faithfully,

KALVIN ANG
Licensed Appraiser



Shu F:ei {LI{I{iuto}

e ——— = =_— —— _— e
From: Lucas Lee <lucaslee@sg.cntaiping.com=
Sent: Monday, 2 April 2018 3:27 PM
Tao: Shu Pei (LKKAuUTO)
Cc [rene Tay
Subject: RE Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC4308G (01 : CTI - SNM18D016039C02) and
SHCA97T (TP - LKK REF -CC3/CTI18005725/K1ub3 ) an 26.03.2018
Attachments: leeSZ_SMNM18D01609C02-PCA308G-LK KDirectSettlementAccidentLtr CLCR95.668.pdf,

MSYH18040487-PC4308G.pdf

Dear 5irs,
Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Case Handler: Irene Tay

Regards

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3. Ansan Road, #16-00

Springleal Tower

Singapore 072309

Co. Reg. Mo, 200208384E

DID: 6389 6181

Fax: G224 ]

Email: claimsdept@sa.cntaiping.com
Email: lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com

Wabsite: www.sg.cntaiping.com

From: Shu Pei [LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 28 March, 2018 6:33 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Irene Tay; Admin A; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC4308G (O1: CTI - TBA) and SHC897T (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18005725/K1ub3 ) on 26.03.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Irene,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHC 897T at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte
Ltd (Loyang).

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

1



Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GIA report
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Our case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phione: §366-0055 | email: shupei@ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hup://www symanteccloud.com
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(DEAD

CHIMA TAIRING

Our Reference: SNM18D01609/C02/8
Date - 02 APRIL 2018

BT&TAN TRANSPORT PTE LTD
7030 ANG MO KIO AVENUE 5
#03-19 NORTHSTAR @ AMK
SINGAPORE 569880

Dear Sir/ Madam

hEAFRE(HIE)FRAE]

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

3 Anson Mosd B1E-00 Springlenl Tower Sngapons OTIHIO
T 111 F 27 1033

THRIBAE

via Ordinary & Registered Mail

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC4308G AND SHCB897T ON 26 MARCH 2018

ALONG JUNCTION OF MARINA BLVD & BAYFRONT AVE

We refer to the abovementioned accident.

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, SHC897T | is filing a third party property

claim against your vehicle.

\We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf
and they will contact you for more information about the accident.

Kindly render your assistance and co-operation accordingly.

Yours truly,
Claims Department

(This is a computer generated letter and no signature is required.)

CC : LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Attn THIN THIN
Ref ; CCYCTI18005725/K1UBS
Contact No ;68412360

viag Email 1 THINTHIN@LKKAUTO.COM

CC : Agent - (ANOS80A) - ODDS & EVEN

FO1/LKKDS-2013
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CITY CAB PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE*

VEHICLENO : SHC 897T

MAKE
MODEL

-

: MERCEDES

C et Iy
DATE 26/3/2018 15:52
Dy ' G0 D

\_E-T-ﬁ

e

Parts Description/ Labour

Unit Price Amount

Door Shell, Ft'LH _— < 2.970.00
Door Outer Handle, Frt/LH e b 88.15
Door Window Regulator, Frt/LH ’kﬁ N b 385.00
Door Window Motor, Fri/LH ;(«‘ . $  1.580.00
Door Shell, RvLH _— i $  2,870.00
SUB TOTAL $ 8,093.15
LESS 20% § 1.618.63
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 647452
Rear Door ComfortDelgro Limo Cab Logo / e S 60.00 |Nett
Labour Charge Son
Panel Beating b ;LIJB"UU”
Spray Painting Charge b3 ’Qﬁé}ﬂﬂ’ Qw
Wiring Charge b 0004 s~
Tuff Kote S L0600 s
Transfer Of Door 3 120,00 | % 24080 TVa o
TOTAL LABOUR §  1.390.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL $ 792452
JCalet S
s 2L
?r' 'q' ! LEH Aut 4
? % I
/7/ ) //
M Ras |

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the

be prepared after the vehicle is survey ed by a motor Surveyd

Ehm'c vehicle, The final repair quantum will

appointed by the msurance company
e



CIT‘I’ CAB PTE LTD C i\ M
REPAIR ESTIMATE*
'VEHICLENO : SHC 897T DATE 26/3/2018 15:52
MAKE e gtk CET
- |1\ ;. L } ] 'k
MODEL __: MERCEDES e IS
Oty Parts Description/ Labour Type Unit Price Amount
Door Shell, FtY'LH _— $ 2.,970.00
Door Outer Handle, Frt'LH =~ S 88.15
Door Window Regulator, Frt/LH 2 % 585.00
Door Window Motor, Frt/LH 7 $  1,580.00
Door Shell, Rr/LH _— $ 2,870.00
SUB TOTAL $ R.093.15
LESS 20%a £ 1,618.63
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 6,474.52
Rear Door ComfortDelgro Limo Cab I_,ﬂgﬂ// b 60.00 |Nett
Labour Charge T
Panel Beating S _4befT
Spray Painting Charge bt }DWU‘ Yoo
Wiring Charge $ D000 p~
Tuff Kote S L0e00 s
[ransfer Of Door 5 12000 | % 24060 Tra o
TOTAL LABOUR $  1,390.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL $ 792452
JCaleit (S
r2sh
// t ‘°’/ e
Y/ ' I
j,,/)'
M 11+ /‘f’ L

I'his is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above veghicle. The final repair quantum will

be prepared afier the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor ap

oirted by the insurance company.

—




QurJobRefNo . 305135496
Date 6. Apr. 2018
FINALIZATION FORM

To LKK

Atln KALVIN
Vehicle Reg Mo SHC B97T

COMFORIDELGRO
ENCINEERING

ComfortDelGro Enginesring Ple Lid
50 Loyang Drive Smgapore 508363
Fax;: G546 6156

Fax:

Date of Accident: 26.03.2018

The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentioned vehicle are as follows:-

1. The repair job shall bill to: CHINA

PC4308G

The finalized amount shall be
{a)  Spare Pars after List discount
{b)  Labour Charges

Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost

Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less:
Final Lumpsum Repair cost

(c.)

3

Estimated normal period for repairs:

within 7 working days

Thank you for your assistance.

working days.

Wa shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed if there is no reply from you

We confirm the estimates and
finalized amaount

Signature N ™y Signature ;
Mame MName kq L‘\
Tel 6214 8316 Date 9/l e
Fax G546 8156
For Official Use Only
Document )
Item Amount Attached Confirm By Remarks
[Signature)
Yes or No

Rental Rate P/Day YES

Loss of Income Paid

Survey Fees

LTA Search Fea

il b fea TR f—

Medical Fees {on behalf
of driver, If applicable)

[25]

Chverrun

Remarks:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Mo 1896807 198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Ref - CC3/CTIH8005725/K1ub3n2
2P RINGLEAR TOWERSINGAPORE 078609 Bine:: 21NN N“wmmll“mm
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PC 4308G Veh. Inspected SHC 887T
Policy No. DMB15N3096041700 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D01608/C02/8 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 27/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ E 220 c.c 2143
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis No. WDD2120022A759858 Colour WHITE
Odometer 587575 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[205/60 R16 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 BRIDGESTONE 7mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE NS BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/03/2018 |Inspection Date 27/03/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508968
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




I V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e B - 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 897T

i justed
Qty Description of Parts Condition | foiriate B i
REPLACEM FP
1|DOOR SHELL FRT /LH DENTED 2,970.00 2.970.00
11DO0OR OUTER HANDLE ,FRT/LH CRACKED 88.15 88.15
1|DOOR WINDOW REGULATOR FRT/LH SERVICEABLE 585.00 -
1|DOOR WINDOW MOTOR FRT/LH SERVICEABLE 1,580.00 -
1|DOOR SHELL ,RR/LH DENTED 2,870.00 2,.870.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1.618.63 -1,185.63
6.474.52 4, 742.52
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR DOOR COMFORTDELGRO LIMO CAB LOGO (SN) MECESSARY 60.00 60.00
60,00 G000
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING . 400.00 300.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE &00.00 400.00
WIRING CHARGE. NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
TUFF KOTE. 100.00 50.00
TRANSFER OF DOOR 240.00 100.00
1,380.00 850.00
GRAND TOTAL 7.924 .52 5,652.52
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC3/CTI18005725/K1ub3n2

et
/ '| 1t

KALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor [ Invesligator Automotive Assessor




