Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 March, 2018 4:05 PM

To: 'Joel Goh'; assignments

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 17/3/18 INVOLVING SLN902G & SKN3298J
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: HMK

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eqginsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 27 March 2018 3:38 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT ON 17/3/18 INVOLVING SLN902G & SKN3298)J

Dear LKK
Kindly assist to take over this direct settlement.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh

i

L '-). Y ./.:!-*ff Kl ir .-1'_-‘4:,]..-

EQ Insurance Company Limited
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .



From: Joel Goh

Sent: Tuesday, March 27, 2018 3:37 PM

To: vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg; catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg; eric.pau@eurokars.com.sg;
ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 17/3/18 INVOLVING SLN902G & SKN3298]

Without Prejudice
Dear Vion

We welcome direct settlement and will appoint LKK to take over this direct settlement.
Kindly liaise with them directly.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims
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EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190
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From: Janet Tan

Sent: Monday, March 26, 2018 11:43 AM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg; jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg; catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg;
eric.pau@eurokars.com.sg; ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT ON 17/3/18 INVOLVING SLN902G & SKN3298]

Without Prejudice
Save As To Costs

Joel,
Please assist.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims
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EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .

From: vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, March 26, 2018 11:40 AM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@egqginsurance.com.sg>

Cc: jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg; catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg; eric.pau@eurokars.com.sg;
ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT ON 17/3/18 INVOLVING SLN902G & SKN3298)J

Dear Janet,

Your Ref: SKN3298)J

Please assist to arrange survey for the above vehicle & kindly also assist to revert the liability for the above.
Thank you.

Best Regards.
E) ELROKARS
Vion Lim
Insurance Claims Officer

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

5 Ubi Close, Singapore 408605

D: (65) 6395 7877 H: (65) 9111 7463
E: vion.lim@eurokars.com.sg
Website: www.eurokars.com.sg




