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Alzirsuis Invoics

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

I"SWNCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Menday to Friday 8am to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ©°! Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Our Rel No GR-18-044179

Date of Request; 23/03/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Lai Huat (Mang Kes) Motor Pte Lid

160 Sin Ming Drive #04-01

Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 2310372018

Enquiry By Jenny Lim Lai Foong

TP Vehicle No SJL9BB1H

Accident Date 23/03/2018

DESCRIFTION AMOUNT (S8)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount D13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 200
Thank You.

This Is a computer generated documant and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use:
Dale:
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Chegue

hiipsuisingapare marimen comiclaims/index cimPlusebox=MTRsashluseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=17581098CFID=30825245ACFTOKEN=cE5aaTdIDb5d



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Joel Goh <joel goh@eqinsurance com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 2 April, 2018 4:19 PM

Te: Mei Ewan [LKKAUtD)

Cc Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIL9BE1H (01 ; EQI - DM1BHO00T66-IG)
AND SGE5234A (TP : LKK REF - CCE/EQI18005667/Kha3) on 22.03 2018

Attachments: SJL9881H pdf

Categories: HMK

Dear Mel Kwan
Attached our insured’s accident report as per your request.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims

egnsurance

A I {Tl'n REFPER

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 063110
did 65 6500 6772 | tel 656223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4150

wWww.aginsurante.com.sg E
J‘chﬂ‘{.qtuh

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the |

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Melkwan@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, April 2, 2018 11:06 AM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIL9881H (OI : EQI - TBA) AND SGE5234A (TP : LKK REF -
CCh/EQI18005667/Kha3) on 22.03.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case,

We had inspected TP vehicle SGE 5234A at M/s Lai Huat (Meng Kee) Motor Pte Ltd.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
« TP GIA report



« TP police report
TP estimated cost of repair
+ Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GlA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mel Kwan | Admin

LEEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 oos5 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)
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LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

Sin Ming Autocity
160 Sin Ming Drive #04-01/#04-02/#07-03 Singapore 575722
Tel: 64538110 Fax: 64596267
UEN: 199407592C

Your Rel: SJL 9B81H 16 November 2018
Our Ref: SGE 5234A - 2018/JL

EQ Insurance Company Lid WITHOUT PREJUDICE
5 Maxwell Road

#17-00 Tower Block

MND Complex

Singapara 068110

Attention: Motor Claims

Dear Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SGE 5234A AND SJL 9881H ON 22/03/2018 AT PIE TOWARDS
TUAS OPPOSITE TOA PAYOH SWIMMING COMPLEX

We refer to the above matter wherein your insured's vehicle no. SJL 9881H was invalved in an accident with
our client’s vehicle no. SGE 5234A

As the accident was caused by your insured’s negligence, our client is now claiming for the following losses:

« Repair cost $3,883.12 (include GST)
= Rental cost 52,090.00 (19 days x 110 per day)
o« GlAsearchfes: 5  2.00

Total: $5975.12

Relevant documents in support of our client’s claim are enclosed for your reflerence

Please do not hesitate to contact Jenny Lim at telephone 64533757 or email jenny limilaihuat com s
should you need any additional information

Meanwhile, we look forward to receiving your affirmative response soon enough.
Thank you.
Yours faithfully
o0
-
LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTELTD

BNCS
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S1 U AVE 1, #0125 PAYA UBTINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408903 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX - (065167414108

Our Ref: CCO/EQI18005067/Khal

10" May 2018

ANG CHOR MENG

Block 203E Compassvale Road
#05-79

Singapore 545203.

Dear Sir'Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJL 9881H, SGE 5234A AND WYC
9328 ALONG PIE TOWARDS TUAS ON 22.03.2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED 1o resolve the claim against yvou and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accidemt wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed 1o negotiate for an amicable setilement
with third party claimant.

Should vou however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD ~ if applicable) will be with held for
the time being. Pending for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal EQ
INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED.

Please call us if you have further quernes.

Yours faithfully,

i ¥
Pnhki!{ Chong
Case Handler
DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108
Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

c.C EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motar Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To:  Lai Hust (Meng Kee) Motor Pte Lid

160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01. #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722
Dear Sirs

SJL 8681H
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS: SGE 5234A & WYC 9328 ON 22/03/2018 -
AT PIE TOWARDS TUAS OFPOSITE TOA PAYOH SWIMMING COMPLEX
This Is 1o confirm that on  23/03/2018 | / We gave you instruclions 10 repair my / our vehicle no.
SGE 5234A  which was damaged in Ihe above accident

In consideration of your agreement to repair my vehicle no.  SGE 5234A . pay for my other

expenses and o defer demanding for payment of the costs of repair which was damaged &s a resull of
the above accident, | / We hereby authorise you andior your solicitors as my | our representative 1o
wiite, negotiate and ssille the accident claim on my / our behall against any part Involved in the
abovementioned accident.

1/ We hereby underiake 1o co-aperate with you and render you all the assislance (including having my
/ our vehicle re-inspected and being a withess al trial) that may be necessary lor you 10 recover the
cost of repairs and the loss of use 1o my / our vehicle. |/ We further underiake 1o keap you informed al
all times of any communication received from any party involved in the abovementioned accident,

| 1 We hereby confirm that by signing this Letter of Authority, | / We are not entilled In law o receive
any payment. If a cheque is sent to me, | / We shall return the same to the sender as | am precluded
in law from accepting any payment.

In the event of my / our claim against sny party Involved in the abovementioned accident being
unsuccessiul for any reason whatsoever, | / 'We shall bear the repair / excess cosl payable to Lal Huat
(Meng Kee) Motor Pte Lid either by cash / cheque or claim against my / our Insurance policy

| { We hereby authorise the payment of my / our claim (including any or all medical related involces /
receipts) to be made directly 1o my / our representative, Lal Huat (Meng Kee) Motor Ple Lid
accordingly.

In relation to the personal vehicle information collected or otherwise provided during the course of
the claim process (including by way of recordings), | agree and consent that Lai Huat (Meng Kes)
Motor Pte Ltd may and process my personal data for the purpose of responding and

administering all to my insurance claim.
Yours faithfully
Signature:;
J h']
Name: Koh Chuan Kean

NRIC No: S1267455D
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LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

760 Sin Ming Drive #04-01, #04-02 & #07-03 Sin Ming Autoclly Singacors ST5722, Tel: 8453 8110 Fax: 6459 8267

UEN: 158407502C
TAX INVOICE
ESTNo. .. .. :EST0018862 GSTRegNo .............: M2-0128608-3
Koh Chuan Kean Page 1 of 2
Mumber . . . INV0O020362
Yourref .................. TP-SJLS8S81HEQ
Our ref ; A
Attn .. . . Date .... ... ... .....BN1/2018
Vehicle No ... SGE 5234A
Vehicle Model . Nissan Latio
Accident on .. - 22/3/2018
Quantity Unit Description Unit price Disc. pot. Amount
Supply of Parts:
100 Pc Rear boot lid 300.00 300.00
1.00 Pc Rear boot lid weatherstrip 42.00 42.00
100 Pc Rear boot lid chrome moulding 120.00 120.00
1.00 Pc Rear boot lid lock 68.00 68.00
1.00 Pc Rear bumper 190.00 180.00
1.00 Pc Rear bumper side holder LH 17.00 17.00
1.00 Pc Rear bumper side hoider RH 17.00 17.00
1.00 Pc Rear tail lamp LH 100.00 100.00
1.00 Pc Rear tail lamp RH 100.00 100.00
100 Pc Rear tail lamp side clip LH 210 210
1.00 Pc Rear tail lamp side ciip RH 210 210
1.00 Pc Rear end panel 135.00 135.00
100 Pc Rear end panel top gamish 55.00 55.00
100 Pc Rear luggage board 70.00 70.00
400 Pcs Rear bumper clips 1.50 6.00
200 Pcs Rear end panel gamish clips 1.50 3.00
100 Pc Rear Lation emblem 46.00 48.00
1.00 Pc Rear logo emblemn 2400 24.00

Tatal amount of parts supplied - S$1,299.20

soaAnREZRY CAROLINERMARKIV N, TRES SRS G TRASAANER S RcEen,
B, EFEENSAICO Delure ®m® 84,

"Our services include the latest and relinble CAROLINER MARK IV repair bench, draw-aligner and the support
dolly system to provide accurate re-alignment and speedy repairs. We also provide the new and advanced SAICO
Deluxe oven heater for re-spraying all motor vehicles."
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LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

180 Bin Ming Drive #04-01, #04-02 & #07-03 Bin Ming Autoety Singapors STST22. Tet: 8453 8110 Fax: 8458 5227
UEN: 1804075620

TAX INVOICE
EST No. ...... ESTD0O18862 GSTRegNo .. . ... .~ M2-0128608-3
Koh Chuan Kean Page ... ..... ... - of 2
Number .. .. . .. - INVD020362
Yourref .................. TP-SJLSBB1HEQ
Payment = .. I
Altn Date .. .. .. 6/11/2018
Vehicle No ... SGE 5234A
Vehicle Mode! - Nissan Latio
Accident on . : 22/3/2018
Quantity Unit Description Unit price Disc. pct. Amount
1.00 15% of parts supplied: 194 88 194.88
Special nett item.
100 Set Rear reversing sensor with installation 200.00 200.00
1.00 Pc Raer number plate 35.00 35.00
Labour & Misc:
1.00 To straighten rear body including cutting 700.00 700.00
and welding, to knock dents on rear fender
LH & RH, rear luggage panel and renew of
parts
1.00 To spray paint 1,200.00 1,200.00
Sub-Total 3,620.08
GST 7.00% 254 04
Total 53 3,88312

soamwRxEdN CAROLINER MARKIV fif. Rageas el FRRaTRESRANNR TN AEER.
B, EWEEH SAICO Deluxe m®#t 4,

"Our services include the latest and reliable CAROLINER MARK IV repair bench, draw-aligner and the support
dolly system to provide accurate re-alignment and speedy repurs. We also provide the new and advanced SAICO
Deluxe oven heater for re-spraving all motor vehicles.”



M Car Rental Pte Ltd

37A BARTLEY ROAD SINGAPORE 539777
Tt e i
AT REGHTTRAT IO OOt s SR CB NO: 200102894H

HIRING AGREEMENT CUM TAX INVOICE NUMBER: 1004234
(Please quote this number in all payments and correspondence)

Vehicle number  : SJU 2035H
Make & model : TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 AUTD

HIRER'S PARTICULARS

Hirer : KOH CHUAN KEAN NRIC No: S1267455D
Address  : BLK 330 BUKIT BATOK STREET 33 #10-113
SINGAPORE 650330

Contact Number Off : Res:

H/p: B6133832
Nationality : SINGAPOREAN Licence Number: AS NRIC NO
Date Of Birth + 21.01.1957 Licence Expiry : NEW PHOTO LIC.
Driver :+ AS ABOVE  NRIC No:
Address : AS ABOVE
Contact Number Off : Res:

H/p:
Nationality + SINGAFOREAN Licence Number: AS NRIC NO
Date Of Birth ¢ Licence Expiry : NEW PHOTO LIC.
RENTAL PRICING
Daily Rental Rate : S8 110.00 Date Qut : 23.03.2018
Days On Rental : 19 /Day Timeout : |l.20am
Sub-Total :S§ 2,090.00 Date Return: 11.04.20(3
G.5.T.@7.0% S8 — Time Return: 10.30am

Total : 5% 2,090-00

**+RENTER’ S Liability for Vehicle Damage EXCESS is 5$1,500,00 ON ALL CLAIMS,

==+ ppplicable to driver below 23YRS old and above 70YRS old OR with less than 2YRS driving experience
EXCESS is 545,000.00

REMARK - Vehicle no: SGE 52344
Job No: 69344

HIRERS DECLARATION
to the terma and conditions above and as set out

overleaf. If | opt/to pay by credit/charge card, my signature
here is deemed to have been r"qadu on the application credit
card charge sli \

LI N 7
Authorised Signatory a Company Samp APEX CAR RENTAL PTE LTD
Prepared by:
Dare:




2018 Involce

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
m RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
ASS50CIATION

Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE o Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-044179

Date of Request 23/03/2018 Your Ref No. Online Purchase

Laj Huat (Meng Kes) Motor Pra Lid

160 Sin Ming Drive #04-01

Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 23/03/2018

Enquiry By Jenny Lim Lai Foong

TP Vehicle No. SJL9B81H

Accident Date 23/03/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No, Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SJL9BRTH EQl Insurance Company Lid 13/02/2018-1202/2019 6223 8433
Thank You.

The images provided o you are faken from the onginal reports forwarded 1o the cenire by the members of the General Insurance Association of
Singapore and we take no responslbility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no llability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of
or in connaction with the reports or their images

This is a compuler generaled documenlt and requires no signaturs,

hilpesingapore. menmen.camiclaimsfiindax cimlusebox=MTRsas 8 useactior=dsp_geninvipBrefid=1756199&4CFID=308252458 CFTOKEN=c85aaTdi0b5d



A0 Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

m 6 Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore D4B580
INSURANCE Frone: 65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to S5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-D44179

Date of Request: 23/0372018 Your Ref No; Online Purchase

Lai Huat (Meng Kee) Motor Pta Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive #04-01

Sin Ming AuloCity

Singapora 575722

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 23/03/2018

Enquiry By Jenny Lim Lai Foong

TP Vehicla Na. SJLO8B1H

Accident Data 23/03/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S§)

TP Insurar Enquiry 1.87
GST Amodnl D.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You,

This Is a compuler generaled document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

hiips.//singapore. marimen.com/claimsdindex.cfm Tusebo=MTRsasSussaction=dsp_geninvipirelid=17561398CFI0=308252458 CFTOKEN=c85aaT df0b5e



Company Raglatration No 190607T108R

1 LR AVE | 225 PAYA DML INTHSTHIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J08933% TEL © (651 62563501 FAX : (IS 62564315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 08/04/2019

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT
Vehicle No SJL 9881H (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DM18HO00766-JG

' SGE 5234A (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No. : CC8/EQI18005667/Kha3g2
Date of Accident 22/3/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost 5 3.883.12
Loss of Use ' 9 days
Rental (If any) 8 1,000.00 10 days
Others: % 2.00
9

488512

Final Settlement Sum |: § 4,800.00 |GLOBAL SUM

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |LAI HUAT (MENG KEE} MOTOR PTELTD

'S 4,800.00

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl industnal Park, Singapore 408833

TEL 5258 3561 FAX. 6258 4215

Reg. No: 18880718BR GST Reg. No. 18-8607186-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Ref CCB/EQI1BOD5667/Khalg2

S o o AR
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date : D8-04-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code : EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJL 9881H Veh. Inspected SGE 5234A
Policy No. DMPPHQ18-D00B37 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. OM18HO00TE6-JG Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 26/03/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN LATIO (A} c.c 1488
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. JN1BAAC11Z0000327T Colour METALLIC SILVER
Odometer 153835 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front T,rr. 185680 R156 FALKEN 3 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/80 R15 FALKEN 3 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/60 R15 FALKEN 4 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 185/60 R15 FALKEN 4 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 22032018 Inspection Date 26/03/2018
Survey held at LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE #04-01/02
SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722 P
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
BiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5b, Estimate Days of Repair

IEST1MATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 8 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 2561 FAX G256 4315

Reg. No: 199607108R GST Reg. No. 18-9607188-R Page No. 1of2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGE 5234!}
aty Description of Parts Condition | S Mlhap?;n .13 o
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOT LID BUCKLED 300.00 300,00
1|REAR BOOT LID WEATHERSTRIP DISTORTED / 42.00 42 00
DENTED
1|REAR BOOT LID CHROME MOULDING WARPED 120,00 120.00
1|REAR BOOT LID LOCK DENTED 68.00 68.00
1|REAR BUMPER CRACKED 160.00 180.00
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER LH CRACKED 17.00 17.00
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER RH CRACKED 17.00 17.00
1|REAR TAIL LAMP LH CRACKED 100.00 100.00
1|REAR TAIL LAMP RH CRACKED 100.00 100.00
1|REAR TAIL LAMP SIDE CLIP LH NECESSARY 210 210
1|REAR TAIL LAMP SIDE CLIP RH MECESSARY 2.10 210
1|REAR TAIL LAMP PANEL LH TO REPAIR SEE 70.00
LABOUR
1|REAR TAIL LAMP PANEL RH TO REPAIR SEE 70.00
LABOUR
1|REAR END PANEL BENT 135.00 135.00
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH DENTED 55.00 55.00
1|REAR LUGGAGE BOARD DEFORMED 70.00 70.00
4|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @$1.50 NECESSARY 6.00 6.00
2|REAR END PANEL GARNISH CLIPS @%1.50 MECESSARY 3.00 3.00
1|REAR LATION EMBLEM NECESSARY 48.00 48.00
1|REAR LOGO EMBLEM NECESSARY 24 .00 24.00
COST PLUS 15% 21588 184.88
1,655.08 1,494 08
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR REVERSING SENSOR WITH INSTALLATION SHORTED / 200.00 200.00
(SN) DENTED
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN) DENTED 35.00 35.00
235.00 235.00

Report Ref No. CCG/EQI18005667/Kha3q2




' V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sadis i = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
"A_. TEL 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 198607188R GST Reg No, 18-9607188-R Page No -2 of 2
ST Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qaty Description of Parts Condition wmnoi?sﬂi *‘gll
LABOUR
TO STRAIGHTEN REAR BODY INCLUDING CUTTING AND 750.00 700.00

WELDING ,TO KNOCK DENTS ON REAR FENDER LH &
RH ,REAR LUGGAGE PANEL AND RENEW OF
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR TAIL LAMP
PANEL LH AND REAR TAIL LAMP PANEL RH

TO SPRAY PAINT 1.300.00 1,200.00
2.050,00 1,800.00

GRAND TOTAL 3,940.08 3,629.08

[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS I [T | 3629.08

Report Ref No. CCB/EQI18005667/Kha3q2

Y 494

KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appralser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THERD FPARTIES: - This Repott s made salely lor the use snd benslil of e Client named on the frenl page of (his Repan




Joanne Lee !Ll(l( Auto!

From: Joanne Lee (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 12:08 PM

To: ‘Joel Gah'

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Acaident Involving SIL 9881H (Ol) and SGE 5234A (TP) on
22/03/2018

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdf; TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT pdf

Dear StrMadam,

Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.
Enclose herewith final repont & relevant documents for vour necessary action please.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapora 408933



