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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

G TEL. 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607196-R

E
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by,
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Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref :  CC3/CTI18005568/Dwb3
géEl?ﬂ%T?fFTDﬂ%&%lNGAPDRE 079908 Doters: 26-03:218 ” "Nmmmlmw
Code; CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJX 81236 Veh. Inspected SHD B748%
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 26/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c a
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer 7 Steering
Brakes Madification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/03/2018 Ilnspeﬂlnn Date 23/03/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




AL

Consultarls

Pig Lid Company Registration Mo 10060 T10RR
FURTAVE | #0220 AV A UREINDUSTREAL PARK, SINGAPORE 308933 TEL : (065) 62563501 FAN (5 HIS6AN]E
Your ref:  To Be Advised Date: 26.03.2018

Our ref? CC3/CTI18005568/Dwh3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHD6T48X
We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 23.03.2018
at the premises of M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Ple Ltd and have the [ollowing to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 55 291776
Revised Estimate Amount : 58 1,110.00
"Check” ltems Amount 1 5% -
Market Value 1 8% -
LTA Reimbursement Value 5% -
Nett Value 55 -

Description of Damage: .
The vehicle sustained damages at the | | § |
N/S Body & N/S Rear Portion R

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period [or repairs: 3 days

Yours laithfully,

ANG BEYAN TANI
Licensed Appraiser



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Angie Foo <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 March 2018 3:24 PM

To: Shu Per (LKKAuto)

Cc Jowyn Tay; Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A; Jowyn Tay

Subject: OUR REF:SNM18D01565C02/3/LKKDS & YR REF: SHDET4EX (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18005568/Dwhb3 ) on 23.03.2018

Attachments: MSYH18039852-5)X8123G.pdf; SNM18D01565C02 20180327 TO INSURED - LKK
ASSIGNMENT LTR. pdf

Dear Shu Pei,
we refer to your email of 26th March 2018.
We attached a copy of our Assignment Letter and Insured's SAS Report for your necessary action.

Please be advised that the claim handle for this case is Jowyn Tay 6383 B6l74

Thank you.

Regards,

Angie Foo

Executive

Motor Division

Claims Departmant

Ghina Taiping Insurance (Singapere) Ple Ltd
3 Ansan Road #16-00

Springleafl Tower

Singapere 079309
Co.Req.No.200208384E

DID: 6389 6186

Fax: 5224 7478 /6224 7175

Emall: angie.foof@sg.cntaiping.com
Email: claimsdept .cnlaiping,.com
Website: www.s5q.cntaiping.com

Duschairar:

This message i canfidential is contents do not constiute a commitment oy China Talping Insurance (Singapare) Ple. Lid. except where provided for in 2 witten
agreement between you and China Taiping fnsurance {Singapore) Fle. Lid, Any unautharized disclosure, use of dissemination, ither in whole or partiai, s
profiied, If you are nof ihe infended recipienl of ifhe message. please noffy [he sencer immegiatety

From: 5hu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ikkauta.com]

Sent: Monday, 26 March, 2018 7:50 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Jowyn Tay; Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 5JX8123G {Ol : CTI - TBA) and SHDE748X (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18005568/Dwb3 ) on 23.03.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Jowyn,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHD 6748X at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte
Ltd {Loyang).

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GIA report
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Our case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupel@lkkauta.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-35 | 5{408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp:/www.svmanteccloud.com




F§ PEAR chE A AR (FT ) RAT)
L |

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPDRE) PTE LTD
CHINA TAIPING i 5 - =
1 ARad n Boacd 8 H5-00 Sponglea! Tower Smgapare areen
T EAES ET1T Fax 2971033

Our Reference: SNM18D01565/C02/3

Date ; 27 MARCH 2018 via Ordinary & Registered Mail
TEO BEE LAN @ TAN SIEW GEOK

41 VERDE CRESCENT

SINGAPORE 688396

Dear Sir/ Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5JX8123G AND SHD6748X ON 23 MARCH 2018
ALONG CLEMENT! AVE 6 TOWARDS COMMONWEALTH AVE

We refer to the abovementioned accident.

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, SHD6748X , is filing a third party property
claim against your vehicle.

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf
and they will contact you for more information about the accident.

Kindly render your assistance and co-operation accordingly.

Yours truly,

Claims Department

(This is a computer generated letter and no signature is required.)

CC © LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Afin ; VIVIAN

Ref : TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18005588/Dwh3
Contact No . 6841 B825

via Email vivianlau@lkkaute.com

£C - Agent - (ANDE13A) - AUTO WORLD PTE LTD

FO1LKKDS-2013
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.am:  ARC Repair TP(CLSO)1

Dats/Time: 23.03.201¢

JOB CARD 32ales Crder:

5+349 Page
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Jono205128022

OMER | mEGN NBie 748K | miLeaGE
& COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD TE =g
o83 SIN MING DRIVE T i
Singapore SINGAPORE 575717 "1-40 230379018 "12: 45
E5508755
iR 8] YR OF TRREET DATE
o T4, 205
CHASS CORAPLETION DATETIME:
SUNT GARD NO. | R Be 1 uMFU068135
JOB DESCRIFT!

-cident Date: 23.03.2018
ATURE: 3P 23.03.18

{NQ LABOR CODE DESCRIPTION

*KED & PASSED OUT BY:

(]
SERVIGE ADVISOR CUSTOMER'S SIGNATURE
ledgement Shp | Ewxit Pass
Vahicle MNa.:

No: SHDET48X% JU CHINA LEK SHDGT48X

if Service Advisar Signature/Date | MName of Service Advisar Diate

surned to Service Aecaption upan coliection | To be kept by Security Guard



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE*

VEHICLE NO : SHD 6748Y

g Wy

DATE 23/3/2018 15:45

MAKE
MODEL : HYUNDAT i40
Qiy Parts Description/ Labour Type ____ Unit Price Amount
Rear Door (LH) 4P~ A $ 135110 [ —
Rocker Panel Outer Garnish (LH) gqﬁﬁp ‘% lln.r 5 483.60 M X
SUB TOTAL S 1,834.70
LESS 20%a 5 36694
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 8 1467.76
Rear Fender Advertisement Logo (LH) K ) 100.00 |Nett =
Rear Door Advertisement Logo (LH) W 5 100.00 |Nett
Rear Door Comfortdelgro & Apps Sticker (LH) g, | $ 8000 |Nett —
$ 280.00
Labour Charge
Panc] Beating §  230m) |2e2 |~
Spray Painting Charge-Fender/Door/Rocker Panel 5 1560 éba |~
Tuff Kote 5 30480 | 25|~
Transfer of Door § 12600 | bty
TOTAL LABOUR § 1,170.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL 5 2917.76
>3 | (oG
3 lllo 0% @ lisounar
o To resurvey T
et ghaplan ¢
» Parts price
“aq \ Vgl o Third party
» Mo g
Pﬁ" "h i’,}p ﬁ/\_l_ o, '%uDﬂ"
G- 3 e
LXlC A -
This is an initial estimate based on ; H':QA:;]I inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.




COMEORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

Date: 27.03.2018
Time: 16:55:05
Page: 1

COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS) JOB NO 305128022
CUSTOMER: 7010045 REGN NO SHD6748X
ADDRESS : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD MILEAGE 0000000000
383 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE HYUNDAI
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717 MODEL 1-40
65508755 DATE OF REGN 23.04.2015
DATE/TIME IN 23.03.2018 12:45
ACCIDENT DATE 23.03.2018
JOB / PARTS DESCRIPTION QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

PART REQUISITION

0001 28-01-0103-2013-A 140V3 APF LOGOREARDOOR 1IN 80.00 0.00 80.00 L

0002 04-01-0103-0596-G 140VC PANEL ASSY-RRDRLH 1L 1,351.10 20.00 1,080.88 —

SUB-TOTAL : 1,160.88

JOB NATURE

0000 L PANEL BEATING- REAR 200.00 —

0001 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA 600.00 —

0002 20-00 TUFF COAT ON AFFECTED PARTS. 3000

0003 20-05 RENEW ADVERTISMENT STICKER- | 200,00 —

0004 L TRANSFER DOOR PARTS 4000 —
SUB-TOTAL : 1,070.00
TOTAL 2,230.88

AUTHORISED : YES / NO
MV A NAME & SIGNATURE SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE
DATE: DATE:




Comgo RID EELc.lsg _
MNEERIMN

Qur Job Ref Mo aps128022 NGl RING 1

Date . 27/03/2018 e Bve: Sngapore 508969

Fax: 6546 81558

FINALIZATION FORM

To LKK Fax :

Min BRYAN

Vehicla Reg No. : SHDGE748X Date of Accident : 23/03/2018

The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-m entioned vehicle are as follows:-

1. The repair job shall bill to: CHINA e S5JX8123G
tHd

2 The finalized amount shall be:

(a) Spare Paris after List discount $1.160.88
{b}  Labopur Charges i $1,070,00

Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost ; §2,230.88 'S
e

(e.) Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less: 20%
Final Lumpsum Repalr cost

3 Estimated normal period for repairs: warking days

4. \We shall treat the above amount as Corrett and Confirmed Iif there is no reply from you
within 7 working days

5. Thank you for your assistance. Wa confirm the estimates and
finalized amount

Signature : \l\ Signature :

Mame. : JUMANI 4 \ Mame
T 6214 8315\ R | i /!h,c} 0

s 1 Le I.‘:_
Fax 3 G5468N 56 \ e
\
For Official Use Only
Document
Caonfirm By
Item Amount Attached : Remarks
Yas or No (Sigmire
1. Rental Rate PiDay YES
2. Loss of Income Pald N
3. Survey Fees
4. LTA Search Fee §7.49 Tt
5. Medical Fees (on behaif
of drivar, if applicable) |
IE Overrun |

Remarks:

: R .
T R

R AT
Lo e
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IVl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
i)~ 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg, No. 18-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Ref : CC3/CTI18005568/0wb3n2
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 by MEOREES M“mmmmm m
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJX B123G Veh. Inspected SHD 67484
Policy No. DMPCSN1747641700 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D01565C02/3/LKKDS  |Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 23/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.C 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMFLUOB8135 Colour BLUE
Odometer 199895 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification MIL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R18 WEST LAKE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/80 R16 WEST LAKE 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S REAR PORTION AND N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/03/2018 Inspection Date 23/03/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508569
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTICON WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




I V4l 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- V1 — 51 Ubi Awe 1 #04-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL® 6256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 16-5507158-R Page No .1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 6T48X
s timate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition Es
Qty pti Workshop ($)) ($)
1|REAR DOOR (LH) DENTED 1,351.10 1,351.10
1|ROCKER PANEL OUTER GARMISH (LH) TO REPAIR SEE 4B3.60 .
LABOUR
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -366 94 270.22
1,467.76 1,080.88
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR EENDER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (LH)(SN) NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
1|REAR DOOR ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (LH)(SN) NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
1|REAR DOOR COMFORTDELGRO & APPS STICKER iLH) WECESSARY BO.0D 80.00
[SN)
280.00 280.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF 250.00 200.00
ROCKER PANEL OUTER GARNISH (LH)
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE-FENDER/DOOR ROCKER 750.00 60000
PAMEL.
TUFF KOTE. 50.00 30,00
TRANSFER OF DOOR. 120.00 40.00
1,170.00 B70.00
GRAND TOTAL 2.917.76 2,230.88
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS ! | | 2,230.88

Report Ref No. CC3/CTI18005568/Dwb3n2

ANG BRYAN TANI HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor | Investigator Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report I8 mate solely for the use and It of the Chent named on the frant page of this Report.

M Bability of responsibility
Bepor, in whole or kn parl. does so al his or her own riak.



