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’ VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

— - 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933

sdun BE B
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg. No: 198807198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref CCR/LCR1BDDS517/Auad
bk I M DL || | ]
Code: LCR
1. Palicy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, SLK 48B1R Veh. Inspected EKZ 92636
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 24/03/2018
2 Vehicle Parliculars & Condition
Make & Modael c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometar = Steering
Brakes Modification
Geaneral
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
LiH Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  16/03/2018 |inspection Date 23/03/2018
Survey held at SUCCESS UNITED PTELTD
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2
#01-33 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417821
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




M K X $

g

SUCCESS LUNITED FTE LTOD
2 Kakl Bukit Ave 2, #01-33 | #02-29 Kaki Bukit AutoHub Singapore 417921

Tel 6746 1515 / 6747 17E7T  Fax 6748 5015

S === UniTas ETE LTDI e succedsunted com.ig o | GET Meg: 2004075100
Estimate TP/18-036
M/s  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Date . 22nd March 2018
AlG Building
78 Shenton Way, #07-16 . Vehicle No = SKZ 9263G
Singapore 079120 v Make/ Model - Hyundai Elantra
Chassis No © EKMHOH4 1CMGUESEED
Attn ©  Motor Claims Acc. Date : 16.03.18
Palicy No
Tel 64191053
Fax: ©B357416 Your Ref . SLK 4661R
S/n. Qty Particulars Urit Price AmL
Materials
1 1 Frt Bumper i’f‘r—‘!' § 41800 “~
2 5 Frt Bumnper Clips ™ -] 3.50 5 17.50
3 1 Frt Bumper Side Holder RH s 21.00 «
4 1 Headlamp RH  »* [ - $ 1,756.00 *
5 1 Frt Fender RH m«ku v 3 461.00
6 1 Frt Fender Liner RH 32" L5 $ 8B.00 ~
T 6 Frt Fender Liner Clips  »~ 5 350 § 17.00 .
s 277850
Less20% 8 §55.70
9 5 2,222 B0
B 1 FtSport RmRH & ) SiNett  § 52000 ~
s 2.742.80
Labour )
1 Toremove. rearrange electrical wirings. check lightings 5 $ 60.00° 3~
2 Toremove, repair and replaced damaged bodyparts, realign 3299
bodyworks & where consistent to the accident. s 58000
3  To putty and respray painting on frt bumper. frt fender. irt door RH. 5 70800 7V
Total : § 4.082.80
h L0 2068 .
R~ 1 ' 2 ) f‘}q.'r-n..ﬂ Ji——1

Success United Pte Lid ¥
No of Days

Re-Survay Before/afier Paint, "

Part By n'n:mlpsum . =

Surveyed! By . Coritact No.
Date of Survéy Fax No |

1 ndd

2 3/1. Zl.fr:"::, '”-,-’JS
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Vivian Lau !L!{I{Autu] W——

From: Vivian Lau (LKEAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 March, 2018 2:22 FM

To: ‘eyap@lioncityrentals.comsg’

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Joy lrene (LKKAuto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 4461R AND SKZ 9263G ON 16/03/2018

Our Ref: CCO/LCRISNOSSTIT/Awald

27 March 2018

LION CITY RENTALS I'TE LTD

Dear Sir'Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 4461 R AND SKZ 9263G ON 16/03/2018

We refer 1o the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant 10 the above said accident wherein you and/or vour authorized driver had amongst other information given us
vour version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for
an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

I you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in
writing within 7 days 1.e. by 06/04/2018. after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the
without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by vou/your driver against the other
party’s insurer arising from this panticular accident.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Thank you

Best Regarde,

Viviam Lau| Case Hundler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlaug@ kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080:33)



Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Ng, Hai-Chuan <Hai-Chuan Ng@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 8 April, 2019 1:58 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: 92035274295G,0ur Ref. CCB/LCR18005517/Awa3 Accident involving

Vehicle SKZ 9263G & SLK 4661R on 16/03/2018

Dear Vivian,

Please proceed to reject the claim.

Our insured has also managed to recover 100% from third party insurer.
Thank you.

Regards,

Ng Hal Chuan

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65)6419 1994
Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com | www.aig.5g

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies
or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or
other defect that might affect any computer system Into which it is received and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibllity is accepted by AlIG for
any loss or damage arising in any way from Its use.

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, April 05, 2019 3:44 PM

To: Ng, Hal-Chuan

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Your ref: 92035274295G,0ur Ref: CC6/LCR18005517/Awa3, Accident involving Vehicle SKZ
§263G & SLK 4661R on 16/03/2018

Caution: External Email

Your ref: 92035274295G
Our Ref: CC6/LCR18005517/Awa3



Dear Hai Chuan
Accident involving Vehicle SKZ 9263G & SLK 4661R on 16/03/2018
we refer to the email below.

Based on the circumstances of both parties and available information in hand, O1D’s video, TP moved off from
stationary position, OID moving straight. We are in the opinion that TP more liable for the accident.

As such, we intend to reject the claim.

Kindly advice on vour view/opinion/instruction for this claim.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(408033)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 5:41 PM

To: 'Ng, Hai-Chuan' <Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com>

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene @lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>»

Subject: RE: Your ref: 92035274295G,0ur Ref: CC6/LCR18005517/Awa3, Accident involving Vehicle SKZ 9263G & SLK
4661R on 16/03/2018

Your ref: 92035274295G
Our Ref: CC6/LCRI18005517/Awal

Dear Hai Chuan
Accident involving Vehicle SKZ 9263G & SLK 4661R on 16/03/2018
we refer to the email below,

Based on the circumstances of both parties and available information in hand, OID’s video, TP moved off from
stationary position, OID moving straight. We are in the opinion that TP more liable for the accident.

As such, we intend to reject the claim.

Kindly advice on your view/opinion/instruction for this claim.



Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@[kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng, Hai-Chuan [mailto:Hai-Chuan.Ng@®aig.com]

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 2:10 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene @lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto. >

Subject: RE: Your ref: 92035274295G,0ur Ref: CC6/LCR18005517/Awa3, Accident involving Vehicle SKZ 92636 & SLK
4661R on 16/03/2018

Please check

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianiau@lkkauto.com)
Sent: Thursday, April 26, 2018 2:07 PM

To: Ng, Hai-Chuan

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: 92035274295G,0ur Ref; CC6/LCR18005517/Awa3,Accident involving Vehicle SKZ 9263G &
SLK 4661R on 16/03/2018

Dear Hai Chuan,

Mo video in merimen

Thank vou

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlan@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Ng, Hai-Chuan Ito:Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 2:03 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkka >

Ce: Joy Irene [LKKAuto) <Joyirene @lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: 920352742956G,0ur Ref: CC6/LCR18005517/Awa3,Accident involving Vehicle SKZ 9263G & SLK
4661R on 16/03/2018

| have uploaded the video footage into Merimen.



Please check and revert if you are unable to access.
Thank you.

Regards,

Ng Hai Chuan

AlIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65)6419 1994| Fax +68357416
Hai-Chuan.Ng®@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this emall In error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies
or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or
other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG for
any loss or damage arising In any way from Its use.

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, April 26, 2018 12:07 PM

To: Ng, Hai-Chuan

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your ref; 92035274295G,0ur Ref: CC6/LCR18B005517/Awa3, Accident involving Vehicle SKZ 9263G & SLK
4661R on 16/03/2018

Your ref: 92035274295G
Our Ref: CC6/LCR18005517/Awn3

Dear Hai Chuan

Accident involving Vehicle SKZ 9263G & SLK 4661R on 16/03/2018
We refer to the above matter.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, is conflicting versions

Kindly advise if there is any video footage(stated in GIA report) submitted by OI/OID to you good office



Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

Phone: 6841-B625 | email: Vivignlap@kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof, Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened. it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) 1s confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed 1o be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notifv me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



Vivian Lau {I.I(KAutu!

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 8 April, 2019 2:35 PM
To: ‘sirina@successunited com.sg’
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Your Ref: SKZ 9263G,0ur Ref: CC6/LCR18005517/Awa3 Accident on 16/03/2018
involving SKZ 9296G & SLK 4661R
Attachments: SLK 4661R.MP4
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE'
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your Ref: SKZ 9263G
Our Ref: CC6/LCRI8005517/Awa3

Dear SirfMadam,
Accident on 16/03/2018 involving SKZ 9296G & SLK 4661R
We refer to the above matter

Our insured driver has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client. Based on our
Insured’s video, vour client moved ofT from stationary position, our Insured moving straight

We attached herewith our insured’s CCTV video Footage for your perusal.

Linder such circumstances, we have our principal’s instruction to deny liability of your client’s claim

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prefudice basis with the sole imtention of
resolving the matter amicably withowt parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission af liahility, whatsoever, should be
deemed / nferred from this negatiation of terms/settlement

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of Hability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafier, by the negotiation terms/settlement

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S${408033)



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Revoknd | Mo settiement

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING -
Case  |Notified Est Submitied Ady Asmgned Adj Apc Ad) Submitted | Ins Auth'nd | Status
i |26 Mar 2018 gs,ﬁ' 218 $$1,650.00 5%$1,650.00 -""""""I for Survey
&I = Edit ad) it | o Eatimates | | _view Rpt .i Cancel Case |

Reference Claim Detalls

LCRF PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 201624557K

CHAN KOK KWANG [CHEN GUOGUANG), 1D: 571245310

| 16/03/2018 15:00 - :59
|SKES2636 Pate of Lo3" | (25 Months From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr]]

TP / 92035274295G Note o™ |1700034563 (Comprehensive)

|

Policy Mo. |
(Clavsarn): | DMPCSNID10701801

Aepairer | Success United Pte Ltd (MQ) 2 Kiski Bukit Ave 2 #01-33, :::nm AutoHub, 417621 Kak Bukit - Tel: 6746 1515
m’t'.:,"’ | AZG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tei; 65-6415-3000 ... [Handied by Ng, Hal-Chusn] Hai-Chuan Ng@sig.com
f::::'r.mnr’ China Taiping Insurance [Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6389 6111
Adjuster. | LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 __ [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 04/04/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED - v [

There are ng mall for this case.

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View Al | Search Tasks | Creste New Task | Complets |

Due Date  Priority Type Task Group  Subject  Mandler  Assigned By Completed On Crested On  Dona?
Wi resilts.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 10/4/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SKZ9263G (92035274295G)
[SLK4661R]
™

CHAN KOK KWANG (CHEN GUOGUANG)
Mar 16 2018 3:00PM
[LCRF PTE LTD]
Success United Pte Ltd

Page | of 2
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{17 [20/04/1812:21 | General View D | weews | A
18 |20/04/18 12:21 | Genersl View O | wows | 2
19 |20/04/18 12:21 | Genaral View 0  weews | A
20 |20/04/18 12:21 | General View D s | A
21 |20/04/18 12:21 | General View © | sdwe | B2 |
22 |20/04/18 12:27 | Reinspection Phato 0 | waaws | A
23 |20/D4/18 12:22 Reinspection Phate 0 | teadws | A
24 20/04/18 12:22 | Reinspection Photo _i Load ps | A
125 10/04/18 1222 | Reinspection Photo 0 | waws | A
(26 | 20/04/18 12:227 | Reinspection Photo - - 0| s &
Documantation - 1 per page E[ ]
No |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 [24/0%/18 17:4% | TP GIA REPORT 0 | Loaror
R | ——— Lmu 01 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 2461R AND SKZ 92636 ON © | Losd P
3 [26/04/18 17:41 | Emall to AIG to seek advise 26.4.18 = © | osdror |
4 |08/D4r15 14:23 Email from ATG to reject TP claim SKZ 92636 D | Load poe ]
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreg me tesesorisss
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sun@lkkauto.comassignmentsi@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCB/LCR1B005517/AWA3Q2
Date: 10/04/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer; AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No: 1700034563
Claimant Vehicle oy20263G Insured Vehicle No : SLK4B61R
Date of Loss: 16/03/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No. 9203527428506
RIPTION & IDENTIFICATI F HI
Reg No: SKZ9263G
Make & Model: HYUNDAI ELANTRA, 1.6 D/AB 2WD 4DR (A) Engine No: G4FGFUDGA0S8
Reg Date 16/02/2016 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No KMHDH41CMGUGSE609
Colour: Silver Odometer 48182 km
Engine Capacity: 1581 cc
Markel Value/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S§) Market Value/New Car Price
| F T 7]
General Condition: Stearing (Serviceabls): Yes Foolbrake (Sarviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification No  Pre-accident Condition
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/55 R16
Front Left Side: Hankook 6 mm Rear Lah Side Hankook B mm
From Right Side: Hankook 6 mm Rear Right Side Hankook & mm
The above values represent the remaming lyre eads depth
COSTOFCLAMS Repairers  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Farts 2,742.80 1,338.00 1.404.80 51.22
Miscellaneous liems 0.00 0.00 0.00 _
Labour 1,340.00 730.00 610.00 45 52
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5§5) 4,082.80 2,068.00 2,014.80 49.35
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,650.00
(55) 4,082.80 1,650.00 2.432.80 £50.59
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5§) 28580 115.50 170.30 58.59
Nett Amount (S5) 4,368.60 1,765.50 2,603.10 59.59
Global Sum Settlement (55) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment. 23/032018
Date Inspected: 23/03/2018 Inspected Al Success United Pte Lid (HQ)
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-33, Kak| Bukil
AutoHub
Singapore 417921
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
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Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: VIVIAN LAU PEI FENG

NOTE: This report reprosenis our findwngs af e fime and place of nspechon atated harem, Such mapection has Beon camed oul o the best of our
knowipdge and ability buf any ather lability undér any offer cimumatences is hemby axprese’y arciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 ‘FRT BUMPER Deformed 418.00FL *418.00FL
2 5 *FRT BUMPER CLIPS Mecessary 17.50FL *“17.50FL
3 1 *FRT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER RH Necessary 21.00FL "21.00FL
4 1 *HEADLAMP RH Mot Necessary 1,756.00 FL *.FL
5 1 *FRT FENDER LH Dented 481.00FL *481.00FL
8 1 *FRT FENDER LINER RH Deformed BA.00FL *BA.OOFL
7 5 *FRT FENDER LINER CLIPS MNecessary 17.00FL *“17.00FL
8 1 *FRT SPORT RIM RH Cut 52000FS *520.00FS
F=Franchise part. S=SpcNett L=ListitemDisc
Sub Total (5S5) 3,298.50 1,542.50
- List item Discount on L lems 20.00/20.00% (S$) 555.70 204,50
Total Parts (S5) 2,742.80 1,338.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. ]
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellanecus items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE,REARRANGE ELECTRICAL WIRINGS ,CHECK Mew 60.00 30.00
LIGHTINGS
2 TO REMOVE,REPAIR AND REPLACED DAMAGED Mew 580.00 300.00
BODYPARTS ,REALIGN BODYWORKS & WHERE
CONSISTENT TO THE ACCIDDENT
3 TOPUTTY AND RESPRAY PAINTING ON FRT BUMPER ,FRT New 700.00 400.00
FENDER ,FRT DOOR RH
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 1,340.00 730.00
l_ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. ]
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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