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MS@FirstCapital R L. S S

Teb (6516222 2911 ‘Fax (69) 6227 3547

Ll & Pt nbarsesining Dot 36 Robison Road WLE-01 Gty House Singepere 068877

Tel {4} 6507 2048 Faw. (551 6507 3640
profrrptranital.com.ag

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Caontact Persan,
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person
Contact Number.

W
MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
18-03-2018 Our Ref No. D1B002238MFSH
15-03-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHeO108 Third Party Vehicle. GBG&TEET
BLK 5§ DEFU LANE 10 #01-57§
WINSON TAN
62664541/ 0 Fax No. B2B10647
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD
NA Fax No. 68416315
NA
FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey repori.

THIRD FARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Worksho HU| WANG ENTERPRISE Attention. NIL
' 4 PTE LTD ]

Cc : TP Salicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Officer Incharge MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for sufvey assignment and 7 days for re-inspaction

This 1s:8 computer generated letter. no signature required.
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Claim Warkfiow System

Job Sheet (/ClaimWS/Surveyor/JobSheet/236094) . | PRI Documents @ | Ciose
[re=] _ A

PRI Header Details

Claimant
Claim No D18002238MFSH Policy No D-18088936MFSH S.No & 1 & HUT WANI
Name
TERF
iikiras | e o N ENTEARBISE curvey | BLK S DEFU LANE 10 #01-576
. Mobile: 0, Phone: 62864541 , Fax: 62810647
Nama KGoniact-Perwl s & Contact | o nailld: HUIWANGS76@GMAIL.COM
WINSON TAN) Details i : )
Cur LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS Instructions :
Surveyor PTELTD To Surveyor WITHOUT. PREJUDICE:
COMFORT P
Insured . Insured
Niise TRANSPORTATION PTE Vehicle No SHEO1DB Vehicle GBGAT7EAT
LTD No
PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 23-03-2018 D1:46:28 PM Appointed 23-03-2018 03:10:53 PM | Accept 23-03-2018 0
Date Date Date
Survey Report Upload
ok et e | Surveyor :f::::
Inspection | s 23-03-2018
Date *: m Report Date ':':“m"
Vehicle Particulars
Make Please Select Make *| | Mode! Please Select Model ¥ Year Select Year v
Chasis No | | Engine No | | Mileage ‘
Cubic
|
Color I Capacity ]
Multiple Documents Upload
| I.J_rﬂnad Multiple Ducumart_m ]
File Nam= Action

Surveyor Job Remarks

Remarks

Save

hitps:/ificiaims: com B001/ClimWSSurvayor/Datall</2 36004

12



Nivitha (LKK Auto) _

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 4:42 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System'’; ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM
Cc MAYCHUA@MSFI RSTCAPITM.CQ M.SG; sur@lkkauto.com
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1B00223BMFSH /A

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please be informed that according to the repairer. TP owner already withdraw claim,

We will close this file at our end without bilting.

BEST REGARDS,

GuNivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultunts Pte Ltd

Phone: 68411072 | email: assigninentsi@ikkhuto.com | fox- 6256-4915

Blk 51, Pava Ui Industrinl Park. Ubi Avenue |, #02-05 | S[antm_p;J

From: Nivitha (LKK Autp) {mailtn:admin-d@Ikkautn.r.um]
Sent: Friday, 23 March 2018 5:27 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <ewsmatarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL. COM.SG; sur@lkkaute,com
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - DIBOO223IBMFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST HEGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Pheme: 6841-1972 | emal: assignmante@klguto com | fax; 6256-4315

Blk 51, Payn U Industrin) Park, Ubi Avenue 1, soa-25 | S( 4oRa3)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmiot
Sent: Friday, 23 March 2018 3:10 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTSELKKAUTO.COM
Ce: EWSMDTGHELMMS@MSFIREHZAPTI'AL.CUM-SG: MAYCHUAGMSFIRST CAPITAL COMSG

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D 18002238MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team
Claim Workflow System



Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel ; 6307 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
; WWW.avg.com



