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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CS/ASM18005475/T1td3

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01

AXATOWERSINGAPORE 068811 Date: 23-03-2018

N

Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- OWN DAMAGE
Insured Veh. Veh. Inspected SJY 2240K
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. S8M0O0BMY Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From SMARTCLAIM (YVONNE ANG) Assign Date 23/03/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3: Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5 General Information
Accident Date  22/03/2018 Inspection Date 23/03/2018
Survey held at SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD
BLK 3, PIONEER ROAD NORTH, #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457.
5a, Remarks
A)THE MARKET VALUE IS S$--——-———(EST. AVERAGE)
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




3/23/2018

’

Service Request Details
Claim
S8MO0BMY

Reference

None &*

Loss Date
March 22, 2018

Request Date
March 22, 2018

Due Date
June 23, 2018

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD)

Type of Loss
Own Damage

Services
Accelerated workshop survey
Actions

Next Step
Finish the work

Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD) =

Menu

Complete Work

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SJY2240K

Make
FORD

htlps:ﬁvp.smaﬂclairns.axa.oom.sg!claim-ponalfhtmIﬁndax-vendor-sarvice-requests.htmI#fsarvice-requastaf?servioaRequestNurnhar=36260



3/23/2018

Claim Portal

SErvice Aaaress

Blk 3 Pioneer Road North, , , 628457

Primary Contact/Insured

GUO JIANHAO
05-723, 305B Punggol Road, 822305, Singapore

anthonyguojianhao@gmail.com

Claim Handler

ANG Yvonne
6568804461
yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
EXCESS 0 PENDING EST & DL WORKSHOP : SNG AH TEE

Menu

Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Notes
New Message
TYPE (7]
SENT 3/22/18 5:05 PM
FROM ANG Yvonne
SUBJECT PENDING INVESTIGATION
BODY We are conducting investigation. fyi
2N

https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/html/index-vendor-service-requests.htmi#/service-requests/?serviceRequestNumber=36260



' Denise Tay (LKKAuto) _

From: ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 6 April 2018 7:03 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: SJY2240K S8MO0BMY GUO JIANHAO
Attachments: 2240.pdf

Hi Denise

Can you assist to comment any mechanical issue when upon survey the vehicle ?

Regards

Yvonne Ang
Assistant Manager
Motor (Property) Claims

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email: yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg
DID: 1800 880 4888

redefining /insurance

AX~Ns Values at Work:

Customer i ONE
9 First @lntegnty QCuuragai AXA

Please consider the environment before printing this email
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient of the message. please notify the sender immediately.

---—-Disclaimer-----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.



. Bf_é!';ise Tay (LKKAuto)

To: ANG Yvonne
Subject: RE: SJY2240K SBMO0OBMY GUO JIANHAO

Dear Yvonne,

According to our surveyor, there was no mechanical issue upon the survey

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: ANG Yvonne [mailto:yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 11 April 2018 9:49 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SJY2240K SSMO0OBMY GUO JIANHAO

Hi Denise
Any update ?

Thanks

Yvonne Ang
Assistant Manager
Motor (Property) Claims

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email: yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg
DID: 1800 880 4888

redefining /insurance

AXAs Values at Work:

Cuslomer ONE
First Integrity °Courage AXA

Please consider the environment before printing this email
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.




4/3/2018 Claim Portal

S€rvice Aaaress

Blk 3 Pioneer Road North, , , 628457

Primary Contact/Insured

GUO JIANHAO
05-723, 305B Punggol Road, 822305, Singapore

anthonyguojianhao@gmail.com

Claim Handler

ANG Yvonne
6568804461
yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
EXCESS 0 PENDING EST & DL WORKSHOP : SNG AH TEE

Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Notes
TYPE o
SENT 4/3/18 2:45 PM
FROM ANG Yvonne
SUBJECT Authorized
BODY Please proceed to authorize repair

BN

TYPE ©
SENT 3/27/18 11:00 AM
FROM LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD)

https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/html/index-vendor-service-requests.htmi#/service-requests/?serviceRequestNumber=36260



51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: SSMOOBMY

Our Ref: CS/ASM18005475/T1td3 Date: 27/3/2018
The Motor Claims Department

M/s AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO SJY 2240K

We thank you for the instruction on 22/3/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 23/3/2018 at the premises of M/s Sng Ah Tee and have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount : S$ __6.342.00

Revised Estimate Amount : S$__ 3.551.00
“Check” Items Amount : S$§ _2.391.00
Total : S$. 5.942.00
Market Value : S§ _26.000.00
LTA Reimbursement Value : S$ _14.551.00
Nett Value : S$ 11.449.00

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
Front O/S. uncarriage portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Repair cost economical

We have not authorize repair

Repair Days: 3

Yours Faithfully,
Taufikh

Automotive Assessor



51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: SSMO0BMY

Our Ref: CS/ASM18005475/T1td3 Date: 26/3/2018
The Motor Claims Department

M/s AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO SJY 2240K

We thank vou for the instruction on 22/3/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 23/03/2018 at the premises of M/s Sng Ah Tee and have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount : S$ __1.796.00(Labour only)

Revised Estimate Amount : S$__ 1.096.00
“Check” Items Amount . S§ 300.00
Total ' : S8, 1.396.00
Market Value : S$ _26.000.00
LTA Reimbursement Value : S$ _14.551.00
Nett Value : S§  11.449.00

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
Front portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Pending part price

Repair Days: 6

Yours Faithfully,
Taufikh

Automotive Assessor



'PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION _ID=F03...

Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Mar 2018

OK

Singapore NRIC
64082

SJY2240K

No

31Mar 2018

FORD

FIESTATREND 1.4L (A) 5-DOOR
Red

2010

AUB2284
WFOJXXGAJJAUB2284
71.0kW (95 bhp)
$12,635.00

12 Aug 2010

12 Aug 2010

0

$12,635.00

Yes
11 Aug 2020
$7.581.00

11 Aug 2020

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$29,501.00

$6,970.00

$14,551.00

Page 1 of 1
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M redefining /insurance

LETTE NDERTA AUTHO MP SUM REPAIR

1. 1, [Name] [NRIC] cue dian flao the owner/

authorized driver of vehicle [Registration No.] _S522440§ Z ("Vehicle") do hereby
authorize the [Workshop/Insurer] to repair the Vehicle on a lump sum basis instead of part
by part.

2. The [Workshop/Insurer] has explained to me the difference between lump sum repair and
part by part repair and the consequences of my authorization for lump sum repair for the
Vehicle.

3. | understand that with lump sum repair, the Workshop may use a mixture of genuine parts,
original equipment manufacturer (OEM) parts, reconditioned and second hand parts to
carry out the repair and | note that the [Workshop/Insurer] will not be furnishing a detailed
breakdown of parts or price for such lump sum repair.

4. | am aware that AXA Insurance Pte Ltd ("AXA Insurance”) does not encourage lump sum
repair as AXA Insurance strongly recommends repairs for vehicles on a part by part basis
for transparency reasons. | confirm that | will hold AXA Insurance harmless from any claims
arising from the lump sum repair of the Vehicle which | have authorized.

5. *To be applicable where person authorizing is the authorized dniver.

| confirm that | have the authority from the owner of the Vehicle to authorize the lump sum
repairs and that | have duly notified the owner of the Vehicle of the contents of this Letter
of Authorization.

Signed and acknowledged by:

Signature of policyholder/ authorized driver* and company stamp (where applicable)
Date:

W (7. G At TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD
BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18
SINGAPORE 628457
Name and signature of workshop posdRneritaIfan g EHéRdp stamp
Date: 0?' MY
*authorized driver to either the named drivers as per motor insurance policy or in the case of commercial
vehicles, permitted drivers who are permitted to drive the insured Vehicle.




« MSAT1B03867T / Sng Ah Tea Motor & Pansl Sernce Fia Lid - Pionesar
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 22/0372018 14:11

- SUBMITTED BY: JOYCE TAN LAl CHIN

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/ar the Authorised Driver.

3, Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresantation or witholding of matarial facts may allow insurance companies to

repudiate policy ability

oW b

. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an agmission of policy liability an the part of the insurance companies.
- Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.
. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for

archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made avallable upon applicalion by interested parties
7. By the lodgement of this report o the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available

aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

22/03/2018 14:11

22/03/2018 08:00

ALONG PENG KANG AVE SAFTI MILITARTY INSTITUTE
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own Insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

SJY2240K

GUO JIANHAO

S8326408Z
ANTHONYGUOJIANHAC@GMAIL.COM
(LOCAL) +65-98302788
OFFICE-NOPHONE

FORD
FIESTA-1.4

PRIVATE CAR

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

GA117510

GUO JIANHAO

S8326408Z

27/08/1983

OUTDOOR

07/05/2007

10 YEARS AND 10 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-98302788

OFFICE-NOPHONE
ANTHONYGUOJIANHAO@GMAIL.COM

Page 1 of 19



.

Address

Postcode

~ Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?
Number of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?
If Yes Please state which Police Station

Police Station Name
Police Station Address

Police Station Contact

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?

If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO POLICE REPORT J/20180322/7014
Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?

Was there any audio recorded?

BLK 305B PUNGGOL RD
#05-723

822305
NO
OWNER

COLLIDED INTO PEDESTRIAN
CLEAR
DRY

NO

YES
YES
NC

NO

YES

JURONG WEST NEIGHBOURHOOD POLICE CENTRE

ROAD: 700 CORPCRATION ROAD , POSTCODE: 649818 , COUNTRY:
SINGAPORE

TEL NO: 1800-2689999 - FAX NO: 62672438
NO

YES
NO
NO

DETAILS OF INJURED PERSON 1

Name

Approximate Age

Injuries Sustain

Injured person in which vehicle?
Were seat belts worn?

Was this injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Address
Postcode

CHOO PING CHERN

YES

Page 2 of 19



' Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material
facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy liabifity.

4. Theissue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy lizbility on the part of the insurance
companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Association of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for 2 fee be made available upon application by

interested parties.

7. 8y the ladgment of this repart to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of
the report being made available aforesaid.

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)

| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

(a) My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore [“GIA") may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set out in this {form] and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (collectively the "Personal Infermation”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal information to all insurer({s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident {all insurer(s) who have insured
vehicle(s) involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority {such as the police), for the purpose(s)
of :

(i) processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
Investigations relating to the claims;

{ii) Investigating the accident and/or my claims;
(iiil} carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

{iv) administering my claims (Including the malling of correspondence, statements, Invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could involve disclosura of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as an the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

{v) complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.{collectively the
“Purposes”)

{b) all insurar{s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

{c) my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agents{including thelr lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapcre, for one or more of the above Purposes.

{d) my Persanal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
Investigation and management in present and all future claims.

(e) theinformation so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

{i) toallinsurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

{ii) for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

Policyholder's Signature Driver's Signature Reporting Centre PErsonnel's Signature
Date & Time: (If driver is not the policyholder) Name;
Date & Time: MNRIC/FIN No.:

1AM AWARED THAT MY RISURER MAY HAVE A 14 DAY S TRIEFRAM E FOR ME TO SUSMIT AN OWN DAMAGE CLAIM UNDER MY W FOLICY. IWILL
CHECK MY POLICY FOR MORE DETAILS.

Page 3 of 18



POLICE REPORT Pg. 1

SINGAPORE
POLICE FORCE

POLICE REPORT (NP298)
Police Station Of Origin

Jurong Police Divisional HQ
% Jurong West Avenue 5 SINGAPORE
2

4948
Tel No:1800-7810000

A G

/20180322/7074

1of2

Report No. J/20180322/7014

Date/Time Report Made Vide Report No. Station Diary No.
22/03/2018 13:36
Name Of Informant \Address

GUO JIANHAO APT BLK 3058 PUNGGOL ROAD #05-723 SINGAPORE
822305
ID Type /1D No. Contact No.
NRIC NO / 583264082 Home/Office: Mobile:
98302788
Mationality Email Address
SINGAPORE CITIZEN .anthonyquojianhao@amail.com
Occupation Sex Age Date of Bith  |Race
OFFICER Male ‘34 27/08/1983  |Chinese
Institution/School Name Language
English

Date/Time Of Incident
22/03/2018 08:00

Location Of Incident

SINGAPORE 638364

500 PENG KANG AVENUE SAFTI MILITARY INSTITUTE

Brief details.

While driving along Peng Kang Ave towards GKSCSC near Brani Ave section, | dropped my camp pass
in the car and while trying to retrieve it, knocked onto the victim (MR Choo Ping Chem, S7933727G) who

was walking along the side of the road.

| got out of my vehicle and checked on the status of the victim. The victim was conscious and there was
some laceration on the back of his head at the point of time. Passerbys also called for ambulance and

Signature Of Officer Recording The Report:
Not applicable

Signature Of Informant:

The identity of the person making this
report has been authenticated by
SingPass. No signature is required.

Signature Of Interpreter.
Not applicable

Date/Time:
22/03/2018 13:36

Officer In-Charge Of Case:

Classification Of Case:

Authentication Stamp

Page 5of 19



B ERAEZEIRIFIANANTFR DT
SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD

Blk 3, Pioneer Road North, #01-18 Singapore 628457
Tel: 6268 6183 (4 Lines) Fax: 6268 1429
Email: sngahtee@singnet.com.sg

Website: www.sngahtee.com
RCB. Reg. / GST Reg. No: 200810440N

Our Ref: 38M00BMY
Date : 23/3/2018

ATTN:THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
8 SHENTON WAY
AXA TOWER #B1-01
SINGAPORE 068811
ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR
Vehicle Reg No. SJY2240K Model / Year FORD FIESTA 2010
Date of Accident 22-Mar-18 Policy No. GA117510
Type of Claim OD AXA Prepared By JOYCE
Survey By Chassis No. WF0JXXGAJJAUB2284

S/INO Description Qty Cost Price Amount

FRT BUMPER A
FRT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH /
FRT BUMPER CLIP M
FRT HEADLAMP(LH) oA~
FRT BONNET 7] ~ A
FRT BONNET INSULATOR ' 1
FRT BONNET INSULATOR CLIP
FRT BONNET RUBBER SEAL -
FRT WIPER GARNISH -
FRT WINDSCREEN Ot P
FRT WINDSCREEN MOULDING SET #°
FRT WIPER BLADE(LH) %
FRT WINDSCREEN SIDE GARNISH( )oJf
FRT TYRE (LH)(196{‘50§15) fwk-‘l;lH ~
FRTRIM(LH) oo
FRT SHOCKABSORBER(LH)
FRT KNUCKLE ARM(LH) 1
FRT LOWER ARM(LH) A
FRT WHEEL HUB(LH)
_FRT WHEEL BEARING(LH)
™ Wt~ piler (W) Y
21  FRT WINDSCREEN SEALy;r n
22 ERP BRACKET Py

TO REPAIR & REPLACE UNDERCARRIAGE

TO CHECK WIRING

TO KNOCK,WELD,REMOVE & FIX ABOVE PARTS
TO PUTTY & RESPRAY PAINTING ON FRT BUMPER
FRT BONNET ,FRT FENDER(LH)

_m_n_l._n_.n_l_t_n_t_n_n_l.m_s_n_l_ns_\_h
O NN AR OOON O AONH O NN
i

— e el e e e el b el
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40.00 S/N

26.00 SIN,;, L.JL°

300.00 (5= ~ [
30.00

700.00 S°Z
70000 S$=v.

$ 40.00
$ 26.00

- =2
ey A en

TOTAL 1,796.00

$
LKK Auto Consuliants hence notly T ARV
the Repainw Bowang: )Nﬁ““"’\
-kmmnm W

o To display damaged pari{s) during resurvey . .
o Parts prices are subject fo confirmasion ey -‘F' ke q_g(ufse :

® Third party survey is on a “Withoul Prejutice” basis ("fr"- e
* No illagal modification(s) is allowed M“B fﬂﬂt
* Supplementary item(s) mus! be resurveyed and @%

&8 subject 1o final approval from Insurance Company S
Acknowledged by Reparrer A }Q o
Signatue: @ [l e

Dete:




HERAERIFFRRANFTRE T
SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD" -

Blk 3, Pioneer Road North, #01-18 Singapore 628457
Tel: 6268 6183 (4 Lines) Fax: 6268 1429
Email: sngahtee@singnet.com.sg
Website: www.sngahtee.com
RCB. Reg. / GST Reg. No: 200810440N

Our Ref: S8MODBMY

Date 23/3/2018
ATTN:THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
8 SHENTON WAY
AXA TOWER #B1-01
SINGAPORE 068811
ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR
Vehicle Reg No. SJY2240K Mode! / Year FORD FIESTA 2010
Date of Accident 22-Mar-18 Policy No. GA117510
Type of Claim OD AXA Prepared By JOYCE
Survey By Chassis No. WF0JXXGAJJAUB2284
S/INO Description Qty Cost Price Amount
1  FRTBUMPER 1§ 50000 $§ 500.00 Qe
2 FRT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH 7, 1 $ - v
3 FRT BUMPER CLIP .~ 10 § 650 $ 65.00-"
4 FRT HEADLAMP(LH) ~ 1 $ 32000 $ 32000 T
5 FRT BONNET - 1 $ 45000 $  450.00 S %o
6 FRT BONNET INSULATOR 7. 1 $ 10500 $§ 105.00 « 1"
7 FRT BONNET INSULATOR CLIp - 10 $ 250 $ 25.00 1"
8 FRT BONNET RUBBER SEAL - 2 3 38.00 $ 7600 147
9 FRT WIPER GARNISH T. 1§ 24000 $ 24000 *" ;
10 FRT WINDSCREEN 1 $§ 950.00 $§  950.00 !
11 FRT WINDSCREEN MOULDING SET” 1 $ -
12 FRT WIPER BLADE(LH) 1 9 50.00 $ 50.00 A
13 FRT WINDSCREEN SIDE GARNISH(LH)~ 1 $ 12000 $§  120.00
(OUTER MOULDING) —
14 FRT TYRE (LH)(196/50R15) 1 $ 20000 $ 20000 SN FM d
15 FRT RIM(LH) % 1 $ 28000 $ 28000 SIN et
16 FRT SHOCKABSORBER(LH) ” 1 $ 25000 $  250.00
17 FRT KNUCKLE ARM(LH) , ? 1§ 40000 § 40000 [ .
18 FRT LOWER ARM(LH) 1§ 22000 $§  220.00 2
19  FRT WHEEL HUB(LH) 1 $§ 16500 $  165.00
20 FRT WHEEL BEARING(LH) 1 $ 13000 S  130.00 .
$ 4,546.00
21 FRT WINDSCREEN SEALANT<” $ 4000 § 40.00 SN h
22 ERPBRACKET d 1§ 2600 S 2600 SIN o ¥
TO REPAIR & REPLACE UNDERCARRIAGE $  300.00 (%0 o{wn-
TO CHECK WIRING $ 3000
TO KNOCK,WELD,REMOVE & FIX ABOVE PARTS $  700.00 STO -
TO PUTTY & RESPRAY PAINTING ON FRT BUMPER $  700.00 GOV
FRT BONNET,FRT FENDER(LH)
TOTAL $ 6,342.00



R E L EIRIE R A KPR D T
SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD

Blk 3, Pioneer Road North, #01-18 Singapore 628457
Tel: 6268 6183 (4 Lines) Fax: 6268 1429
Email: sngahtee@singnet.com.sg .

Website: www.sngahtee.com
RCB. Reg. / GST Reg. No: 200810440N

Our Ref, S8MO0OBMY
Date :  23/3/2018
ATTN:THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

8 SHENTON WAY
AXA TOWER #B1-01
SINGAPORE 068811
ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR
Vehicle Reg No. SJY2240K Model / Year FORD FIESTA 2010
Date of Accident 22-Mar-18 Policy No. GA117510
Type of Claim OD AXA Prepared By JOYCE
Survey By Chassis No. WF0JXXGAJJAU82284
S/NO Description Qty Cost Price Amount
1 FRT BUMPER 1 § 50000 $ 50000 c
2 FRT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH 1 $ - nn
3 FRT BUMPER CLIP 10 §$ 650 § 65.00~" Nél
4 FRT HEADLAMP(LH) 1§ 32000 $§ 32000 cyu!
5 FRT BONNET 1§ 45000 §  450.000/p4
6 FRT BONNET INSULATOR 1 8§ 10500 $§ 105.00X
7 FRT BONNET INSULATOR CLIP 10 § 250 $ 25.00X n1
8 FRT BONNET RUBBER SEAL 2§ 38.00 $ 76.00% 1N
9 FRT WIPER GARNISH 1§ 24000 $  240.00X A1
10 FRT WINDSCREEN 1 8§ 95000 $ 95000 (ul
11 FRT WINDSCREEN MOULDING SET 1 $ - Vo wlwindson Zut
12 FRT WIPER BLADE(LH) 1 8 50.00 $ 50.00" (ud ]
13 FRT WINDSCREEN SIDE GARNISH(LH) 1 8§ 12000 $  120.00 ) (wir) ¥
(OUTER MOULDING) 9
14 FRT TYRE (LH)(196/50R15) 1§ 20000 $§ 20000 SINY ptead
15 FRT RIM(LH) 1§ 28000 S 28000 SNV (ui
16 FRT SHOCKABSORBER(LH) 1§ 25000 $  250.00X
17 FRT KNUCKLE ARM(LH) 1 $ 40000 $  400.00
18 FRT LOWER ARM(LH) 1§ 22000 $§ 22000 A
19 FRT WHEEL HUB(LH) 1 § 16500 $  165.00¥
20 FRT WHEEL BEARING(LH) 1 § 13000 $ 130.00¥% o
S 454600 PATy $NGOF Guktise]
21 FRT WINDSCREEN SEALANT 1 $ 4000 § 40.00 SINy, vt
22 ERPBRACKET 1 § 2600 $ 26.00 SNy YL
TO REPAIR & REPLACE UNDERCARRIAGE $  300.0041507 v
TO CHECK WIRING S 30.00v
TO KNOCK,WELD,REMOVE & FIX ABOVE PARTS $  700.00 i}
TO PUTTY & RESPRAY PAINTING ON FRT BUMPER $  700.00 il
FRT BONNET, FRT FENDER(LH) by ,; ol
TOTAL $ 6,342.00
g ol 410
%F{W\"?N‘ (¢ 7‘07, 7% F 34 *.{lu,.. -
 Lhrad B "3 ok Sl P
@ M Ml@vlml #gﬂ’]’ QN ALt 6}"7“‘ W! -



Email: sngahtee@singnet.com.sg

Website: Www.sngahtee.com
RCB. Reg. / GST Reg. No: 200810440N

Our Ref: 58M00BMY
Date : 23/3/2018

ATTN:THE MOTOR cLAIMS DEPT

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD

8 SHENTON WAY

AXA TOWER #B1-01

SINGAPORE 068811

ESTIMATE cosT OF REPAIR

Vehicle Reg No, SJY2240K Model / Year [FORD FIESTA 2010

Date of Accident 22-Mar-18 Policy No. GA117510

Type of Claim OD AXA Prepared By JOYCE

Survey By Chassis No. WFOJXXGAJJAUB2284

S/NO Description Qty Cost Price Amount

FRT BUMPER Ao—" 1
FRT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH 7 1
FRT BUMPER CLIP wil” 10
FRT HEADLAMP(LH) 5.4,

FRT BONNET |y .- a

FRT BONNET INSULATOR < 1

FRT BONNET INSULATOR CL{{’

FRT BONNET RUBBER SEAL

FRT WIPER GARNISH ¢ »

10 FRT WINDSCREEN ou 7
11 FRT WINDSCREEN Mouugir}s SET ¥

12 FRT WIPER BLADE(LH) 7
13 FRT WINDSCREEN Sipg GARNISH(LH) ot -t (UU'I?;&,,E} )
14 FRT TYRE (LH)ugefsoys) W =4 mou

5 FRTRIM(LH) ~ .. A

cooowmm-h-mm—n

1
16 FRT SHOCKABSORBER(LH 1
17 FRT KNUCKLE ARM(LH) 9 1
18 FRT LOWER ARM(LH) A 1
19 FRT WHEEL HUB(LH) 1
20 FRT WHEEL BEARING(LH) 1
T windsores~ piye, W) oy o
21 FRT WINDSCREEN SEALANT A&
22 ERP BRACKET e 1 8§ 2600
TO REPAIR & REPLACE UNDERCARRIAGE
TO CHECK WIRING 30.00 «
TO KNOCK WELD,REMOVE & FIX ABOVE PARTS 700.00 Seo
TO PUTTY & RESPRAY PAINTING ON FRT BUMPER § 70000 $eo.
FRT BONNET FRT FENDER(LH)

$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$ .
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
¥
$

40.00 SN

26.00 S/N
7
300.00 (5= FL“"LO

N s oen

TOTAL $ 1.??6.00
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