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y iy LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e - 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 198607158R GST Reg. Mo, 15-9607128-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationala Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref . CS/EGI18005465/Uvd3

s SR ToWER LRI
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 23-03-2018
SINGAPORE 0383985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBE 6781P Veh. Inspected SKG 86850
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. GBE 6781P/RH/pl Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From  YEEPEILI Assign Date 23/03/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer = Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  20/03/2018 Inspection Date

Survey held at BLUWEL AUTOMOTIVE SERVICE PTELTD

BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#01-28/51/53/55(MAIN OFFICE)
SINGAPORE 417883

5a. Remarks

L)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BYIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,




Consuliants

! I’/’!"f Auto

dm = = Pto L Company Reglatration Mo 186071988
51 UBLAVE 1. #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTREAL PARK, SINGAPORE J08933 TEL : (065} 62563361 FAX (M8} H2EHA315
Your Ref: GBE6T81P/RH/p!

Our Ref: CS/EGL18005465/Uvd3 Date: 12/4/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s: ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Without Prejudice

Dear SirfMadam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SKG 885D

We thank you for your instruction on 22/3/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
3472018 at the premises of M/s BLUWEL AUTOMOTIVE SERVICE PTE LTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amounl 1 5515,886.00

Revised Estimate Amount : §%8,000.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check” Items Amount : 58

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 8%

Nett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
rear and front portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 April 2018 9:23 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)

Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: GBE6T81P / TP : SKG8685D/LKK / DOA: 20/03/2018
Attachments: SKG 8685D PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Pei1 Li,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKG 8685D
Date of survey: 3/4/2018
Number of days:6 days

Best Regards,

veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 April 2018 2:30 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GBEG781P /TP : SKG8685D/LKK / DOA : 20/03/2018

Dear Pei Li,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKG 86850 on 3/4/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Vferon Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Thursday, 22 March 2018 5:28 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=
Subject: RE: GBEG781P / TP : SKGE685D/LKK / DOA : 20/03/2018

1



Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignme nts@@lkkauto.com | fax: 62536-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) EmaiIto:Suwev.ﬁegurt@ergu,mm.sg]
sent: Thursday, 22 March 2018 4:57 PM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Ol : GBEG781P / TP : SKGB685D/LKK / DOA : 20/03/2018

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD -
CHUA KANG SENG to be the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from M NEDUMARAN & CO,
ADDRESS . BLUWEL AUTOMOTIVE SERVICE PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#01-55 BLK C AUTOBAY@KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
PERSON TO CONTACT : SALLY @ 6745 2088
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : ROHAINI
Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third party
vehicle that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your

office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the
survey status via Survey.Report @ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured's and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).
Kindly acknowledged receipt of this email.

Thank youl

Yee Pei Li

Claims Assistant (Motar)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid

5 Temasek Boulevard

#04-01 Suntec Tower Five

Singapore 038985

Tel: 65 6529 5100 DID; 65 6829 9194
Wiehsile: waww ergo.com.sg



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LEKAUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 April 2018 2:30 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: GBEG781P / TP : SKGB685D/LKK / DOA : 20/03/2018
Dear Pei Li,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKG 8685D on 3/4/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 March 2018 5:28 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GBEG781P / TP : SKG8685D/LKK / DOA : 20/03/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6841-1972 | email; gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 22 March 2018 4:57 PM

To: 'admin-d @lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com:>

Subject: Ol : GBE6781P / TP : SKG8685D/LKK / DOA : 20/03/2018

Dear Catherine,



In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD -
CHUA KANG SENG to be the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from M NEDUMARAN & CO,

ADDRESS :  BLUWEL AUTOMOTIVE SERVICE PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#01-55 BLK C AUTOBAY@KAKI BUKIT

SINGAPORE 417883
PERSON TO CONTACT 1 SALLY @ 6745 2088
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE ~ : ROHAINI

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third party
vehicle that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your
office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the
survey status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured's and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).
Kindly acknowledged receipt of this email.

Thank you

Yee Pei Li

Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid

5 Temasek Boulevard

#04-01 Suntec Tower Five

Singapore 038985

Tel - 65 6B29 0100 DID: 65 6829 9194
Website: www, ergo.com.sq

ERGOC is one of the maijor insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries
and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 March 2018 4:57 PM

To: ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’

Subject: Ol : GBEGTB1P / TP : SKGBBESD/LKK / DDA : 20/03/2018

Attachments: GBEG781P - SAS.pdf; SKG8685D - SAS.pdf; SKGBEESD - PRI NOTICE. pdf; SKGE6E5D

- PRS FORM.pdf

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD -
CHUA KANG SENG to be the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from M NEDUMARAN & CO

ADDRESS : BLUWEL AUTOMOTIVE SERVICE PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#01-55 BLK C AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883

PERSON TO CONTACT ¢ SALLY @ 6745 2088
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : ROHAINI

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third party
vehicle that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your
office directly. Please do keep us in the loap.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the
survey status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured's and TP's 5AS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).
Kindly acknowledged receipt of this email.

Thank you

Yee Pei Li

Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard

#04-01 Suntec Tower Five

Singapore 038985

Tel.: 65 6829 9199 DID: 65 6829 9194
Website: www.ergo.com.sg

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Gaermany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries
and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers



22-03=18;:15:62 iFrom: EAGD Imsurance Fte, Ltd, To!@65008482 i88288247 = 1.7

ERGO

Data: 22.03.2018 Sent via Fax 500 sgs
Our Reference:  GBE 6781F/RH/pl .
Your Reference; MN/IG/B1/1812296/ST

Emall

serenetan@mneduco.com.sg

To: M NEDUMARAN & CO

Pre-Repalr Survey (PRS) Acknowledgement

Vehicle For Inspection; SKG 86850
Insured's Vehlcle: GBE 6721P
Date Of Accldent: 20.03.2018

We acknowladge receipt of your request far PRS on: 3a0.01.2018

In compllance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.l of 2016", do select an assessar from

the Est below and Indicate your selection in the box marked *. W w&&:ﬂ“ :Eul. ante Ph Ud )

Al Automobile Inspection Services Ple Lid LBs L.B.S Auto Consultanls PMe Lid
FTa FormTeam Consultancy Ple Ld LK LEK Auto Consullants Me Lid
A5 Infiniti Appraisal Service Ps Priority Services

IPK IP Knlghts Ple Lid VAL Vicom Ltd

v Your request for inspection does not have your elienl's cost of repal estimate, kindly forward a COPY.

Your request for inspection does not have your clienl's incomplele G repon, kindly farward a copy.

We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & rever saon upan recelpt of estimate,

Our Insured's driver has not reported the accident Lo us todate,

V_Jothers  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE - Diay c13ak had Sel poke A My Cwnd KONG Send P LEE huto
Consubtont as & SE - Howower we have been mshucked £ dook Wit e tloim - Our Qient
aundfov W workshep will wet be kean o o irent stlewiont -
Prepared by: ai E:I b Pei LE G829 5194 clalms@ergo.com.sg
Signature: P FAX: 6829 9247
Assessor use onhy: Workshop use on 3
Ssresyor attended werkshop on;
Aszignimenl Dale: Date:
Aszignment Time: _ Time
Inspector;
Remarks: D Vehlcla not avallable at the appointed date and tme.

Kindly acknowledge our Assassor prasence for the abova Job .

Workshop Acknowledgement & Stamp,
Note: Qur Inspection Is on a without admizslen to lioblity basls.




22-03-18;10:35 ;IWC 165098482 ¥ 1

M NEDUMARAN & CO Advocates & Solicitors

Commissioner for Oaths

UEN NO. 53181067D

Please reply to our Branch Office for this matier

Nedumaran Muthukrishnan = Branch Office: 11 Sin Ming Road
LLB (hons) [Buckingham] #B2-09 (Unit 2) Thomson V Two
Barrister at Law (Lincoln’s Inn) ) Singapore 575629

Tel : 6509-8480 / 6509-848]
Fax ! 6509-8482

Email ; iggge.lim@mnaducg‘;gm.ﬁg
serene tan@mn educo.com.sp

Cur Reference MNAG/B1/1812296/st
YourReference :  GBEG781P

Date  : 22 March 2018

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD BY FAX 6829-9247 ONLY
5 Temasek Boulevard

#04-01 Suntec Tower Five

Singapore 038985

Dear Sirs,

1. NOTICE OF ACCIDENT TO INSURERS AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS PURSUANT TO

PARAGRAPH 2 OF THE STATE COURTS PRACTICE DIRECTIONS (AMENDMENT NO. 1 OF 2018)

2, ACCIDENT ON 20/03/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS, SKG 8685D, GBE 6781P & SHC 4303A ALONG ANG MO KIQ
AVENUE 3,

We are Instructed by LIOW HOCK KENG (owner of motor vehicle no, SKG 8685D) and/or BLUWEL AUTOMOTIVE SERVICE PTE
LTD (the motor workshop for SKG 86850) to notify you of & road traffic accident on 20/03/2018 at about 1720 hours along ANG MO
KIQ AVE 3 Involving our client's vehicle registration number [ SKG 8685D ) and [ GBE 6781F ] driven by you at the material time, A
copy of the Singapore accident statement/irafic police report flled is enclosed.

As @ result of the accident, our cllent's vehlcle has been damaged. Befora we proceed to repair the damaged vehicle, please lat us
know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or your Insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of
the vehicle. If we do not racaive any reply from you with the slipulated timeline, we shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further
referenca to you.

Yours faithfully,

NEDUMARAN & CO - (Branch Office)
Encl
¢.c.1) DRCEngineering Ple Ltd (Vehicle : GBE6781P )

2) NAME OF WORKSHOP !
Eluwel Automotive Servise Ple Ltd (Vehicle : SKG 86850 )
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
#01-55 Blk C AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Telephone ; 6745-2088 {Attention : Ms Sally )



Used Peugeot 508 Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart Page 1 of 2

sGCARMART.COM Login  Sign up
MNew Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources
] - G|
- 1 it
-
3 Now 5 3 1 5 1. (o i
Post an Advertisement ow 5 Year Coe Renewal Toyota Altis 1.6A J | Think O A e =
Sell it yourself| Advertise it at just . g & Munith =
%58 until it's SOLD! g
L]
- M
|
Birowse by Category | Sort by Date Posted v 20 resultsfpage | v|
5 vehicles Pewgent 508 tivanced Search ) Submit 1
ke Migssel Price Depreciation eqg Dt Eng Cap Mileage eh Type
Search Selection Peugeot SO8 : 2012 Y ] available
Peugeot 508 SW 1.6A Turbo 550, 800 £10,320 fyr 02-Jul-2012 1,598 cc 76,000 krm Stationwagon Avaliable
- Allure Plus
100% Qualiy B! With Full Service Record. Stylish Interior. Peace Of Mind With An Optional 1 Or 2 Years Warranty, Available In Showrgorn For —
Wiewing Now. [ P o
L M ] Peage 8 = 0 i
Peugeot 508 1.6A Turbo £58,000 49,930 fyr 18-0ct-2012 1,598 ¢ 80,100 km Liury Avallable
Active

Elegant White, Ome Cwreer Onby, Powerful Drive, High Paper fiebate Value "$49400%, Low Mieage Done, Very Well Maintained, Drive Away With
Minimum Daown Payment, Flexible [n-house Loan Packages Available...

Prirme Maolir B Leasing

Pocted: W-Mar-2008  Tags: 2012 Pewgeot 508, Peugeot 504, P

Peugeot S08 1.6A Turbo £50,151 5,690 fyr 3-Jan-2012 1,598 cc 99, 799 kin Lupsury Available
Active

Just Arrived! Vary Well Maintained By Ex Owner, 1 Year Extanded Warranty, High Loan With High Trade In Available, Price Negatiable. Call Now Cr
Wil Our Showraom Today!

Dash Car
ar- 2016 i Pe 5 e
Peugeot 508 1.6A Turbo Allure  $52,800 59,590 fyr 22-Feb-2012 1,598 cc 109,818 km Lussury Availabla
- Plus
Exclusive 1 Year Warranty & Free 3 Servicing Is Given To Our Value Customers At Our Very Own Workshop (VERMOGEN ALTO). The Peugeot 508
Actually Has A Corventional Design That Attracts Rather Than Ale..,
Peugeot 508 SW 1.6A Allure $62,000 10,500 fyr 14-Sep-2012 1,598 e BB, 700 km SlaTinwWanoen Available
Plus
1 Owner,Full Agent Maintained With Low Mileage Done At LETO0KM Yearly, High COE, Accident Free Free 1 Year QBE Extended Warranty, Lowest Dep
In The Market, Tha Style And Comfort OF A Powerfid Continen... ECTTOE
Smy Autn Trading
b 4 ": _'--i'- vy AT Peugest SAGS,
Giwd this search critéria, 1o gt email alerts whenever a match s found
Make Model Price Depreciation Reg Date Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type Cratus
For oibadantisements, view Expired ads |20 | results/page

htp://www.sgearmart.com/used_cars/listing.php IRGD=2012&MOD=Peugeot 508&RPG=20&VEH=0... ~ 03-Apr-18



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Page 1 of |

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Singapore MRIC
8057F

SKG8685D
Mo

03 Apr 2018
PEUGEOT

508 STATION WAGON 1.6 ALLURE PLUS
HID

Brown

2012

10FJIBX1496553
VF38E5FVACL037810
115.0 kW (154 bhp)
$31,553.00

17 Oct 2012

17 Oct 2012

1

$31,553.00 1¢1 16

Yes
16 Oct 2022
$22,087.00

16 Oct 2022

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$63,000.00

$28,570.00

$50,657.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 03 Apr 2018

OK

I1tlps:.-'.-"rrl.lta.gm'.5g.-"hu;'!.'rI-"ar:timle'cnquire[{ehuu:H}'I’uhliuBcfm'eDr:rcg]npul‘?Fl.’-NL’"l’l(]N ID=F030... 03-Apr-18



BLUWEL AUTOMOTIVE SERVICE PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AUENUE 6

#01-53/55
SINGAPORE 417883
VEHCILE NO:SKG 8685D
aTy PARTICULAR
1PCS REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING
1PCS TAILGATE
1PCS TAILGATE REAR LOGO
1PCS TAILGATE PEUGEOT EMBLEM
1PCS TAILGATE '508SW' EMBLEM
1PCS TAILGATE REFLECTOR N/S
1PCS TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP
1PCS TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD
1 SET TAILGATE INNER TRIM BORAD CLIPS
1PCS TAILGATE INNER LOCK
1PCS TAILGATE OUTER GARNISH
1PCS REAR BUMPER
1PCS REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT
1PCS REAR BUMPER INNER TOP RETAINER
2 PCS REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKETS @$105.00
2 PCS REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS @$65.50
2PCS REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSORS @$245.00
2 PCS TAILLAMPS @$505.00
2 PCS TAILLAMP HOUSING PANELS @$320.00
1PCS REAR END PANEL ?2,9
1PCS REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH
1PCS REAR FLOOR PANEL / 0
1PCS REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD
S.NETT
1 PCS REAR LICENSE PLATE W/HOLDER
1PCS REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT
1 PCS REAR END PANEL SEALANT
1SET REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATOR
TO CHECK WIRING

TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REVERSE SENSOR
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX SEAT,CUSHION UPHOLSTREY
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TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR EXHAUST

TO TRANSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING

LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING,CUT,WELD,STRAIGHTENED

REPLACING PARTS

TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING

TOTAL

Prejudice” basis

st be resunveyed and
reier Imsurance Company

Hapase

A4 $100.00%
$100.00 & O
$100.00 D

$1,200.00 480

$1.500.00 l?ga

$15.886.00
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ukl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapone 408933
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-0607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CS/EGHB005465/Uvd3n2
5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD M“W“““MNN
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date : 16-04-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  GBEG781P Veh. Inspected SKG 8685D
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. GBE 6781P/RH/pl Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From ¥EE PEI LI Assign Date 22/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model PEUGEOT 508 SW (A) C.C 1598
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 202
Chassis No. VF3BESFVACLO37810 Colour BLACK
Odometer 154847 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/40 R18 CONTIMNENTAL & mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/40 R18 CONTINENTAL & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/40R18 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/40 R18 CONTINENTAL & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR AND FRONT PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  20/03/2018 Inspection Date 03/04/2015
Survey held at BLUWEL AUTOMOTIVE SERVICE PTE LTD
BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#01-28/51/53/55(MAIN OFFICE)
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5hb. Estimate Days of Repair

IEETIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

6 Working Days




avinsm

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607188R GST Reg, No. 19-9607198-R Page No. 1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKG 8685D
i Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING MECESSARY 110.00 110.00
1| TAILGATE DENTED / WARPED 1,820.00 1,820.00
1| TAILGATE REAR LOGO NECESSARY 68.00 £8.00
1| TAILGATE PEUGEOT EMBLEM MECESSARY £69.00 69.00
1| TAILGATE "S0BSW"' EMBLEM MECESSARY 65.00 65.00
1| TAILGATE REFLECTOR N/S CRACKED 285.00 28500
1| TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP TWISTED 299.00 299.00
1| TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD NOT NECESSARY 322.00 -
1|SET TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1| TAILGATE INNER LOCK TWISTED/ 299.00 299.00
SHORTED
1| TAILGATE OUTER GARNISH CRACKED / £85.00 £85.00
WARPED
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED 1,465.00 1,465.00
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT DENTED 495.00 495.00
1|REAR BUMPER INNER TOP RETAINER CRACKED 185.00 185.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKETS @$105.00 BENT 210.00 210.00
2|REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS @$65.50 NOT NECESSARY 131.00 -
2|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSORS @$245.00 SHORTED 490.00 490.00
2| TAILLAMPS @$505.00 CRACKED 1,010.00 1,010.00
2| TAILLAMP HOUSING PANELS @$320.00 TO REPAIR SEE £40.00 .
LABOUR
1|REAR END PANEL DENTED 982.00 920.00
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH TWISTED 266.00 266.00
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 1,480.00
LABOUR
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD NOT NECESSARY £80.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -874.10
12,106.00 7,866.90
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR LICENSE PLATE W/HOLDER (SN) BENT 50.00 40.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 40.00

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18005465/Uvd3n2




' ’d V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e r £1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
/ré_. TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
i e Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | 8 mmp'g“ “l}
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|SET REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
350.00 130.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING 80.00 30.00
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REVERSE SENSOR. 80.00 50.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN. 150.00 120.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX SEAT,CUSHION UPHOLSTERY. 120.00 80.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY 100.00 .
TO TRANSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM 100.00 80.00
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING. 100.00 50.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL 1,200.00 680.00
BEATING,CUT WELD,STRAIGHTENED REPLACING
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF TAILLAMP
HOUSING PANELS AND REAR FLOOR PANEL.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 1,500.00 980.00
3,430.00 2,070.00
GRAND TOTAL 15,886.00 10,066.90
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 8,000.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18005465/Uvd3n2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser




